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THE CHdmNT WANUFACTURING INDUSTRY, 1945

Shipments of Portland cement by Canadian producers amounted to 8,471,679
barrels valued at §14,246,480 in 1945, an increase of 18 per cent in quantity and
23 per cent in value over the 1944 shipments of 7,190,851 barrels at $ll,62l,37%.
Production by provinces in 1945 was as follows: Quebec 3,874,273 barrels; Ontario
2,460,996 barrels; Manitoba 959,398 barrels; Alberta 620,357 barrels, and British
Columbia 558,575 barrels.,

The same 8 plants were in operation during 1345 as in the previous year.
The Canada Cement Company Limited had works at Hull and Montreal bast in Quebsec,
at Port Colborne and Belleville in Ontario, at Fort Whyte in Manitoba, and at
Exshaw in Alberta, The St, Mary's Cement Company operated a mill at St, Mary’'s,
Ontario, and the British Columbia Cement Company had a plant at Bamberton, British
Columbia. These mills had 13 kilns with total rated capacity of 33,250 barrels
per day., Raw materials used in 1945 included 70,600 tons of shale, 1,849,258 tons
of limestone, 45,883 tons of gypsum, X3,4%4 tons of silica sand, 161,980 tons of
clay and 3,137 tons of pyrite cinder, There is also one plant in Canada, operated
by Medusa Products Company of Canada Limited at Paris, Ontario, which makes white
Portland cement, cement paints, etc., out since this works uses imported clinker
it's operations nave not been included in this review, which is concerned only
with the establishments which operate on domestic raw materials.

An average of 1,317 workers were employed in this industry in 1345 and
salaries and wages totalled $2,328,117. Raw materials, process supplies and con-
tainers cost $2,794,676, fuel and electricity cost $3,210,923, ‘and tne gross value
of shipments, f.o.b., works, including containers, was $l5,422,03l.

Imports of ordinary Portland cement into Canada amounted to 32,653 bar-
rels valued at $141,539, and the imports of white Fortland cement clinker totalled
16,728 barrels at $35,023. Kxports of Fortland cement in 1345 amounted to 281,944
barrels at $535,012,

Table 1 - PRINCIPAL STATLISTICS FOi THE CeMENT WMANUFACTUKLNG INDUSTKY LN CANADA,

1936-1949
Cost of Gross vulue of
Coat of procesyd products sold
Salaries fuel and supplies, during year
Year Plants Emn- and electri- materials including con-
ployees wages city and con- tainers
tainers(x) (f,0,b, worksg)
No. No. ¥ $ ¢ ¢
193 ... 9 1,052 1,196,664 1,576,142 532,929 6,908,132(x)
4887 ... 9 1,083 1,373,444 1,904,413 540,915 9,095,867(x)
1938 ... 8 1,034 1,306,331 1,764,427 1,369,173 9,081, 366
1933 ... 8 1,001 1,297,542 1,708,981 1,378,358 9, 3814 SHL.
LOME ... 8 1,052 1,515,766 2,347,730 1,943,491 13,006,643
O ;s . g 1,235 1,860,931 2,897,383 2,146,825 14,323,372
g2 ... 8 1,241 2,008 8eF @ 5,12@126¢ 2,087,703 15,628,403
1943 ... 8 1,208 2,154,218 3,089,380 2,467,709 12,709,852
1944 ... 8 ., 207 2,254,775 3,197,955 2,566,432 12,646,741
1945 ... 8 1,317 2,0, 107 35,2020 22,794,676 15,422,031

Note: For FOOTWOTE see Page 2.
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Footnote to lable 1

(x) Includes only process supplies for 1936 and 1937; both process supplies and con-
tainers for 1933 to 1942 inclusive; and process supplies, containers, and raw
materials for later years.

Table 2 - EMPLOYESS, SALARL&S AND wWAGES IN Tdb CridENT MANUFACIURING IRDUSTRY IW
CANADA, 1340-1345

Number of imployees Total

Year On Salaries On Wazes Lo tal balaries Wages salaries

Male Female Male Female and wages

¥ ¢ ¢

1940z, .00 79 4 269 ... 1052 194,548 ; 1,884,218 - 1,835,766
Toiday i ay g 79 8 Ll dB=.. <i. 1,355 180,771 1,670,160 '-- 1,880,351
KA 5. 79 10 L, LG8 ... 1,241 20,779 - 1,858,558 2,059,337
195V, . TS 16 1509% 27 1,209 245,237 - 1,953,081  2;154,KE8
1948 .. . 76 16 1,066 49 15307 249,400 1 2,025;285 - 2,284,743
1946 Fsrat 87 5 1,159 56 1,317, 248,366 2,149,758 2,308,313

Table 3 — WAGE-EARNERS IN ‘IHE CEluNT MAHUFACTURLNG INDUSTRY IN CANADA, BY MONIHS,

1944 and 1349
Lo da g 1 8 adagl
Month Quarry Mill Quarry Mill
Llale Male Female Male Male remale

JENUBTTH ol o oLoe itk 136 903 Lz 128 942 39
BoRrRE: . ' » « «.20.4 138 AlS I 120 9x8 30
MR O o5 o o is Siats a8 132 930 it 122 930 I8
BAGEAE. -« o7 o wiexensrore G 140 340 43 126 348 39
MBY seevucnrnonnas 157 917 64 143 936 72
JRIDOIRES .ol o l6ioieioks o ol 141 896 69 151 893 75
TV 4 TR A, 1628 941 73 166 1,027 79
ABEISTELS o o o olo o sslste L5k 936 L) 152 1,033 e
September .cceeees 157 895 66 1563 1,047 64
QCIQMBE oo v neor 1ol ANl 65 146 1,128 6l
November e.esevess 145 8127 59 147 L%l 54
DecollBer ».esspess 136 908 45 165 1,188 45

AVERAGE ..... 147 019 49 144 1,015 56

Tahle 4 ~ NUMBER OF WAGE-EARNEHS WHO wOKKeD THE NUMbsk OF HOUKS SPECIFIED, DURING
ONi vk IN MONTH Of HIGHEST ®MPLOYMmNT, 1945

Hours Male Fenale Hours Male Female
No. No. No. No.
30 hours or less 29 6 51-54 hours .... 59 1y
31“"43 hO’lrS RN Y 94 14 55 hOUI‘S ee P e s g 'R}
445 IORES. 14150 0 s » 168 1 56-64 NOUrs <. 183 Sl
45-47 hours .... 45 3 65 hours or over 2 —
48 hours ...vees 734 45 Toital. ..5.. L il 76
49-850 hours .... 52 L Total wages paid
in that week § 45,902 1,847

TS e
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Table § - FUEL AND BLECTHKICITY USkD I4 Tdk Cudedil MANUFACTUD NG IHDUSTRY,
1344 and 1946

Unit of E-9- 4--4 ol S b3,
measure Quanti ty Value Quantd ty Value
$ $
Bi tuminous coal--Canadian short ton 108,202 751,706 sl i@ 823,288
Imported short ton 219,802 1,634,690 206,395 1,566,420
PR EET NS U Y %5 11 136,170 36,893 141,359 38,085
BRSNSt e SInpERL, 6,942 1,304 8,996 1,878
Fuel'oil and diesel oil.. Imp.gal. 51,39& 6, <44 08,272 7,741
Wood (cords of 128 cu.ft.) cord 48 348 | 422

Electricity purchased, in-
cluding service charges. K,W,H, 1317526051 aR 786,765 146,034,325 772,660

TOTAL et e oo As S (U] 5.1371355 2 2.8 3_-2-;039]2_9_
Electricity generated for
omnlilsart e, i i. . i DO - v s O 394,218 o 417,863 aits

Table 6 — POWER BQUIPMENT IN CEMaNT PLANTS IN CANADA, 1945

Ordinarily in Use In Reserve or ldie
Description Nunber Total horse Number Total horse
of units  power (x) of units power (x)
SIBANS eNCINES y o oo e oo e s eess 4 50 830 oot
B ge e EiNes . oo o oflaste oo s oo 5 L, 176 apess oo
Gasoline, gas and oil engines,
other than diesel engines ..... 42 1,306 6 442
Electric motors -
(a) Uperated by purchased power 1,470 16,130 <1 13,409
TR . So0fe s o agses 5 8, v68 297 13,851
(b) Operated by power generated
by the establishment ,,... =38 968 o 210
SHEEERary Dol L erS" , . st e s's ass's 8 475 . 40
Motor-genserator sets ....ev0ss04 13 1,884 d 160

(x) According to manufacturers' rating.

Table 7 — PRODUCIION, ImPORTS AND pXPOnTS OF POKTLAND Ckalkdi[, 1944 and 1J945

loeQr 444 A0 00 de il
parrelsix)  Value Barrels{ x) Value
® $
QUEPUL +evnenreernncnnnnsesnesss 7,601,007 ees 7,819,412

Shipments (sold or used by pro-
ducers) S 4 00 2880 0SSP AN Ee NS S '/,190’651 11’621-’572 8,471’679 14’246’480

Stocks on hand December 3l ..... &,006,799 el /554 1358 R
Imports -
Portland cement and hydraulic
or water lime ...... Nk 14,004 76,833 32,683 141,539
Portland cement clinker (white) 9,872 21,356 1o, 728 35,023
Manifactures n o dDs «ssseensess coe 21,128 For 31,306
Exports -
REctliand: cement .ueses s nos i oo 210,449 377,434 231,944 535,012
APPARENT CONSUMPTION ..... 6,994,406(#) ... B8,2:2,388(4) cad

(x) 1 barrel = 350 pounds.
(£) Exclusive of clinker imported.
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/ﬁ;;jg;ble 8 - PRODUCERS' SHIPMENTS AND APPARKNT CONSUMPTION OF CEMENT IN CANADA,
» __1930-1945

Shipments Apparent Consumption(x)
Year 1 in Canada
Barrels _$ Barrels

N ) o o 5d s sanla 11,082,538 17,713,067 10,977,238 i
TR o1 5 o inimminss « (3 somy @ 10,161,658 15,826,243 10,085,986

B o a5 ils ik o 4,498,721 6,930,721 4,466,738

B . iiicnenionase 5,007,432 4,536,935 2,974,020

B SR - o sebaes 3,783, 226 5,667,946 5,727,521

B B8 s s o AT 3,648,086 5,580,043 3,610, 217

B oo i < o e 4,508,718 6,908,192 4,479,656

T 6,168,971 9,095,867 6,157,485

B . ikis s oasis she el 5,619,102 8,241,330 5,478,180

(T R 5,731,264 85 541, 21 5,591,328

L T - 7,559,648 11,775,345 7,274,886

I el e & s 8,368,711 13,063, 588 8,069,824
SRR 9,126,041 14, 365, 237 8,878,481
TR ST 7,302, 289 11,599,033 7,148,265

B 30 e b« b 7,190,851 11,621,372 6,994,406

SR, Fosd & 5 meid'y oo § 59 8,471,679 14,246,480 8,222,588/‘

rd

(x) Shipments plus imports less exports.

! SHIPMNTS OF  CEMeNIT IN CANADA, BY PrOVINCKS, 1943-1345
il 944 3 e aiiiosd. 2 -

Teble 9 - PHODUCERS

Ve e Barrels _Value(x Berrels _ Value(x)  Darrels _ Value(x)
$ $ $
Quebec ..... 3,394,895 4,899,578 3,249,302 4,736,004 3,872,373 5,985,077
Ontario .... 1,972,009 2,872,732 1,863,210 2,730,381 2,460,996 3,805,131
Mani toba ... 793,913 1,503,416 865,756 1,698,567 959,398 2,027,629
Alberta .... 606,705 1,176,442 699,989 1,370,502 620,337 1,246,346
Eritish
Columbia .. 534,769 1,146,865 512,594 1,085,918 558,575 1,182,297
CANADA ... 7,302,289 11,599,033 7,190,851 11,621,372 8,471,679 14,246,480
(x) Less value of containers.
A
/Table 10 - SELLING PHICE PER BARKEL OF CARADIAN Cl
Year High Low Year Hi gh Low
$ $ $ v
19% e tss e e 2.68 1.25 1941- LECIE LA B B Y 2.70 1025
1937 LI I A N Y 20% 1025 1942 eecrvenves 2.70 1025
1958 LI 2 B B B 2055 1025 1943 .'....‘-.'A 2.70 1025
AR seeiiinae 2.85 1.25 1944 ...i0000.e 2. 70 1,25
1940 se s 0o 2055 lu52 1945 et evoseroen 2.70 1.38

7
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Table 11 - SPECIFIED WATknI sbs USED IN CARADLAN CHMENT FLaNTS, 13936-1945

Year Shale Limestone Gypsum ":t;;f_ Qay xi;’;;‘ g
(tons)

1836 0.us.s (x) 1,180,358 25,447 8,549 94,943 (x)

T~ — (x) 1,465,168 33,691 9,281 195,877 444

s 13,821 1,344,868 51,375 9,465 143,4%1 22

i1 i 27,241 1,579,658 81,492 7,942 105,982 16

T340 e . . 18,347 1,765,944 38,903 15,208  144,15% 170

i T 26,837 2,086,761 49,08l 16,110 185,95 614

T, 30,498 2,155,750, 49,816 20,711 ' 188,208 - 2,094

LT 75,460(b) 1,918,742 47,084 19,475 165,545 1,502

0 S N 74,303 1,865,597 42,672 23,942 173,728 3,924

1945 (c) ... 70, 600 1,849,258 45,885 29,424 161,980 3,197

(x) Data not recorded.

(£) Produced from iron pyrites by the chemical industry.

(a) Value of these materials purchased in 1943 totallec $408,<89.

(b) Prior to 1943 shale consumed in' british Columiia plants was included with lime-

stone.
(c) Value of these materials purchased in 1945 totalled $349,195.

Table 12 — COAL USED IN PORILAND CriiwiT PLANTS IN CANADA, 1936-1945

Canadian Foreign

Year Tons $ Tons &

LY e R P, 119,903 (5675 (@150 8 66,460 367,740
TSI W A 145,791 760, 766 90, S8 513,417
LEEE L Dl S L7, 913 656,187 88,4878 499,812
1S I, 190,538 1,010,071 16,141 8¢, 330
1240, oS e 1835, 325 1,108,R87 85,885 a3, 224
BIREVIE A oreiore o ¢ oo o 125,740 772,829 203,906 1,331,448
e 156, 544 1,003,490 192,105 1,305,283
M o S sec e 98,135 o8, 385 «R5,741 1,664,546
JLG) R N 108,282 731,706 219,802 1,634,680
TL1/41 [ S A 121,%99 83,988 206,995 1,566,420

Table 13 - NUMBEK AND CAPACITY OF KILNS IN PORTLAND CHEMENT PLANTS IN CANADA,

1936-1345
Total Kilns £ilns in Use During the Year
Total capacity Total capacity
Lear Number Barrels per Numbex- Barrels per
g4 hours <4 hours
RGN %oz 02 0sdes 15 53,000 (x) (x)
i A PR 18 33,900 (x) (x)
17 S, oAl 35, &00 10 23,100
LTRER | e codoneee 2L 35,000 11 83, 700
(L 10 SR R gl 35,000 13 £7,950
1 PSR O AN 20 33,080 16 30,350
R 19 34,650 17 32,450
1943 Fiveeenes 19 33,750 15 30, 296
U e SR 19 33, <50 15 30,150
B s V6 c a5 oo 19 33,250 15 30,150

{x) Data not recorded.
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DIRECIORY OF PORTLAND CHUENT PhODUCEKS IN CANADA, 1945

Location of

Name of Firm Head Office Address PLant
Quebec -
Canada Cement Company Ltd. box %0, Station B, Montreal Hull
Montreel Kast
Ontario -
Canada Cement Company Ltd. Box &90, Station B, Montreal, Que. Belleville

Port Colborne
St. Mary's Cement Company
Ltd, 357 bBay St., Toronto St. Mary's

Mani toba -
Canada Cement Company Ltd. Box 220, Station b, Montreal, Que. Fort Whyte

Al berte -
Canada Cement Company Ltd. Box %90, Station b, Montreal, Que, Kxshaw

British Columbja -
British Columbia Cement Co.
Ltd. 500 Fort St., Victoria, b,C. bamberton
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