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READER'S NOTE 

In a departure from previous reports, the notes to 
the text in One in Three may be found at the back of 
the report, after the appendixes. They are followed by 
the list of the notes and sources for the charts and 
tables. 

The reader should also note that various con­ 
ventional symbols have been used in the tables, 
similar to those used by Statistics Canada: 

.. figures not available 
... figures not appropriate or not applicable 
- amount too small to be expressed 
- nil or zero 
e estimated figures. 
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1 A Comprehensive Approach 

By the time today's high school students reach the 
age of retirement - around the year 2030 - 
approximately one out of every five Canadians will 
be 65 years old or over, compared with roughly one 
out of every ten now. At the same time, the propor­ 
tion of elderly people among the population aged 20 
and over could jump from about one in seven now to 
nearly one in three 50 years hence. 

The age profile of the Canadian population is 
undergoing dramatic changes. The causes of this 
evolution have been at work for some time: the 
generation born during the "baby boom" that took 
place in the decade following the Second World 
War is aging, and birth rates in Canada have fallen 
sharply in the 1960s and 1970s. 

Demographic transformations of this magnitude 
have profound effects on society. The "baby boom" 
of the late 1940s and the 1950s, the "student boom" 
of the 1960s and the early 1970s, and the rapidly 
evolving "adult boom" of today have brought about 
a succession of social, political, and economic 
changes in various fields - in health and education 
systems, in the demand for foods and fashions, in 
the work place and in the polling booth, to name but 
a few. 

The coming explosion in the older population - 
what has been called the "pension mountain" - 
also has far-reaching implications for economic and 
social policy. Changes in the age structure of the 
population or in policies designed to provide secure 
sources of income for older people - income from 
public and private pension programs, from individu­ 
al savings, and from work - can affect the econo­ 
'my in two ways. They can alter the claims of older 
people on the economy's total output of goods and 
services, and they can also affect the economy's 
capacity for supplying these goods and services. As 
time goes on, more and more people will be leaving 
the labour force because of their age, and there will 
be fewer and fewer young people to replace them. 

The task of producing the basic necessities - food, 
shelter, clothing, appliances, and so on - for a 
growing number of older people will therefore rest 
on the shoulders of a work force that will be increas­ 
ing much more slowly. 

The treatment of the elderly is already a con­ 
troversial issue in Canada. Despite recent improve­ 
ments in public and private programs directed at 
our older citizens, some of them are still in difficult, 
even desperate, and certainly socially unacceptable 
circumstances. There have been pressures to expand 
the services aimed at the elderly and to improve the 
coverage and benefits of retirement income pack­ 
ages. There have also been warnings, however, that 
the expected increase in the proportion of older 
people will increasingly threaten Canada's capacity 
to provide even the existing level of benefits. Some 
observers have suggested that further expansion of 
commitments to the old might even bring about a 
collapse of the economy that would jeopardize the 
well-being of Canadians of all ages. 

These two opposite views delineate the question 
that is at the core of our report: Can Canada ensure 
its older generation - which, 50 years from now, 
will represent one-fifth of its total population - an 
adequate income without risk to the economy? The 
matters discussed here are very complex, and many 
aspects of the question are subtly but closely inter­ 
related. In order to clarify and elucidate them, our 
approach involves the following elements: 
1/ reference to a comprehensive framework, or 
"model," that sets out the relationships over time 
between demographic and economic changes and 
changes in the policies and institutions that form 
this country's system for providing income for older 
people; 2/ an attempt to define the objectives of this 
particular group of policies; 3/ the setting out of a 
number of alternative ways to achieve these objec­ 
tives; and 4/ the production of information having a 
bearing on the choice of these alternatives. 
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The Council's interest in these issues stems in 
part from its continuing concern about the implica­ 
tions of a changing age structure for the economy. 
Our report does not describe in detail the situation 
of those elderly people who, in 1979, are suffering 
from want. This question has been well documented 
elsewhere, and further elaboration by the Council 
would contribute little of interest to the discussion. 
We focus instead on a major obstacle that has 
impeded action to alleviate the problem and that 
has received surprisingly little attention: the uncer­ 
tainty about the longer-term repercussions of such 
action on the economy. This report is an attempt to 
dispel some of that uncertainty, and our analysis is 
therefore somewhat more oriented towards the 
future than other current investigations of these 
issues. This does not mean that it is an abstract 
exercise in futurism: reducing the uncertainty will 
no doubt assist those who are now in the older age 
groups. Besides, it is worth repeating that, although 
we refer often to the elderly population of the year 
2030, those "old people" of tomorrow are, in fact, 
the high school students of today. 

A CONCEPTUAL FRAMEWORK 

In its simplified version, the general framework 
employed here consists of three major blocks or 
subsystems: the population, the economy, and the 
income security policies directed at older people 
(Chart 1-1). The population block takes into 
account the various factors that influence the size 
and age-sex composition of the population - that 
is, births, deaths, and migration, and the causes 
underlying them. The economic block comprises 
those factors that directly affect the economy's 
output of goods and services and their allocation 
among various uses - the size and composition of 
the labour force, the stock of real capital, employ­ 
ment, savings and investment, and the rate of tech­ 
nological progress, to mention but a few. The policy 
block focuses attention on the various institutions 
and policies, both private and public, that directly 
affect the flow of income to older people - the 
contribution and benefit structure of various types 
of pension plans, tax legislation, and programs 
designed to provide special services. This block is 
broader than the pension or retirement income 
system narrowly defined, since pensions are only one 
method - albeit the most important one at 
present - of providing income to older people. 

CHART (-( 
THE GENERAL MODEL 

r---------- 
THE ECONOMY 

I . - 
I ~ 
I 
t 

INCOME SECURITY 
POPULATION POLICY FOR OLDER 

PEOPLE 

The three blocks are closely interrelated. Changes 
in population, for example, can affect the output of 
the economy by altering the size of the labour force. 
Economic factors such as income levels may also 
have a bearing on the size of the population, 
although our knowledge of such effects is rather 
limited (that is why this "feedback" is shown as a 
broken line in Chart 1-1). Population changes may 
affect the economy by way of the income policy 
subsystem as well. The claims of older people on 
total output are determined not only by their num­ 
bers but by the level of pension benefits. Some 
features of the income policy block may affect the 
economy directly; for example, certain programs for 
older people may affect the incentive to work or to 
save. Economic factors may in turn affect decisions 
about these programs. 

Although the basic framework outlined above 
underlies our analysis throughout the report, our 
work is not based on a single, detailed economic 
model. Given the present state of our knowledge and 
the limitations on our time and resources, we have 
drawn instead on several models, each differing in 
the comprehensiveness of its treatment of the sub­ 
systems mentioned above. 

THE NEED FOR PRECISE OBJECTIVES 

The primary objective of the group of public and 
private policies that is the focus of this report is 
something we have as yet defined only loosely as 
"income security for older people." It does not take 
long to find out, however, that individuals, unions, 
employers, and other groups differ greatly in their 
conceptions of such security and in the importance 
they assign to it relative to other goals of our 
society. 



Income security for older people is only one of a 
variety of broad national objectives in Canada. 
Some of the others include improving the health and 
education of the population in general, ensuring the 
protection of persons and property, and providing 
support to the unemployed. Our society is also 
concerned with the performance objectives of the 
economy - increases in real income over time, full 
employment, reasonable stability of prices, and a 
more equitable distribution of income among differ­ 
ent groups and regions. And, of course, there are 
many noneconomic objectives as well. One of the 
most important, in the context of this report, is the 
provision of a large measure of freedom of choice to 
the individual. 

There are strong interrelationships - and, at 
times, conflicts - between many of these objectives. 
The achievement of one may well hinder the 
achievement of others, sometimes simply because 
the total resources of the economy are limited. To 
achieve greater efficiency it is necessary to seek 
ways of realizing one objective more adequately 
without sacrificing the others or, at least, by mini­ 
mizing such sacrifices. To this end, the costs and 
benefits of a variety of approaches must be 
compared - a task that is possible only if the 
objectives are reasonably precise. 

Pension policies are often used to achieve more 
than one objective. In Italy, for example, the pen­ 
sion and social security systems are used to promote 
regional development and economic stabilization 
objectives; employer contributions have been 
reduced during business slowdowns, and labour sub­ 
sidies to particular regions have been made avail­ 
able through the system. Sweden allows elderly 
persons to draw pensions at an earlier age rather 
than attempt to move them to regions with better 
employment prospects. The Canada Pension Plan 
has been used as a source of financing for provincial 
governments. 

Even when retirement income policies are not 
deliberately directed at more than one objective, 
they may have "spillover" effects that must be 
taken into account when designing an efficient 
policy system. If, for example, income security for 
the elderly were to be defined only in terms of the 
proportion of pre-retirement income replaced, the 
system would simply help to perpetuate regional 
income disparities in Canada, whereas reduction of 
these disparities is also a national objective. Perhaps 
the greatest concern, however - at least in Canada 
and the United States - is the possibility that 
present retirement income policies will reduce eco­ 
nomic growth. It is therefore necessary to determine 
whether the most efficient methods are being used 
to achieve given objectives and how any undesirable 
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spillover effects can be minimized or desirable 
effects reinforced. 

The possible conflict between income security for 
older people and freedom of choice is a subject that 
has received far too little attention. As well as 
affecting the allocation of income among individu­ 
als, Canada's system involves efforts to change pat­ 
terns of consumption and saving over the lifetime of 
individuals, partly through the use of various forms 
of compulsion. How much compulsion can be justi­ 
fied and on what grounds? Are employer-sponsored 
pensions a barrier to the free mobility of workers? 
Can ways be found to permit greater freedom of 
choice without sacrificing income security? 

ALTERNATIVE WAYS TO ACHIEVE 
INCOME SECURITY FOR OLDER PEOPLE 

Just to begin moving towards a more precise 
definition of objectives requires recognition that 
income security for older people has a dual purpose. 
The first, one that emerged in most Western coun­ 
tries many years ago, is to prevent people from 
becoming destitute by providing a basic, or floor, 
income regardless of previous circumstances. As 
progress has been made in that direction, attention 
has been directed increasingly to the need for some 
level of income replacement that would prevent an 
unduly large decline in the standard of living of 
individuals between their prime and later years. 

The latter concern is an explicit recognition of the 
difficulty of defining poverty Or social deprivation: 
"What would have seemed a tolerable standard of living 
in 1900 would not be so regarded today in any developed 
country. What would be felt to be bitter hardship by most 
Americans would be affluence to most of the inhabitants 
of Africa or India .... Clearly the concept of poverty has a 
relative aspect which is of crucial importance to an under­ 
standing of the problem."! 

Linking retirement income to pre-retirement 
income is one way - albeit an imperfect one - of 
dealing with this problem. But it does help to avoid 
the situation in which an individual who had been 
earning an adequate income while working suddenly 
finds himself with a very sharply reduced living 
standard after retirement. 
The two goals mayor may not coincide. When an 

individual's pre-retirement income is low - and 
there will always be people who, for various reasons, 
are unable to work or who receive only low 
incomes - even a high level of income replacement 
will not provide sufficient basic income. When pre­ 
retirement income is high, on the other hand, some 
level of replacement will accomplish both goals. But 



Primary policy objectives: 
I) To prevent poverty and to provide a basic income; 
2) To replace pre-retirement income. 
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the provision of a basic old-age income sufficiently 
high to prevent, by itself, a sharp drop in the 
retirement income of middle- and upper-income 
workers would be extremely expensive and could 
involve serious distortions of work and saving incen­ 
tives. For these reasons, many countries use sepa­ 
rate methods to achieve each goal. 

These dual objectives involve many complex 
issues. What is poverty? What income is adequate 
to prevent destitution? Who should be eligible for a 
basic income? At what age? Should a means test be 
used to determine eligibility? Should the basic­ 
income payment be indexed to the wage or price 
level? How much income is required to maintain 
one's standard of living after leaving employment? 
Why shouldn't individuals provide for their own 
income replacement? To what extent are 
governments - or even private firms - justified in 
forcing their present workers to save in order to 
provide benefits beyond the basic minimum? How 
far can the retirement income system be expected to 
go to take care of problems that may have their 

CHART 1-2 
INCOME SECURITY FOR OLDER PEOPLE: THE OPTIONS 

Income from 
employment 

roots in much earlier periods of individuals' lives - 
insufficient education, low-income jobs, or poor 
health, for example. Answers to these questions also 
require precise definition of the objectives and a 
careful assessment of the alternative ways to achieve 
them. 

The goal of income security for the elderly can be 
pursued by enabling them to work to a more 
advanced age and thus receive employment income 
or by providing other forms of income, including 
transfers from the active work force or income from 
capital - that is, the return on savings. There is an 
almost bewildering variety of methods or programs 
that could be used to implement these two broad 
approaches - some involving direct government 
intervention and others involving the private sector, 
including regulations and legislation concerning that 
sector (Chart 1-2). This report is largely concerned 
with providing information that may help in assess­ 
ing the various alternatives and in choosing the 
appropriate mix of policies and the methods through 
which to implement them. 
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The first level of choice mentioned above is be­ 
tween an approach that would enable or encourage 
people to work to an older age and one that would 
involve nonemployment sources of income. Obvious­ 
ly, the former would be of little use to the very old 
or to those who, for health reasons, might not be 
able to work. It is clear, too, that the first approach 
would involve a good deal of emphasis on programs 
that might be brought to bear even long before 
retirement, in such areas as education, retraining, 
health, and accident prevention, as well as on pro­ 
grams directed at those already in the older age 
groups, such as the creation of full- or part-time 
jobs designed specifically for them. It is necessary to 
know just how effective these various methods 
would be, how much they would cost, and how 
much they might add to the economy's output. Even 
if the economic returns should prove to be limited, 
such programs might well be encouraged in order to 
increase freedom of choice or psychological 
satisfaction. 

Other forms of income may be provided through 
universal (government) schemes, occupational 
(mainly employer-sponsored) plans, or through 
families or individuals, with many variations in each 
approach. Not too long ago, the family unit was the 
main channel for transferring income from active 
workers to the elderly. With the transition to an 
industrialized, urban society and a more mobile 
work force, however, the characteristics of the older 
population have changed, and as families have 
become more widely dispersed, their role as provid­ 
ers of income for their older members has dimin­ 
ished in importance. 

Beyond the family's contribution, individuals 
were expected to save during their working lives in 
anticipation of their own retirement. That emphasis 
too has shifted in favour of collective or institutional 
action because of the high social costs entailed by 
inadequate provision for retirement, the uncertain­ 
ties facing the individual in planning for retirement, 
and, quite simply, myopia with respect to retirement 
needs. With the rise in real incomes, higher levels of 
education, the availability of basic old-age income, 
and the development of financial markets, however, 
the use of government assistance, compulsion, or tax 
privileges to promote collective, as opposed to 
individual, preparations for retirement could at least 
stand re-examination. There is also the question, 
though, of the ability of the individual or of private 
pension plans to deal with the discouraging effects 
of inflation. 
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OUTLINE OF THE REPORT 

For policy-makers to choose wisely from among 
the various collective approaches or to choose be­ 
tween these and the family or individual ap­ 
proaches, a great deal of information and analysis is 
required. Chapter 2 describes Canada's present 
retirement income system with a view to revealing 
both its strengths and its weaknesses, and it does so 
in such a way as to facilitate economic analysis. It 
points out too that alleviation of present problems 
cannot be discussed sensibly without reference to 
cost, especially because of the substantial increase 
expected in the numbers of older people. Chapter 3 
examines this aspect by linking various demographic 
scenarios to the proportion of current production 
that will be required to support our retirement 
income system in the future. 

Depending upon how the system is set up, how­ 
ever, production itself may be influenced. Chapter 4 
shows how retirement income plans can redistribute 
income or wealth between generations as well as 
between individuals of the same generation. Such 
redistribution may bear directly on the adequacy of 
benefits. It may also do so indirectly through its 
repercussions on the economy by way of its implica­ 
tions for the choices between consumption and 
saving and between work and leisure. Chapter 5 
looks in more detail at the first choice, especially at 
how it may be affected by the method of funding 
public pension plans or by the mix of private and 
public plans. The choice between public and private 
plans, or between various types of private plans may 
also be conditioned by the ways in which different 
plans invest the savings entrusted to them. That is 
the subject of Chapter 6. 

Chapter 7 looks at how the sources of finance for 
retirement plans, and the conditions surrounding 
benefit payments may alter the choice of how much 
to work and where to work - that is, the supply 
and mobility of labour - as well as at the costs and 
benefits of extending freedom of choice with respect 
to age of retirement. The choice between public and 
private pension plans may also be affected by their 
ability to adjust benefit payments over time to rising 
prices or rising real wages. These problems, which 
have assumed great importance in recent years, are 
the subject of Chapter 8. 

Because of the great complexity of the subject, 
the Council itself found it useful to pause for a 
while to draw its findings together and to summa- 
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rize the implications of the available options and 
alternatives. The results are set out in Chapter 9. 
Chapter 10 then reviews the costs of various policy 

packages and makes a number of recommendations 
for increasing the adequacy and viability of the 
system in the future. 



2 The Holes in the Fabric 

Canada's system for ensuring that older men and 
women can live decently, with adequate incomes, is 
now much better than it was even a few years ago. 
Like any system - and especially any system that 
is a great melange of public and private 
initiatives - it misses some ·of the people it is 
designed to help: some couples and individuals are 
still in distress. These "holes in the fabric" are the 
subject of this chapter. 

What we have now has been shaped by history. It 
was not 50 years ago that the aged depended largely 
on their families or on their own thrift. Canada is 
now a very different society. We have higher living 
standards, earned by wholesale economic 
reorganization - a shift from an essentially rural, 
agricultural existence to a highly industrial, urban­ 
ized economy that, for all its immense benefits, has 
required us to reorganize the family as well. 
Although the pressures, controversies, and changing 
perceptions of needs that have brought Canada's 
retirement income system to its present state make a 
fascinating story (see Appendix B), we must con­ 
centrate here on today's issues and concerns. 

Canada's older people have come to depend very 
little on income from employment (Chart 2-1). 
Their participation in the labour force is now far 
below what it was even 20 or 30 years ago. This 
decline reflects, at least in part, the deliberate deci­ 
sion of society to provide them with other sources of 
income. It may also reflect mandatory retirement 
provisions and a lack of job opportunities for older 
workers. 

There are a number of public, publicly funded, 
and private programs designed to provide opportuni­ 
ties for older Canadians to use their talents. I In 
most cases, however, they are not designed primari­ 
ly to supplement the individual's income. One 
exception is the federal "Over 55" program, which 
provides free job-placement and counselling services 
for qualified mature persons in good health and with 

specific skills. We know of no special programs in 
Canadian industry to provide part-time employment 
to older workers, like those that exist in the United 
Kingdom, the Netherlands, and Sweden. 

CHART 2-i 
INCOME DISTRiBUTION OF OLDER AGE GROUPS, BY 
MAJOR SOURCE, CANADA, 1975 . 

(::::::::::::;:;:1 Transfer payments? 

L:J Other sources) 
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70 and over 
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55-64 

65-69 

70 and over 

o 20 80 100% 40 60 

Thus our major concern here is with those gov­ 
ernment and private programs, both institutional­ 
ized and individual, that provide older people with 
their major sources of nonemployment income. Not 
surprisingly, the programs designed to provide a 
basic retirement income for the elderly - that is, to 
achieve the anti-poverty objective - are all estab­ 
lished by government. The objective of providing 
income replacement above this income floor is met 
by a mixture of public and private programs 
(Table 2-1). 
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TABLE 2-1 
CANADA'S RETIREMENT INCOME PROGRAMS, 1977 

Contributions 
Value of 
assets Objective Program Benefits 

Income 
floor 

Old Age Security! 
Guaranteed Income Supplement! 

Provincial income supplements! 
Nova Scotia 
Ontario 
Manitoba 
Saskatchewan 
Alberta 
British Columbia 

Income in kind 
Tax programs 

Canada Pension Plan 
Quebec Pension Plan 

Occupational pension plans 
Public 
Private Income 

replacement 
Other saving 

Registered Retirement Savings Programs 
Registered Home Ownership Savings 
Program 

Tax programs 

TAX POLICIES 

Various taxation policies and regulations have an 
important bearing on the income security system for 
older people, in respect of both the basic-income and 
the income-replacement objectives. These measures 
include exemptions as well as measures - tax 
deferrals and reductions, certain tax deductions, and 
tax shelters - aimed at encouraging individuals to 
save some of their employment income for their 
retirement through pension plans and various forms 
of individual saving. 

The Canadian income tax system provides a per­ 
sonal exemption ($1,520 in 1978) for individuals 
who are over 65 years of age, beyond the basic 
exemption ($2,430 in 1978) available to all taxpay­ 
ers. These exemptions are adjusted for changes in 
the cost of living, helping to ensure a basic-income 
level as well as a higher level of income replace­ 
ment. There is an exemption for aged dependants 
($840 in 1978) offered to families supporting their 
older members. In addition, there is a deduction of 
up to $1,000 for pension income. 

(Millions of dollars) 

3,669 
1.078 

7 
108 

2 
6 

34 
35 

1,828 998 12,596 
611 359 4,618 

3,005e 1,106e 34,586e 
2,247e 786e 22,137e 

2,369 7,000e 

476 

Within certain limits, the contributions paid by 
employers, employees, and self-employed people to 
pension plans are deductible from current income. 
In many cases, this enables individuals to defer 
payment of the tax until their taxable income is 
considerably lower and therefore subject to a lower 
marginal tax rate. The Income Tax Act also pro­ 
vides incentives to save by allowing deduction of the 
first $1,000 of interest and dividend income from 
gross income, in addition to the basic personal 
exemption for older people and the pension income 
deduction. 

Finally, the investment earnings of pension 
funds except those involving employee 
profit-sharing - are, for the most part, not taxable. 
Such investments can therefore produce a consider­ 
ably higher rate of return than similar ones made by 
individuals or institutions subject to tax. Pension 
funds cannot, however, claim the tax credits for 
dividend income that are available to individual 
taxpayers. In addition, they are liable to a tax if, at 



the end of any month, more than 10 per cent of 
their holdings is in foreign assets. 

No matter how generous they may be, tax policies 
do not, however, provide income directly to older 
people, unless they involve some form of negative 
income tax. At best, they can only supplement the 
more positive basic-income and income-replacement 
programs. 

INCOME-FLOOR PROGRAMS 

Among the schemes designed to guarantee a 
minimum income for older people, the most impor­ 
tant is the Old Age Security (OAS) program. In the 
1977 - 78 fiscal year, a total of $3,669 million was 
paid in OAS benefits to over 2 million pensioners, 
half of whom also received Guaranteed Income 
Supplement (GIs) payments, totalling an additional 
$1,078 million (Table 2-1). 

A number of provinces (Nova Scotia, Ontario, 
and the four western provinces) have their own 
programs of supplementary assistance to provide 
some form of guaranteed income for the retired. 
The provincial supplement programs vary in terms 
of both benefits and eligibility. Nova Scotia, 
Ontario, Manitoba, Saskatchewan, and Alberta 
guarantee a basic income for persons aged 65 and 
over and for their spouses. British Columbia guar­ 
antees a minimum income for persons aged 60 and 
over. All basic-income programs are now financed 
from the general revenues of the governments con­ 
cerned. The provincial supplements are provided on 
a shared-cost basis with the federal government, 
subject to certain conditions. 

Both the OAS and GIS benefits are adjusted 
automatically for cost-of-living increases. Until 
1972 this adjustment could not be more than 2 per 
cent a year, but the programs have since then been 
modified to compensate for the actual increase in 
the consumer price index. Benefits are not, however, 
indexed to wage increases or general growth, nor is 
there any procedure for a regular review of their 
adequacy. None of the provincial supplementary 
income programs are adjusted automatically. 

The adequacy of present basic-income benefits 
for older people is a complex question. It involves 
consideration of what constitutes poverty. In fair­ 
ness, it must also involve comparison with programs 
available to those in other age groups who are 
unable to participate in the labour force, such as the 
disabled. And it cannot be considered in isolation 
from the availability of other services for the aged, 
such as medical care and housing. 
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As of January 1979, the Old Age Security pro­ 
gram provided a monthly payment of about $167 
($2,007 on an annual basis) to all Canadian resi­ 
dents aged 65 or over, subject only to a minimum 
length-of-residence qualification. In addition, the 
GIS program provided a maximum income-tested 
supplement of $1,647 a year for an unattached 
individual and $2,740 for a married couple v This 
meant that the maximum annual OAS and GIS ben­ 
efit for married couples was $6,753, slightly above 
the national average low-income line of $6,563 cal­ 
culated by Statistics Canada. But the maximum 
benefit for an unattached individual ($3,654) was 
nearly $900 below the low-income cutoff for this 
category. 

By contrast with persons aged 65 and over who 
receive a large proportion of their income support 
from federal programs, especially through OAS and 
GIS benefits, individuals under age 65 who are 
unable to work because of various forms of disabili­ 
ty rely more on provincial programs (50 per cent of 
whose costs are financed by the federal government 
under the Canada Assistance Plan). In most prov­ 
inces, the maximum monthly social assistance pay­ 
able for ordinary needs (food, clothing, shelter, and 
household and personal needs) to disabled persons 
under 65 years of age is less than that available to 
older people whether they are disabled or not 
(Table 2-2). 

The estimates of disability payments do not lend 
themselves to an interprovincial comparison of 
income-maintenance programs. These estimates 
must be treated with caution, in particular because 
they do not include other forms of assistance that 
may be granted to eligible recipients. Indeed, pro­ 
vincial and municipal governments also provide a 
wide variety of ancillary services for both the dis­ 
abled and the elderly, often at little or no cost to the 
recipient. 

Health care and housing facilities have a particu­ 
larly important bearing on the adequacy of basic­ 
income benefits. Canada has eliminated much of the 
severe income risk confronting those in need of 
health care through the provision of medical care 
and hospital insurance programs administered by 
the provinces. In most cases, these programs are 
funded in part by contributory premiums; persons 
aged 65 or over are either exempt from premiums or 
entitled to rebates, depending on income. In some 
provinces, prescription drugs and certain other 
health services are available to older people without 
cost. But older people do require more health care 
than younger individuals. In 1976 the 65-and-over 
group accounted for an estimated $3.1 billion of 
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TABLE 2-2 
MAXIMUM MONTHLY BENEFIT PAYABLE TO THE DISABLED COMPARED WITH 
MAXIMUM OLD-AGE INCOME SUPPORT, BY PROVINCE, AS OF 31 MARCH 1979 

Under 65 Over 65 

Disability Pension Provincial Old-age Disability payment 
payment payable supplement income as a proportion of 

under social under to the support old-age income support 
assistance I OAS/GIS elderly (2) + (3) (I) -ê- (4) 

(I) (2) (3) (4) (5) 

(Dollars) 

Newfoundland Individual 271.00 304.49 304.49 .89 
Couple 451.00 562.72 562.72 .80 

Prince Edward Island Individual 304.49 304.49 
Couple 562.72 562.72 

Nova Scotia Individual 267.00 304.49 13.50 317.99 .84 
Couple 392.00 562.72 27.00 589.72 .66 

New Brunswick Individual 242.00 304.49 304.49 .79 
Couple 387.00 562.72 562.72 .69 

Quebec Individual 276.00 304.49 304.49 .91 
Couple 439.00 562.72 562.72 .78 

Ontario Individual 286.00 304.49 38.88 343.37 .83 
Couple 572.00 562.72 104.02 666.74 .86 

Manito.ba Individual 263.50 304.49 7.82 312.31 .84 
Couple 404.00 562.72 16.86 579.58 .70 

Saskatchewan Individual 390.00 304.49 25.00 329.49 1.18 
Couple 530.00 562.72 45.00 607.72 .87 

Alberta Individual 303.00 304.49 45.01 349.50 .87 
Couple 522.00 562.72 94.40 657.12 .79 

British Columbia Individual 342.00 304.49 38.88 343.37 .99 
Couple 673.00 562.72 99.66 662.38 1.02 

health-related public expenditures - a figure not 
much different from that of total OAS payments - 
and these expenditures will increase as the popula­ 
tion ages.' 

Fortunately, many people aged 65 and over own 
their own homes - 75 and 55 per cent of male and 
female household heads, respectively, according to 
the 1971 Census - often free of mortgages. Those 
homes are among the most important, relatively 
inflation-proof assets that the elderly have. Yet 
shelter costs can still loom very large in their budg­ 
ets. In a 1975 survey, the Metropolitan Toronto 
Social Planning Council reported that one-half of 
all elderly homeowners and more than two-thirds of 
older renters, in that city at least, were paying 
shelter costs in excess of 25 per cent of their 
income.' 

The provinces have come to playa larger role in 
the provision of housing or rental supplements and 

tax credits and grants enabling older people to 
continue to rent or own dwellings of reasonable 
quality and encouraging them to remain in the 
neighbourhoods and communities familiar to them. 
This type of assistance is probably preferable and 
less costly than public housing projects, senior citi­ 
zen hostels, nursing homes, and other forms of 
institutional care that tend to isolate older people 
from others in society. At the same time, however, 
the growing number of much older people - those 
75 years of age or over - is bringing problems in 
this regard also. A substantial majority of them are 
women living alone or with relatives, and this has 
led to increased demand for self-contained apart­ 
ments, hostels, nursing homes, and home-care ser­ 
vices. While these institutions vary widely in the 
amount of individual care they provide, most entail 
expenditures that are well beyond the individual 
means of the pensioners who use them. Most prov­ 
inces, in fact, subsidize the elderly in nursing homes 
and senior citizen residences. 



INCOME-REPLACEMENT PROGRAMS 

There is wide public support in Canada for some 
measure of basic income support, although there 
may be disagreement about the levels of support and 
the methods used. The income-replacement goal is 
more contentious, especially as a matter of public 
policy. Nevertheless, governments have stepped in, 
partly because of a growing realization that the 
income-replacement levels provided by the private 
system have not been high enough for a large 
proportion of those who have retired from the work 
force. 

There remain strongly conflicting views about the 
adequacy and potential cost of the income-replace­ 
ment system. There is concern that benefits are too 
low, yet it is quite possible, under existing programs, 
for some people to have higher incomes after retire­ 
ment than before.' The problem is that there are 
indeed "holes in the fabric." Some people have been 
left behind - many workers in private industry, 
especially in small firms; workers who change jobs; 
and, in many cases, women. 

THE PUBLIC/PRIVATE MIX 

Canada's existing income-replacement system 
consists of the universal public plans, the Canada 
and Quebec Pension Plans, and a variety of private 
plans (Table 2-1). The term "private pension plan" 
refers here to occupational and personal plans, both 
of which supplement the public programs. Occupa­ 
tional plans are related to employment. The vast 
majority of them are sponsored by the employer, 
although some are backed by other sponsors such as 
labour unions or professional associations. 

We shall distinguish here between plans spon­ 
sored by public and private employers. The plans 
sponsored by public employers are of three types: 
consolidated-revenue plans, trusteed plans, and 
insured plans. Contributions to the first type go 
directly into the consolidated-revenue fund of the 
government concerned. Trusteed and insured plans 
derive their name from the organization - often a 
trust or insurance company - or group of individu­ 
als who provide facilities for the accumulation of 
assets and payment of benefits under the plan. 
Occupational plans for employees in private indus­ 
try are largely trusteed or insured or a combination 
of the two. Personal plans include Registered 
Retirement Savings Plans (RRSPS) and Registered 
Home Ownership Savings Plans (RHOSPS). 
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Canadian pension funds together (excluding 
RRSPS) held assets equal in value to about one-fifth 
of GNP in the early 1960s. That ratio had risen to 
one-third by 1977 (Chart 2-2). By far the largest 
part of this growth stemmed from the Canada and 
Quebec Pension Plans (Charts 2-2 and 2-3); to­ 
gether they have accumulated a surplus fund that 
exceeded $17 billion at the end of 1977, although 
this covered only a fraction of their outstanding 
liabilities.' Nevertheless, government consolidated­ 
revenue plans and the trusteed and insured pension 
plans - the two types of occupational schemes - 
still accounted for about one-quarter and one-half of 
total pension fund assets, respectively, in 1977. In 
addition, an estimate made for the Council suggests 
that assets in RRSPS probably totalled about 
$7 billion in 1977. 

The public programs aimed at income 
replacement - the Canada and Quebec Pension 
Plans - paid out benefits (including survivor and 
disability benefits) in 1977 that amounted to only 
one-third of those provided under the OAS program, 
although this will change as the CPP and QPP 
mature. The occupational pension plans - the most 
important part of the private retirement income 
system - involved contributions of $5.2 billion in 
1977, more than double those paid into the CPP and 
QPP, while their benefits amounted to $1.9 billion, 
compared with $1.4 billion for the two government 
plans. Total contributions to RRSPS amounted to 
$2.4 billion in 1977. 

CHART 2-2 
BOOK VALUE OF PENSION FUND ASSETS AS A 
PROPORTION OF GNP, BY TYPE OF PLAN, CANADA, 
1962-77 
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CHART 2-3 
BOOK VALUE OF PENSION FUND ASSETS, BY TYPE 
OF PLAN, CANADA, 1962-77 
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For many people, however, the opportunities for 
accumulating savings to supplement other sources of 
retirement income are quite limited. We noted ear­ 
lier that "stocking up" for old age through home 
ownership can be very important. This type of 
saving can be said to benefit from the fact that 
Canada does not tax imputed rent on owner­ 
occupied homes or capital gains from the sale of an 
individual's principal residence. In contrast with the 
United States and Britain, however, mortgage inter­ 
est payments have not been tax-deductible. The 
RHOSPS, introduced a few years ago, are designed 
more to stimulate home ownership than to promote 
retirement savings, although they may contribute to 
such savings. 

Detailed descriptions of all of these programs 
designed to supplement basic income are available 
from a number of sources.' Thus, rather than exam­ 
ine each plan in turn, the discussion that follows will 
focus on those aspects that are most important for 
an analysis of economic impact and social concern. 

BENEFIT STRUCTURE 

Although experts may argue about the technical 
details, the concern that most people have about 
pensions centres on the level of benefits that they 
will receive. Will their pensions be sufficient to 

provide them with a decent standard of living in 
their older years? What opportunities will be avail­ 
able to them to build up their benefits? The intro­ 
duction of the Canada and Quebec Pension Plans, 
as well as recent improvements in some private 
plans, have gone a long way to redress the deficien­ 
cies of a few years ago; yet many problems remain. 

Eligibility and Coverage - The Canada and 
Quebec Pension Plans, which are completely port­ 
able, cover about 98 per cent of the work force . 
Membership in, and contributions to, the plans are 
compulsory for almost all employees and self­ 
employed individuals between 18 and 65 years of 
age. The few exceptions are those whose participa­ 
tion would raise difficult constitutional or adminis­ 
trative problems. Unfortunately, confining coverage 
to the work force as it is usually defined excludes 
one particularly large group - housewives working 
in the home; these women are unable to accumulate 
their own benefits. 

Contributions to the CPP and QPP are based on 
earnings from employment, within a range bounded 
by a basic exemption on the one hand and a yearly 
maximum pensionable earnings level (YMPE) on the 
other. In 1978 the exemption was $1,000, and the 
maximum was $10,400. Provided they have con­ 
tributed to either plan for a minimum number of 
years, workers who leave the labour force at age 65 
or who are disabled receive benefits based on an 
average of their annual earnings up to the YMPE. 
The maximum benefit in 1978 was $2,333, or 17 per 
cent of the earnings of an individual at the average 
industrial wage. A surviving spouse receives 60 per 
cent of a participant's entitled benefit. Those who 
decide to work beyond age 65 may continue to 
contribute to age 70 if they wish to do so, in order to 
improve the average on which benefits are based. 

There are several reasons, however, why the ben­ 
efit actually paid may fall below the maximum. 
Those who became eligible for the pension before 
1976 - that is, before contributing to either plan 
for at least ten years after its inception - will 
receive less. Then, too, some workers earn less than 
the YMPE even though they are regularly employed; 
many of them are women, since they have a higher 
incidence of low-paying jobs than men. Others may, 
as a result of unemployment, have earnings that fal! 
below the YMPE for prolonged periods during the 
contributory phase. To compensate for years of low 
earnings, 15 per cent of a contributor's years in the 
plans can be dropped out of the lifetime average 
earnings calculation. Under the QPP, further years 
can be dropped out of the average calculation by 
parents who have to look after young children - a 
provision that is of particular importance to women. 



Legislation amending the CPP in similar fashion has 
been passed by the Parliament of Canada, but it 
cannot come into effect until ratified by the Prov­ 
ince of Ontario. 

Occupational plans are designed exclusively for 
paid workers, thereby excluding the self-employed, 
those who work for small family businesses without 
pay, and, once again, those who work in the home. 
The growth in the numbers of these plans slowed 
down after the establishment of the CPP and QPP, 
although membership in existing plans has con­ 
tinued to grow (Chart 2-4). In 1976, there were 
nearly 16,000 occupational plans, the majority of 
which were employer-sponsored, covering 
3.9 million workers. This amounted to 39 per cent of 
the total labour force - roughly the same level as 
in 1970 - or to about 46 per cent of employed paid 
workers. But coverage, as well as several other 
features bearing on the structure of benefits, differ 
considerably among industries and sectors, especial­ 
ly between the public and private sectors generally, 
and between men and women. 

Virtually all employees in public administration 
and defence were covered by occupational plans 
(Chart 2-5). Indeed, if the public sector is defined 
more broadly to include, for example, government­ 
owned business enterprises and educational institu­ 
tions, slightly less than one-half of all full-time paid 
workers covered by occupational plans were public 
employees in 1976. Some areas of the private sector, 

CHART 2-4 
GROWTH OF OCCUPATIONAL PENSION PLANS IN 
CANADA, 1960 TO 1976 
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such as mining, do have fairly extensive coverage 
also; in others such as trade (largely retail trade), 
coverage is very low. Unfortunately, these are areas 
in which a higher proportion of women are 
employed. In fact, in 1974 only 32 per cent of 
female workers were covered by occupational plans, 
compared with 48 per cent of male paid workers. 

Even among larger enterprises, coverage is less 
than complete, although it is much lower still in 
smaller firms. An examination of collective bargain­ 
ing agreements in force in January 1974 for firms 
with 200 or more employees showed that roughly 
one-third of those with 500 or more employees and 
close to one-half those with between 200 and 500 
employees had no private pension provisions.' 

Some 40 per cent of occupational plans are now 
integrated with the Canada and Quebec Pension 
Plans." While integration covers 97 per cent of 
public employees, however, it includes only one-half 
of the members of occupational plans in the private 
sector. 

For those firms with private pension plans, eligi­ 
bility conditions do not significantly inhibit partici­ 
pation. Some plans restrict membership to specific 
classes of employees, but many employers operate 
separate plans for groups excluded from the general 
plans. Most plans - over 80 per cent in 1976 - 
have requirements related to service (one year or 
more) and/or age (usually a minimum of 18). These 
requirements are designed mainly to keep out high­ 
turnover employees, such as the very young or short­ 
service workers. In practice, however, as a result of 
labour mobility and present vesting, portability, and 
locking-in arrangements, the number of workers 
who qualify for a full pension based on their whole 
lifetime of work may be drastically reduced." This is 
particularly true of private industry, where vesting 
periods are generally much longer than in the public 
sector (see Chapter 7). Once again, the situation is 
worse for women, since they are more concentrated 
in low-paying, high-turnover jobs. 

In 80 per cent of all plans - covering 72 per cent 
of the total membership in 1976 - the age of 
eligibility for full benefits is 65. Again, there are 
differences between private- and public-sector plans. 
In the former, over 93 per cent of the men and some 
82 per cent of the women were in plans with this 
feature, whereas corresponding figures for public­ 
sector plans were only 61 and 56 per cent, respec­ 
tively. Fewer than 11 per cent of all covered workers 
were in plans with an eligibility age of 60, and most 
of these were in the public sector. Moreover, 87 per 
cent of the members in the public sector are in plans 
that provide widow's pensions, compared with only 
33 per cent in the private sector. 
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CHART 2-5 
PERCENTAGE OF PAID WORKERS IN THE LABOUR FORCE COVERED BY PENSION PLANS, BY INDUSTRY, 
CANADA, 1970 AND 1976 . 
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Eligibility conditions for RRSPS are very broad, 
and the number of contributors grew from about. 
348 thousand in 1971 to over 1.4 million in 1977. 
Persons not participating in a registered occupation­ 
al pension plan may contribute 20 per cent of their 
earned income (but no more than $5,500 in 1978) to 
an RRSP, and the contributions qualify as deductions 
from gross income for tax purposes. Members of an 
occupational plan who contribute less than 20 per 
cent of their income (or less than $3,500, whichever 
is lower) may contribute the difference to an RRSP. 
Moreover, in contrast with many private employer­ 
sponsored plans, RRSPS are completely portable. 
Participation in the RRSP program is largely con­ 
fined, however, to taxpayers with relatively higher 
incomes, those most likely to have savings and most 
likely to gain because of their higher marginal tax 
rates. Indeed, RRSPS may be used as much for 
tax-deferral purposes as for retirement savings. 
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As for RHOSPS, all Canadian residents aged 18 
and over may contribute to these plans, provided 
they or their spouses do not own homes. These 
contributions may not exceed $1,000 annually or 
$10,000 over the lifetime of the participants; they 
are specifically for the purchase of a home or for 
home improvement, and they are deductible from 
earned income for taxation purposes. 

Adjustment to Change - Pension benefits that 
may appear to be quite adequate at one time can be 
eroded very quickly if they are not somehow adjust­ 
ed for increases in prices and in real wages. In 
recent years, there has been a growing emphasis in 
Canada on preserving pension benefits, both as they 
accumulate before retirement (we often refer to this 
as pension credits or rights) and as they are paid out 
after retirement, in the face of inflation and rising 
real wages. To some extent, both pension rights and 



benefits paid under the major income-replacement 
schemes have been "dynamized" - that is, more or 
less automatically adjusted for price and wage 
increases. Such protection is less prevalent, however, 
in private-industry plans than in those backed by 
governments. 

Under the Canada and Quebec Pension Plans, 
pension rights are protected in two ways. First, the 
YMPE, which serves as the upper limit of the basis 
for contributions, is to be increased by 12.5 per cent 
a year until it catches up in the 1980s to the 
national average of industrial wages and salaries. 
Subsequently, it will be adjusted upward annually, 
in line with a three-year moving average of those 
wages and salaries. Second, pension rights are 
adjusted for wage and cost-of-living increases by a 
procedure that converts past earnings into current 
dollars, thereby compensating for increases in the 
average wage level. Since 1976, pension benefits 
paid have been adjusted annually to compensate in 
full for cost-of-living increases, as measured by the 
consumer price index. There is no regular procedure 
for adjusting benefits for general wage increases in 
the economy. 
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In occupational plans, preservation of pension 
rights in the face of a rising cost-of-living or real­ 
wage increases depends mainly on the nature of the 
contractual arrangements with employers 
(Table 2-3). The best protection is provided by 
final-average or average-best earnings plans, though 
protection is provided in a less systematic fashion in 
other types of occupational plans.'? In some career­ 
average and flat-benefit plans, the benefit structure 
is periodically updated to compensate for inflation. 
Since many of the flat-benefit plans are the result of 
union negotiations, such updating takes place regu­ 
larly as part of the collective bargaining process. 

The proportion of employees covered by average­ 
best earnings plans has increased in recent years 
(Table 2-4). As recently as 1976, however, only 
about 24 per cent of the members of plans spon­ 
sored by private employers were in this category, 
compared with almost 90 per cent in public-employ­ 
er plans. 

Moreover, because of the prevalence of rather 
long vesting periods and the lack of portability 
among private-employer plans, the expansion of 

TABLE 2-3 
PRE-RETIREMENT PRESERVATION OF PENSION CREDITS AGAINST INFLATION, 
BY TYPE OF PENSION PLAN 

Defined benefit 

Flat benefit 

Defined contribution 
(Money purchase) 

Unit benefit 

Final average Average best Career average 
Final earnings earnings earnings earnings 

Specified percentage of: Method of determin­ 
ing benefits to be 
paid in each year of 
retirement: 

Contributions accu­ 
mulated with interest; 
on retirement life 
annuity purchased 
out of proceeds. 

Specified 
dollar amount ----------------------- 
of benefit for 
each year of 
service. 

A verage earnings 
for total years 
of service for each 
year of service. 

Earnings in last 
year of service 
for each year of 
service. 

Average earnings 
in last specified 
number of years 
of service for 
each year of 
service. 

A verage best 
earnings for 
a specified 
number of years 
of service for 
each year of 
service. 

Percentage of 
covered employees in 
plans in 19761: 4.7 19.7 0.2 3.2 52.8 17.5 

Degree of pre- Only to extent that None, unless Total; but if Almost total. Almost total. Partial. 
retirement preser- final contributions benefit in- final earnings Unaffected by Depends on 
vation of credits: increase. creased arbi- decline, so do decline in final pattern of 

trarily or benefits. earnings. income over 
through collee- career. 
tive bargaining. 

Who bears pre- Member. Mostly mem- Sponsor. Mostly sponsor, Mostly sponsor, Partly by sponsor, 
retirement inflation ber, some by some by some by partly by member. 
losses? sponsor. member. member. 
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TABLE 2-4 

DISTRIBUTION OF MEMBERS COVERED BY MAJOR TYPES OF PUBLIC- AND PRIVATE-SECTOR 
OCCUPATIONAL PENSION PLANS, CANADA, 1960, 1970, AND 1976 

1960 1970 1976 

Public Private Total Public Private Total Public Private Total 

(Per cent) 

Defined-benefit plans 

Final average 15.2 4.0 7.7 6.0 0.8 5.2 3.2 
A verage best 34.0 77.0 18.2 44.7 88.6 23.5 52.8 
Career average 25.1 11.3 34.6 24.1 8.9 24.6 17.5 
Flat benefit 9.5 1.7 26.0 15.0 0.7 35.3 19.7 
Other 0.6 0.5 0.3 0.3 0.2 

Subtotal 84.4 94.0 87.0 90.1 99.0 88.9 93.4 

Money-purchase plans 13.0 0.9 8.1 4.9 0.9 7.8 4.7 

Profit-sharing plans 1.3 1.4 0.8 0.9 0.5 

Other 1.3 5.1 3.5 4.2 0.1 2.4 1.4 

Total 100.0 100.0 100.0 100.0 100.0 100.0 100.0 

best-earnings plans has done little for employees 
who change employers. In most provinces, such 
employees are treated in either of two ways. If their 
benefits are not vested, they will not get back their 
employer's contribution or its benefit equivalent. 
They will receive only their own contributions to the 
plan, with accumulated interest; they can, if they 
wish, then use those funds to purchase an RRSP. If 
their benefits are vested, they must take them in the 
form of a deferred annuity based on final earnings 
or final-average earnings up to the time of the shift. 
They rarely have the option, except in some public­ 
sector plans, of having their past-service credits 
integrated into the benefit formula of their new 
employer's plan. Unlike wages, these annuities will 
not be adjusted upward as prices increase. Thus 
individuals who change employment several times 
during their working career, whether by choice or 
not, would receive much smaller pension benefits 
than those who worked for the same employer for 
all of their career. This would be true even if total 
working years and total contributions were the same 
for both groups, because a deferred annuity (and to 
some extent an RRSP) would be eroded by inflation 
and because average-best earnings over a whole 
career would not apply to the total number of years 
employed. 

The divergence between public- and private-sec­ 
tor plans is even more marked with respect to the 
post-retirement protection of benefits. By 1976, 

some 53 per cent of the members of public-sector 
plans were automatically protected against inflation 
during their retirement years. In contrast, less than 
5 per cent of the membership in private-sector plans 
had this advantage. According to a recent survey of 
large private employers, however, 80 per cent of the 
plans they sponsored (covering more than 80 per 
cent of the total membership of those plans) had 
undertaken some type of post-retirement adjust­ 
ment, usually on an ad hoc basis, at the employer's 
discretion. I I Over the 1971-75 period, this adjust­ 
ment amounted, on average, to 55 per cent of the 
increase in the consumer price index. It should be 
noted that the Public Service Superannuation Act is 
being amended to reduce its indexation to some­ 
thing less than the full annual increase in the CPI. 

Adequacy - In terms of the level of income 
replacement, Canada's public pension plans (includ­ 
ing OAS/GIS, the CPP, and QPp) appeared to fall 
somewhat below those of a number of European 
countries and the United States in 1975, at least 
insofar as an unattached individual earning the 
average manufacturing wage was concerned 
(Chart 2-6). Canada came somewhat higher in rank 
in its treatment of married couples. 

Such international comparisons must, however, 
be treated with great caution. It is difficult, first of 
all, to put the data for each country on a completely 
consistent basis. Secondly, the comparison can 
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and cPp/QPP benefits combined now replace slightly 
more than one-third of the pre-retirement income of 
unattached individuals and close to three-fifths that 
of individuals whose spouses were never in the 
labour force. When the replacement rate is calculat­ 
ed on the basis of after-tax income, it increases 
slightly for a single individual and somewhat more 
for a married couple. The replacement rate in both 
cases is higher still for those with pre-retirement 
incomes that are below the national industrial aver­ 
age wage, and below it for those above that average. 

Nevertheless, some 40 per cent of Canada's older 
workers experience a drop in before-tax income of 
roughly one-quarter after retirement (Table 2-5). 
They are mainly women and semiskilled, nonunion­ 
ized workers who are not well covered by occupa­ 
tional plans and do not benefit fully from public 
plans. Research carried out in the United States 
suggests that 86 per cent of the pre-retirement 
income is required to prevent a post-retirement drop 
in the standard of living." 

The introduction of the CPP and QPP has gone a 
long way to redress some of the worst of the pension 
inequities, and the combination of these plans with 
OAS and GIS, with benefits indexed to the consumer 
price index, provides the elderly with a reasonable 
post-retirement income floor. But, despite these 
initiatives, the income of many pensioners is below 
the poverty line. In 1977, some 20 per cent of 
families with heads aged 65 and over were in the 
low-income category as defined by Statistics 
Canada, while 60 per cent of all unattached elderly 

80% people were in that same category." 

CHART 2-6 
PRE-RETIREMENT EARNINGS REPLACEDI BY PUBLIC 
INCOME SECURITY PLANS, SELECTED COUNTRIES, 
1975 
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change from year to year since the way in which 
pension systems adjust to movements in prices and 
real wages may differ among countries. Canada's 
replacement ratio shifts very little in response to 
such changes, whereas in some other countries ~ 
West Germany, Sweden, and Belgium, for 
example ~ the ratio increases with real wages; 
indeed, preliminary estimates suggest that Canada's 
international rank has declined since 1975. Finally, 
a more comprehensive comparison of adequacy 
would also look at such factors as age of entitle­ 
ment, the level of income on which replacement is 
based, tax provisions that may augment or modify 
the income of the elderly, and the availability of 
private occupational pensions. 

For older people whose pre-retirement wages are 
equal to the national industrial average, OAS/GIS 

o 60 20 40 

A high proportion of those below the poverty line 
are unattached women. Their chances of being in 
this position are much greater than the national 
average if they are over 70 and live in the Atlantic 
provinces or Quebec. Of the Atlantic provinces, only 
Nova Scotia has a provincial "top-up" program to 
supplement the basic OAS/GIS payment. A major 
reason for the high incidence of low incomes among 
the old, especially among older women, is that they 
have not had adequate opportunities to build up 
earnings-related pension entitlements. 

MENDING THE HOLES 

Few would deny that action is needed to remove 
some of the deficiencies in the present retirement 
income system. But there is another side to the 
story. Improving benefit levels or extending them to 
groups not now covered, and providing better pro­ 
tection against price or wage changes, will not be 
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received exceed current benefits paid out. The 
excess - the accumulated reserves - has been 
available to the provinces for various purposes. 
Recent estimates indicate that by the mid-1980s 
current contributions will equal benefits paid out, so 
that the funds will not increase thereafter. Unless 
contribution rates are raised, payment of subsequent 
benefits will then draw down the reserve funds. 
Under existing arrangements - without any further 
increases in benefit levels - these funds would 
disappear early in the coming century. 

TABLE 2-5 

AVERAGE INCOME BEFORE TAX OF PERSONS AGED 65 TO 74 YEARS BEFORE AND AFTER 
RETIREMENT, BY INCOME QUINTILE, CANADA, 1975 

Average income (Constant 1975 dollars) 

Pre-retirement] Post-retirement (2) as % of (I) 
(I) (2) (3) 

Income quintile: 
First, lower-income 2,162 2,083 96.3 
Second 5,282 3,877 73.4 
Third 8,234 6,301 76.5 
Fourth 11,799 9,946 84.3 
Fifth, upper-income 21,939 20,233 92.2 

costless. The problem will be accentuated in the 
future by the very large increase in the size of the 
older population relative to the numbers still in the 
work force. There is concern, too, that the attempt 
to achieve adequate benefits will conflict with other 
goals, including economic growth. 

FINANCING RETIREMENT PROGRAMS 

In contrast with the OAS and GIS programs, which 
are financed out of general taxation revenues, the 
Canada and Quebec Pension Plans are financed by 
payroll contributions from employers and 
employees - at present, each pays 1.8 per cent of 
the employee's pensionable earnings - and by the 
interest earnings of the plans' reinvested funds. The 
contribution rates are significantly lower than those 
of public plans in Europe, as a result of both the 
immaturity of the Canadian system and its lower 
benefit levels. The latter in turn reflect the stated 
objective of the Canadian plans not to discourage 
the provision of pension protection by the private 
sector. 

The majority of public-sector occupational plans 
also depend upon contributions from both employers 
and employees. In the private sector, noncontributo­ 
ry schemes - that is, plans financed by the contri­ 
butions of employers only - represented less than 
24 per cent of all plans but as many as 47 per cent 
of the members of private-sector occupational 
schemes in 1976. Employee contribution rates also 
vary a great deal, although they average about 6 per 
cent of gross salary or wages in the public sector 
and perhaps closer to 5 per cent in the private 
sector. 

The CPP and QPP are now partially funded in the 
sense that, in the aggregate, current contributions 

In the case of employer-sponsored occupational 
plans, private employers are generally required by 
law to aim for full funding; that is, within certain 
limits, accumulated assets must match benefits 
promised to date, and contribution rates are set 
accordingly. Public-sector occupational plans exhib­ 
it more variation. The largest of these, the federal 
Public Service Superannuation plan, provides regu­ 
lar benefits plus supplementary payments - the 
latter at present being fully indexed against infla­ 
tion. The regular benefits are fully matched by 
obligations of the federal government, again with 
contributions set accordingly. The supplementary 
price-indexed benefits, however, are not matched in 
the same way; as noted earlier, legislation limiting 
the indexed benefits was introduced, though not 
passed, by the last Parliament. 

There are two major concerns in connection with 
financing arrangements. The first is that taxes to 
finance OAS and GIS benefits, and payroll contribu­ 
tions to finance the CPP and QPP, will have to rise as 
the number of the elderly rises, even without further 
increases in benefit levels. And, for plans such as 
those sponsored by private employers, which are 
already fully funded, contributions will have to 
increase if there are further improvements in ben­ 
efits. Rising taxes and contribution rates have 



implications for the workers of the future and for 
the competitive position of Canadian industry. 

The second concern relates to the method of 
funding. Questions have been raised about the possi- 

. bility that pay-as-you-go partly funded schemes 
reduce incentives to save and to work and, in turn, 
the rate of economic growth. Lower levels of GNP in 
the future would make it more difficult to achieve 
adequate retirement benefits. 

INVESTMENT OF FUNDS 

Since pension plans are already so large in 
Canada, the way that any surplus of contributions 
over current benefits is invested could have a signifi­ 
cant împact on the allocation of savings in the 
economy (see Chapter 6). The surplus funds of the 
CPP are loaned to the provinces in proportion to the 
contributions paid by their residents, at interest 
rates related to the average paid on Government of 
Canada bonds of similar (long-term) maturity. The 
provinces have used the funds for both specific and 
general purposes." As for the QPP surplus, it is 
invested through the "general fund" of the Caisse 
de dépôt et placement du Québec. In the past, only 
about two-thirds of those funds (69 per cent in 
1977) have gone into government securities, princi­ 
pally those of the Province of Quebec. The remain­ 
der have been invested in corporate securities, mort­ 
gages, real estate projects, and various short-term 
investments. 

The funds of nontrusteed government-employee 
pension plans - the consolidated-revenue plans - 
are used for the general purposes of the sponsoring 
government. As far as trusteed funds are concerned, 
government securities form a considerably higher 
proportion of the total investments of public-sector 
than of private-sector schemes. The latter, on the 
other hand, invest more in corporate securities. 

In connection with the use of pension savings, 
concern has been expressed that too high a propor­ 
tion is already being captured by governments, 
much of it bypassing the financial markets entirely. 
It has been suggested that this may make it more 
difficult for business to raise funds from domestic 
sources and that it will increase the inflow of foreign 
capital. There is concern, too, that pension savings 
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are concentrated in too few hands, with implications 
for capital market efficiency, and that industry may 
eventually be controlled to a large extent by pension 
funds. 

CONCLUSION 

Canada's system of income security for elderly 
people has made major advances in recent years, 
particularly since the mid-1960s. Yet the expansion 
of the system has made people even more aware of 
its problems and deficiencies. 

There are indeed problems. There are strongly 
conflicting views about the adequacy of the system; 
while some Canadians have done very well under it, 
others have been left behind. There are many old 
people still in poverty, particularly older women. 
There are disparities of treatment, insofar as 
income-replacement plans are concerned, between 
employees in the public and private sectors, particu­ 
larly those in small private-sector firms; between 
mobile workers and those who remain a long time 
with the same employer; and between men and 
women. The establishment of the CPP and QPP has 
helped to redress some of the inequities, but many 
gaps remain, especially in the private-employer pen­ 
sion plans. 

Alleviation of these problems cannot, however, be 
discussed sensibly without reference to cost - cost 
in terms of taxes, contribution rates, and other goals 
such as economic growth. In order to determine the 
appropriate mix of programs that will reconcile 
these conflicting objectives and to achieve some 
level of "adequate" benefits at the least possible cost 
in the future, we must learn a great deal more about 
the impact of the present system or of possible 
changes therein. How will costs vary under different 
assumptions about population and program mix? 
What mix of public and private programs will best 
satisfy the several, sometimes conflicting, objectives 
at the same time? In answering these questions, 
care must be taken to avoid putting undue emphasis 
on present, perhaps temporary, problems. Care must 
also be taken to give due consideration to future 
circumstances - such as significantly higher aver­ 
age real wages or the presence of many more better­ 
educated individuals - in deciding on the general 
policy thrust. 



3 The Pension Mountain 

To many Canadians, the problems of the aged are 
someone else's. While concern has been expressed 
about the effects of changes in the age structure of 
the overall population, interest has focused on the 
immediate problems of today's younger groups and 
on such issues as the expansion of the education 
system or the lack of employment opportunities for 
an expanding labour force. Indeed, we concentrate 
here on these same groups, but our time horizon 
differs: we seek to determine how they will fare 30, 
40, or 50 years hence, when the "baby boom" that 
occurred after the Second World War matures into 
the "pension mountain."! 

To approach this question, we examine the demo­ 
graphic block of the broad framework suggested in 
Chart 1-1, as well as its links with the economic 
system. The size and composition of Canada's popu­ 
lation depend on the number of births and deaths 
and on net immigration. By and large, death rates 
and life expectancy change only slowly, while 
changes in immigration and, to an even greater 
extent, in fertility and birth rates can be expected to 
produce more rapid population shifts. Such shifts 
have implications for the economy in terms of both 
the demands that are placed on it - notably the 
cost of supporting nonworking members of the 
population - and its ability to meet those demands. 

Demographic projections are subject to many 
uncertainties, however, and these increase as the 
projection period is extended into the future. Long­ 
range planning requires preparation for the unex­ 
pected through a "distant early warning" system 
enabling policy-makers to detect the first signs of 
changes that might affect the economy and society 
as a whole. To provide one element of such a 
system, the Council has studied a variety of popula­ 
tion and labour force growth projections, three of 
which - high, medium, and low - are used here.' 
The projections incorporate a wide range of 
assumptions - some of them rather extreme - 
about birth rates, life expectancy, immigration, and 

labour force participation, in order that factors 
having the greatest influence on the size and age 
composition of Canada's future population and 
work force may be revealed. In other words, the 
projections are designed less to portray the most 
likely trends of the future than to illustrate what 
would happen if birth rates, for example, moved 
towards either extreme. It is worth noting, however, 
that Statistics Canada's most recent population pro­ 
jections fall between the Council's medium and low 
projections; indeed, they appear to be closer to the 
latter.' 

THE OLD, THE YOUNG, 
AND THE WORK FORCE 

The number of old people will grow considerably 
in Canada in the future. It is a sobering thought 
that those who will be 65 years old or over in the 
year 2031 - roughly the point at which the coming 
shift in age composition will reach its peak - are 
already alive and that their future numbers will be 
affected only by migration or death. Based on the 
medium projection, the number in the 65-and-over 
group will more than triple in the intervening 
period, to reach 7 million by 2031, while the number 
of much older people (aged 75 and over) - particu­ 
larly women - will increase even more rapidly 
(Charts 3-1 and 3-2). Support for those 7 million, as 
well as for young dependants, must come from the 
work force at that time (which could include some 
of the older people). It is more difficult, however, to 
predict the size of that work force and of the 
young-dependant cohort in the year 2031. 

Our projections suggest that there will be a sharp 
increase in the number of those aged 65 and over 
relative to those of work-force age - 20 to 64 - at 
least until about the year 2031 (Chart 3-3). This 
increase is more pronounced, the slower the popula­ 
tion growth assumed. If the present trend towards 
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CHART 3-1 
DISTRIBUTION OF OLDER POPULATION, BY MAJOR 
AGE GROUP, CANADA, 1976 TO 2051 
(Medium population growth projection) 
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CHART 3-2 
DISTRIBUTION OF OLDER POPULATION, BY AGE 2041 
GROUP AND BY SEX, CANADA, 1976 TO 2051 
(Medium population growth projection) 
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earlier retirement continues and the normal retire­ 
ment age declines to 60, the shift in the older-gener­ 
ation/Iabour-force ratio could become very large 
indeed (Chart 3-4). Numerically, however, the 
increasing potential "burden" on the work force is 

CHART 3-3 
POPIJLATION AGED 65 AND OVER PER 1,000 PERSONS 
AGED 20 TO 64, CANADA, 1976 TO 2051 

(Population growth projections) 
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likely to be offset to some extent by a decline in the 
number of young dependants, at least until early in 
the next century (Chart 3-5). Of course, some mem­ 
bers of the younger and older groups participate in 
the work force, while some of those in the prime-age 
group do not. When allowance is made for these 
differences in participation rates, the increase in the 
ratio of potential nonworkers to workers is smaller 
(Chart 3-6). 

It should be noted that Canada is not the only 
country whose population is aging. The proportion 
of the total population who will be 65 years of age 
or over in the year 2001 will still be lower in Canada 
than it was in many European countries in 1975 
(Chart 3-7). Our projections suggest, however, that 
by the second decade of the coming century this 
country will experience the same high levels of 
aging as now exist in Europe; by 2031 it will surpass 
them. 



CHART 3-4 
POPULATION AGED 60 AND OVER PER 1,000 PERSONS 
AGED 20 TO 59, CANADA, 1976 TO 2051 

(Population growth projections) 
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THE DEMANDS ON THE ECONOMY 

For the work force, the costs of supporting the old 
and the young are far more significant than the 
actual numbers in each group. In fact, the use of 
such numbers as an indication of cost can be quite 
misleading because the needs of, and expenditures 
on, the young and the old differ considerably. To 
provide at least an approximate indication of the 
cost of support in the future, it is useful to calculate 
the proportion of total output that would go to both 
groups under various demographic and policy 
assumptions. How difficult it would be to provide 
that proportion would also depend on the actual 
level of GNP and on how the costs would be shared 
by 'various groups of the population, including the 
older people themselves. 
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The costs of supporting the young and the old 
may be either private or public. Unfortunately, 
information on private expenditures is almost 
nonexistent. On the other hand, there are a number 
of studies on the effect of the changing age composi­ 
tion of the population on public expenditures for 
both Canada and the United States. The evidence 
suggests that public expenditures per capita are 
roughly three times as great for the old as for the 
young.' This divergence is likely to increase for 
several reasons - among them, the growing politi­ 
cal strength of the older groups, the general pres­ 
sure to improve income security for the elderly, the 
growing interest in education and other services for 
them, and the fact that health care expenditures are 
greater for the much older. 

CHART 3-5 
POPULATION AGED 19 AND UNDER PER 1,000 PERSONS 
AGED 20 TO 64, CANADA, 1976 TO 2051 

(Population growth projections) 
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Total, both age groups 

CHART 3-6 
INACTIVE AS A PROPORTION OF ACTIVE POPULATION,I CANADA, 1976 TO 2051 
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For present purposes, we have projected total 
retirement benefits under various assumptions about 
benefit levels and age of eligibility as if they were 
provided by an expanded version of the existing 
public system. In other words, our projections allow 
for complete coverage of the older population by 
basic-income programs and for complete coverage 
of the labour force by programs designed to replace 
some specified percentage of earnings. The fact that 
such coverage is not complete and that it differs 
greatly among occupational plans is, of course, one 
major reason why the existing retirement income 
system should be changed or expanded. The 
approach in this chapter enables us to focus atten­ 
tion on the scope for improving coverage and ben­ 
efits either while remaining within given cost limits 
or by altering the way in which costs are divided 
between present workers (future pensioners) and 
future workers. 
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We emphasize again that these scenarios are not 
intended to describe any "most likely" outcome. 
Rather, they are designed to reveal which factors 
have the greatest influence on the system and should 
therefore be monitored regularly for policy planning 
purposes. They are designed also to provide a quan­ 
titative measure of the impact on the economy of 
some of the policy changes that have been suggested 
by various groups. 

Gross national product was projected under the 
same demographic assumptions as benefits and at 
an annual rate of increase in real output per worker 
(and real wages) of 1.8 per cent. The real output (or 
productivity) assumption is the average annual 
increase over the past decade, but any such assump­ 
tion must be treated with great caution, particularly 
when it is projected for many years ahead. In 
several of its reports the Council has pointed to the 



CHART 3-7 
POPULATION AGED 65 AND OVER AS A PROPORTION 
OF TOTAL POPULATION, SELECTED COUNTRIES IN 
1975 AND CANADA FROM 1976 TO 2031 
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necessity of raising productivity growth above its 
recent levels, and further work on this subject is 
already under way. If the level of benefits is fixed in 
terms of the average real wage, however, their share 
of GNP should vary only if the number of people 
eligible for such payments changes relative to the 
number of workers. In Canada, at present, the 
accumulation of benefits to the point of retirement 
is in fact linked to real wages to a large extent, and 
this feature is reflected in our projections; the 
growth of benefits as a proportion of GNP slows very 
little as productivity increases.' 

THE COST OF INCOME SECURITY 
FOR OLDER PEOPLE 

Even at the present target level of income replace­ 
ment provided by the CPP and QPP, and with OAS 
payments continuing to bear the same relationship 
to the average industrial wage as in 1978 (providing 
a combined replacement ratio of about 39 per cent 
for an unmarried worker earning the average indus­ 
trial wage), Canada's public expenditures on income 
support for the aged as a share of GNP will rise in 
the future because the number of eligible people will 
increase faster than that of people in the labour 
force. Under our medium demographic growth 
assumptions, this share would increase from about 
3 per cent in 1976 to over 7 per cent in the 
year 2031, with the most rapid rise occurring in the 

The Pension Mountain 27 

20% 

second and third decades of the twenty-first cen­ 
tury. After 2031 it would stabilize at a slightly 
lower level (Chart 3-8). 

If population growth follows the low path, how­ 
ever, benefits to the elderly could represent as much 
as 10 per cent of GNP by 2031, given the present 
income-replacement ratio and age of eligibility 
(Chart 3-9). It is worth noting though that this 
figure is not too much out of line with that observed 
in some European countries at the beginning of the 
present decade - and GNP in those countries is 
much below what Canada should expect in the 
future (Table 3-1). If the income-replacement ratio 
were increased to 75 per cent through changes in 
the CPP and QPP programs, benefits would rise to 
about 12 per cent of GNP with medium population 
growth and to over 17 per cent with low population 
growth (Chart 3-10). If the income-replacement 
ratio were maintained at its present level but the age 
of eligibility were lowered to 60, the share of ben­ 
efits could range from about 7 per cent of GNP in 
the high-growth projection to over 14 per cent in the 
low-growth projection (Chart 3-9). Finally, if the 
replacement ratio were increased and the eligible 
age lowered, the share would rise to much higher 
levels indeed (Chart 3-10). 

Some of these changes will appear much less 
extreme if it is recalled that the present occupation­ 
al pension system, when added to existing CPP and 
QPP benefits, produces, for some people at least, 

CHART 3-8 
EXPENDITURES ON PUBLIC RETIREMENT INCOME 
PROGRAMSI AS A PROPORTION OF GNP, CANADA, 
1976 TO 2051 
(Medium demographic growth projection) 
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CHART 3-9 
EXPENDITURES ON PUBLIC RETIREMENT INCOME 
PROGRAMS] AS A PROPORTION OF GNP, UNDER 
VARIOUS DEMOGRAPHIC GROWTH ASSUMPTIONS 
AND BY AGE OF ELIGIBILITY FOR BENEFITS, CANADA, 
2031 
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income-replacement ratios substantially above those 
provided by the public schemes. On the other hand, 
it is well to remember also that the cost estimates 
above are based on projections of the labour force; 
thus they do not make allowance for any direct 
accumulation of benefits by one large group at 
least - full-time housewives. 

Our projections do suggest that this problem will 
be less severe in the future, since they call for a 
substantial increase in the labour force participation 
rates of women." Nevertheless, should existing 
retirement arrangements continue, women working 
in the home will be the largest group excluded from 
accumulating their own income-replacement ben­ 
efits. To make this group eligible for the average 
retirement benefit received by women in the labour 
force would involve something like a 20 per cent 
increase in our projected income-replacement ben­ 
efits by 1991 and 5 per cent by 2031. Such increases 
would be partly offset by a decline in GIS 
payments - a reflection of the growth of income­ 
replacement plans - although by 2031 those pay­ 
ments would be so small in any event that the effect 
would be insignificant. 

TOTAL DEPENDENCY COSTS 

Some analysts have suggested that the total gov­ 
ernment spending on dependants could remain rea- 

CHART 3-10 
EXPENDITURES ON PUBLIC RETIREMENT INCOME 
PROGRAMS] AS A PROPORTION OF GNP, UNDER 
VARIOUS DEMOGRAPHIC GROWTH ASSUMPTIONS 
AND BY INCOME REPLACEMENT RATIO AND AGE OF 
ELIGIBILITY FOR BENEFITS, CANADA, 2031 
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sonably stable, since declining outlays on the young 
would offset increased expenditures on the older 
generations. Several areas of public expenditure 
other than income security for the elderly are also 
sensitive to the age composition of the population - 
notably health, education, and various social assist­ 
ance programs.' On a per capita basis, health expen­ 
ditures for the 65-and-over group, for example, are 
now roughly seven times as great as for the under- 
18 group. In 1971, persons in the former group 
accounted for only 8 per cent of the total population 



TABLE 3-1 

INTERNATIONAL COMPARISON OF AGE 
COMPOSITION AND PUBLIC OLD AGE BENEFITS, 
1970-711 

Persons aged 65 
and over as a 
proportion of 

total population 
1970 

Old age, death, 
and survivor's 
benefits as a 

proportion of GDP 
1971 

(Per cent) 

Netherlands 10.1 8.4 
West Germany 13.3 8.0 
France 12.8 6.8 
Italy 10.6 6.6 
Belgium 13.3 6.5 
United Kingdom 12.8 4.7 
United States 9.6 4.2 
Sweden 13.6 3.4 
Canada? 7.8 2.1 

but for 35 per cent of patient-days in hospital.' 
Education expenditures are, of course, presently 
devoted almost entirely to the younger age groups. 
Expenditures per capita on social assistance 
(excluding retirement income) are slightly higher 
for the young than for the old. 

Projections of expenditures in these areas are 
sensitive to assumptions about the level of service 
provided and the effect of increases in productivity 
or real wages. The Council has projected depen­ 
dency costs (other than those of pensions) by assum­ 
ing that 1976 levels of service would be maintained. 
For education, this implies that teacher jpupil ratios 
and the proportion of the 15-19 age group in post­ 
secondary educational institutions will remain at 
their 1976 levels. Increases in these ratios would, of 
course, entail even higher expenditures. Our projec­ 
tions assume, too, that wages in the health and 
education areas will increase in line with real wages 
in the overall economy. 

The projections indicate that if there were no 
productivity increase in the health and education 
fields themselves and if the level of social assistance 
payments increased in line with real wages, total 
public expenditures on both the old and the young 
would still increase substantially until about 2031 
(Chart 3-11). Declining (under low demographic 
growth) or more or less stable (under medium or 
high demographic growth) expenditures on the 
younger age groups would partially offset rising 
expenditures on the older group until the beginning 
of the coming century. After the year 2010, pension 
costs and health expenditures on older people would 
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rise more rapidly, particularly if demographic 
trends followed the patterns assumed in the low­ 
growth scenario. Although expenditures on the 
young might decline in the critical 2011-31 period 
under this scenario, that reduction would not be 
sufficient to offset the sharply rising costs of the 
expenditures devoted to the aged. 

The increase in pension expenditures would, how­ 
ever, be outweighed by declines in theother catego­ 
ries, at least under high and medium demographic 
growth, if productivity in the health and education 
fields increased as rapidly as in the economy gener­ 
ally and the level of social assistance payments were 
indexed to prices only, with service levels held con­ 
stant. What is most likely, of course, is that there 
will be some increase in productivity in these areas 
and some improvement in the levels of services, so 
that the end results will fall somewhere between our 
two limits. 

DEMOGRAPHIC CHANGES, 
TOTAL OUTPUT, 

AND OUTPUT PER PERSON 

Our work thus suggests that it would be unwise to 
depend too much upon the decline in expenditures 
on younger age groups to compensate for the 
expected increase in support costs for older people. 
We have also noted that the share of total output 
required for retirement income programs is, under 
existing pension arrangements in Canada, largely 
independent of the growth in real output per worker. 
The more rapid that growth and the higher the level 
of GNP per capita in the future, however, the less 
difficult it will be to provide any given share to older 
people. 

Even if there were no formal system of income 
support for older people, the changing age composi­ 
tion of the population would have some impact on 
economic growth. To understand why, one must 
look at the sources of growth: the quantity and 
quality of labour and capital inputs, and the effi­ 
ciency with which labour and capital are combined 
in the production process (total factor productivity). 

Even if the average work week or working life is 
not shorter in the future than it is today, the quanti­ 
ty of labour inputs will increase more and more 
slowly in the years ahead, particularly after the 
beginning of the coming century (Chart 3-12). 
Other things being equal, this factor, which has 
been taken into account in the projections discussed 
above, would slow the potential growth of the econo­ 
my and the rise in real income per person. 
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Assuming the Same Productivity Increase in Health and Education 
as in the Economy in General! 

CHART 3-11 
PUBLIC EXPENDITURES ON MAJOR PROGRAMS I FOR THE YOUNGER AND OLDER AGE GROUPS AS A 
PROPORTION OF GNP, UNDER VARIOUS DEMOGRAPHIC GROWTH AND PRODUCTIVITY 
ASSUMPTIONS, CANADA, 1981 TO 2051 

Assuming No Productivity Increase in Health and Education' 
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Other things will not be equal, however. The 
slower increase in the quantity of labour is likely to 
be offset at first by an improvement in its quality. 
The stock of education in the labour force will rise 
as older people with lower levels of education are 
replaced by younger people with many more years 
of schooling. This positive influence on growth is 
likely to stabilize early in the next century 
(Chart 3-13), but the increased average age of 
workers will mean that, quite apart from education 
attainment, the work force will be generally more 
experienced and skilled. 

Slower growth in the labour force could also be 
associated with slower growth in capital inputs, not 
so much because of an adverse impact of age com­ 
position on saving, but because there will be fewer 
workers to equip with any given amount of ma­ 
chinery and equipment. On balance, we conclude 
that population aging in itself is likely to lead to 
some downward pressure on the potential growth of 
the economy in terms of real income per person, 
particularly after the year 2000. 

CHART 3-12 
AVERAGE ANNUAL INCREASE IN LABOUR FORCE, 
BY DECADE, CANADA, 1961 TO 2051 

(Medium demographic growth projection) 
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COMPENSATING DEMOGRAPHIC AND 
MANPOWER POLICIES 

It seems, therefore, that Canada is about to face a 
period in which income security costs f~r t~e elde~ly 
as a share of gross national product Will rise, while 
GNP may grow more slowly, simply as a re~ult of t~e 
changing age structure of the population. This 
underlines the importance of examining the impact 
of the system itself on the growth of the economy. 

Should a low-demographic-growth scenario 
evolve, there would be pressure to reduce the share 

CHART 3-13 
MEDIAN YEARS OF SCHOOLING, BY MAJOR AGE 
GROUP, CANADA, 1976 TO 2051 

(Medium population growth projection) 
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of GNP devoted to programs of income security for 
the aged or to promote greater reliance on the 
efforts of individuals to meet their own needs. This 
could be done in various ways: by reducing the 
benefits granted under the public schemes, increas­ 
ing the age of eligibility for benefits under those 
schemes, moving towards full funding of the public 
schemes, increasing the importance of private (fully 
funded) plans, or increasing the work force (or, 
more accurately, the supply of labour) relative to 
the number of those eligible for retirement benefits. 
The last of these alternatives would undoubtedly be 
considered the most desirable by many Canadians; 
indeed, it has sometimes been suggested that 
changes in this direction would resolve much of the 
problem, should it arise. Once again, unfortunately, 
our work indicates that such action is likely to be of 
limited value. 

Policy action to stimulate growth of the work 
force in the critical period in the coming century 
would have to centre on immigration and/or 
increased labour force participation. Immigration 
policy is not likely to be dominated by labour force 
considerations; but, even if it were, a very large 
increase in net immigration - well beyond anything 
Canada has ever experienced, except perhaps in the 
early decades of this century - would be required 
to bring about even a small reduction in the GNP 
share of the retirement income programs. Increasing 
labour force participation would provide somewhat 
more scope for action, but even that would be of 
limited value. We noted earlier that the retirement 
income programs would reach just over 7 per cent of 
GNP by 2031, assuming moderate population growth 
and maintenance of the present age of eligibility and 
income-replacement ratio. To reduce this share by 
only I percentage point would necessitate an addi­ 
tional 2.8 million workers in the labour force and no 
extra retirees by 2031. To accomplish this would 
require anyone of the following: 1/ an increase in 
net immigration in the decade prior to 2031 from 
80,000 to 640,000, assuming, as is now the case, 
that only half of the immigrants would be of work­ 
force age; 2/ an increase in the participation rate of 
those aged 65 and over from our projected rate of 
4.7 per cent for that year to about 44 per cent (this 
would be much higher than the 1976 rate of 9.5 per 
cent for this group - indeed, higher than it has ever 
been for the group); 3/ an increase in the participa­ 
tion rate of those aged 55 and over from a projected 
rate of 21 per cent to 47 per cent (the rate for this 
group was 32 per cent in 1976); or 4/ an increase in 
the participation rate of women aged 20 to 64 from 
the projected 60 per cent to almost 87 per cent (the 
1976 rate for this group was 53.2 per cent). Some 

less extreme changes in these factors might certain­ 
ly be considered in combination, although this 
would not change our general conclusion. 

CONCLUSION 

Canada's older population is increasing, causing 
the costs of income security to rise. More important, 
the older generation is growing relative to those who 
are actively working. Thus demands on the econo­ 
my, in the form of higher income security costs for 
older people, will be rising at a time when its 
productive capabilities, in terms of labour inputs at 
least, will be growing more slowly. Our projections 
indicate too, however, that there is considerable 
scope for improving benefits over present levels 
without huge increases in the required proportion of 
GNP. But the lower the rate of population growth, 
the less that scope and the more likely that Canadi­ 
ans will face hard choices in setting priorities for 
improvement. 

The most critical period will be roughly between 
2010 and 2030. Although that may seem a long way 
off, it is well to remember that many of the Canadi­ 
ans who will retire in that period are already in the 
work force. If Canada's system of income security 
for the aged is to be altered, whether for demo­ 
graphic or other reasons, changes will have to be 
announced well in advance so that people can take 
them into account when planning for their 
retirement. 

The Council's work suggests that it would be 
unwise to pin too much hope on the possibility that 
decreasing costs in other areas will offset the 
increasing absolute and relative levels of income 
security costs for the elderly. The decline in the 
number of younger dependants will be of some 
assistance in the next two or three decades, though 
not beyond that period. In any event, since support 
costs are much greater for the old than for the 
young, total dependency costs are likely to continue 
to increase; they may even accelerate during the 
critical period mentioned above. 

Given the existing system of income security for 
older people, it will be difficult to lower significantly 
the proportion of GNP devoted to these programs, 
either through an increase in real output per worker 
(if benefits are to be more or less fixed relative to 



real wages) or through immigration policy. 
Increased labour force participation rates offer 
somewhat more scope, although even that is limited. 

A higher rate of economic growth - as measured 
by growth in real income per capita - whether it 
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results from increased participation rates or from 
increased real output per worker, will alleviate the 
burden of transferring any particular proportion of 
GNP to older people. Beyond that, there remains a 
range of options for dividing the cost between 
present workers (future pensioners) and the future 
work force. 



4 Who Pays? Who Benefits? 

The choice of a given option from a range of 
alternative programs designed to provide income 
security for the elderly depends in part upon know­ 
ing who will benefit from a particular program and 
who will pay for it. A retirement income system 
may transfer or redistribute wealth between differ­ 
ent age groups and between individuals in the same 
age group. As a result, some may receive benefits in 
excess of their own contributions, while others may 
receive amounts that fall short of their contribu­ 
tions. Within limits, such transfers are likely to be 
publicly acceptable. If pushed too far, however, the 
system could be judged unfair and could break 
down. This redistribution of wealth may affect the 
economy by influencing the choices that people 
make between saving and consumption or between 
work and leisure. This feature raises the possibility 
of conflict with other goals such as economic 
growth-a conflict that might in turn jeopardize the 
objective of income support itself. It may be impos­ 
sible to reconcile these goals completely; opinions 
will always differ as to their relative importance. 
Nevertheless, by searching out the most efficient 
combination of alternative programs - one that 
will achieve the desired level of income for older 
people with the least loss of total output - the 
scope for conflict can be reduced. 

Of course, many government programs have 
redistributional features. Education and health ex­ 
penditures, far more than pension plans, may redis­ 
tribute income between generations. Ideally, the 
effects of a particular set of programs should not be 
examined in isolation. Thus it is important to keep 
in mind that retirement income programs may rein­ 
force or offset the effects of programs in other 
policy areas. But that proviso should not prevent us 
from using the information that is available to 
examine the distributive effects of the plans that are 
the prime focus here. 

REDISTRIBUTION OF WEALTH 

How government programs redistribute 
income - or, perhaps more accurately, wealth - is 
easily illustrated.' Suppose that A pays $50 in tax 
towards a particular program but receives $100 in 
benefits while B, who has a higher income and can 
afford to pay more, pays $100 in tax but receives 
only $50 in benefits; as a result of the tax-transfer 
process, $50 is redistributed from B to A. 

GENERAL CONSIDERATIONS 

A retirement income system may redistribute 
wealth not only between age groups (intergenera­ 
tional transfers) but also between individuals in the 
same age group (intragenerational transfers). In 
this case, the redistribution is slightly more difficult 
to measure because it involves an inflow of contribu­ 
tions (or taxes) into the system in one period and an 
outflow of benefits over a later period. To compare 
the values of the two flows, it is necessary to put 
them on a common basis by calculating, for a 
particular point in time, the present value of each 
flow (see Appendix D). If the present value of an 
individual's contributions is not equal to that of the 
benefits he or she will eventually receive, redistribu­ 
tion of wealth is said to occur.' 

If the individuals belonging to a given age 
group - say, all persons born between 1925 and 
1929 - stand to receive more in benefits than they 
pay into the scheme, they are considered to be the 
recipients of a net intergenerational transfer. If, in a 
particular age group, individuals with low incomes 
receive greater benefits net of contributions (again, 
calculated on a present-value basis), than people 
with high incomes, they are said to receive a net 
intragenerational transfer of wealth. 
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Net intergenerational transfers will normally 
arise largely in the context of pension plans that are 
less than fully funded, although they are also possi­ 
ble in fully funded plans. Under a fully funded plan, 
each age group pays for its own benefits out of its 
accumulated contributions. At the other extreme, 
under a pay-as-you-go plan, the contributions of the 
current work force are only sufficient to pay for the 
benefits of those already retired; in other words, 
such plans are based entirely on an intergeneration­ 
al transfer. Whether or not a particular age group is 
a net beneficiary of wealth through such transfers, 
however, depends upon other factors. There is a net 
intergenerational transfer, for instance, when full 
benefits are extended to people retiring at the begin­ 
ning, or during the early years, of a plan, even 
though they have contributed relatively little, or 
maybe nothing, to it. Indeed, this "blanketing-in" 
effect, as it is known, is one of the reasons that 
governments adopt pay-as-you-go plans. 

Once a plan has reached maturity - that is, 
when the first of those who have paid contributions 
for the full prescribed period begin to retire - the 
type of redistribution described above ceases, pro­ 
vided the rate of interest at which funds in the 
economy can be invested is equal to the rate of 
growth of aggregate earnings.' If this condition does 
not obtain, there will be a further net intergenera­ 
tional redistribution of wealth under any scheme 
that is less than fully funded. 

The maintenance of pay-as-you-go schemes 
depends, in the last analysis, upon a series of inter­ 
locking redistributive promises: Generation B in 
effect promises to support Generation A, so long as 
they believe that Generation C will do the same for 
them, and so on. Even if per capita output were to 
remain constant, no problem would arise provided 
the ratio of workers to pensioners was constant or 
rising. To get the same benefits, each successive 
group would have to contribute the same amount if 
the ratio were constant, or less if it were rising. But 
if the ratio of workers to pensioners is declining - 
as it is in Canada at present - the contributions 
from the current work force must be increased to 
maintain even the same level of benefits for succes­ 
sive groups of retirees. Naturally, increasing the 
benefit level would involve still higher contribution 
rates. Eventually, the workers could end up paying 
very high rates and contributing more than they 
could expect to receive in benefits. At some point, 
they might reject this situation, and the whole 
scheme could then break down. 

Net redistribution of wealth within generations 
reflects the source and structure of contributions 

and the structure of benefits. If married persons 
contribute the same amount as single individuals 
and if their families qualify for survivors' benefits, 
there will be a redistribution in favour of the mar­ 
ried contributors, again on a present-value basis. Or, 
if a flat benefit financed by a tax proportional to 
income is paid to all who retire, it will result in a 
transfer of wealth from higher- to lower-income 
groups. 

THE CANADIAN SITUATION 

Canada's retirement income system involves both 
intergenerational and intragenerational transfers of 
wealth.' Calculation of these effects is a complicat­ 
ed matter, however, and our present knowledge is 
confined largely to the public system. 

The Public System - For analysis of the redis­ 
tributive impact of the public retirement income 
system, the Council was able to draw upon a model, 
developed first for the Ontario Economic Council 
and improved for the present study, that generates 
future life histories for a representative sample of 
Canadians.' Among other things, it takes into 
account their chances of being in the labour force, 
of being unemployed, of reaching a particular level 
of education, and of being married. Then it calcu­ 
lates how, under various assumptions about demo­ 
graphic trends and about funding methods for the 
cpp and QPP, wealth would be redistributed between 
age and earnings groups, between men and women, 
and between married and single people, taking into 
account their different patterns of contributions and 
benefits. The results are, of course, purely sugges­ 
tive; they are designed only to show what would 
happen if the system remained as it is or if specific 
changes were made to it. In brief, they may indicate 
directions for policy change. 

The standard calculation presented in this chapter 
is based on our medium-population-growth assump­ 
tions, an assumed real interest (or discount) rate of 
2.5 per cent, and a public retirement income system 
modeled on the existing Canadian system, with one 
modification. With the present contribution rate of 
3.6 per cent for the CPP and QPP, the reserve funds 
that have been accumulating since 1966 will start to 
decrease in the mid-1980s and will disappear 
altogether early in the next century. We assume, 
therefore, that the contribution rate will be raised 
from 2007 on, to put the plans on a pay-as-you-go 
basis. From time to time we change some of these 
assumptions and compare the results with those that 
emerge from the standard calculations. 



The standard calculations show some significant 
redistribution of wealth among age groups. There is 
a net transfer of wealth to all age groups up to those 
born in the 1960-64 period, with the older groups - 
except for the very old - benefiting more than the 
young (Chart 4-1). In other words, some of the 
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benefits now promised will be paid for in the future 
by today's very young age groups as well as by those 
yet unborn. 

The older people benefit more from OAS and GIS 
programs; the young groups, from CPP and QPP. In 
fact, people who were born in 1940 or later contrib­ 
ute so much more to OAS and GIS than they are now 
promised in benefits from those programs that their 
net wealth is actually reduced on this account. 
Among those who entered the CPP or QPP programs 
in 1966 when they began, the best deal - that is, 
the largest net benefit - will go to the group born 
between 1925 and 1929. 

If the funding of the CPP and QPP had been 
increased in 1978 - using a contribution rate of 
about 9 per cent, for example - the net transfer of 
wealth to those not retired by then would be 
reduced. By far the greatest reduction would occur 
in the younger age groups, since they would be 
contributing at a higher rate for a much longer 
period. Indeed, for those born between 1960 and 
1964, who are just now entering the labour force, 
there would be almost no net redistribution of 
wealth. 

In addition, OAS and GIS benefits are presently 
indexed to the consumer price index, so that their 
real purchasing power remains constant. Over time, 
as gains in productivity cause real wages to rise, the 
relative position of the elderly who depend solely on 
these programs will deteriorate. This problem could 
be overcome by adjusting benefits in one way or 
another to wage increases. Such action would sub­ 
stantially increase the net transfer of wealth to older 
age groups and reduce the net transfers to younger 
groups. 

I I 

Canada's major public retirement income plans 
also benefit some individuals within the same age 
group more than others. Not surprisingly, the OAS 
and GIS programs transfer net wealth towards those 
with lower lifetime earnings and away from those 
with higher lifetime earnings. At the present time, 
CPP and QPP are transferring net wealth from future 
generations to all present participants. Since these 
transfers are proportional to pensionable earnings, 
the higher-earnings group receives larger net ben­ 
efits than the lower-earnings group. Nevertheless, 
because the influence of the OAS and GIS programs 
dominates, the system as a whole transfers net 
wealth to middle- and lower-earnings groups and 
away from the upper-earnings group. 

If the CPP and QPP had adopted a contribution 
rate of 9 per cent in 1978, the situation would have 
been different. The plans would have ceased trans- 
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ferring net wealth from future generations for cred­ 
its earned after 1978. Because the basic exemption 
benefits low earners proportionately more than high 
earners, these plans would then transfer net wealth 

CHART 4-2 
NET LIFETIME BENEFITS FROM PUBLIC RETIREMENT 
INCOME PROGRAMS, BY AVERAGE LIFETIME 
EARNINGS CLASS, CANADA 1960-64 AGE COHORTI,2 
(1977 dollars - Discount rate, 2,5%) 
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from the higher-earnings groups to the lower-earn­ 
ings groups (Chart 4-2). As the system matures, 
contribution rates will have to increase. This exam­ 
ple indicates that, as they do, the plans will become 
more progressive. In other words, people with low 
earnings will experience a higher ratio of benefits to 
contributions (on a present-value basis) than 
individuals with high earnings. The redistribution of 
net wealth between earnings groups would also 
change if OAS and GIS benefits were indexed to 
wages. Lower-earnings groups would receive greater 
net transfers, and higher-earnings groups would 
receive less. 
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The calculations also suggest that the CPP and 
QPP redistribute net wealth in other ways. Women 
stand to receive lower net benefits than men because 
their earnings are generally lower, especially during 
their child-bearing years. Where men and women 
have the same lifetime earnings, however, women 
receive greater benefits because, on average, they 
live longer. Men with children will be entitled to 
slightly higher benefits than others because they (or 
at least their families) are eligible for spouse and 
survivor benefits (Chart 4-3). 

30+ 
CHART 4-3 
NET LIFETIME CPP/QPP BENEFITS PER PERSON, MEN 
AND WOMEN WITH AND WITHOUT CHILDREN, 
1950-59 AGE COHORT 1,2 
(1977 dollars - Discount rate, 2.5%) 
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Another change to the CPP (one already incorpo­ 
rated in the QPp) that has been passed by the 
Parliament of Canada but has not yet been ratified 
by British Columbia and Ontario, is an income 
drop-out provision for parents. It provides that 
family allowance recipients may drop those years 
during which they had children under seven years of 
age - perhaps years of low or zero earnings - 
from the calculation of average lifetime earnings on 
which the amount of the final pension is based. This 
change would bring an increase of roughly 22 per 
cent in net benefits to the average woman with 



children, with greater increases going to those with 
higher incomes (Chart 4-4). It would also require an 
increase in the contribution rate for all plan partici­ 
pants. That increase in turn would lower the net 
benefits received by men and women without 
children. 

CHART 4-4 
NET LIFETIME CPP/QPP BENEFITS FOR WOMEN WITH 
CHILDREN, BY AVERAGE LIFETIME EARNINGS CLASS, 
1950-59 AGE COHORTI,2 
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All these illustrations are based on an assumed 
real rate of discount of 2.5 per cent - a figure in 
line with recent experience. It may well be, however, 
that individuals with lower earnings have a consid­ 
erably greater preference for current, as opposed to 
future, consumption than this average rate implies. 
This interpretation is borne out by the fact that 
lower-income individuals are more likely than high­ 
er-income people to pay very high interest rates to 
finance their consumer loans. When cpp and QPP 
net benefits are calculated on the basis of a 5 per 
cent real rate of discount, the transfer of net wealth 
is lower for all earnings groups (Chart 4-5). What 
this implies is that poorer people in particular may, 
in fact, perceive the net transfer of wealth through 
cpp and QPP benefits to be much lower than our 
basic calculations suggest. They may well ask 
whether the forced saving achieved through these 
pension plans is worth it. 
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CHART 4-5 
NET LIFETIME CPP/QPP BENEFITS, BASED ON 
ALTERNATIVE DISCOUNT RATES, BY AVERAGE 
LIFETIME EARNINGS CLASS, 1960-64 AGE 
COHORTI) 
(1977 dollars) 
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The Occupational Pension Plans - Occupational 
pension plans redistribute wealth to a much lesser 
extent than do public plans. Intergenerational trans­ 
fers are quite possible in public-sector plans, how­ 
ever, because they are not necessarily fully funded. 
But since private-sector plans are required to aim 
for full funding, they are far less likely to result in 
such transfers. A transfer may nonetheless occur if 
the benefits are adjusted after an individual 
becomes eligible for retirement. 

Private-sector occupational plans may transfer 
wealth between individuals of the same age groups. 
Plans with less than full and immediate vesting of 
the employer's contributions transfer wealth from 
mobile to less-mobile workers, and perhaps from 
younger to older workers as a group as well. This 
takes place because workers who leave an employer 
before their contributions are vested get back only 
their contributions, plus interest. This may result in 
only a small loss for some younger workers, but the 
loss could be substantial for older workers.' Since 
occupational pension plans, which are usually com­ 
pulsory for the group concerned, maintain the same 
contribution rates for all plan members, some 
individuals receive more benefits than others. 
Women earning the same income as men for the 
same job receive extra benefits because of their 
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longer life expectancy. Individuals with families 
receive more benefits than single people because of 
survivor benefits. 

Tax exemptions for contributions to, and invest­ 
ment returns from, pension plans, as well as the 
exemption granted to people aged 65 and over for 
the first $1,000 of pension income, may also transfer 
wealth towards occupational plan members. Non­ 
members can, if they wish, obtain similar benefits 
through the purchase of RRSPS, but this approach 
will not provide all of the advantages deriving from 
participation in an occupational pension plan. 

IMPLICATIONS FOR POLICY 

The receipt of a net transfer of wealth by pension 
plan members means that the benefits received (net 
of taxes) are in excess of contributions to the plan, 
when both are calculated on a present-value basis. 
In other words, the members receive more in ben­ 
efits from the plan than if they had invested else­ 
where an amount equal to the contributions made to 
the plan by themselves or on their behalf by their 
employer. Either way, a member's gain is someone 
else's loss, and that fact may affect the operation of 
the system. 

The OAS and GIS programs are expressly designed 
to ensure a basic minimum income for older people 
regardless of previous circumstances. These pro­ 
grams do redistribute wealth in favour of the ~lder 
groups in the population and, at the same time, 
those with lower lifetime earnings. 

This basic income could be assured at less cost if 
the universal program (OAS) were phased out and 
replaced by an expanded version of the GIS (an 
income-tested program) since benefits would then 
go only to those who need them most. Our estimates 
suggest that if the OAS program had been replaced 
by an expanded GIS scheme in. 1979, th~ federal 
government might have reduced ItS expenditures by 
roughly $1 billion that year, while maintaining the 
same guaranteed minimum income level. Alterna­ 
tively, that amount could have been used to increase 
the minimum. 

There have been strong political objections to 
income- or means-tested programs in the past, how­ 
ever, and the present system represents a hard­ 
fought compromise among diverse groups.' Indeed, 
the very fact that OAS payments are received by all 
older people is an important factor in the political 
support that the program continues to enj.oy '. On the 
other hand, it is possible that the objections to 

income- or means-testing may lessen in the future 
for several reasons." First, the system is becoming 
much more impersonal and automatic. Income­ 
tested programs are becoming more closely related 
to the tax system, and there is less hesitation to get 
something back from the tax man than to personally 
visit some, perhaps unsympathetic, welfare official. 
Moreover, the more that the actual change in popu­ 
lation approaches the low-growth scenario, the 
greater will be the pressure to seek ways of reducing 
costs. 

As for the CPP and QPP, the decision to transfer 
net wealth to all age groups participating in these 
plans so far is implicit in the less-than-full funding 
of the scheme. The amount of the transfers is, in 
effect, the result of compromise between those 
favouring a short period of transition to full benefits 
and those opting for a much longer interval. Such a 
transfer implies political acceptance of the idea that 
at the present time - and presumably for some 
time to come - the division of income between the 
older people and workers is not appropriate. This 
position can be defended on various grounds - for 
example, it may be seen as compensation to the 
older groups for their net transfers to the young for 
education; but, ultimately, it will be the subsequent 
generations who will decide whether it is appropri­ 
ate and whether the "pension promise" will be 
honoured. 

The net transfer of wealth to present participants 
implies that, at some time in the future, members of 
the then-current work force may have to contribute 
at rates higher than those required to fund their own 
pensions in full (Table 4-1). Under the low-growth 
projection, the contribution rate on eligible earni~gs 
would be twice as high by 2031 as under the high 
projection. By way of comparison, however, it is 
worth noting that the employer jemployee contribu­ 
tion rate for U.S. social security programs is already 
above 10 per cent; it is expected to rise even further. 

TABLE 4-1 
CPP AND QPP PAY-AS-YOU-GO CONTRIBUTION 
RATES, UNDER VARIOUS DEMOGRAPHIC 
GROWTH ASSUMPTIONS, 1991 TO 20511 

Demographic growth projection 

High Medium Low 

1991 4.4 4.5 4.7 
2001 5.1 5.4 5.8 
2011 5.6 6.4 7.4 
2021 6.7 8.4 10.6 
2031 7.3 10.0 14.2 
2041 6.4 9.5 14.7 
2051 6.8 9.7 15.2 



The Canadian rate would rise above that shown in 
our calculations, of course, if benefits were 
increased from present levels - for example, to 
provide a higher income-replacement ratio (see also 
Chapter 3, especially Chart 3-9). Would future 
workers agree to pay these higher rates or would 
they choose, instead, to reduce the promised ben­ 
efits? The question is anything but academic: 
among those whose benefits could be affected by the 
decisions made by the workers of 203 I are the 
young people who are now entering the labour force. 

One consideration that could affect the outcome 
is the way in which the present system reallocates 
wealth among various individuals in the same age 
groups. Think for a moment of contributions to the 
cpp and QPP as a form of investment. At the present 
time, all age groups in the system are being offered 
a positive rate of return on that investment; how­ 
ever, when contribution rates are increased, as they 
must be if the system is to continue, that rate of 
return will decline. In addition, the potential rate of 
return is lower for some people than for others. 
Since the mature system will redistribute wealth 
away from higher-income groups, their rate of 
return will be lower than the average, perhaps lower 
than they could get by investing their accumulated 
contributions themselves. That feature could well 
lessen their support for the system." Nor can we be 
sure that lower-income groups will be anymore in 
favour of the present system. Their rate of return 
will be higher than the average; but, for some at 
least, it will still not compensate for their loss of 
current consumption. Some individuals may have to 
pay very high rates of interest if forced to borrow 
for consumption purposes. 

Few Canadians would argue with the principle 
that the working group must support those who, for 
one reason or another, cannot provide adequately 
for themselves. The question is: What is the fairest 
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way to accomplish this? Because the present system 
of contributions amounts to a regressive payroll 
tax - a tax that bears more heavily on those least 
able to pay it - it may seem quite unfair to many. 

There are two possible solutions: to finance the 
cpp and QPP from general revenues, or to shift the 
basic-income objective entirely to the public pro­ 
grams that are not related to earnings and to make 
cpp and QPP benefits proportional to earnings. (In 
the latter case, the income-replacement rates would 
be equal for all earnings levels.) The second 
approach has the advantage of clearly identifying 
cpp and QPP contributions as savings for the 
individual. Moreover, with benefits proportional to 
contributions, members could be permitted to opt 
out of the program if they could provide proof that 
they were building up retirement savings in some 
other way. This would permit increased freedom of 
choice; at the same time, removal of the redistribu­ 
tive element could mean somewhat lower contribu­ 
tion rates for all participants. 

There seems to be a good argument, too, for a 
staged increase in the contribution rate, beginning 
perhaps in the mid-1980s when the present reserve 
funds begin to decline. This might be politically 
more acceptable than one very sharp increase at the 
point when the funds are ultimately exhausted. 
However, final decisions with regard to changing 
both the contribution rate and the structure of 
financing and benefits will also depend on what 
effect the system - or changes in it - would have 
on other goals. Financing through general revenues 
has different implications for stabilization policies 
than financing through a payroll tax. The timing of 
the increases in contribution rates would also affect 
these policies. In addition, the system has implica­ 
tions for growth, since the redistribution of wealth 
may affect saving and capital formation, as well as 
the choice between work and leisure. These features 
are examined in the chapters that follow. 



5 The Savings Connection 

Of all the links between the economy and the 
income security policies for older people, the "sav­ 
ings connection" has aroused the most controversy. 
If Canada's public retirement plans contribute to a 
lowering of total saving and capital formation and 
to slower economic growth, as some suggest, it may 
become more difficult in the future to meet the 
demands for pension benefits and the other needs of 
our society. 

Even if total saving is not altered, its composition 
could be affected. Some fear that the growth of 
public retirement income plans that are less than 
fully funded could mean a decline in personal 
saving, an increased concentration of savings in the 
hands of governments, or greater dependence on 
savings from abroad, which could lead to increased 
foreign ownership of Canadian industry. 

First, we must be quite clear on what we mean by 
saving. Unless there are unemployed resources in 
the economy or unless capital is imported from 
other countries, an increase in the stock of capital 
requires that some of Canada's current output of 
goods and services be saved - that is, not con­ 
sumed. When individuals save, the resources that 
would have been devoted to the production of goods 
for consumption can be utilized instead for capital 
formation. The terms "capital formation" or 
"investment" are used here in the narrow sense of 
physical goods serving as inputs in the productive 
process. They exclude investment in "human capi­ 
tal" by way of expenditures on health, education, 
and training, even though that type of investment 
may also be very important for growth. 

Frequently, of course, those who save are not 
those who invest in real capital. Instead, the savings 
are transmitted to their final users by way of the 
financial markets. When an individual purchases a 
new corporate security, the issuing enterprise can 
then use the proceeds to invest in real capital. 

SOURCES OF SAVING 

The savings accumulated by individuals and by 
small businesses operated by their owners (the per­ 
sonal and unincorporated business sector), by large 
private and government business enterprises (the 
corporate sector), and by governments themselves, 
together constitute "gross domestic saving." When 
Canada's surplus or deficit in current international 
transactions is taken into account, the result is gross 
saving. Such surpluses or deficits are matched by 
financial flows - including investment by foreign­ 
ers in Canadian equity capital, bonds, and other 
securities, and investment by Canadians in foreign 
securities. 

Over the past 25 years, gross domestic saving has 
represented just under 22 per cent of GNP 
(Table 5-1); in 1975-77, it averaged $40 billion. 
Because gross investment in Canada - which must 
be equal to total gross saving - has been slightly 
larger (averaging 23.5 per cent of GNP), Canada has 
imported new capital (foreign savings) to fill the 
gap. Indeed, in a very important sense, our use of 
foreign savings has been much greater than these 
figures would suggest. Strictly speaking, the savings 
of foreign-controlled businesses in Canada, which 
are very large, should also be treated as foreign, 
rather than domestic, savings. 

In the Canadian system of National Accounts, 
contributions to the Canada and Quebec Pension 
Plans and to non trusteed pension plans covering 
some government and government-enterprise 
employees (the consolidated-revenue plans) are 
treated as government revenues, and benefit pay­ 
ments from these plans are considered government 
current expenditures. The surplus of contributions 
and earnings over benefits has accounted for a 
sharply increased proportion of government saving 
since the mid-I 960s. The surplus of contributions 



Economists generally regard this behaviour as con­ 
forming to the life-cycle savings hypothesis. 
Individuals may also voluntarily transfer some of 
their assets to other generations - for example, to 
their children as bequests or to their own parents to 
enable them to live comfortably in their later years. 
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TABLE 5-1 
SAVING IN CANADA, BY MAJOR SOURCE, AS A PROPORTION OF GNP, THREE-YEAR AVERAGES, 
1954-56 TO 1975-77 

1954-56 1957-59 1960-62 1963-65 1966-68 1969-71 1972-74 1975-77 

(M illions of dollars) 

A Gross National Product 28,835 35,045 40,311 50,541 66,941 86,650 125,441 189,017 

(Per cent) 

Gross domestic saving' 
as a proportion of GNP 21.5 20.4 19.6 22.3 23.2 21.8 23.4 21.4 

Gross saving? 
as a proportion of GN P 24.2 24.5 22.1 23.8 24.4 22.1 24.0 23.9 

B Composition of gross saving! 100.0 100.0 100.0 100.0 100.0 100.0 100.0 100.0 

Personal saving 30.5 29.3 30.3 30.4 31.8 31.3 37.0 43.7 
-Pensions- 7.3 7.7 6.5 7.9 8.3 10.3 
-Other 23.0 22.7 25.3 23.4 28.7 33.4 

Corporate saving 45.1 44.0 47.4 46.6 43.5 44.8 40.8 41.0 

Government saving 13.4 9.9 10.7 16.4 20.3 22.4 19.3 5.1 
-Pensions-> 4.5 3.8 9.0 10.6 9.5 8.7 
-Other- 6.2 12.6 113 11.8 9.8 -3.6 

Foreign saving 10.8 15.2 10.5 5.4 4.3 -0.1 3.0 10.6 

C Pension saving 
as a proportion of gross saving 11.8 11.6 15.4 18.5 17.8 19.1 

and earnings over benefits of other pension plans 
(trusteed and insured plans) is treated as personal 
saving. Total pension saving now provides close to 
one-fifth of the gross savings. Total personal saving, 
which includes some pension saving, as well as other 
forms of saving, is larger still; from the late 1950s to 
the mid-1970s, it grew from 29 per cent to nearly 
44 per cent of gross saving. 

PENSION PLANS AND SAVING 

To determine the effect of pension plans on 
saving, we must first study these two broad ques­ 
tions: Do these plans affect personal saving and, if 
so, how? If they cause a reduction in personal 
saving, is that decline likely to be offset by increased 
saving by other domestic sources such as govern­ 
ments or corporations? 

PERSONAL SAVING 

One of the principal motives for saving is to 
provide income for retirement. At the beginning of 
their working years, most people receive relatively 
low incomes and save very little. With age and 
experience, their earnings rise and so, too, does their 
saving. After they retire, they draw upon savings to 
support their consumption. As a result, savings 
smooth out consumption over a lifetime (Chart 5-1). 

Pension plans, especially public plans, introduce 
some additional considerations. First, they might 
simply be regarded as a way of taxing the current 
work force to support the present group of older 
people. The elderly consume a higher proportion of 
their income than the work force in general. Thus 
the transfer causes a decline in total personal 
saving. In fact, however, the effect does not appear 
to be very large. Not only is the number of workers 
much larger, but many members of the work force 
- people with young familites or low incomes­ 
would be unable to save much anyway in the 
absence of the compulsory plans. 

If plan members take a longer view, however, the 
implications could be much more far-reaching. To 
illustrate, consider what effects the introduction of a 
fully funded or a pay-as-you-go (less than fully 
funded) universal pension plan could have on an 
individual's wealth and asset portfolio. 

The introduction of a fully funded universal pen­ 
sion plan would not immediately affect personal 



CHART 5-1 
LIFE-CYCLE PATTERN OF INCOME, CONSUMPTION, 
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wealth, since individuals would expect to pay com­ 
pletely for their own pensions by the time of retire­ 
ment. Over time, however, the pension plan may 
cause them to save more than otherwise, for two 
reasons. First, since public pension credits are 
illiquid - that is, they cannot be "cashed in" before 
retirement - these individuals might not fully 
reduce other forms of saving by the amount of 
pension saving. Second, the compulsory nature of 
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the plan might force them to contribute more to 
pension saving than otherwise. 

The introduction of a pay-as-you-go or partly 
funded universal pension plan could, in contrast, 
have an immediate effect on personal wealth. Most 
people in the work force at the time could expect to 
receive pension benefits in excess of what they could 
have bought with their contributions. In other 
words, their wealth would be increased by the plan 
(see Chapter 4). This increased wealth might 
encourage more consumption and less saving, and 
perhaps earlier retirement and greater bequests to 
heirs. Over time, as the plan matured and contribu­ 
tion rates rose, this effect would become less impor­ 
tant, because new entrants into the labour force 
could expect approximately to pay for their own 
pensions. Since, initially, the pay-as-you-go rate 
would be less than the fully funded rate, forced 
saving would also be less initially under the former 
system. 

The availability of pension benefits could induce 
people to retire earlier. With the possibility of a 
shorter working life and a longer retirement period, 
they might even save more during their working 
years. As a result, this induced-retirement effect 
could cause personal saving to rise. Similarly, people 
who decide to work more prior to retirement, per­ 
haps to gain overtime pay, could also save more, and 
personal saving would rise because of this labour­ 
supply effect. 

Instead of altering their present consumption (or 
saving) behaviour because of the anticipation of 
future public pension income, some might instead 
maintain the present level of saving in order to 
provide more for their children by way of their 
estate. Or, if they perceived their parents to be 
better off because they receive their own public 
pensions, the children's contribution to their par­ 
ents' upkeep might be reduced - in effect, increas­ 
ing their own disposable income - and they would 
save more from that higher income. These voluntary 
transfer effects could reduce, or even fully offset, 
the direct substitution of pension credits for other 
types of personal saving. 

Economists have attempted to measure the 
importance of these effects on personal saving, but 
the results of their investigations have been some­ 
what contradictory. For a while, research in both 
Canada and the United States seemed to indicate 
that universal pensions had substantially reduced 
personal saving. Now more refined work in both 
countries suggests that either there has been no 
effect on saving or the effect has been very small.' 
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The real problem is that the data available for this 
type of analysis are very inadequate. In Canada 
they consist of only highly aggregative time series. 
The analysis would be greatly facilitated if data on 
the saving behaviour of individuals over time were 
available. In any event, great care should be taken 
not to apply U.S. results to Canada in wholesale 
fashion, since the public retirement income systems 
in the two countries differ substantially, as do many 
provisions in the income tax legislation that have a 
bearing on savings. 

After the introduction of the Canada and Quebec 
Pension Plans in 1966, personal saving as a percent­ 
age of disposable income fell at first, but then it rose 
to earlier levels and beyond (Chart 5-2). The drop 
resulted largely from a decline in contributions to 
private pension funds, presumably reflecting the 
integration of these funds with the two public plans, 
and from the fact that in the National Accounts 
public pension saving is treated as government, 
rather than personal, saving. Saving through private 
pension plans began to increase again in the late 
1960s, and other forms of personal saving have risen 
rapidly. This latter increase reflects in large part an 
inflation-induced rise in discretionary saving.' 

CHART 5-2 
PERSONAL SAVING AS A PROPORTION OF PERSONAL 
DISPOSABLE INCOME, CANADA, 1954-78 
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Personal saving may be affected by a number of 
factors other than pension benefits, and their influ- , 
ence could be offsetting. The difficulty lies in 
attempting to isolate the effects of particular fac­ 
tors. Yet, for policy purposes, that is what is needed. 
Several studies by the federal government have been 
unable to determine whether contributions to the 
cpp and QPP have had any significant influence on 

personal saving. They did indicate, however, that 
from the mid-1960s to the early or mid-1970s, 
personal contractual saving - through insurance 
and private pension plans, for example - was 
reduced by about 40 cents for each dollar of contri­ 
butions to the CPP and QPP. Much of this could be 
explained by the integration of private with public 
pension plans in the early years of the public system. 

The Ontario Treasury Department has carried 
out considerably more detailed analysis relating per­ 
sonal saving to various measures of the benefit 
structure of Canada's public pension system.' The 
results for 1976 range from an estimated 14 per 
cent reduction in personal saving (using coverage 
and total benefits paid under OAS, GIS, CPP and 
QPP - an indirect measure of pension plan wealth) 
to a decline of only 1.8 per cent (based on max­ 
imum, rather than actual, benefits). 

Another study conducted at the University of 
British Columbia on the basis of the methodology 
used in the United States relates direct, rather than 
indirect, measures of OAS, CPP, and QPP wealth to 
personal saving.' It finds no statistically significant 
effects. The authors suggest, however, that the 
effect of substituting pension saving for other forms 
of personal saving has probably been offset by the 
retirement effect, the presence of tax incentives for 
saving (such as RRSPS), increased personal saving 
rates attributable to higher levels of personal 
income, and perhaps private intergenerational trans­ 
fers. They also suggest that the results may reflect 
the fact that the CPP and QPP are not yet mature 
and that households have not fully adjusted their 
saving behaviour to allow for the benefits promised 
by these plans. 

The results of the Council's own work also con­ 
firm the suggestion that public retirement income 
plans have had relatively little effect on total per­ 
sonal saving, at least in part because the various 
influences mentioned earlier offset one another.' 
Individuals make decisions not only about the 
amount of their saving but also about how it is to be 
allocated among a variety of real assets - a house, 
for example - and financial assets. The Council's 
study examines the effect of private and public 
retirement plans (including OAS) on both decisions, 
as well as on the amount of labour supplied by 
individuals - a factor that in turn has implications 
for personal saving. By examining a wider range of 
factors that might affect saving - including demo­ 
graphic changes, inflation, unemployment, portfolio 
risk, interest rates, and the holdings of other forms 
of wealth by households - the study attempts to 
isolate more precisely the effects of retirement 



income plans. Like the University of British 
Columbia study, it relates direct measures of public 
pension-plan wealth to personal saving. 

The increase in wealth from the introduction of 
the CPP and QPP appears to have had no significant 
impact on personal saving, although there is some 
suggestion that the promise of OAS benefits reduced 
such saving slightly during the 1953-75 period." 
Moreover, the availability of public and private 
pensions together resulted in earlier retirement for a 
number of individuals, causing an additional reduc­ 
tion in personal saving. The overall reduction in 
personal saving that has resulted from these factors 
is within the range estimated by the Ontario Trea­ 
sury and the federal Treasury Board studies. 

The Council study also points to some offsetting 
impacts. Occupational pension plans seem to have 
increased personal saving per capita - a result in 
accord with recent results for the United States.' In 
addition, the aging of the work force has increased 
the number of net savers in the economy, causing 
real personal saving per capita to rise. Finally, 
pensions and earlier retirement together appear to 
have resulted in some increase in man-hours worked 
prior to retirement; the consequent increase in 
labour income would also cause personal savings to 
rise. 

In total, then, the effect of public and private 
programs together has been a small decline in the 
level of real personal saving per capita. If personal 
saving is expressed as a percentage of personal 
disposable income, this amounted in 1975 to a 
reduction of about half a percentage point ($600 
million). 

The results also seem to suggest that there is no 
great danger of a downward trend in personal 
saving for some time in the future. The effects of 
two of the factors that appear to reduce personal 
saving - the promise of OAS benefits and the 
impact of earlier retirement - are expected to 
decline or stabilize in the future. The further aging 
of the work force and any further growth in occupa­ 
tional pensions should, if anything, lead to increased 
personal savings for at least several decades. 

THE IMPACT ON TOTAL SAVING 

Even if personal saving were reduced by the 
public pension schemes, total domestic saving would 
not necessarily decline. Its behaviour and that of 
rates of return on Canadian investments would 
depend upon how the schemes were funded and how 
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governments used the funds in partly or fully funded 
schemes. What would happen to gross saving would, 
in turn, depend upon how nonresidents reacted to 
changes in Canadian rates of return. 

Domestic Saving - A pay-as-you-go plan is just 
a promise to pay present contributors when they 
reach a specific age. It does not include the build-up 
of a fund, because contributions are simply con­ 
sumed by present beneficiaries. Under these circum­ 
stances, should personal saving suffer a decline 
because of the introduction of public pension plans, 
total domestic saving would also be reduced, and 
interest rates in Canada would rise. 

The Canada and Quebec Pension Plans have, 
however, been partly funded since their inception in 
1966.8 Contributions have exceeded current ben­ 
efits, and a fund upon which the provinces can draw 
for their own purposes has accumulated. In Cana­ 
da's national accounting system, that fund is a part 
of the government sector; thus the impact of the 
public plans on total domestic saving will vary, 
depending on how this fund is used by government. 

Various possibilities are presented in Table 5-2.9 
Under Options 1.1, 1.2A, and 1.2B, for example, we 
assume that public pension contributions are treated 
as perfect substitutes for personal saving, so that the 
latter will decline by the full amount of those contri­ 
butions. If the surplus of contributions available to 
government has no effect on its spending, either 
current or capital - if it is used to retire debt, for 
example - there would be no change in total 
domestic saving or in the general level of Canadian 
interest rates. 

If, instead, government uses the surplus to 
increase its spending on current goods and services 
(Option l.2A), government consumption will rise, 
government saving will not change, total saving will 
fall, the level of domestic interest rates will rise, and 
private investment will fall. Again, if the funds are 
used for investment in such things as hospitals, 
schools, or roads (Option 1.2B), personal saving will 
decline, but now government saving will rise, and 
total saving will remain unchanged. With govern­ 
ment investment up, however, the level of domestic 
interest rates will still increase, and private invest­ 
ment will decline, unless there is some slack in the 
economy. 

In both of the latter cases, private investment will 
be "crowded out" - in the former, by increased 
government consumption; in the latter, by increased 
government investment. In fact, these options 
describe two of the most common worries about 
public pension schemes: that the funds generated 
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Government-sector options 

TABLE 5-2 
THE IMPLICATIONS OF ALTERNATIVE ASSUMPTIONS FOR THE LEVEL OF AGGREGATE SAVING, 
UNDER A PARTLY OR FULLY FUNDED GOVERNMENT PENSION PLAN, ASSUMING NO INTER­ 
NATIONAL CAPITAL FLOWS I 

Option 1 

No effect on 
government spending 

Option 2 

Government spending increases by amount of contributions 

A B 
Current goods Government capital 
and services formation 

Personal saving -100 Personal saving -100 
Government saving - Government saving +100 

no change Total domestic 
Total domestic saving - no change + saving -100 Domestic interest 
Domestic interest t level t level Private investment 
Private investment .. Government investment • Government consumption' 

Personal Sector Options 

Option 1: Public pension contributions 
of $100 million treated as 
perfect substitute for 
personal saving 

Personal saving -100 
Government saving + 100 
Total domestic 

saving - no change 
Domestic interest 

level - no change 
Private investment - 

no change in level; 
possible changes in 
composition. 

Personal saving - 
no change 

Government saving 
Total domestic 

saving 
Domestic interest 

Option 2: Public pension contributions 
of $100 million not treated 
as a substitute for personal 
saving 

rate level 
Private investment 
Government invest­ 

ment - no change 
Private consumption 

+100 

Personal saving - 
no change. 

Government saving - 
no change 

Total domestic 
saving - no change. 

Domestic interest rate 
level - no change. 

Private investment - 
no change 

Government investment - 
no change. 

Government con- 
sumption • 

Private consumption • 

Personal saving - 
no change 

Government saving + 100 
Total domestic 

saving + 100 
Domestic interest 
level - no change 

Private investment - 
no change 

Government investment .. 
Private consumption • 

+100 

t 
• 

will be either "wasted" on government consumption 
(although that may include investment in human 
capital through expenditures on health or educa­ 
tion) or at least diverted into public investment - 
and thus perhaps into less productive uses than in 
the private sector. 

Foreign Saving - Given the open nature of 
Canada's economy, the conclusions in the scenarios 
above - where total domestic saving declines 
and/or Canadian rates of return rise - would likely 
be modified to some extent, since an increase in the 
level of domestic interest rates would tend to attract 
foreign funds. The sensitivity of international capi­ 
tal flows to interest rates would determine in what 
way the composition of aggregate investment would 
change. With higher domestic interest rates, foreign 
funds would flow into Canada, and both the rise in 
domestic interest rates and the decline in private 

investment would be less than otherwise. If capital 
were perfectly mobile, there would be no decline in 
private investment and no increase in the domestic 
interest rate. There would, however, be an increase 
in the ownership of Canadian assets - and possibly 
in the control of Canadian industry - by 
foreigners. 

The Evidence - So much for the possibilities. Is 
there anything to indicate which response is most 
likely? There is some evidence that government 
spending has increased as a result of the pension 
plans. Work done for the Council indicates that the 
less wealthy provinces, particularly in the Atlantic 
region, have expanded their outlays as a result of 
the availability of funds from the Canada Pension 
Plan (available data do not permit a distinction 
between current and capital expenditures at the 
provincial level).'? This source of funds has enabled 

___j 



them to have higher per capita borrowings than 
other provinces and, indeed, to increase their overall 
debt more than would have been possible had they 
attempted to borrow all of the funds from private 
lenders. We could find no evidence that government 
expenditures have increased in the wealthier prov­ 
inces or that taxation revenues have decreased as a 
result of the flow of pension funds, except in one 
small respect. II The funds of the CPP are borrowed 
by the provinces at rates somewhat below market 
rates. This, in effect, constitutes a subsidy, estimat­ 
ed to have been about $150 million in 1977-78. If 
the provinces had had to pay this additional interest, 
they would have had to either increase revenues or 
cut expenditures correspondingly in order to main­ 
tain savings. 

As far as foreign capital flows are concerned, the 
evidence, though somewhat dated, suggests that 
portfolio investment and trade in outstanding 
securities - which, together, can be very large - 
are very sensitive to the interest rate differentials 
between Canada and its major trading partners, 
particularly the United States.'? This would indicate 
that, over a long period of time, capital is very 
nearly perfectly mobile on the international mar­ 
kets. On the other hand, direct investment, which 
involves control by foreigners over physical assets in 
Canada, was affected more by other factors, such as 
profit prospects, that are often specific to each 
industry. 

SAVINGS: NEEDS AND SHORTAGES 

The best available evidence does not support the 
contention that Canada's existing public retirement 
income system has caused a major reduction in 
personal saving or in total domestic saving, or that it 
is necessary, on these grounds at least, to shift the 
Canada and Quebec Pension Plans towards a more 
fully funded status. Admittedly, however, the evi­ 
dence is somewhat conflicting, and it is based on 
inadequate data. In Canada's case it is also based on 
analysis of income-replacement plans that face sub­ 
stantial increases in contribution rates as they 
mature. 

For these reasons alone, it would seem only pru­ 
dent to keep the impact of the plans on saving under 
continual surveillance and to improve the quality of 
the data required for analysis. It should be pointed 
out, however, that worry about this problem goes 
far beyond consideration of data limitations and 
statistical analysis. It is tied in with a broader 
concern about the possibility that, in the years 
ahead, Canada's savings could fall well short of its 
needs. 
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This concern is not new, but its focus has changed 
over the years. In the last four or five decades, the 
main preoccupation has often been about 
"oversaving" - saving to the extent that depression 
or economic stagnation could occur. Indeed, as 
recently as the 1960s, fear was expressed in the 
United States that pension funds were generating 
too much saving and that depression might occur 
unless strong compensatory actions were taken by 
government. Today the concern in the United States 
is that their social security system, as well as the tax 
treatment of savings, has unduly depressed the per­ 
sonal saving rate. Even in Canada, which has at 
present a much higher personal saving rate as the 
result of higher interest rates and tax exemptions on 
certain forms of saving, many proposals for modify­ 
ing the retirement income system are based on the 
premise that we are facing shortages of savings or 
capital. 

The "shortage" suggestions are frequently linked 
with projections of investment requirements. 
Canada will face very large investment require­ 
ments in the coming decade, especially for energy 
development and for the modernization and ration­ 
alization of its industry. Some feel, too, that the 
slower growth in the labour force will, in the longer 
run, have to be compensated by increased capital. In 
this respect, it must be pointed out, however, that 
investment in new capital may represent capital­ 
widening (supplying an increasing number of work­ 
ers with the same amount of capital per worker) or 
capital-deepening (increasing capital per worker). 
With slower growth in the labour force, the need for 
capital-widening will be less; in fact, capital per 
worker could be increased even if the saving rate 
were lower than at present. 

Regardless of the level of projected saving needs, 
however, there is a flaw in the "savings shortage" 
argument. It is quite possible that the expected 
supply of savings may be exceeded by the expected 
demand for investment funds. This means, in effect, 
that the supply will be less than the demand at a 
particular price (rate of interest) for savings. If the 
market for investment funds is free, that price will 
rise, bringing supply and demand into balance. If 
this does not happen, it must be concluded that 
there is some imperfection in the market - a 
possibility that cannot be ruled out. In that case, the 
answer to a prospective capital shortage may lie in 
removing the imperfections. For example, there is 
said to be a shortage of "venture capital" in 
Canada - funds for new, perhaps high-risk, opera­ 
tions. It would be more accurate, however, to say 
that at the current high prices for such funds, 
investors simply cannot undertake all the projects 
they have in mind. By improving information about 
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such projects and pooling risks, it might be possible 
to bring down the price of such funds and to get a 
better allocation of total savings. 

A shortage of savings may, however, be defined in 
relation to some goal that lies outside the operation 
of a reasonably free capital market. First, if domes­ 
tic savings are insufficient to meet the demand for 
capital at going interest rates, foreign funds may 
flow in to fill the gap. This would result in increased 
foreign ownership and perhaps control of Canadian 
assets. In effect, the shortage is defined in terms of 
the undesirability of a particular source of savings. 
There is some evidence that in recent years private 
borrowers have resorted more than previously to 
foreign capital markets. I) As for the medium-term 
future, the only evidence available at present is in 
the form of simulations to the year 2000, obtained 
with the CANDIDE model." When the domestic 
saving rate is held at roughly the present level and 
allowance is made for energy requirements, the 
simulations show that dependence on the use of 
foreign savings will decline slightly after the mid- 
1980s. Since Canada is already heavily in debt to 
foreigners, however, and because that debt also 
contributes to pressure on the country's balance of 
international payments, few Canadians would look 
with favour upon policies that might reduce domes­ 
tic saving and increase that debt. Whether the 
retirement income system is the appropriate vehicle 
for reducing that debt is a question to which we 
shall return shortly. 

There is another position on savings or capital 
shortages that seems, on more thorough examina­ 
tion, to be less convincing. Some feel that the rate of 
capital accumulation is too low to support the 
higher rate of economic growth that, in their view, is 
appropriate. Others think that the returns on addi­ 
tional saving would be very high. Actually there 
appears to have been a slight downward trend in the 
real rate of return, in Canadian industries, in recent 
years." In either case, however, the suggestion is 
that present consumption be sacrificed in favour of 
future benefits. Ultimately, resolution of such argu­ 
ments will depend upon political and social choices, 
not upon economic calculations. Yet, in making 
such choices, great care should be taken not to 
overemphasize the role of saving and capital forma­ 
tion or to underestimate the influence of other 
factors in the process of economic growth. 

SAVING, CAPITAL FORMATION, 
AND ECONOMIC GROWTH 

Economic growth, as noted earlier, derives from 
increases in the quantity and quality of labour and 

capital inputs, as well as in their productivity - the 
efficiency with which these factors of production are 
combined. Although saving provides the basis for 
capital inputs, the relationship between saving, capi­ 
tal formation, and growth is rather tenuous." 

The fact that savings are available does not guar­ 
antee that investment will take place. The reasons 
behind the two types of decisions - to save and to 
invest - are often likely to be quite different. 
Indeed, if savers decided to put aside a great deal of 
money and to restrain their consumption, they 
might reduce the demand for goods to such an 
extent that businessmen would choose not to invest. 
National income would then decline and, with lower 
incomes, people would end up saving less than they 
had planned. What might appear like a shortage of 
savings would in reality reflect a lack of sufficiently 
profitable investment opportunities. In brief, saving 
is a necessary but insufficient condition for 
investment. 

What is the relationship between capital forma­ 
tion and growth? Actually it varies widely among 
countries, and Canada is among those with high 
investment and low growth in output per worker 
(Chart 5-3). In fact, to produce a given volume of 
output in manufacturing, this country uses more 
capital and more labour than does its major trading 
partner, the United States. The amount of equip- 

CHART 5-3 
GROWTH OF REAL OUTPUT PER WORKER AND 
PROPORTION OF GNP INVESTED, SELECTED 
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ment per person employed is roughly comparable to 
the U.S. figure, but Canadian investments in build­ 
ings are higher, reflecting in part the more severe 
Canadian climate. While the gap in output per 
worker between Canada and the United States has 
narrowed over the past 20 years, it still persists. 
This is due much more to factors such as Canada's 
smaller market area and shorter production runs, 
and to a tendency for innovations to be incorporated 
more slowly in Canada than in the United States, 
than to a lack of capital per worker." 

The fact that capital formation has not been the 
dominant source of economic growth in the past, 
here or abroad, is suggested very strongly in an 
international comparison developed by Denison." 
Economies of scale, advances in knowledge, 
improved resource allocation, and increased employ­ 
ment accounted for over 80 per cent of Canada's 
growth between 1950 and 1967; increases in busi­ 
ness capital formation, although they were very 
large, contributed to less than 20 per cent 
(Chart 5-4). This implies that exceptionally large 
increases in capital formation would be required to 
significantly influence the rate of economic growth. 
The contribution of capital formation to economic 
growth was even less in other countries. During the 
periods covered by the chart, it accounted for only 
16 per cent of the economy's growth in West Ger­ 
many, 12 per cent in France and Japan, and 9 per 
cent in the United States, 

In effect, Denison attributes differences in GNP 
growth rates between Canada and other countries 
only in small part to capital formation. Of the total 
difference of 3.86 percentage points between 
Canada and Japan, for example, only about one­ 
fourth was attributable to that factor. For Canada 
and West Germany, the corresponding proportion 
was one-fifth. The differences in overall growth 
rates are explained far more cogently by differences 
in output per unit of input, which reflects the effi­ 
ciency with which capital and labour are used in the 
production process. 

Denison's work has been criticized on the grounds 
that his estimates of capital inputs do not allow 
sufficiently for differing quality aspects, including 
the length of service life. To the extent that this 
criticism is valid, his method underestimates the 
contribution of capital formation to growth and 
overestimates the contribution of factor 
productivity." It remains true, however, that the 
process of economic growth is much more complex 
than most people realize. Capital is only one of the 
inputs into production. Simply expanding savings 
and the quantity of capital, without regard for the 
quality of that capital or the efficiency with which it 
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CHART 5-4 
AVERAGE ANNUAL GROWTH IN REAL NATIONAL 
INCOME, BY MAJOR SOURCE, SELECTED COUNTRIES 
AND TIME PERIODS 
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is used, is not likely to contribute much to an 
increase in productivity and growth. 

PUBLIC PENSION PLANS AND 
INCREASED SAVING 

Canadians have grounds for concern about the 
level of domestic saving, not so much because any 
shortfall with respect to investment requirements 
will stunt economic growth, but rather because it 
will tend to be offset by imports of capital. They 
should, of course, be equally concerned about the 
efficient use of the domestic savings that are gener­ 
ated. Another question remains to be answered, 
however. If a deliberate decision is taken to stimu­ 
late domestic saving, should it be implemented 
through increased funding of public pension plans? 

To "fully fund" Canada's present public pension 
plans in the sense used for private plans would be 
unrealistic. It would imply setting contribution rates 
high enough to pay not only for all benefits prom­ 
ised from now on, but to build up a fund - over a 
few years - sufficient to pay also for all present 
liabilities. Such action would place an enormous 
burden on the present work force and create great 
problems for economic stabilization. 
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We are not talking here about extinguishing the 
present deficit but rather about the build-up of a 
fund at least large enough to finance benefits over 
the critical years of the coming century. Even in this 
limited sense, funding could be a very effective way 
to increase saving, provided that governments did 
not use the proceeds to increase their total borrow­ 
ing, but it would still involve serious disadvantages. 
It would, of course, mean increased compulsion and 
less freedom of choice. Moreover, the required 
increase in the contribution rate would fall more 
heavily on those with lower earnings because it is a 
payroll tax. To ask this group for increased contri­ 
butions to improve their pension benefits is one 
thing; to ask them to bear the brunt of programs 
designed to reduce foreign ownership of Canadian 
industry or to accelerate economic growth - a 
doubtful result in any event - is quite another. In 
brief, any decision to shift the Canada and Quebec 
Pension Plans towards a more highly funded basis 
should rest on other grounds. If an increase in 
savings is considered desirable for other reasons, it 
should be pursued by means that bear more equit­ 
ably on the population, such as fiscal policy. 

The greater the increase in the size of the reserve 
funds for the CPP and the QPP, the greater also the 
possibility of conflict with stabilization objectives. 
Care would have to be taken with the timing of 
changes in contribution rates. With less than full 
employment, greater funding would lead to 
increased government surpluses. Unless these were 
offset by compensatory fiscal or monetary 
policies - such as reductions in taxes or in interest 
rates - these measures could be self-defeating. 
They could lead to lower national income, less 
saving, and reduced capital formation. In addition, 
over the longer term, greater concentration of gov­ 
ernment bonds in the enlarged funds could make the 
pursuit of monetary policy more difficult. 

CONCLUSION 

The possibility that Canada's public retirement 
income programs could jeopardize the country's 
future economic prospects through an adverse 
impact on saving has been much discussed recently. 
In particular, it has provided the basis for the 
suggestions that the Canada and Quebec Pension 
Plans should be fully funded or, alternatively, that 
the present mix of public and private plans should 
be altered in favour of the latter. 

Our findings indicate, however, that the impact of 
these plans on saving does not, in itself, provide a 
strong basis for policy change. The empirical evi­ 
dence on the impact of public plans on saving tends 

to be somewhat contradictory, but the more refined 
studies generally tend to suggest that the plans have 
had little or no adverse impact. One cannot rule out 
the possibility that increased contribution rates, let 
alone increases in CPP and QPP benefits without 
matching changes in contributions, could put more 
downward pressure on personal saving, but, at least 
for some years to come, there will be pressure in the 
other direction also. 

There are reasons, of course, why Canadians 
cannot look with equanimity on policies that might 
reduce domestic saving or why they might wish to 
increase that saving. These are often expressed in 
terms of a shortage of savings. It turns out that the 
idea of a shortage is based largely on value judg­ 
ments about Canada's dependence on foreign saving 
or about the need to accelerate the country's eco­ 
nomic growth. 

For many years this country has, on balance, 
supplemented its own savings by drawing on those 
of other countries to finance an important part of its 
domestic investment. Such investment has brought 
many benefits, but it has also been reflected in 
deficits on the current account of the balance of 
international payments and in the increasing levels 
of foreign ownership and net international indebted­ 
ness. If these features are to be reversed, more of 
our domestic investment will have to be financed 
from our own savings. This will be particularly 
important in the coming decade or so, when there 
will be major requirements for capital formation. 
Over the long run, however, slower growth in popu­ 
lation may also bring with it a reduction in some 
needs for capital. 

Greater funding of public retirement income 
plans would certainly be an effective way to increase 
saving because it involves compulsion. It could, 
however, involve some stabilization problems and it 
would not necessarily be an efficient way to increase 
growth. The relationship between saving, capital 
formation, and economic growth is rather tenuous. 
Other approaches to stimulating growth could well 
have a greater pay-off without the necessity of 
substantial reductions in consumption. Nor would it 
seem fair to put the major burden of reducing 
Canada's international indebtedness or accelerating 
its economic growth on a payroll tax. Should greater 
savings be required for these objectives, they could 
be achieved by methods that bear more evenly on 
the population as a whole. In brief, the choice of the 
funding method for public pension plans should not 
be constrained by fear of the consequences for the 
growth and level of GNP, and it is doubtful whether 
it should be the primary method of reducing our 
foreign debt, important as that goal may be. 



6 Where Do All the Savings Go? 

However the retirement income system affects the 
levels of domestic and total saving, it is clear that a 
growing proportion of that saving has been chan­ 
neled through pension funds since the early 1960s. 
Pension funds are already among the country's larg­ 
est long-term investors, and they are destined to 
become even larger. The way in which they 
invest - that is, how they allocate the savings 
entrusted to them - is another important facet of 
the interface between the economy and income 
security policies for older people. 

It is a facet, too, that has raised serious, some­ 
times conflicting, concerns in its own right. Eco­ 
nomic growth and, in turn, the income security 
objectives could be jeopardized directly if pension 
saving is not allocated to its most productive uses, or 
indirectly if the operation of pension funds reduces 
the efficiency of the capital market. There is con­ 
cern that pension savings will become more concen­ 
trated in the hands of a small number of institution­ 
al investors or government agencies, with 
implications both for capital market efficiency and 
the control of Canadian industry. Also, fears have 
been raised that pension fund investments are being 
diverted from the business to the government sector, 
thus forcing Canadian firms to look more to foreign 
sources of funds and increasing the risk of greater 
foreign ownership and control. 

THE ALLOCATION OF PENSION FUND 
SAVING 

Pension fund saving increased from less than 12 
per cent of gross saving in the early 1960s to nearly 
20 per cent in the mid-1970s (Table 5-1). Reflecting 
this flow, the assets of pension funds rose from the 
equivalent of one-fifth of GNP in the early 1960s to 
roughly one-third by 1977 (Chart 2-2). Of course, 
other forms of institutionalized saving also grew 
rapidly over this period. In fact, the growth of 

deposit-taking institutions, particularly near-banks 
such as trust and mortgage loan companies, credit 
unions, and caisses populaires, was even more rapid 
than that of pension funds, partly as a result of 
revisions to the Bank Act in 1967 (Chart 6-1). Some 
of the growth of near-banks, especially trust compa­ 
nies, may also have been due to their taking an 
increasing share of the expansion of RRSPS. 

How pension savings and the total assets of pen­ 
sion funds will grow in the future will depend on a 
variety of factors, including population growth, pen­ 
sion plan coverage and benefit levels, and the extent 
of funding in the system. With the aging of the 

CHART 6-1 
BOOK VALUE OF TOTAL ASSETS, BY MAJOR 
FINANCIAL INTERMEDIARY CLASS, CANADA, 1962-77 
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population that is foreseen and the pressure to 
improve benefits, however, it seems very likely that 
pension funds will not only grow rather rapidly in 
the future but that they will grow more rapidly than 
other long-term saving institutions. 

Assuming that the present system, including its 
public/private mix, continues, but with some 
increase in coverage of private-sector employees, our 
projections suggest that by the year 2031, trusteed 
pension plans alone could hold assets equal to two­ 
thirds of GNP (Chart 6-2). By that time, consolidat­ 
ed revenue and insured plans could well hold assets 
amounting to the equivalent of one-fifth of GNP. 
Thus, even if the CPP and QPP were on a pay-as-you­ 
go basis (without invested assets) during the critical 
period in the coming century, the total assets of 
pension funds could be equal to more than four­ 
fifths of GNP. If the system were expanded in the 
future, this ratio could turn out to be much larger 
still. The proportion would be somewhat smaller in 
terms of capital stock, of course, assuming that the 
present ratio of capital to output were maintained, 
although that assumption is unlikely to be borne out 
in fact. 

The prospect of such large flows of saving being 
channeled through pension funds raises several 
questions. Assuming that the present mix, particu­ 
larly the public/private mix of pension funds, were 

CHART 6-2 
ESTIMATED BOOK VALUE OF ASSETS OF TRUSTEED 
PENSION PLANS AS A PROPORTION OF GNP, UNDER 
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CANADA, 1981 TO 2051' 

(Demographic growth projections) 

-- High --- Medium ••••••• Low 

% 
80 - 

.................... .. , .. ' 
60- .' 

. ......... ..,.,. ..... ------- .... .,.' 
..... ",;"" .. " __ ------ 

.... ""''' 
•••••••• ...-! 

.' 

40- 

20- 

0- 
I 

1981 1991 2001 2011 2021 2031 2041 2051 

to remain, would Canada's total savings be allocat­ 
ed somewhat differently in the future if a larger 
proportion were to flow through pension funds than 
through other savings institutions? How would 
changes in the mix of pension funds or in factors 
affecting their investment patterns alter the flow? 

Definitive answers to these questions would 
require a very large economic model incorporating 
the investment portfolios of the major financial 
intermediaries in the economy and the factors caus­ 
ing changes in them. Although such a model is 
unavailable, it is possible to gain some idea of what 
might happen by examining the recent investment 
patterns of pension funds and other savings 
institutions. 

The flow of funds in recent years provides some 
clue. If the share of pensions in gross saving is split 
by major uses, we find that since 1966 some 60 per 
cent has gone into the government sector 
(Chart 6-3). Indeed, in very recent years, pension 
saving has been the equivalent of about three-quar­ 
ters of government-sector capital formation. A large 
proportion of that flow was channeled through the 
various government consolidated-revenue pension 
plans and the newly established CPP (Chart 6-4). By 
contrast, except for the 1975-77 period, three-quar­ 
ters or more of trusteed and insured pension plan 
funds went into the private sector of the economy 
(Chart 6-5). Indeed, between 1961 and 1977 those 
plans accounted for 30 per cent of the total increase 
in corporate bonds held by Canadian financial insti­ 
tutions and for 45 per cent of the increase in stocks. 
For more detailed analysis of investment patterns, 
however, we shall have to look at changes in total 
assets rather than at flows of funds. 

CHART 6-3 
FLOW OF PENSION SAVING INTO THE PUBLIC AND 
PRIVATE SECTORS AS A PROPORTION OF GROSS 
SAVING, CANADA, 1963-77 
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CHART 6-4 
FLOW OF PENSION SAVING INTO THE PUBLIC SECTOR 
AS A PROPORTION OF GROSS SAVING, BY TYPE OF 
PENSION PLAN, CANADA, 1963-77 
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CHART 6-5 
FLOW OF TRUSTEED AND INSURED PENSION SAVING 
INTO THE PUBLIC AND PRIVATE SECTORS AS A 
PROPORTION OF GROSS SAVING, CANADA, 1963-77 
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THE REGULATION OF PENSION FUND 

INVESTMENT 

For policy purposes, of course, we need to know 
not only the investment pattern of pension funds but 
also the factors that affect that pattern (Table 6-1). 
The funds accumulated in the CPP must be invested 
in provincial bonds, but the provinces are free to use 
the proceeds as they see fit. In fact, both these funds 
and those accruing from the government consolidat­ 
ed-revenue plans are used for the general purposes 
of the government concerned. In contrast, QPP funds 
are, like private funds, invested through the capital 
market. 
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15% 

In most provinces, investments by trusteed pen­ 
sion plans - the majority of occupational plans - 
are governed by legislation that is modeled in large 
part on the Ontario Pension Benefits Act. The 
Canada Pension Benefits Standards Act, which is 
similar, applies to the Territories and to those indus­ 
tries that fall under federal jurisdiction. Investment 
restrictions bearing on both the quality and the 
quantity of eligible securities are much the same as 
those that apply to insurance companies under fed­ 
eral and provincial legislation. For example, pre­ 
ferred or common shares are eligible for purchase 
by a pension fund only if they have paid a dividend 
during each of the preceding five years or have had 
earnings available for the payment of such divi­ 
dends. In either case, such earnings or dividends 
must not be lower than a specified rate. In the case 
of common shares, the specified rate must be at 
least 4 per cent of the average value at which the 
shares were carried in the capital-stock account of 
the issuing corporation. Moreover, a pension fund 
may not invest in more than 30 per cent of the 
common shares of anyone corporation, and no more 
than 10 per cent of the book value of its assets may 
be loaned to, or invested in the securities of, anyone 
corporation, partnership, or person. 

The major difference between pension and insur­ 
ance legislation is that there is no limitation on the 
total amount that a pension fund may invest in 
eligible common shares or in real estate or lease­ 
holds for the production of income. Some types of 
investment are specifically disallowed on conflict-of­ 
interest grounds. The federal pension benefits legis­ 
lation and that of some of the provinces also contain 
a "basket" clause that allows up to 7 per cent of a 
fund to be invested in assets that, while not specifi­ 
cally disallowed, do not meet the quality tests. 

Although it is difficult to determine the extent to 
which the general legislation governing the trusteed 
plans and the Caisse de dépôt reduces the potential 
earning power of their portfolios, it would appear 
that their investments are much the same as those 
any prudent portfolio manager would consider 
sound under normal circumstances. Except for the 
fact that pension fund managers have to deal with 
legislation and regulation from a variety of 
sources - a problem that might be alleviated by 
greater standardization of existing legislation - 
general pension legislation does not seem to be a 
serious constraint.' 

The federal Income Tax Act also contains provi­ 
sions that relate to pension fund investment. Pension 
plans are not normally taxed on the income from 
their investments, nor are they eligible for the tax 
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TABLE 6-1 

THE REGULATORS OF PENSION INVESTMENT 

Type of pension plan 

Occupational 
Personal Universal 

Consolidated 
CPP QPP revenue plans 

Membership All employed All employed Some government 
workers outside workers in Quebec employees only. 
Quebec, plus with income above 
Armed Forces and minimum. 
RCMP in Quebec, 
with income above 
minimum. 

Regulators of 
investment 

Legislation CPP Act: QPP Act: Usually specific 
Surplus funds Surplus funds act of sponsor- 
loaned to provinces deposited with ing government; all 
in proportion to Caisse de dépôt et surplus funds 
contributions placement du deposited with, and 
collected. Interest Québec; investment become liability of, 
rate equal to restricted to assets sponsoring govern- 
average rate on eligible under ment. 
Government of Canadian and 
Canada bonds of British Insurance 
similar maturity. Companies' Act 

and Quebec Life 
Insurance Act. 

Trusteed and 
insured plans RRSP 

Some government 
and some private­ 
sector employees. 

A vailable to all 
employment income 
earners with occupa­ 
tional plan contri­ 
butions below 
maximum. 

Federal and Income Tax Act 
Provincial and Provincial 
Employee Benefit Trustee Acts: Limit 
Standards Acts and on foreign assets. 
Provincial Trustee 
Acts: Investments 
restricted to assets 
specified in various 
acts. Restrictions 
similar to restric- 
tions of Canadian 
and British 
Insurance Com- 
panies' Act. 

May bias No effect. Taxation of fund No effect. 
income 

May bias 
investment away 
from equities. 

Large size of fund No effect. 
may make adjust- 
ment of portfolio 
difficult and may 
bias investment in 
favour of Govern- 

May bias 
investment away 
from equities. 

investment away 
from equities. 

Characteristics of No effect. 
plan and 
sponsor 

Liquidity needs Not applicable. 
and willingness 
of sponsor to bear 
risk will affect 
investment. 

ment bonds. 

Supply of assets, 
prospective return, 
and risk will affect 
investment. 

Market conditions No effect. No effect. Supply of assets, 
prospective return, 
and risk will affect 
investment. 

Supply of assets, 
prospective return, 
and risk will affect 
investment. 

When this limit is exceeded, a tax equivalent to 
1 per cent of the excess is applicable for that month. 
This means that, in practice, the foreign assets of a 
Canadian pension fund are effectively limited to 
10 per cent of its total holdings. Moreover, at 
present, Canadian pension fund investments in the 
United States are subject to a withholding tax in 
that country, while U.S. pension funds investing in 
Canadian securities are not subject to a withholding 
tax in this country. 

Contributions to registered retirement savings 
plans (RRSPS) are deductible for tax purposes up to 

credit that is available to individuals receiving divi­ 
dends from Canadian corporations. Thus, while the 
rate of return on both bonds and stocks is higher for 
pension funds than for most individuals, it is rela­ 
tively higher on bonds. In that sense, stocks may be 
less attractive to pension funds than to individuals. 

Canadian pension funds are also discouraged 
from investing in foreign securities by both domestic 
and U.S. legislation. Under Canada's Income Tax 
Act, pension funds enjoy a tax-exempt status only if 
no more than 10 per cent of their holdings at the 
end of any month are in the form of foreign assets. 



a specified maximum, and any income earned by 
the plans themselves is tax-exempt. Of course, any 
amount received from an RRSP is considered as 
regular income and taxed at the full marginal rate. 
There are no special tax concessions for realized 
capital gains, nor is there any dividend tax credit. 
Thus relative to individuals investing outside these 
plans, RRSPS have the same bias towards fixed­ 
income securities as trusteed pension funds. 

By and large, it seems that market conditions and 
self-regulation - particularly conditions laid down 
by plan sponsors - have more impact on the pat­ 
tern of investment by trusteed plans than legislation 
or government regulation. Pension fund managers 
need to match the maturity structure of their asset 
portfolio with that of future liabilities. Future 
liabilities and cash flows will be determined by 
many factors: the characteristics of the plan itself, 
such as the benefit formula, the contribution rates, 
and the actuarial valuation method; the kind of 
business that the sponsoring firm is engaged in and 
its prospects for expansion; and, finally, the age 
profile and expected turnover rate of its work force. 

Given the overall characteristics of the plan, 
market considerations of risk, return, and liquidity 
will be important investment criteria. For example, 
pension fund managers feel that, at a time when 
stock market performance is poor overall, the "pru­ 
dent man" rule would generally advise against pur­ 
chasing anything less than high-quality stocks. Also, 
only the better-quality stocks trade regularly and in 
sufficient quantity to provide the good supply and 
turnover potential necessary to make them attrac­ 
tive to institutional investors. 

A further important consideration is the size of a 
given fund in relation to the financial market as a 
whole. Large funds tend to have difficulty in readily 
adjusting their portfolios to changing market condi­ 
tions, since their purchase or sales may substantially 
affect the price of a particular security. The signifi­ 
cance of this problem is underlined by the fact that 
some 49 funds held about two-thirds (almost $18 
billion in 1977) of all trusteed pension fund assets. 
Existing constraints on investment in foreign securi­ 
ties exacerbate the situation by limiting access to 
international financial markets, and they will 
become more severe in the future as the share of 
pension plans in Canada's total financial assets 
increases. 

Such considerations obviously call for a good deal 
of personal judgment on the part of fund managers. 
But that judgment may also be tempered by the 
sponsor's requirements. Despite the fund manager's 
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fiduciary responsibility to future pensioners, his 
accountability is usually solely to the plan sponsor, 
reflecting the fact that it is the sponsor who must 
make up any experience deficiencies. (In this 
respect, it should be noted, however, that in Canada 
an employer can terminate a plan at any time and, 
in contrast with the situation in the United States, 
he is not legally liable for any unfunded liability 
that then exists.) And although any surplus may be 
used to reduce employer contributions, they are 
often seen by plan membership as an opportunity to 
increase benefits. This feature can bias investment 
against high-risk assets that could either engender 
significant deficits or provide the kind of high 
returns that motivate employees to ask for higher 
benefits. In addition, some sponsors may give expli­ 
cit instructions to fund managers to avoid certain 
types of investments - for example, on social or 
moral grounds. 

THE PATTERN OF INVESTMENT 

In 1977, trusteed and insured pension plans held 
51.6 per cent of the total assets of Canadian pension 
funds. Together, the Canada Pension Plan and the 
various government consolidated-revenue pension 
plans accounted for 42.1 per cent of the total, and 
the Quebec Pension Plan for a further 6.3 per cent. 
The cpp funds are, of course, invested almost entire­ 
ly in provincial bonds, while consolidated-revenue 
plans are backed by the contingent liabilities of 
their respective governments. 

By contrast, the surplus funds of the QPP are 
recycled in the private market through the Caisse de 
dépôt et placement du Québec. In 1977, QPP assets 
accounted for about 95 per cent of the Caisse's 
general fund assets. The Caisse also invests on 
behalf of several other pension plans - for exam­ 
ple, the Quebec construction union plan - which 
are segregated from its general fund. 

More than half of the Caisse's general fund has 
been invested in Quebec government bonds and 
three-quarters in bonds of all types (Chart 6-6). 
Roughly 10 per cent of total general-fund assets 
have been invested in corporate stock, and almost all 
of them were of corporations listed on the stock 
exchange. The expense and difficulty of investing in 
new or small firms (most of which are not listed on 
the exchange) have prevented the Caisse from 
making any large amounts of funds available to 
them. It should be noted, however, that the rate of 
return on the Caisse's investments has generally 
exceeded that of the cpp - by about one-half of 
I per cent in the 1970-77 period - although this is 

._------------------------------------------------------------~----~~---- 
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due in part to the fact that Province of Quebec 
bonds generally have a higher rate of interest than 
federal bonds, which provide the basis for the rates 
of return on CPP funds. 

CHART 6-6 
DISTRIBUTION OF THE BOOK VALUE OF ASSETS OF 
THE GENERAL FUND OF THE CAISSE DE DÉPÔT ET 
PLACEMENT DU QUÉBEC, BY MAJOR ASSET 
CATEGORY, 1968-78' 
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The proportion of the total assets of private-sector 
trusteed pension plans (which account for 50.5 per 
cent of the assets of all trusteed plans) held in stocks 
rose steadily from the early 1960s to the mid-1970s, 
although it declined from 1975 to 1977 (Chart 6-7). 
The proportion held in bonds, especially government 
bonds, was almost halved from 1962 to 1977. 
Nevertheless, in 1977 some 50 per cent of the total 
remained in fixed-interest securities (bonds and 
mortgages) and about 30 per cent in stocks. Foreign 
securities (mainly stocks and bonds) have remained 
well below 10 per cent of total holdings. 

Although we have not investigated individual 
portfolios, there are also strong indications that 
trusteed pension plans tend to concentrate their 
equity investments in low-risk securities - particu­ 
larly blue-chip issues - to a greater extent than do 
individuals. This would be in line with the "prudent 

CHART 6-7 
DISTRIBUTION OF THE BOOK VALUE OF ASSETS OF 
PRIVATE-SECTOR TRUSTEED PENSION PLANS, BY 
MAJOR ASSET CATEGORY, CANADA, 1962-77 
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man" approach. The various quality tests that 
stocks must satisfy in accordance with federal and 
provincial legislation would also militate against 
consideration of "lower-quality" stocks. 

The behaviour of public-sector trusteed plans dif­ 
fers considerably, however, from that of private-sec­ 
tor plans. Although public-sector trusteed plans as a 
whole also reduced the proportion of bonds in their 
total holdings between 1962 and 1977, the share 
remaining in bonds in 1977 was still about twice 
that of private-sector plans. In contrast, the share of 
stocks in their portfolios, although larger than in 
earlier years, was still only half that of private-sec­ 
tor plans. These differences largely reflect the oper­ 
ations of trusteed pension plans of provincial and 
municipal governments and their agencies 
(Chart 6-8). In this connection, it might be noted, 
however, that the Province of Ontario has undertak­ 
en an experimental program to direct more govern­ 
ment trusteed pension plan funds - notably those 
of the Ontario Municipal Employees' Retirement 
System (OMERS) - into private-sector securities. 
The asset pattern of the trusteed plans of federal 
Crown corporations has been more like that of 
private-sector plans, except that there is a larger 
share in mortgages (Chart 6-9). 
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More than four-fifths of the RRSPS are adminis­ 
tered by trust companies and insurance companies, 
but no breakdown of investments is available for 
them. Assuming that RRSP funds are invested in the 
same way as the general assets of agencies respon­ 
sible for their administration, they would tend to 
hold a high proportion of mortgages, either directly 
or by way of guaranteed funds. Perhaps one-fifth of 
their total would be in equities, although the equity 
share has declined relative to mortgages and guar­ 
anteed funds in the 1970s. This decline may reflect 
the fact that individuals may be able to get better 
tax treatment on the equity portion of their 
investments -- through the dividend credit as well 
as the lower tax rate on capital gains -- by keeping 
it outside of RRSPs. In any event, like private trus­ 
teed and insured pension funds, a high proportion of 
RRSP funds are invested in the private sector. 

Their particular mix of investments will, of 
course, directly affect the rate of return on the 
assets of trusteed plans. For the 1963-77 period as a 
whole, the combined rate of return for private- and 
public-sector trusteed plans was greater than an 
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CHART 6-9 
DISTRIBUTION OF THE BOOK VALUE OF ASSETS OF 
THE TRUSTEED PENSION PLANS OF FEDERAL CROWN 
CORPORATIONS, BY MAJOR ASSET CATEGORY, 
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CHART 6-10 
BOOK VALUE OF ASSETS OFMAJOR LONG-TERM 
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TABLE 6-2 

AVERAGE ANNUAL RATE OF RETURN ON TRUSTEED PENSION PLANS AND SELECTED ASSETS, 
FIVE-YEAR TIME PERIODS, CANADA, 1963-77 

Government 
of Canada Toronto 

Trusteed pension plans Bonds 90-day 90-day 30-day Stock 
Treasury financial financial Exchange 

Public Private Total Provincial Municipal Utilities Industrial bills paper paper "300" 

1963-67 5.43 2.08 2.08 1.61 1.49 4.18 5.12 4.82 11.02 
1968-72 7.63 8.69 8.23 7.25 7.58 7.32 7.69 5.49 6.47 6.31 9.89 
1973-77 7.53 4.88 6.07 6.92 7.36 7.63 7.33 7.47 8.81 8.61 1.20 

Mean, 
1963-77 6.57 5.39 5.64 5.48 5.46 5.70 6.79 6.57 7.28 

investor might have earned on a portfolio consisting 
entirely of long-term bonds (Table 6-2). In the same 
period, however, the trusteed plans were outper­ 
formed by the Toronto Stock Exchange index of 
300 common stocks and by 90-day finance paper. 
For the 1973-77 period, on the other hand, a port­ 
folio based entirely on any of the major bond 
categories would have outperformed the trusteed 
plans, but one matching the composition of the TSE 

CHART 6-11 
DISTRIBUTION OF THE BOOK VALUE OF ASSETS OF 
LIFE INSURANCE COMPANIES, BY MAJOR ASSET 
CATEGORY, CANADA, 1962-77 
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index would not. Clearly, the funds' poor perform­ 
ance in recent years reflects the dismal behaviour of 
common stocks. It should be emphasized, too, that 
nothing can be inferred about management prac­ 
tices on the basis of these highly aggregative figures. 

The combined effect of all of the factors bearing 
on pension fund investment has therefore been to 
direct large amounts of funds into fixed-interest 

CHART 6-12 
DISTRIBUTION OF THE BOOK VALUE OF ASSETS OF 
TRUST AND MORTGAGE LOAN COMPANIES, BY 
MAJOR ASSET CATEGORY, CANADA, 1962-77 
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secunues, especially those of governments. Both 
trusteed pension funds - particularly private-sector 
funds - and RRSPS have nonetheless been impor­ 
tant sources of funds, including equity funds, for the 
private sector. In recent years, however, there have 
been major shifts in the portfolios of trusteed 
funds - a fact that suggests that present legislation 
allows a good deal of flexibility. Where differences 
in investment patterns do occur, as between provin­ 
cial and municipal government trusteed funds and 
private-sector funds, they can be largely explained 
by constraints imposed by the sponsors rather than 
by general pension legislation. 

As of the end of 1977, trusteed pension plans - 
in the public and private sectors combined - held 
assets roughly equal to those of life insurance com­ 
panies and to about 90 per cent of those of mort­ 
gage loan and trust companies (Chart 6-10). In 
contrast with these other major long-term financial 
intermediaries, private-sector trusteed funds, in par­ 
ticular, have tended to hold a much larger propor­ 
tion of their total assets in stocks and a much 
smaller proportion in mortgages (Charts 6-7, 6-11, 
6-12). It should be noted that the relevant legisla­ 
tion limits the holdings of stocks by insurance com­ 
panies more strictly than those by pension funds. 

THE ECONOMIC IMPLICATIONS OF 
PENSION FUND INVESTMENT PATTERNS 

The substantial differences in the investment pat­ 
terns of various types of pension funds, as well as 
between pension funds and other financial inter­ 
mediaries, suggest that changes in the proportion of 
total saving flowing through the pension system - 
or changes in the mix of the system itself - will 
have significant implications for financial markets. 
It is impossible for us to assess what the ultimate 
allocation of savings among various sectors or finan­ 
cial instruments would be, since, as the flows of 
saving change, the prices of financial assets - 
i.e. the interest rates - would also change; given 
our present knowledge of investment strategies, 
however, certain general directions of change can be 
suggested. 

THE ALLOCATION OF SAVINGS 

Large quantities of pension savings are now 
directed towards government, either directly as the 
result of legislation - through the Canada Pension 
Plan and various consolidated-revenue plans - or 
indirectly because of the restrictions imposed on the 
access of pension funds to certain assets, thereby 
making government securities more attractive. 
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Given existing investment constraints for the various 
types of pension funds, increasing the share of sav­ 
ings channeled through those funds would tend to 
expand the resources available to governments, 
especially at the provincial level, relative to the 
private sector, particularly to corporations and bor­ 
rowers of mortgage funds. Reduced demand by the 
provinces in capital markets would probably result 
in smaller inflows of foreign capital for government 
securities, but any shortage of domestic savings 
would be reflected in larger inflows of foreign capi­ 
tal for corporate securities. 

These effects would be reinforced if the Canada 
Pension Plan were expanded relative to private-sec­ 
tor plans. They would, on the other hand, be 
reduced if private trusteed pension plans were 
expanded relative to the public plans. They would 
also be reduced if CPP funds were invested more like 
QPP funds - even more so if the CPP investment 
pattern were more like that of private trusteed 
funds. In the two latter cases, more pension savings 
would be available for corporate financing, particu­ 
larly in the form of equity capital, though at the 
expense of mortgage and provincial financing 
requirements, and less foreign money would likely 
flow into Canadian business. Expansion of RRSPS 
relative to other private-sector pension funds would 
imply a lesser impact on mortgage financing. 

Just how such shifts would ultimately be reflected 
in real resource use is even more difficult to assess. 
Increased funding of the CPP and QPP beyond 
present levels would improve the financial position 
of the provinces, but it would, at the same time, 
reduce federal tax revenues. There is at least some 
evidence to suggest that this captured source of 
funds would lead to increased government expendi­ 
tures, more likely on the part of the less affluent 
provinces. It is difficult, if not impossible, to prove 
that this would result in saving allocations that 
would be less productive than private alternatives. 
As long as governments do not have to bid competi­ 
tively for these savings, however, the suspicion - 
and indeed the danger - remains that misallocation 
may occur. 

It should be pointed out that withdrawing the 
availability of CPP funds could cause difficulties for 
some provinces, at least in the short run. Their 
borrowing from the cpp has tended to increase the 
total debt of the poorer provinces. Without access to 
these funds, the Atlantic provinces, in particular, 
would have to either reduce expenditures, increase 
taxes, or borrow at higher rates of interest from 
other sources. 
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In addition, since institutional pension funds tend 
to avoid investing in high-risk ventures or in firms 
without a sufficiently long record of dividends, new 
firms and firms in high-risk activities find it more 
difficult to raise capital now than they would if the 
funds were invested by individuals. It has been 
suggested that, because of this situation, such enter­ 
prises have frequently been forced to obtain foreign 
capital, resulting in a high level of foreign owner­ 
ship among potentially expanding firms. This prob­ 
lem could be alleviated by creating "venture invest­ 
ment companies" that would act as 
intermediaries - by "pooling" venture capital 
risk - between institutional investors, particularly 
pension funds, and new or more risky investments.' 
The re-insurance scheme announced by the federal 
government in March 1979 is also designed specifi­ 
cally to meet this problem, and the Council wel­ 
comes its establishment. 

The question of the bias against the purchase of 
foreign securities by pension funds may be more 
contentious than the issue of investment in high-risk 
ventures. From the viewpoint of the income security 
goal, pension funds should be able to invest in assets 
that offer the highest return - regardless of their 
origin - after allowance for risk. If rates of return 
were generally higher in Canada, this approach 
would also be consistent with raising the rate of 
growth in GNP per capita. Some argue, however, 
that Canadian pension savings should be used only 
in Canada, to increase capital formation in this 
country. In effect, they are emphasizing the impor­ 
tance of another goal, perhaps at the expense of the 
income security objective. There may be nothing 
wrong with this, but when it is done, the purpose of 
the policy should be set out explicitly, and the level 
and distribution of the costs and benefits of this 
option should be examined. 

In Chapter 5 we questioned the fairness of achiev­ 
ing this alternative objective through a method that 
bears most heavily on lower-income groups. Equally 
important, the real purpose of investment is not to 
attain a larger capital stock but higher real income. 
If pension savings were invested only in Canada, 
without regard to the rate of return, the ultimate 
result could be a much larger capital stock but little 
increase in income. Moreover, with Canadian pen­ 
sion fund assets expected to increase more rapidly 
than GNP in the years to come, it may become even 
more difficult for large funds to acquire Canadian 
securities without greatly affecting their prices. 
Freer access to good-quality foreign securities might 
enable them to increase their rates of return for any 
given level of risk. 

THE EFFICIENCY OF CAPITAL MARKETS 

Efficient capital markets will allocate savings to 
their most productive uses - to produce the kinds 
of goods and services that consumers want most - 
in the least costly way. The conditions that lead to 
greater efficiency are those that promote 
competition - namely, the largest number of par­ 
ticipants in the market and transactions effected 
through the market - and full use of all available 
information. 

Because the Canada Pension Plan and govern­ 
ment consolidated-revenue plans bypass the finan­ 
cial market, they cause a reduction in the number of 
participants and transactions in the market. If these 
plans, especially the CPP, were expanded relative to 
the smaller but more numerous occupational pen­ 
sion plans and to the RRSPS, efficiency could be 
further reduced. Indeed, from the efficiency point of 
view, all the funds flowing into government hands 
should be invested through freely operating finan­ 
cial markets - as is already the case with the 
Quebec Pension Plan - so that all government 
borrowing would be subjected to the market test. 

Large government funds are, of course, not the 
only potential source of inefficiency in financial 
markets. Large private funds - pension or 
otherwise - can also reduce efficiency if they exert 
monopoly power and influence prices. As we have 
noted, even the assets of the trusteed pension funds 
in Canada are rather highly concentrated in a rela­ 
tively small number of funds. Moreover, the tenden­ 
cy for individuals to deposit large amounts of sav­ 
ings, including RRSP savings, in banks, trust 
companies, and other financial institutions - in 
addition to pension funds - instead of investing 
directly, also reduces the number of market partici­ 
pants and may, on this account at least, reduce 
efficiency. 

There is danger, however, that this view may be 
oversimplified. Since larger pension funds, for 
example, may have access to better investment 
information, some concentration of pension savings 
may even help to increase market efficiency. 
Whether such information could be made more 
readily available in other ways, however, is a ques­ 
tion worth asking. 

There is also the question of concentration of 
industry control in the hands of pension funds. 
Serious questions have been raised in Britain, for 
example, about the need for more regulation of 
what has been termed "the private corporate 
state" - the private savings institutions, including 



pension funds, that have come to command enor­ 
mous power within the economy.' Questions have 
also been raised in the United States about "pension 
fund socialisrn.:" Such emotive labels may overstate 
the case, and, in any event, pension benefits legisla­ 
tion in Canada has for some time been more com­ 
prehensive than in the United States or Britain. At 
the very least, however, a case can be made for 
improving the information publicly available on 
pension fund investments, for the benefit of both 
plan participants and other investors. 

In the absence of additional safeguards, the prob­ 
lem of concentration and control could be exacer­ 
bated by action to direct a larger portion of the 
pension savings now in the hands of governments 
back into the financial market. Government pension 
funds are so large that they could influence prices in 
the market and thereby create another type of 
inefficiency, especially if they are invested in firms 
or industries for reasons other than return and risk 
considerations. Moreover, large amounts of private 
bonds and stocks would be held by government-con­ 
trolled funds. This would give governments 
increased influence over private corporations - 
influence that would not normally be subject to 
parliamentary scrutiny. In brief, it would be neces­ 
sary to insulate the market from excessive govern­ 
ment influence. 

This problem could be avoided - although others 
could be raised - by continuing to restrict public­ 
fund investment to government bond issues, as the 
cpp does at present. As long as this access to 
captured funds did not affect total government bor­ 
rowing, there would be no reduction in the funds 
available for private investment. 

The Swedish approach to this problem has been 
to decentralize the main public pension fund initial­ 
ly into three subfunds. Prohibited from investing in 
stocks, they were at first permitted to invest only in 
such securities as bonds, debentures, and promissory 
note loans issued by, or through, financial institu­ 
tions. In 1974, a fourth fund was set up explicitly to 
permit direct investment in shares, but this accounts 
for less than 1 per cent of the total funds. Even so, 
there is concern among many in Sweden that this 
fourth fund will be used by the government to 
nationalize Swedish industry indirectly. 

A similar strategy has been suggested for cpp 
funds and has already been adopted by the QPP to 
some extent.' The funds would be deposited with a 
financial institution "whose operations are at arm's 
length from the government concerned" or, for a 
large province like Ontario, with a minimum of four 
such institutions, each related to different sectors of 
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the economy - manufacturing, resource, service, 
and financial - and each dominated by representa­ 
tives of its sector rather than by government. Such 
an arrangement would reduce the problem of politi­ 
cal control and, perhaps, the potential for capital 
market distortion. Sectoral representatives would, 
however, likely bias such funds towards investment 
in the sector they represent. This would be undesir­ 
able, since financial resources would not necessarily 
flow to their most productive uses. 

Another strategy might get around the latter 
problem too. The Toronto Stock Exchange, while 
expressing serious reservations about fully funded 
public pension plans, has suggested that what funds 
are accumulated "should be managed on a competi­ 
tive basis under contracts with investment managers 
in the private sector."? Recognizing too, however, 
that there has been a trend towards concentration of 
power in the hands of private-sector institutional 
investors, the Exchange has recommended a move 
towards greater involvement of individuals in 
managing their pension savings. 

CONCLUSION 

The proportion of Canada's saving that is chan­ 
neled through pension funds is already substantial, 
and it is likely to grow much larger. Given existing 
investment practices and constraints, a large 
amount of that saving will be allocated to the 
government sector, in large part bypassing financial 
markets entirely. Quebec Pension Plan savings - 
and, even more so, those in private trusteed and 
insured funds and RRSPS - do flow in substantial 
amounts to the private sector. In fact, the private­ 
sector trusteed funds are among the more important 
sources of finance for the corporate sector, although 
they tend to invest in less-risky securities to a 
greater degree than, for example, individuals. 

It is difficult to prove that the large flow of 
pension saving into government funds has resulted 
in an actual misallocation of resources, particularly 
when it is recalled that governments are important 
investors in human, as well as physical, resources. 
Nevertheless, there are very good reasons for chan­ 
neling a much higher proportion of the growing flow 
of pension saving through the financial market, 
where it will be seen to be subject to the test of the 
market. In other words, governments will be seen to 
compete on the same basis as other users of savings. 
It should be recognized, however, that such recy­ 
cling of "captive" savings back through the market 
may require additional action to ensure that large 
government pension funds, like large private funds, 
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do not exercise undue influence on the market or 
undue control over particular industries. 

More recycling of government pension fund sav­ 
ings or expansion of private-sector plans would 
likely increase domestic resources available for cor­ 
porate finance, and it could help to reduce the level 
of foreign ownership and control of Canadian indus­ 
try. Although this might well be, to some extent at 
least, at the expense of funds available for mortgage 
financing, the likelihood is that, as the population 
ages, the demand for mortgage funds will in any 
event decrease relative to other requirements. 

Our work suggests that changes in pension ben­ 
efits legislation, as it affects investment, may have 
much less influence on future investment patterns 
than anything that is done directly to the various 
government or government-backed pension plans. 
We do, however, foresee the need for some easing of 
the impact of income tax legislation on the invest­ 
ment of pension funds in foreign securities and, as 
well perhaps, some expansion of the "basket" 
clause. We would hope also that providing more 
information to plan participants about pension fund 
investments would preclude the need for more 
detailed investment regulation. 



7 The Work Choice 

How retirement income plans affect savings is not 
among the daily preoccupations of most people. The 
majority of us are far more concerned with such 
questions as: Can I get work if I want it? Do I have 
to wait until I am old to get enough time off work to 
do some of the things I like to do? Do I have any 
choice about when I retire? What happens if my 
health gives out? Will I be forced to retire at a 
certain age even if I am still able and willing to 
work? What happens to my pension benefits if I 
change jobs? 

The retirement income system contains a number 
of features that affect the choice between working 
and not working and even the choice of jobs. In 
particular, it has reinforced the long-standing trend 
towards earlier retirement. Whether that trend 
should continue to be encouraged is now being 
questioned for economic as well as other reasons. 
On the other hand, it is argued that workers should 
have greater freedom to retire when they wish. But 
extending that freedom of choice in either direction 
involves costs as well as benefits - for the individu­ 
al worker, for the firm, and for the economy as a 
whole. The costs and benefits of alternative ways of 
expanding freedom of work choice must be evaluat­ 
ed in the light of the changing needs of our society. 

THE MIX OF INCENTIVES 

Even in the absence of an income security system, 
the choice between work and leisure can be affected 
by a variety of factors, such as higher incomes, 
overtime pay, and job satisfaction. "Leisure" may 
also be forced on people because of health consider­ 
ations or lack of employment opportunities. The 
presence of retirement Income plans adds other 
considera tions. 

Retirement benefits may increase the wealth 
available to individuals as they approach a certain 

age, thereby inducing them to diminish, or even 
stop, their participation in the labour force, as well 
as to change their savings behaviour (see 
Chapter 5). If retirement benefits are also work- or 
income-conditioned - that is, payable only if the 
individual does not work (or perhaps does not work 
in a particular job) or does not earn more than some 
given amount - work may become less attractive 
than leisure. The very existence of retirement ben­ 
efits linked to a specific age may condition people to 
think of retiring at that age. Some observers have 
also suggested that in expectation of potentially 
higher benefits, people will want to work even more 
than they would otherwise, perhaps by working 
overtime or holding a second job. Finally, the mobil­ 
ity of labour may be reduced if higher benefits 
depend on long service with one employer. 

In this context, the distinction between age of 
entitlement and age of retirement is particularly 
important. The term "retirement" in this report is 
used in the sense of withdrawal, either complete or 
partial, from the labour force. Thus a "retired" 
person may work part-time. On the other hand, 
withdrawal from the labour force is not necessarily 
a condition of entitlement to pension benefits. 

At given benefit levels, raising or lowering the age 
of entitlement has a direct and immediate impact on 
the cost of benefits (see Chapter 3). Withdrawal 
from labour force participation, on the other hand, 
involves another type of cost - costs for the econo­ 
my in terms of output forgone, leading to a reduc­ 
tion in the revenue base from which benefits are 
paid. The catch is, of course, that changing the age 
of entitlement may also affect the choice of retire­ 
ment age. 

The choice between work and leisure, and the 
choice of a job, can be affected by the availability of 
benefits - and particularly, perhaps, by the pres­ 
ence of less than fully funded benefits; the income- 
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testing of GIS and provincial top-up programs; and 
the vesting, locking-in, portability, and mandatory 
retirement provisions of occupational plans.' In this 
connection it is worth noting that Canada's public 
retirement income system contains less potential for 
distortion of the work/leisure choice than the 
U.S. social security system. Under the latter, the 
total benefit available to an individual is subject to 
an earnings test that, in effect, imposes a 50 per 
cent tax on earnings over a specified amount. In 
addition, the system has early retirement provisions. 
In contrast, Canada and Quebec Pension Plan ben­ 
efits are not earnings-tested, and they have no provi­ 
sion for early retirement other than for disability. 

The features of our retirement income system 
that affect work choices did not evolve in a vacuum. 
They developed out of the needs of our society, as 
perceived by various interest groups. The increase in 
benefits themselves resulted from the realization 
that something needed to be done for the older 
population. At the same time, higher benefits, as 
well as such provisions as mandatory retirement, 
were useful in balancing labour force supply and 
demand and in opening up jobs to younger 
workers - a reflection of the trauma experienced 
during the high-unemployment period of the 1930s 
and, indeed, of the needs created more recently by 
rapid labour-force growth. In these circumstances, 
the income-testing of retirement programs may have 
helped both to keep public expenditures down and to 
secure jobs for younger workers. What remains to 
be seen is how effective these various incentives and 
disincentives are and whether the present balance of 
incentives in our retirement programs will be appro­ 
priate in the face of slower demographic growth and 
the increasingly frequent tendency to distinguish 
between the "young old" - those still very much 
physically capable of an active life - and the "old 
0Id."2 

THE TREND TOWARDS EARLIER 
RETIREMENT 

CHART 7-1 
lABOUR FORCE PARTICIPATION RATES) OF OlPER 
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CHART 7-2 
lABOUR FORCE PARTICIPATION RATES OF 
POPUlA TION' AGED 65 AND OVER, CANADA, 
1921 TO 1971 
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Canadian men aged 65 and over have participat- 
ed less and less in the labour market on a full-time 1951 ~F~~~~~~~~;;;J 
basis in recent years, continuing a long-run trend 
that has been present since at least the end of the 
First World War (Charts 7-1 and 7-2). Since the 
mid-1960s, this trend has been reinforced by the 
lower labour-force participation of men aged 
55 to 64. Those in this group who have withdrawn 
from the labour force have, for the most part, left it 
entirely; few of them have undertaken part-time 
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TABLE 7-1 

ACTUAL AND PROJECTED LABOUR FORCE PARTICIPATION RATE OF POPULATION AGED 65 AND 
OVER, BY SEX, SELECTED COUNTRIES, 1950, 1970, AND 2000 

work. The participation of older women in the 
labour force has provided a marked contrast. 
Women aged 55 to 64 became more and more 
engaged in full-time work in the late 1950s and 
early 1960s, although this trend has slowed down 
recently, while the participation rate of women 
aged 65 and over has remained relatively stable for 
many years. 

In comparison with the early 1960s, the number 
of Canadians now retiring after age 65 is down, 
while the number of those retiring at 65 or even 
earlier has risen (Chart 7-3). It is worth noting, 
however, that the participation rate of Canadians 
aged 65 and over is already closer to European 
levels than that of their U.S. or Japanese counter­ 
parts, for example (Table 7-1). 

Of course, longer retirement has not been the 
only way in which the proportions of work and 
leisure in the life cycle have been altered. Over the 
last four decades, the average duration of working 
time has been shortened both in terms of hours per 
day and days per week; holidays have been 
increased in length; and a larger proportion of the 
population has remained longer in school. Neverthe­ 
less, earlier retirement has become increasingly 
important, and in re-examining the alternatives, it is 
worth asking what has brought it about. 

Canada has had earnings-related public pension 
programs only since 1966 and during the first 
10 years of the CPP and QPP, the plans contained 
both incentives to delay retirement and disincentives 
to labour force participation in the form of earnings 
and retirement tests.' Thus the experience of those 
years is of limited value in explaining the long-run 
effects of the plans. Some additional light was cast 
on the subject by the Retirement Survey carried out 
by Statistics Canada for Health and Welfare 
Canada in 1975 - after the disincentives were 
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CHART 7-3 
PERCENTAGE OF ME1'I THAT LEFT! THE LABOUR 
FORCE, BY AGE, CANADA, 1961 AND 1976 
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removed from the CPP - although even the data 
from that investigation are not completely satisfac­ 
tory and results based on them must be treated with 
great caution.' 

When discussing early retirement, it appears 
necessary to distinguish between two things: the 
long-run decline in the average age of retirement or 
of labour force participation by older people, and 
the reasons for retiring before or after what has 
come to be considered the normal retirement age - 
roughly 65 in Canada. 

The long-run decline in the labour force partici­ 
pation of older people cannot be explained by health 
considerations, since the lengthening of life expect- 

Men Women 

1950 1970 2000 1950 1970 2000 

(Per cent) 

Canada 36.9 20.9 15.0 2.7 5.1 4.1 
United States 45.0 25.8 19.3 9.7 9.2 7.8 
Japan 54.5 54.4 37.2 21.6 19.6 14.5 
Sweden 36.6 18.3 13.2 7.9 4.0 3.2 
United Kingdom 31.8 19.8 14.9 5.3 6.3 5.4 
West Germany 26.6 16.0 11.9 9.4 5.8 4.9 
France 38.4 13.6 9.4 13.8 6.0 4.5 
Spain 66.6 23.1 13.5 10.6 4.3 2.5 
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ancy has been accompanied to some extent by an 
improvement in health. Nor can it be explained 
entirely by the presence of organized pension plans, 
since it began well before such plans were wide­ 
spread in Canada. Rather, it probably reflects such 
general factors as rising income levels, which have 
in turn been reflected in more adequate pension 
plans. 

But once some norm for the retirement age is 
established, the major influences on early retirement 
appear to be pension-related factors and health 
considerations. Less important, apparently, are a 
variety of other factors not related to pension con­ 
siderations, including aggregate economic variables 
such as unemployment. Health considerations are 
obviously related to income and pension consider­ 
ations, however, and the effects of each set of 
factors are difficult to disentangle, let alone 
quantify. 

The Council's own work based on the Retirement 
Survey brings out several interesting points: the 
likelihood that individuals will retire before the age 
of 65 increases with the level of retirement income; 
the likelihood that an individual will retire because 
of health reasons decreases with the level of retire­ 
ment income; the likelihood that individuals with 
poor health will retire early is much greater for 
those with high retirement incomes than for those 
with low retirement incomes (Table 7-2). These 
results confirm expectations. People with a high 
retirement income have a greater degree of choice. 
Other things being equal, lower-income people are 
more likely to work longer, whatever the state of 
their health, than high-income people. 

Further confirmation of the relationship between 
retirement income and earlier retirement is provided 
by econometric work commissioned by the Council 
to examine the incentives to early retirement in the 
public pension plans.' It would appear that individu- 

ais with high retirement income might retire per­ 
haps two years earlier than those with low retire­ 
ment income. Given this finding, it is not difficult to 
understand why the sharpest drop in the participa­ 
tion rates of older men took place after the retire­ 
ment income system was improved in the mid- 
1960s, or why the sharpest decline occurred in the 
64-65 age group. 

Universal income-tested pension plans such as GIS 
and provincial top-up programs, while providing a 
basic minimum income for the elderly poor, can be 
expected to discourage them from seeking employ­ 
ment after the age of entitlement. For every two 
dollars of income received from any other source, 
including pensions, the GIS payment is reduced by 
one dollar - an effective marginal tax rate of 
50 per cent. For several of the provincial programs, 
this rate is 100 per cent. Unfortunately, the Retire­ 
ment Survey does not distinguish the recipients of 
GIS and provincial top-up benefits from the others, 
so that the degree to which these programs discour­ 
age labour force participation cannot be estimated 
with any certainty. Since, however, they apply only 
to persons aged 65 and over (and in some cases to 
the disabled at an earlier age), the number dis­ 
couraged from working would be much smaller than 
for programs such as unemployment insurance, 
which affect the whole work force. 

The effects of mandatory retirement on the deci­ 
sion to withdraw from the labour force are conten­ 
tious but ambiguous. Mandatory retirement provi­ 
sions usually specify withdrawal from a particular 
job rather than from the labour force itself, 
although in some cases - multi-employer plans, for 
example - they may preclude holding a job in any 
part of a specified industry. Because this withdrawal 
may involve loss of seniority, however, the older 
worker may find it more difficult to obtain a new 
job. On average, Canadian men subject to mandato­ 
ry retirement appear to retire slightly earlier than 

TABLE 7-2 
NUMBER OF MEN PER SAMPLE OF 1,000 WHO RETIRE BEFORE, AT, OR AFTER AGE 65, BY 
RETIREMENT INCOME GROUP AND BY REASON OF RETIREMENT, CANADA, 19751 

Reason for retirement 

Before 65 At 65 After 65 Total 

Health Other Total Health Other Total Health Other Total Health Other Total 

$0-$4,000 171 41 212 198 504 702 49 38 87 418 583 1,000 

$4,000-$8,000 106 128 234 151 558 709 10 47 57 267 733 1,000 

$8,000 + 105 485 590 25 356 381 29 29 130 870 1,000 

Weighted average 130 202 332 131 478 609 21 38 59 282 718 1,000 



those not so affected. Since mandatory retirement is 
more often linked to membership in a pension plan, 
however, this earlier retirement date may simply 
reflect the availability of a higher retirement 
income. In any event, what does seem to emerge 
from the evidence available is that mandatory 
retirement itself prevents only a minute percentage 
of the older group from further labour force partici­ 
pation (Chart 7-4). We emphasize again that these 
results must be treated with caution, although it is 
encouraging that they conform rather closely to the 
outcome of similar work in the United States." 

CHART 7-4 
DISTRIBUTION OF FULL-TIME EMPLOYEES AGED 55 
AND OVER IN RELATION TO MANDATORY 
RETIREMENT, CANADA, 1975 

51.9' Job not subject to mandatory retirement 

Job subject to mandatory retirement 

Planning to retire earlier 

Planning to retire at the mandatory 
retirement age 

Willing to retire 32.0 

·::rt~I Unwilling to retire 

The decision by older men as to whether to 
withdraw from the labour force is also affected by 
their level of education, since education enlarges the 
range of choices available. The better-educated 
older people tend to remain in the labour force 
somewhat longer than those with less education 
(Chart 7-5). It should perhaps be noted also that 
since January 1976 an unemployed individual 
aged 65 and over cannot apply for unemployment 
insurance benefits. Instead, at age 65 all unem­ 
ployed workers receive a lump sum payment equal 
to three weeks of such benefits. 
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CHART 7-5 
LABOUR FORCE PARTICIPATION RATES OF MEN AGED 
66 TO 70, BY LEVEL OF EDUCATION, CANADA, 19751 
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FLEXIBLE RETIREMENT 

Today's debate about the age of retirement has 
several facets. Some critics of the retirement income 
system suggest that the trend towards earlier with­ 
drawal from the labour force should be reversed 
because of its cost, while others believe that it will 
continue and that it should be encouraged. On the 
other hand, although human rights advocates and 
health experts have come out strongly against man­ 
datory retirement, there is much support for such 
provisions from both industry and organized labour. 

One point should be made clear. While there are 
arguments both for and against a specific age of 
retirement, there is no particular reason why that 
age should be 65. Indeed, the fact that 65 has 
become the average age of retirement in a number 
of countries seems to be an historical accident 
having its origin in Germany in 1916, when that age 
was set. 

The economic crux of the present debate lies in 
the advantages and disadvantages of extending free­ 
dom of choice as to retirement age and labour force 
participation: 

"Whether they want to work after 65 or not, most 
workers resent being denied the choice. They would like 
to retire at a time that suits them rather than their 
employer, their union, or their government. And because 
their numbers are growing, and with it the power of their 
votes, they are bringing strong pressure to bear on politi­ 
cians to raise the mandatory retirement age, or do away 
with it altogether. "7 

Actually, a more flexible retirement policy could 
involve two features: more freedom to select the 
time at which a pension would begin, and expanded 
possibilities for part-time work. But, regardless of 
how freedom of choice is increased, it involves costs 
and benefits that will vary depending upon the 
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method used. Whatever else is done, the ability to 
make rational choices would be greatly enhanced by 
the regular provision to pension plan participants of 
more information on benefits. 

INCREASING EARLY RETIREMENT CHOICES 

• 

There will always be some occupations where a 
retirement age earlier than the average is desirable 
because of their hazardous nature or more demand­ 
ing physical requirements; protective services and 
mining are good examples. There are others where 
sheer boredom and lack of job satisfaction will 
remain valid causes for earlier retirement as well. 
Many of these situations can and should be handled 
by collective bargaining. 

A far more important question arises in connec­ 
tion with providing public benefits to people under 
age 65, since such action would not only involve an 
increase in public expenditures, but it would also, in 
all likelihood, influence private pension plans. 
Simply lowering the age of entitlement to public 
pensions while maintaining benefits at the same 
level would be very costly, although it would extend 
freedom of choice considerably. Another possibility 
would be to keep the normal age of entitlement at 
65 but to provide actuarially reduced benefits for 
those retiring earlier. This approach, which is fol­ 
lowed in the U.S. social security program, keeps 
public expenditures constant for any given number 
of retirees; in addition, it involves a lesser reduction 
in the labour supply than when annual benefits per 
person are kept constant in the face of a lowering of 
the retirement age. Nevertheless, U.S. experience 
shows that the method does result in a considerable 
reduction in labour force participation." 

Provisions for early retirement are, however, 
largely aimed at relieving the problems caused by 
the unemployability of some older workers, and the 
real question is whether or not this is the appropri­ 
ate method. In Canada, the Retirement Survey 
suggests that a significant number of Canadian 
workers retire early because of poor health, even 
when their retirement incomes are relatively low 
(Table 7-2), although, as noted earlier, the proba­ 
bility of the low-income group doing so is less than 
that of the high-income group. Rather than extend 
present benefits to all who retire early, which would 
be very costly in terms of direct expenditures, or 
even reduce benefits - which could still affect 
labour force participation - priority might be given 
to the expansion of CPP and QPP disability benefits, 
perhaps with the level of qualifying disability 

decreasing with age. It is worth noting, too, that 
some European countries have taken long-term 
unemployment (for example, for a year preceding 
the application for benefits) as qualification for 
earlier retirement benefits." 

There is the more general question of the costs 
and benefits of earlier retirement compared with 
those of other options for increasing leisure time. 
Examination of longer holidays, shorter work weeks, 
or delayed entry into the labour force does not fall 
within the terms of reference for this study. Never­ 
theless, they should come under more intensive 
examination as alternatives to earlier retirement. 
Until that is done we cannot be sure, for example, 
which alternative is the least costly for the economy 
in terms of forgone output. 

ENCOURAGING LATER RETIREMENT 

Fear of the consequences of slow demographic 
growth for the "pension burden" has led some crit­ 
ics of the present system to suggest that the age of 
entitlement to pension benefits be raised. Such 
action would certainly lead to a sharp reduction in 
the direct costs of benefits, and it would increase the 
labour force participation of older people. But it 
would, at the same time, reduce the present range of 
choice. On the basis of our demographic and expen­ 
diture projections, we do not believe that such dras­ 
tic action is warranted. Nor should later retirement 
be seen as a substitute for more adequate retire­ 
ment income programs. Thus the question boils 
down to the cost-efficiency of various alternatives 
for at least maintaining, but hopefully extending, 
the present range of choice. 

Since a substantial group of workers retire at 
age 65 or earlier because of poor health, programs 
to improve health earlier in their careers might 
induce them to retire later. It is worth noting, 
however, that since retirement income is also likely 
to increase with better health, the latter would not 
necessarily, in itself, lead to extended labour force 
participation. Further action to reduce disincentives, 
or to increase incentives, for older people to work 
longer would therefore be required. 

A similar conclusion can be drawn with respect to 
the abolition of mandatory retirement or the raising 
of the mandatory retirement age. There is no ques­ 
tion that such action would provide benefits. It 
would increase freedom of choice for older workers, 
and medical experts suggest that work opportunities 
in later years could improve life expectancy and 
general health. It would lead to some increase in 



labour force participation, but as Chart 7-4 sug­ 
gests, the increase resulting from the abolition of 
mandatory retirement alone would be very small - 
much too small to compensate for slow demographic 
growth. On the other hand, it must be recognized 
that it could involve substantial costs, particularly if 
it were implemented quickly. Organized labour has 
argued that the removal of mandatory retirement 
could expose workers to more arbitrary manage­ 
ment decisions, bar opportunities for younger work­ 
ers, and reduce the incentive for companies to 
improve pension plans. It might also induce industry 
to employ more younger workers in order to avoid 
the additional costs involved with older workers. It 
would involve complex changes in existing retire­ 
ment programs as well as in group insurance pro­ 
grams. Industry representatives also fear that it 
would raise the cost of present retirement programs 
and complicate personnel management. In the fed­ 
eral public service, the mandatory retirement age 
was adopted at least in part to offset political 
pressures - often for humanitarian reasons - to 
keep older people in jobs. 

Perhaps more important, present retirement prac­ 
tices have developed as a result of a great deal of 
experience and through the collective bargaining 
process. To intervene in that process by legislation 
would seem undesirable unless potential benefits 
were quite high and costs very low. The Council 
believes that industry and labour will begin to 
experience very different problems in the future as a 
result of the slower growth in the labour force and 
that mandatory retirement provisions will wither 
away on their own as a result. Thus, rather than 
legislate against the practice, government should 
perhaps take action to encourage later retirement. 
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Reduction or removal of the GIS income test (in 
effect, enlarging the OAS program) would be one 
possibility. In 1975, about 332,000 men were in the 
65-69 age group - the group most likely to be 
induced back into the labour force. Of those, some 
141,000 received GIS payments and did not work. 
On the basis of the Retirement Survey, we can 
assume that perhaps one-third of this group could 
not work because of poor health. That leaves 94,000 
men; if all of them were to go back into the labour 
force on a full-time basis - an unlikely prospect - 
it would roughly double the present participation 
rate of that age group. It would, however, bring 
about only a small increase in the total labour force 
and GNP, and it would involve considerably larger 
total benefit payments. 

It would appear likely that more positive action 
would be required in order to get many older people 
back in the labour force. Certainly this would be the 
case for those not now affected by income-testing. 
Possibilities here would include accelerated pension 
benefits - benefits that would accrue faster after 
age 65, for example, than before. Obviously, too, it 
would be necessary to broaden job opportunities for 
older workers. The standard working conditions 
facing all workers, the eight-hour work day and 
five-day work week, may suit many younger work­ 
ers, but according to the Retirement Survey, many 
elderly Canadians, both retired and working, would 
prefer more flexibility in the amount of time spent 
working both before and after the normal retire­ 
ment age. It is worth noting that, at present, older 
workers in Canada, more so than the work force in 
general, are concentrated in occupations like farm­ 
ing, sales, or services, which provide better scope for 
part-time work (Table 7-3).'0 

TABLE 7-3 
DISTRIBUTION OF LABOUR FORCE AGED 15 AND OVER AND AGED65AND OVER, BY INDUSTRY AND 
BY SEX, CANADA, 1978 

Men Women 

Aged 15 
and over 

Aged 65 
and over 

Aged 15 
and over 

Aged 65 
and over 

(Per cent) 

All industries' 100.0 100.0 100.0 

Agriculture 5.5 24.0 3.0 
Other primary industries 4.0 0.6 
Manufacturing 23.3 12.0 13.5 
Construction 10.5 6.0 1.3 
Transportation, communication and other utilities 1l.0 4.5 4.3 
Trade 16.6 15.8 18.2 
Finance, insurance and real estate 3.5 8.3 8.0 
Service? 17.7 24.1 44.0 
Public administration 7.4 3.8 6.1 

100.0 

7.8 

19.0 

58.8 
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From a medical and psychological point of view, a 
gradual reduction in work over a period of years is a 
sound approach to the problem of retirement. Per­ 
haps retirement should no longer be thought of as a 
fixed point in time at which all work ceases, but 
rather as a time of gradual change from full-time 
work to full-time leisure, perhaps spread over a 
decade or more. This phasing-in period of leisure 
would enable the elderly to better equip themselves 
for the enjoyment of full-time retirement. 

By broadening employment opportunities and 
increasing the rate of activity among the aged popu­ 
lation, the number of those completely dependent on 
retirement benefits would be reduced, and GNP 
could be at least slightly increased. Moreover, it 
may be that people are often enticed to retire with­ 
out fully realizing the inadequacy of benefits or the 
irreversibility of their decision. Hence there is an 
increasing need for a change in the attitude of 
government and employers towards job opportuni­ 
ties for the elderly. A program enabling older work­ 
ers to vary the number of hours worked would have 
important implications for firms. Some firms could 
adapt very easily, while others could not do so as 
readily because of the nature of their operations. 
The reduction in the number of hours worked could 
be in the form of shorter working days, shorter 
weeks, or even extended periods of leave from work. 
Sweden has an interesting program in which two 
older workers share one job, each working part of 
the week." The nature of the job would dictate how 
the reduction in working time should take place. 

Many members of occupational pension plans 
find it necessary to work at their present job on a 
full-time basis until they retire, in order to protect 
their accrued pension credits, even though, for 
health or other reasons, shorter working weeks or 
days, or less onerous work, would be preferable. 
There is a need for greater flexibility in designing 
pension plan formulas that would enable elderly 
workers to take advantage of more suitable employ­ 
ment and yet protect their accrued pension credits. 

At the present time, there are a number of agen­ 
cies attempting to extend labour force participation 
among the elderly. While useful, most of these 
efforts are aimed at specific groups, such as execu­ 
tives and trades people. There are no comprehensive 
counselling and retraining services in Canada to 
assist those nearing retirement age to prepare for 
the last few years of active employment or to facili­ 
tate a smooth transition into full-time retirement. 

THE CHANGE-Of-WORK CHOICE 

The retirement income system as it now stands 
also affects an individual's decision to change 
jobs - and thus the mobility of labour and perhaps 
the efficiency of the economy. Perhaps more impor­ 
tant, the more frequently that workers change jobs, 
the smaller their retirement benefits are likely to be 
and the less their ultimate freedom of choice about 
retirement age." 

It is quite clear that in Canada the presence of 
pension plans does, on balance, reduce labour mobil­ 
ity somewhat. Tenure with the principal employer 
is, on average, roughly five years longer where a 
pension plan exists, although there is considerable 
variation among industries in this respect 
(Table 7-4). It is also clear, however, that 
workers - particularly younger workers - do 
change jobs rather frequently; for example, in 
Ontario, less than 20 per cent of working men aged 
20 to 24 and less than 40 per cent of those aged 
25 to 44 remained with the same employer during 
the 1968-72 period (Chart 7-6). 

TABLE 7-4 
PENSION PLANS AND DURATION OF 
EMPLOYMENT,' BY INDUSTRY, CANADA, 1975 

Without With 
a plan a plan 

(Years) 

Agriculture, forestry and fishing 

Mining and manufacturing 

Construction 

Transportation arid 
communication 

13.8 

20.0 

13.8 

21.6 

23.4 

14.2 

18.6 

19.7 

17.7 

20.5 

18.4 

25.6 

23.9 

21.3 

21.3 

23.0 

Trade 

Finance and service 

Public administration 

All industries 

The protection of pension benefits of workers who 
change jobs involves provisions for vesting, locking­ 
in, and portability of pension rights. Vesting refers 
in general to the right of employees, should they 
change jobs prior to retirement, to all or part of the 
benefits associated with the contributions made to a 
pension plan on their behalf by an employer, wheth­ 
er those benefits are taken in cash or as a deferred 
pension. In Canada, however, vesting is now usually 
associated with mandatory locking-in provisions, 



which prevent workers from withdrawing either 
their own or their employer's contributions in cash 
and which require them to accept a deferred pen­ 
sion. Portability refers to the ability of employees to 
take their pension along in one form or another 
when they change jobs. 

CHART 7-6 
JOB PERMANENCYI OF WORKERS IN ONTARIO, BY 
AGE-SEX GROUP, 1968-72 
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The longer the vesting period, the more likely that 
a worker will end up with benefits far below the 
maximum available to employees who do not 
change jobs. Employer contributions to the Canada 
and Quebec Pension Plans are vested in full 
immediately, and accrued benefits are both com­ 
pletely portable and, to a large extent, adjusted for 
rising wages. This is not the case for many occupa­ 
tional pension plans. 

The legislation governing most Canadian occupa­ 
tional plans requires that the employer's contribu­ 
tions be vested at least when a member attains 
age 45 and has 10 years of service with the employ­ 
er. This minimum standard leaves a wide margin for 
variation among plans, and there is a marked differ­ 
ence between government and private employers. 
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Although there has been some improvement in 
recent years, by 1976 only about 10 per cent of the 
members of private-employer plans could qualify for 
full vesting within five years, compared with 40 per 
cent of those in public-employer plans (Chart 7-7). 
And, while more than 90 per cent of the member­ 
ship of public-sector plans qualified within 10 years, 
the same was true for only 68 per cent of those in 
private-employer plans. 

CHART 7-7 
DISTRIBUTION OF OCCUPATIONAL PENSION PLAN 
MEMBERS, BY PERIOD REQUIREDI FOR VESTING, 
CANADA, 1970 AND 1976 
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To what extent does this situation result in 
reduced pensions for many Canadian workers? Data 
from the Retirement Survey suggest that only about 
Il per cent of male workers spend less than 
10 years - and 40 per cent spend 25 years or 
more - with their longest-term employer during 
their entire working life (Table 7-5). Other evidence 
suggests, however, that even if coverage of the work 
force by occupational plans were complete, male 
workers in Canada would qualify, on average, for 
only between 7 and 22 years of pensionable service 
under the 45-and-IO rule, depending upon the 
assumptions about labour mobility." As the age of 
qualification and minimum length of service decline, 
of course, the expected years of pensionable service 
rise substantially. It must also be noted that the 
average in this case covers a diversity of people. 
Those in government service with generally shorter 
vesting periods and a great deal of portability, as 
well as managerial and white-collar workers, are 
more likely to qualify for pensions - and higher 
pensions at that - than blue-collar workers." 
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TABLE 7-5 
FULL-TIME EMPLOYEES AGED 55 AND OVER, 
BY LONGEST DURATION OF EMPLOYMENT 
WITH SAME EMPLOYER, CANADA, 1975 

Men Women 

(Per cent) 

Years of employment 

0-4 3.2 8.7 
5-9 7.9 13.7 

10-14 13.7 27.0 
15-19 21.9 15.2 
20-24 14.9 10.5 
25+ 38.5 24.9 

Total 100.0 100.0 

If pensions are considered strictly as deferred 
wages, there is a strong argument for immediate 
vesting. This approach would lead to some increase 
in mobility and economic efficiency, and it would be 
much more fair to the mobile workers than delayed 
vesting. Yet shortening the vesting period may also 
involve costs. Employers suggest that delayed vest­ 
ing seems to reduce labour turnover and so enables 
them to train and retrain greater numbers of skilled 
workers. Shorter vesting periods could also add 
directly to employer costs; in that sense, then, they 
should be considered as competing for priority with 
other possible improvements to benefits. 

Care should be taken not to exaggerate either the 
gains to employees, or the costs to employers, of 
shorter vesting periods. The Council's projections of 
the proportion of GNP required for various levels of 
pension benefits are already based on the assump­ 
tions of immediate vesting of coverage of the whole 
work force, and of indexation of benefits." In a 
mixed public/private system a shorter vesting 
period would, however, imply an increased share of 
that proportion for private-plan contributors. Work 
for the federal Task Force on Pensions suggests 
that, unless vested benefits were also indexed, there 
would be no increase in the employer cost of con­ 
tributory plans, even with substantial reductions in 
the vesting period, as long as vested contributions 
became locked into a deferred pension at a rate of 
interest below the market rate." For noncontributo­ 
ry plans, there would be a small increase in employ­ 
er costs even in the absence of indexation. 

Locking-in as it now exists is one of several 
features that could reduce prospective gains for 
employees and costs for employers. Before locking­ 
in and vesting provisions were tied together by 
legislation, many employees in fact opted for an 
immediate cash refund of their own contributions, 
even if that meant forfeiting their employer's contri- 

butions. Such behaviour was not entirely irrational; 
many younger workers prefer greater near-term 
receipts in order to support a family or to invest in a 
house. And, particularly during inflationary periods, 
they might well earn a lower rate of return on a 
deferred pension than if they were to put those 
savings into another instrument. In brief, during an 
inflationary period, even with immediate vesting, 
deferred (nonindexed) pensions would suffer. 

In addition, it should be noted that during the 
initial years of employment, employer contributions 
to a deferred benefit plan are not likely to be large 
in any event. Moreover, with reduced vesting 
requirements, employers could still favour long-term 
employees by changing their wage structure or 
escalating other fringe benefits. 

Vested benefit rights may be preserved in several 
ways: through reciprocal agreements among 
employers, through a deferred pension, or through 
purchase of a deferred annuity from an insurance 
company. Reciprocal agreements are extensively 
used in Canada between governments and their 
agencies, between governments and universities, and 
between the universities themselves, as well as in 
some multi-employer plans. By and large, however, 
they are difficult to set up among private-employer 
plans because of the wide differences in structure. 

One very interesting proposal for overcoming the 
difficulties associated with portability among pri­ 
vate pension plans has recently been made by the 
Canadian Life Insurance Association." The eux 
scheme is being put into effect this year for the 
pension plans of 15 major life insurance companies, 
with other members of the Association indicating 
that they plan to join it later. The Association hopes 
that it will also be adopted by employers outside the 
insurance industry. 

The scheme provides that employees moving to a 
new employer would take with them a credit for a 
specified number of years of service. The credit 
would be used, in effect, to buy into the new 
employer's plan, after an adjustment had been made 
to put both plans on an equivalent basis. For exam­ 
ple, if the employees move to a more generous plan, 
a credit of say 10 years in their original plan might 
buy only 8 years of service in the new plan. The key 
element in the proposal is that employers would 
have to agree to use the same formula for valuing 
the pensionable service of employees who are leav­ 
ing and of those who are arriving, so that what the 
employers lose in one direction, they might gain in 
another. Thus there may be no advantage to a firm 
setting either artificially high or low values. The 
ci.rx has also suggested that each company should 



include in its pension plan a minimum money-pur­ 
chase benefit for all employees, with matching 
employer / employee contributions. This provision 
would put a floor under the amount to be 
transferred. 

There are two other possibilities for improving the 
benefit protection of mobile workers: the expansion 
of the public retirement income system, and the 
creation of a central agency of some sort to manage 
deferred occupational pensions. The Canadian 
Labour Congress has recommended the first 
approach because of the private occupational sys­ 
tem's inadequate coverage and its limited protection 
of benefits in the face of mobility and inflation, and 
because the CLC feels that immediate vesting would 
be impractical and costly in private-sector plans." 
Under this approach, the expanded public benefits 
would presumably be protected in the same way as 
they are now under the CPP and QPP. 

The report of the COFIRENTES+ Committee in 
Quebec recommended the second approach men­ 
tioned above, namely that the management of 
deferred pensions be entrusted to a central agency, 
administered by the Caisse de dépôt et placement, 
that would invest the acquired funds through its 
segregated account." The advantages of this 
approach might be enhanced if employers and 
employees were represented on the board of the 
agency. The central agency need not be adminis­ 
tered by government, however. Such an agency 
exists for the forest industry in British Columbia, 
and in France there are two main central agencies 
covering different groups of industries. A central 
agency could, in any event, improve administrative 
efficiency, and it might be used to promote greater 
harmonization of private pension schemes. A far 
more important question, however, is whether or not 
the central agency would offer some indexation of 
deferred benefits against inflation. In the United 
Kingdom, for example, a central agency created by 
the government is used to administer a supplemen­ 
tary pension scheme. Employers may "contract out" 
of the state supplementary scheme, which indexes 
deferred benefits in line with the general increase in 
earnings, upon proof that their own pension fund 
arrangements are at least as good as those of the 
government plan." The central agency administers 
the funds of those employees who are not members 
of contracted-out schemes and of those who move 
from one contracted-out plan to another. 
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CONCLUSION 

Canada's present retirement income system con­ 
tains some work disincentives, but they affect a 
proportion of the population that is small relative to 
the total work force. That proportion would 
increase, of course, if the age of entitlement, espe­ 
cially to public retirement income benefits, were 
lowered to draw in the increasingly larger age 
groups under age 65. 

There is increasing pressure, however, to have 
more freedom of choice with respect to retirement 
age and labour force participation. Extension of 
such freedom involves costs and benefits in terms of 
expenditures, labour force participation, and gains 
to physical and psychological well-being. It will 
become ever more important in the future, with the 
growing number of older people, to provide more 
information on benefits to pension plan participants 
and to search out the least costly ways of increasing 
the range of choice. Among other things, this will 
require much more extensive information on the 
work-force experience of individuals over extended 
time periods. 

The present mix of incentives in the retirement 
income system undoubtedly tends somewhat to dis­ 
courage later retirement and greater labour force 
participation by older people. Greater participation 
by older people would not involve any major reduc­ 
tion in the potential "pension burden," but it could 
provide important gains for some individuals and at 
least some increase in the economy's productive 
capabilities. Improvements in health and the elimi­ 
nation of mandatory retirement would increase free­ 
dom of choice for older people, although they might 
not result in much greater participation in the 
labour force by this group. To achieve that, addi­ 
tional action would probably be necessary, including 
perhaps the alleviation of income tests, expanded 
job opportunities, and even positive incentives such 
as accelerated pension benefits. 

Equally important, the present system imposes a 
serious trade-off for individuals when considering 
job changes, largely because of deficiencies in the 
private occupational pension plans. Unless those 
deficiencies can be removed, the provision of ade­ 
quate retirement income for the majority of Canadi­ 
an workers will have to depend upon expansion of 
the public system. 



8 Inflation: The Achilles Heel 

Inflation has been described as Ha method by which 
the able-bodied rob the aged."! Strongly worded 
though it may be, this definition may be plausible 
enough to warrant closer examination. More than 
any other single factor, the sharp rise in price levels 
has brought an air of urgency to discussions of the 
problem of income security for the elderly. If that 
security is to be provided, older people must be 
protected against inflation because so much of their 
income comes from sources other than employment. 
It is income that does not adjust quickly - if at 
all - to price increases, particularly unexpected 
increases, unless by policy action. The elderly are 
therefore much more vulnerable to those increases 
than are those in the work force. But can this 
protection be provided, particularly at a time when 
the number of older people is increasing, without 
threatening Canada's economic viability and the 
competitive position of its industry? 

THE EFFECTS OF INFLATION 
ON THE ELDERLY 

To appreciate the potential effects of inflation on 
older people, consider that consumer prices in 
Canada increased by an average annual rate of 
5.75 per cent from 1966 to 1976 (Chart 8-1). If a 
person retired in 1966 with a pension of $10,000 - 
and most Canadians retired on far less - that was 
not protected against inflation, the purchasing 
power of that pension would have been only $5,717 
ten years later (Chart 8-2). Even if prices continued 
to rise at the same average rate - and in fact they 
have been rising more rapidly - that purchasing 
power would be only $4,323 by 1981 - a drop of 
roughly three-fifths from its original level. A com­ 
parison with employment income is revealing: while 
the consumer price index rose by a total of 78 per 
cent between 1966 and 1976, the average weekly 
industrial wage increased by 137 per cent (from 
$96.30 to $228.03). It should be remembered, how- 

ever, that workers under age 65 do not receive the 
additional tax exemptions that are available to older 
people. 

CHART 8-1 
YEAR-TO-YEAR PERCENTAGE CHANGE IN CONSUMER 
PRICE INDEX, CANADA, 1960-78 
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CHART 8-2 
PURCHASING POWER OF UN INDEXED PENSION OF 
$10,000 WITH 5%% PRICE INCREASE, 1966 TO 1981 
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For those people who filed income tax returns in 
1976, investment income (largely interest) and pen­ 
sion and transfer payments were far more impor­ 
tant, and employment income far less important, for 
those aged 65 and over than for those under 65 
(Chart 8-3). Unfortunately, interest income is not 
likely to be well protected against inflation. A bond, 
for example, pays a fixed rate of return - the 
nominal rate. But, in effect, that nominal rate at 
any point in time consists of two parts: a premium 
to cover the expected rate of inflation, plus a real 
rate of return. As long as individuals know what 
rate of inflation can be expected, they will know 
what return they will get in real terms from the 
bond, or to put it another way, how much they will 
have to invest to maintain a given level of real 
income in the face of rising prices. But if the rate of 
inflation rises beyond what was expected, the 
individual will find the income from the investment 
falling in real terms. In this sense, it is the unex­ 
pected increases in inflation that cause problems. 

CHART 8-3 
DISTRIBUTION OF AVERAGE ASSESSED INCOME OF 
CANADIANS FILING INCOME TAX RETURNS, BY AGE 
GROUP AND INCOME SOURCE, 1976 
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Income from pensions and government transfer 
payments is another matter. While the majority of 
participants in government-sponsored occupational 
pension plans are now well protected against infla­ 
tion during both their working years and their 
retired years (see Chapter 2), such protection, par­ 
ticularly for the post-retirement period, is much less 
prevalent in plans sponsored by private employers. 
The importance of OAS, GIS, CPP, and QPP payments 
is understated in Chart 8-3 because the data refer 
only to those who file income tax returns; many 
older people who depend entirely on those pay­ 
ments, especially OAS and GIS, do not file tax 
returns because their income is not sufficiently high. 
These sources of income are now indexed for infla­ 
tion, however; as a result, the average income of the 
elderly increased very slightly between 1971 and 
1975, in terms of 1971 purchasing power 

(Chart 8-4). In other words, the rise in the real 
value of those payments was slightly more rapid 
than the decline of the real value of other income. 

CHART 8-4 
AVERAGE INCOME OF FAMILY UNITS, BYSOURCEAND 
AGE OF HEAD, CANADA, 1971 AND 1975 
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This positive development may lend added per­ 
spective to the situation, but it provides no grounds 
for pride or complacency. That transfer payments 
have kept up with inflation does not mean that they 
were adequate to begin with. Besides, older people 
have been hit particularly hard by the prices of such 
important items as food, which have risen more 
rapidly than the overall consumer price index. 
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Examination of income flows alone does not, of 
course, provide a complete picture of the effects of 
inflation on the elderly. In Chapter 2, we pointed 
out that one of the most important methods of 
saving for old age is through home ownership. In 
fact, in 1971 more than two-thirds of household 
heads aged 65 and over owned their own homes. 
While home ownership has turned out to be a useful 
hedge against inflation in recent years - because of 
rising capital values and the avoidance of increasing 
rental payments - it also presents a problem. 
Because of rising property taxes and high mainte­ 
nance and utility costs, as well as the reduced 
incomes of the retired and the overall inflationary 
increases in the general cost of living, the ability of 
the elderly to keep their homes has become increas­ 
ingly jeopardized. At the same time, they are 
innately reluctant to give up the homes in which, in 
many cases, they have spent their whole lives. Cou­ 
pled with this is the realistic expectation that giving 
up their own homes for rental housing leaves them 
vulnerable to inflation-induced rent increases that 
they may not be able to afford - especially once 
their one major inflation-proof asset has been 
liquidated. 



The ideal solution to all of these problems, of 
course, would be to stop inflation, but recent experi­ 
ence shows that that is no easy task. Thus it is 
necessary to seek other, less-encompassing solutions. 
Since opportunities for older people to earn income 
from employment are limited and, for the very old, 
virtually nonexistent, what are the difficulties 
entailed in protecting the major sources of nonem­ 
ployment retirement income from inflation? 

INFLA TION AND PRIVATE PENSION 
PLANS2 

Despite the recent expansion of public pension 
plans in Canada, benefits from private plans - both 
occupational and individual - remain a very impor­ 
tant source of income for the elderly. Indeed, these 
payments will grow more rapidly in the coming 
years, since so many private plans were established 
or expanded only in the last two decades or so. 
Whether or not participants in these plans can be 
protected against inflation will have an important 
bearing on decisions about the future mix of public 
and private plans in Canada's retirement income 
system. 

THE LIMITATIONS OF PRIVATE PLANS 

The present system of private pension plans suf­ 
fers from several limitations in respect of inflation. 
First, many employees are still not covered by plans 
that protect accumulating pension rights from infla­ 
tion during their working years, let alone benefits 
during their retirement years. Second, while some 
defined-benefit plans do protect pension rights from 
inflation to a great extent, they are rarely portable. 
Even when the pension rights of employees who 
change jobs are vested, the deferred annuity to 
which they become entitled is likely to be seriously 
eroded by inflation during their working years. 
Third, sponsors of defined-benefit plans are often 
unable or reluctant to commit themselves to the 
contractual indexation of benefits during the post­ 
retirement period. Finally, there is the inability of 
members of money-purchase plans (including 
RRSPS) to acquire indexed annuities. If action is not 
taken quickly to improve occupational plans in these 
respects, there will almost certainly be further pres­ 
sure to expand public programs. 

The vulnerability of private pension plans to infla­ 
tion differs greatly among the various types. Very 
few plans sponsored by private employers provide 

Inflation: The Achilles Heel 79 

post-retirement indexation, although many employ­ 
ers have made ad hoc adjustments. In contrast, a 
high proportion of public employees are now cov­ 
ered by full post-retirement indexation, although 
legislation to reduce this protection was introduced 
in the last Parliament. The preservation of the real 
value of pension rights is much more widespread, at 
least for workers who remain with the same employ­ 
er. The degree to which rights are protected depends 
on the benefit formula, with final- and average-best­ 
earnings plans providing the best protection (see 
Chapter 2), and on the willingness of sponsors to 
upgrade plans whose benefits have been eroded by 
inflation. 

In part, at least, the recent expansion of final­ 
earnings plans within the private sector reflects 
more favourable tax legislation.' Many employers 
remain hesitant to adopt such plans, however, and 
most are reluctant to index benefits contractually 
after retirement. The reasons for this reluctance are 
the perceived relationship between pension plans 
and the financial health and competitive position of 
the sponsors, the response of pension fund liabilities 
and assets to inflation, and the effect of inflation on 
the profitability of a firm's own operations. The 
effect of inflation on investments in existing finan­ 
cial instruments also makes insurance companies 
reluctant to provide indexed annuities. 

Current accounting and taxation procedures may 
significantly influence the effect of inflation on the 
profitability of firms. Because profits, as calculated 
for tax purposes, are distorted upwards, business 
taxes are correspondingly higher and equity values 
lower. At the same time, capital assets must be 
depreciated at historical costs, and these are much 
lower than actual, inflated replacement costs. Inven­ 
tories must also be replaced at costs higher than 
those used in the calculation of profits for tax 
purposes. Previous work for the Council also sug­ 
gests that inflation has benefited the financial sector 
because of its debtor/creditor position, while impos­ 
ing additional costs on manufacturing and non­ 
manufacturing industries (excluding utilities and 
finance).' 

INFLATION AND PENSION COSTS 

Employers incur costs for pensions in several 
ways. They must contribute to the Canaria and 
Quebec Pension Plans, and their taxes help to pay 
for the OAS and GIS programs. If they also sponsor 
a private plan, the costs they must assume may, at 
least initially, vary considerably, depending upon 
the plan chosen. 
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In both defined-benefit and defined-contribution 
plans, the employers and/or employees contribute to 
a fund. The proceeds of that fund are invested, and 
benefits are paid from it. For a fund to remain 
solvent over its lifetime, the contributions and the 
investment income received must equal the benefits 
paid out and any administrative expenses. 

The sponsor's responsibility differs greatly be­ 
tween the two types, however. In a defined-contribu­ 
tion plan, employee contributions are fixed, but the 
benefits are not. When employees retire, they are 
entitled only to the proceeds of the employer and 
employee contributions invested on their behalf, 
whatever amount may result from such investment. 
In contrast, under a defined-benefit plan, both the 
benefit payments and the employee contributions, if 
any, are fixed by formula, and the sponsor must pay 
any supplement necessary to keep the fund solvent. 
At least initially, therefore, the sponsor must bear 
most, if not all, of the risk, should the fund fall short 
of whatever is required to pay the benefits promised. 
How these additional costs are absorbed ultimately 
is a question to which we shall return later. It 
should also be noted, however, that under some 
circumstances the sponsor may actually gain from 
inflation.' 

The sponsor's contributions are affected by three 
types of cost: for current service, for past service, 
and for experience deficiencies. Current-service 
costs are those resulting from the pension rights or 
credits that have been earned in the current year by 
current members of the plan as well as the cost of 
ad hoc increases for inflation in existing pensions. 
These costs must be met each year by the sponsor. 
Past-service costs arise from recognition of the ser­ 
vice of employees prior to the inception of the plan 
they are now in and of improvements made to a plan 
after its inception. Shortfalls in investment funds 
caused by these factors must generally be extin­ 
guished by the sponsors over a period of 15 years. 
Experience deficiencies - the other component of 
unfunded liabilities - arise, in effect, because 
experience turns out to be more adverse than the 
assumptions on which a plan was based. In Ontario 
and in most of the other provinces that regulate 
private plans, sponsors are required to make up 
these deficiencies over a period of five to fifteen 
years, depending on the source of the deficiency. 

Many employers have had to face dramatic 
increases in the costs of pension plans in recent 
years, largely because of the payments required to 
extinguish past-service costs and experience 
deficiencies." Current-service costs, which account 
for more than one-half of total employer pension 
costs, have nonetheless remained almost constant as 

a percentage of total payroll costs. According to a 
survey conducted in 1977, they averaged 5.5 per 
cent of wage and salary costs for final-, final-aver­ 
age-earnings, or average-best-earnings plans and 
3.2 per cent for career-average plans. 

Inflation may have played only a small part in 
respect of current- and past-service costs, but it has 
played a major role in the recent increases in experi­ 
ence deficiencies. The law requires that, at regular 
intervals - usually every three years - a defined­ 
benefit plan's financial position be reassessed by an 
actuary to verify that it has sufficient funds to meet 
its obligations. To carry out such a procedure, the 
actuary must make some educated guesses about a 
number of factors that could affect benefit pay­ 
ments or the flow of income from the investment 
fund. The three most important assumptions con­ 
cern the future increase of wages and salaries, the 
termination rates of the employees covered, and the 
expected rate of return on investments. If salaries 
increase faster than expected or if investment 
returns or termination rates are lower than expect­ 
ed, experience deficiencies will occur. 

Considerable caution must be used in comparing 
the pension costs of Canadian and U.S. firms. 
Unlike the situation in Canada, most 
U.S. occupational plans do not require employee 
contributions (nor are such contributions tax­ 
deductible, as in Canada). Moreover, while the 
U.S. social security system is financed entirely from 
employer and employee payroll contributions, a sub­ 
stantial part of the Canadian system is financed 
from general government revenue. Pension costs are, 
of course, only a part of the total labour cost 
package that, together with capital costs and the 
efficiency with which both labour and capital are 
employed, determines the competitive position of 
our industries. At present, pension-related employer 
costs appear to be higher in the United States than 
in Canada, but extensive expansion of Canadian 
plans could, in the absence of offsetting changes in 
other costs or of similar action by U.S. firms, 
change the situation. 

PENSION FUND LIABILITIES AND ASSETS 

The two types of assumptions that have most 
often been violated by actual experience in recent 
years, largely as a result of the changing rate of 
inflation, are those about salaries and wages and the 
rate of return. There is no problem as long as prices 
rise in line with the actuary's expectations, but when 
the actual inflation rate is higher than expected, the 
trouble begins. 



Unexpected inflation may affect pension plans in 
various ways. First, the wages of plan members may 
increase faster than expected. Since wages tend, on 
average, to remain in line with prices (and produc­ 
tivity gains, if any), real wages will not change. 
Benefits are related in most plans to final, final 
average, or average-best earnings, however; as a 
result, the money value of future benefits will be 
greater than expected, and, other things being 
equal, the plan's liability will be increased. Even if 
the value of the accumulated investments is not 
reduced, the sponsor will have to make additional 
payments into the fund to meet the larger future 
obligations. However, the real rate of return on 
investment funds is also likely to be reduced by 
inflation, as has happened in the 1970s (Table 8-1). 
The evidence suggests that this adverse effect is not 
unique to the recent period of price increases.' 

TABLE 8-1 
AVERAGE NOMINAL AND REAL RATE OF 
RETURN ON TRUSTEED PENSION PLANS, 
CANADA, 1963-77 

Average rate of return 
Average rate of -------- 
price increase' Nominal Real 

1963-67 
1968-72 
1973-77 

2.66 
3.91 
8.95 

(Per cent) 
5.43 2.77 
8.23 4.32 
6.07 -2.88 

Unexpected inflation is likely to cause people to 
anticipate even larger future price increases. Anal­ 
ysis shows that financial markets push up the nomi­ 
nal interest rates on fixed-income securities in line 
with expected inflation. If the pension fund con­ 
cerned holds only cash when inflation occurs - 
including additional payments from the sponsor to 
meet the effects of wage increases - that cash can 
be invested at the new, higher rate of interest. The 
fund will then grow rapidly enough to meet benefit 
payments unless, of course, there is a further change 
in the expected rate of inflation. Suppose, however, 
that the fund is already invested in fixed-income 
securities such as bonds or mortgages. Until these 
mature, interest will be earned at the old lower rate, 
the flow of income will not match the increase in 
benefit payments, and the sponsor will have to make 
up the difference." 

Traditionally, common stocks have been con­ 
sidered a much better hedge against inflation than 
bonds and mortgages. Indeed, pension funds have 
been encouraged to use this form of investment by 
legislation permitting them to invest all of their 
assets in common shares. More recent analysis 
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throws a different light on this approach, however. 
While it is true that, over long periods, the rate of 
return on common stocks has exceeded the rate of 
inflation - that is, the real rate of return has been 
positive - for shorter periods ranging in length 
from four to ten years, it has declined in response to 
inflation. In recent years, this effect may have been 
aggravated by such factors as the particularly rapid 
increase in energy costs, but other, longer-run fac­ 
tors have undoubtedly played a role as well. 

THE BURDEN OF UNFUNDED LIABILITIES 

Data taken from the annual reports of a sample 
of the 200 largest Canadian companies indicate 
that, on average, unfunded liabilities were equal to 
6 per cent of common equity in 1977, if the trans­ 
portation industry is excluded." Since the average 
after-tax rate of return on this equity was 14 per 
cent (implying a before-tax return of roughly double 
that figure), only slightly more than one-quarter of 
a year's before-tax earnings would be required, on 
average, to extinguish these liabilities. 

With the transportation group included, unfunded 
liabilities were on average equal to Il per cent of 
common equity in 1977. That group is dominated by 
Canadian Pacific Limited and Canadian National 
Railways, which together accounted for $1.9 billion 
(almost 50 per cent) of the surveyed companies' 
unfunded liabilities. Because of the special circum­ 
stances surrounding the railway plans, however, the 
companies were allowed an amortization schedule 
that is much longer than otherwise called for under 
Canadian pension benefits legislation. 

The size of unfunded liabilities in the United 
States has also drawn a great deal of attention. JO 
Our examination suggests that Canadian firms tend 
to have lower unfunded liabilities, on average, than 
do U.S. firms in the same industries. This result 
should occasion no surprise, since the U.S. pension 
legislation was, at least until recently, much less 
elaborate than Canada's. The comparison also pro­ 
vides at least some additional indication that the 
competitive ability of Canadian firms vis-à-vis 
U.S. firms has not been greatly impaired by pension 
costs in themselves. 

The concept of unfunded liability is of dubious 
value in comparing the competitive position of 
individual firms. First, the method of calculation 
varies among firms and among actuaries, not only 
because of differing actuarial assumptions but 
because costs t lat appear as current-service charges 
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for one firm may be considered past-service costs by 
another. Second, the measure of unfunded liability 
tells us nothing about the effects on costs of ad hoc 
increases in pensions for retired employees. Nor 
does the presence of unfunded liabilities necessarily 
imply that a plan would be insolvent if it were 
terminated; in such circumstances, benefits would 
be based on current wages while the calculation of 
unfunded liabilities is based on projected wages. 

Whatever interpretation is placed on current fig­ 
ures, many firms are more concerned about the pace 
of the increase in pension costs and about problems 
that may emerge in the future. Pension plans spon­ 
sored by private employers have in recent years been 
"caught in a squeeze between low rates of return on 
their investments and rapidly growing benefit 
liabilities. "II The survey conducted in 1977 by the 
Financial Executives Institute suggested that for the 
companies it covered, unfunded liabilities were 
growing at an "alarming" pace - from 3.2 per cent 
of net capital employed in 1970 to 5.7 per cent in 
the 1976 fiscal period." 

Although this change may in part only reflect 
lags in the adjustment process, private employers 
see pension costs as another factor - and one of 
significance - contributing to the general cost 
increases that have faced Canadian industry. They 
are particularly worried that pension commitments 
appear to be open-ended and that, once they are 
built in, their evolution tends to be largely beyond 
the control of the company. They see such commit­ 
ments as another facet of institutionalized cost 
increases, along with inflation-indexed government 
programs and cost-of-living clauses in collective 
work agreements. They are well aware that contri­ 
bution rates to the Canada and Quebec Pension 
Plans will have to be increased before long. They 
are uneasy about the pressures exerted on them by 
the example of fully indexed pensions for public 
servants. And, perhaps most important of all, they 
are concerned about the cost increases that may 
result from prospective changes in pension benefit 
legislation. 

These fears make employers particularly reluc­ 
tant to index post-retirement benefits. To some 
extent at least, the costs of pre-retirement indexa­ 
tion can be shifted by granting lower wage increases 
to current employees who benefit from increased 
pension credits. However, the cost of post-retire­ 
ment benefits - and, even more so, of indexing 
deferred annuities for employees who change 
jobs - cannot be shifted in this way. If the indexa­ 
tion of post-retirement benefits were imposed on 
employers without providing them with some insur- 

ance against unexpected costs that could result from 
inflation, they would become less willing to sponsor 
pension plans. In addition, companies with pension 
plans would be penalized relative to competitors 
who did not have them. 

INFLATION AND PUBLIC PENSION PLANS 

The impact of inflation on the universal public 
pension plans depends on their funding structure. 
Pay-as-you-go plans are better protected against 
inflation than funded plans. The OAS and GIS pro­ 
grams, for example, are financed from general tax 
revenues. Since the tax base increases with the 
general price level, the tax burden is not affected." 
Both fully and partially funded public plans, how­ 
ever, suffer from the same inflation problems as do 
similar private plans. Since the CPP and QPP provide 
indexation for both pension rights and pension ben­ 
efits, their liabilities rise even more rapidly with 
inflation than do those of most private plans. At the 
same time, the real rate of return on their invest­ 
ment funds will decline. This implies that their 
contribution rates will need to be increased earlier 
than anticipated. 

But these plans, as well as the federal and provin­ 
cial employee plans, have one major advantage over 
those sponsored by private employers: they are ulti­ 
mately backed by the taxing power of the govern­ 
ment concerned. This may, of course, cause prob­ 
lems of a different order, relating to the perception 
of rising government expenditures and, in the case 
of public-employee plans, to the preferential treat­ 
ment accorded one segment of the work force and to 
the pressures that may result for private employers. 

THE IMPLICATIONS OF INDEXATION 

There have been some notable disagreements in 
recent years between economists and members of 
the private pension plan industry over the question 
of indexation. In part at least, these divergences 
derive from the fact that many economists tend to 
focus on the implications of indexation for the 
economy as a whole, while the industry looks at it 
from the viewpoint of individual pension plan spon­ 
sors, who fear that pension costs may increase 
beyond their control, adversely affecting their com­ 
petitive position. The same reasoning has led many 
people to express concern that full price indexation 
of all pensions would bankrupt the economy. Is 
there any basis for such worries? 



Suppose, for example, that 5 per cent of this 
year's GNP is devoted to pension benefits, that prices 
increase at 10 per cent a year, and that pensions are 
fully price-indexed. If there were no increase in real 
GNP, pensions would still represent only 5 per cent 
of GNP as long as the pensioner jworker ratio 
remained constant, because GNP itself would rise 
with the price level. If the pensioner jworker ratio 
doubled over a given period, the pension pay-out at 
the end of that period would represent 10 per cent 
of GNP, but the increase would be the result of 
demographic change rather than inflation. Indeed, 
if GNP were to rise in real terms also, if pensions 
were indexed to prices only, and if the pensioner j 
worker ratio remained constant, the share going to 
pensioners would decline. 

The point of this exercise is that some of the 
doom-and-gloom predictions about the repercus­ 
sions of indexation derive from a failure to make 
proper comparisons; they project pensions in inflat­ 
ed (future) dollars while projecting GNP in terms of 
today's prices. The claim that the .overall economy 
cannot "afford" indexation appears to be based on 
the assumption that an acceleration of inflation 
exerts a depressing influence upon both the rate of 
growth and the level of GNP, but that is an enor­ 
mously complex question for which little conclusive 
evidence is available." Of course, when inflation 
here is more rapid than abroad, Canada's interna­ 
tional competitive position may be impaired. And, 
although depreciation of the foreign exchange value 
of the Canadian dollar may temporarily restore 
competitiveness, it does not solve the fundamental 
problem. 

There may also be concern about two other 
aspects of indexation: its implications for stabiliza­ 
tion policy, and for equity considerations. There has 
been very little work on the effects of indexation on 
the relative efficiency of monetary policy in particu­ 
lar. Economic theory suggests that indexation may 
assist stabilization policy when inflation arises from 
monetary changes; when inflation is caused by real 
shocks, however - such as the massive increase in 
petroleum prices experienced in the 1970s - there 
may be more of a problem. In the matter of equity, 
care must be taken that the interests of one particu­ 
lar group are not protected at the expense of others. 
At the very least, inflation protection must be 
extended to all older people, not just to the partici­ 
pants of occupational pension plans. 

PROTECTION OF RETIREMENT INCOME 

A number of ways have been suggested to provide 
more protection for the income of older people 
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against inflation. For post-retirement pension ben­ 
efits, these include the issuance of indexed financial 
instruments or the provision of inflation insurance to 
enable the private system to provide fully indexed 
pensions. Another possibility would be the expan­ 
sion of the public retirement income system. These 
proposals, as well as the possibility of converting 
home ownership by elderly people into a source of 
income, are evaluated briefly here. 

Indexed Bonds and Annuities - If indexed 
bonds - that is, bonds that guarantee some prede­ 
termined real rate of return - were available, 
private pension plan sponsors would be able to 
provide full indexation of post-retirement benefits. 
Such bonds would also enable life insurance compa­ 
nies to offer indexed annuities to plan sponsors. A 
study carried out for the Council suggests, however, 
that there is little likelihood that private corpora­ 
tions in Canada will introduce indexed bonds in the 
near future. In fact, the international experience to 
date is that only central governments have been 
willing to underwrite the risks associated with infla­ 
tion by issuing such instruments. 

In Canada, the issuance of such bonds by the 
federal government would nevertheless involve prob­ 
lems. If they were issued in sufficient volume to 
enable pension plans to offer indexed benefits, the 
potential impact on the Canadian financial system 
would be quite dramatic. The yields on alternative 
assets could change sharply, and the federal govern­ 
ment's role as a financial intermediary could 
expand. If the indexed bonds were issued on a more 
limited scale, the impact on the financial system 
would be reduced, but the ability of private plans to 
provide indexed benefits would be diminished. 
There is also the possibility that the introduction of 
such bonds - which would have to be specially 
earmarked for pension funds - would reduce the 
depth and breadth of the market for the normal 
marketable bonds of the federal government. If this 
were so, the conduct of open-market operations 
might be impaired. 

In order to limit the amount of government 
indebtedness in indexed instruments, the federal 
government might consider selling price-indexed 
annuities to pension plans. To limit the govern­ 
ment's commitment, such annuities might be made 
available only at the time of a participant's retire­ 
ment. They could also be available for purchase by 
individuals at the time of retirement out of the 
proceeds of registered retirement savings plans. This 
would give inflation protection to pension plan 
members in the post-retirement period, when it is 
required the most. While this proposal would affect 
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Canadian financial markets in the same way that 
indexed bonds would, the magnitude of the effect 
would be smaller since less government indebtedness 
would be involved: pension plan assets backing pre­ 
retirement pension credits would not be involved, as 
they might be if indexed bonds were issued. 

Inflation Insurance - Rather than issue indexed 
bonds or annuities to pension funds, the federal 
government might instead consider providing insur­ 
ance that would protect plan sponsors from the 
inflation-associated risks of indexed pension ben­ 
efits. Such insurance would enable life insurance 
companies to provide indexed annuities, which in 
turn could be used to protect the benefits from 
money-purchase plans (including RRSPS). A form of 
this system is already operating in the United 
Kingdom. 

Here, in brief, is how the proposed system would 
work. A defined-benefit pension plan involves a 
promise to pay a certain amount each year to plan 
participants when they retire, usually at age 65. 
Suppose that amount is $10,000 and the average 
member lives for ten years after retirement. If there 
were no inflation and the rate of interest were 3 per 
cent - and, in the absence of inflation, that would 
be the real, as well as the nominal, interest rate - 
for $85,300 the plan sponsor could buy from an 
insurance company an annuity of $10,000 for ten 
years. 

Actually, the real rate of return on long-term 
Government of Canada bonds seems to have been in 
the vicinity of 2 to 3 per cent over long periods. 
Thus a bond offering 10 per cent is really paying 
about 3 per cent in real terms and 7 per cent to 
offset expected price increases over the life of the 
instrument. An insurance company could invest in 
such bonds and use them as backing for an annuity 
that it could then sell to a plan sponsor. For 
$85,300, that annuity would guarantee the retiree 
not only $10,000 a year for ten years but also an 
additional amount each year ($700 in the first year, 
$1,449 in the second year, etc.) that would offset 
the expected 7 per cent annual increase in prices. In 
brief, the insurance company could offer an annuity 
indexed at 7 per cent per year. 

That might still not be sufficient, however, to 
support the promise of a pension that was fully 
indexed against price increases. As noted earlier, 
much of the problem arises when the rate of infla­ 
tion turns out to be higher than expected. This is 
where inflation insurance could play a role. In 
return for a promise by the insurance company to 
provide full indexation of the annuity, the federal 

government would sell the company some inflation 
insurance. If the rate of inflation at the end of the 
first year turned out to be 10 per cent rather than 
the expected 7 per cent in our previous example, the 
government would pay the insurance company an 
additional $300 on an annuity of $10,000. The $700 
yield from the original bonds plus the $300 insur­ 
ance payment would match the total price increase 
of 10 per cent. On the other hand, if inflation turned 
out to be only 4 per cent instead of 7 per cent, the 
insurance company would be required to reimburse 
the $300 to the government. 

If, over long periods of time, forecasts of expected 
inflation rates provided by the nominal interest rates 
on government bonds would turn out, on average, to 
be correct, the government would only need to 
charge a premium for such insurance sufficient to 
cover its administrative expenses. And there is some 
evidence to suggest that pension plan members 
would be prepared to pay for insurance that would 
protect them fully against price increases. 

Variants of the inflation insurance scheme might 
also be used to solve the problem caused by the 
inflation-induced erosion of the benefits of mobile 
employees. The portability of pensions protected 
against this erosion could be assured if all employers 
offered final-earnings plans that were sufficiently 
similar to enable them to credit new employees with 
past service and to receive in turn from prior 
employers an amount sufficient to buy the deferred 
annuities to which their new employees had already 
become entitled. Such reciprocity would be difficult 
to achieve because existing private-employer plans 
are so diverse, but it is available for a number of 
government-employee plans. If inflation insurance 
were available, an employer could purchase an 
indexed deferred annuity for employees leaving the 
firm during the course of their working lives, in just 
the same manner as he would buy one for retiring 
employees. 

The major advantage of this proposal is that the 
impact on the stability of the financial system would 
be small. There would be no need to deposit large 
amounts of pension funds with the federal govern­ 
ment, as would be required with indexed bonds. 
This feature in itself would mean fewer problems 
for the conduct of monetary policy. The proposal 
could be used for money-purchase plans (including 
RRSPS), and inflation insurance could be made 
available directly to plan sponsors, if they so wished, 
rather than through insurance companies. Because 
chronic inflation is such a recent phenomenon in 
Canada, however, it is probably advisable to investi­ 
gate the implications of this proposal more thor­ 
oughly before its implementation is considered. 



Expansion of Public Pension Plans - If nothing 
can be done to effect major and widespread 
improvements in the inflation protection provided 
by private pension plans, there will be little alterna­ 
tive but to expand the Canada and Quebec Pension 
Plans. One approach that might offer a way of 
retaining the best features of the private system 
while moving quickly to overcome its deficiencies 
would involve the establishment of a fully funded 
supplement to the Canada and Quebec Pension 
Plans, with an option for employers to contract out, 
as in the present British system. In the United 
Kingdom, employers may participate in a state 
scheme that offers price-indexed benefits, or they 
may contract out of that scheme, provided their own 
plan meets certain specified standards. Indexed 
deferred benefits are transferred to the government 
plan for employees who change employers prior to 
retirement, thus effectively making a minimum level 
of pension benefits fully indexed and portable for all 
employees. Employers outside the plan may limit 
their liability for indexing benefits to 8.5 per cent a 
year by paying a premium to the state scheme, 
which then assumes responsibility for making up 
any additional indexation required. Employers in 
the state plan may, if they wish, offer supplemen­ 
tary benefits in addition to those offered by the state 
plan. 

Adjustments for Economic Growth - Even if all 
retirement benefits were fully adjusted for inflation, 
the real income of older people in Canada would 
still not rise at the same rate as the average industri­ 
al wage. Industrial wages reflect real growth in the 
economy - that is, in productivity - as well as 
price increases. The Canada and Quebec Pension 
Plans and the employer-sponsored defined-benefit 
plans do adjust benefits to varying degrees for 
increases in real wages until retirement. Apart from 
ad hoc adjustments to the OAS and GIS programs, 
however, we know of no retirement income program 
in Canada that provides post-retirement adjustment 
for general increases in real wages. For a retired 
person, the effect is equivalent to a decline in the 
income-replacement ratio. 

The needs of individuals depend largely upon the 
community's lifestyle. Over time, as real incomes 
rise, what were once luxuries become necessities - 
central heating, telephones, radios, or television sets, 
among others. If older people do not share somehow 
in productivity gains, it means that they will have to 
forgo amenities that the rest of us now take for 
granted. 

In our view, this problem is not nearly as serious 
as that caused by inflation. Nevertheless, it cannot 
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simply be dismissed, because it may be particularly 
acute for the elderly poor. To force them to live in 
the future with even the same real income as today 
is to force them to remain poor. Yet many of them 
depend almost exclusively on OAS and GIS pay­ 
ments, which - unlike CPP and QPP benefits and 
many occupational pension payments - do not 
automatically reflect real wage increases to the 
point of retirement. At the very least, OAS and GIS 
payments should continue to be reviewed from time 
to time in light of increases in the average industrial 
wage in the economy and other considerations. 

Income from Home Ownership - We noted ear­ 
lier that home ownership has provided a useful 
hedge against inflation but that it presents the 
elderly homeowner with a dilemma. One method of 
expanding the choice open to elderly homeowners is 
the reverse-annuity mortgage, which has been in use 
in the United Kingdom for some years and is being 
introduced on an experimental basis in several areas 
of the United States. For the plan to be of substan­ 
tial benefit to many elderly homeowners, however, 
mortgage interest would have to be deductible from 
taxable income. 

A reverse-annuity mortgage is an arrangement 
whereby a loan is taken out with the house as 
security and is used to buy a lifetime annuity. 
Repayment of the principal is deferred until the 
death of the owners or liquidation of the property. 
The periodic payment made to the individual is 
reduced by the mortgage interest. 

Such mortgages have several attractive features. 
They would increase the freedom of choice for older 
people by providing them an additional source of 
income. They would be particularly beneficial to 
lower-income homeowners; although the absolute 
amount of home equity rises with income, the ratio 
of home equity to income is higher among lower­ 
income groups. Finally, during prolonged periods of 
inflation the house can continue to provide protec­ 
tion against price rises, since the mortgage, and 
hence the annuity payment received, can be periodi­ 
cally increased as the value of the house increases. 
Moreover, a reverse mortgage arrangement allows 
the elderly homeowners to remain in their own 
homes and to enjoy continued "indexed" rental 
accommodation. 

On the other hand, it should be emphasized that 
since the amount of the annuity increases with the 
age of the homeowner at the outset, these plans are 
likely to be of primary benefit to those aged 70 and 
over - widowed women in particular, many of 
whom receive few, if any, benefits from occupation­ 
al pension plans. 
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Under current Canadian tax law, the interest 
component of the annuity would be taxable as ordi­ 
nary income. This would reduce the value of the 
annuity for those with sufficient other income to 
make the annuity taxable. If mortgage interest were 
deductible from gross income, the reduction in tax 
liability would more than offset the tax payable on 
the annuity." 

While we have not investigated the willingness of 
the private sector to provide the required funds, it is 
known that the Metropolitan Trust Company has 
recently launched a trial "Independent Income 
Mortgage" in Toronto. A reverse mortgage program 
would, however, increase the demand for mortgage 
funds in the coming period, when the increasing 
proportion of older people might imply a reduced 
demand for housing. As an alternative, reverse 
mortgages could, perhaps, be sponsored by an insti­ 
tution like the Canada Mortgage and Housing 
Corporation. 

CONCLUSION 

Inflation has placed a severe strain on our pension 
system. Beneficiaries of private-sector occupational 
plans see the real purchasing value of their pensions 
falling, and they are powerless to do anything about 
it. Some relief is granted from time to time by ad 

hoc increases, but this is not enough. Not only may 
those increases be insufficient but, because they are 
not systematic, they do not remove a pensioner's 
uncertainty about the future. 
Private-sector pension plan members receive 

much less protection from inflation than those in the 
public sector. There is a need to move public- and 
private-sector plans much closer together in respect 
of inflation protection, but to a very considerable 
extent, this should be done by removing the 
inadequacies of the private plans. 
Preserving the real purchasing power of retire­ 

ment pensions - either public or private - against 
the ravages of inflation will not "bankrupt" the 
Canadian economy. No more real resources are 
required for price-indexed pensions in an inflation­ 
ary environment than for unindexed pensions in a 
noninflationary environment. But the indexation of 
pension benefits does present problems for sponsor­ 
ing firms; inflation pushes up benefit liabilities and 
pushes down the value of pension fund investments, 
since no investment instruments available at present 
seem to be capable of ensuring a positive real rate of 
return. Moreover, the situation may be exacerbated 
by the effects of inflation on the profitability of a 
firm's own operations. 

The weakness in the present system cannot be 
removed by industry alone, but it can be overcome 
by goverment, or by government in partnership with 
industry. 



9 A Range of Choice 

At the outset of this report, we defined the primary 
objectives of the system of income security for the 
elderly and indicated a variety of ways to reach 
those objectives. In later chapters, we discussed the 
implications of these various alternatives for the 
economy, including their possible impact on other 
national goals. Although more attention has been 
devoted to the structure of the system than to actual 
benefit levels, this is not because the Council neces­ 
sarily believes that the latter are adequate at 
present. The emphasis on structure reflects, rather, 
the concern that the achievement of adequate ben­ 
efit levels could be jeopardized by an inappropriate 
system. 

The Council recognizes that differences of opin­ 
ion about the goals and objectives of such a complex 
system will endure. Similarly, views about the price 
that people are prepared to pay to achieve specific 
objectives will vary. It has been difficult, even in our 
own deliberations, to arrive at any consensus; it will 
be much more so in the country at large. 

We have had heated discussions about the 
adequacy of-benefit levels and about the degree and 
desirability of government intervention in the retire­ 
ment field. We have debated the use of the retire­ 
ment income system as a means of accelerating 
economic growth or reducing the level of foreign 
ownership in Canada. We have argued over the 
possibility that measures to improve the lot of older 
people could adversely affect the fiscal position of 
our governments, the competitive position of 
Canadian industry, and Canada's balance of inter­ 
national payments, or that they could create an 
intolerable burden for the work force of the future. 

As individuals, we have differed - indeed, we 
still differ - as to the importance to be assigned to 
these many areas of interest. Nevertheless, in the 
course of our debates and research, as we came to 
better understand how the system works and how it 
does in fact impinge on a variety of goals, we have 
narrowed many of the areas of disagreement. 

We have found that the costs of the system, in 
terms of the resources required to support our older 
population, and the ease or difficulty of transferring 
these resources to them, can be greatly affected by 
demographic trends, by inflation, and by productivi­ 
ty growth - factors beyond the purview of retire­ 
ment income policies. On the other hand, our work 
also suggests that a wide variety of policy alterna­ 
tives can be employed with no significant cost in 
terms of economic growth. In brief, our work draws 
attention both to considerations that narrow policy 
choices and to others that need not be viewed as 
severe constraints. The subject is so complex, how­ 
ever, that the Council itself found it necessary to 
summarize and review the findings and the policy 
alternatives before making any recommendations. 

A SUMMARY OF FINDINGS 

Here, in brief, are the major findings of this 
report: 

- The number of older people in Canada is 
increasing rapidly. More important, the more 
this country moves in the direction of a low­ 
demographic-growth scenario, the smaller will 
be the future work force to supply the goods and 
services required by the older generation. 

- Even with a medium-to-low population growth 
rate, until well into the next century Canada will 
not reach the high ratios of elderly to work force 
now experienced by some Western European 
countries. Even then, the Canadian ratio will not 
rise much above that now being experienced in 
these other countries. 

- Even with present retirement benefit levels, the 
share of total goods and services required for our 
older population will increase somewhat. To 
remove some of the existing gaps in the retire­ 
ment system will, of course, require an even 
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greater share, although much can be done while 
staying within limits that are reasonable by 
international standards. 

- It is not likely that the increased requirements of 
our older population will be balanced by a 
decline in expenditures on the young, particular­ 
ly after the year 2000. 

- No matter how rapid the growth in real GNP - 
and projections of growth as far ahead into the 
future as those in this study must be treated with 
caution - the growth in the share of total goods 
and services required for our older population 
will be little reduced. It may well be that the 
adverse effect on GNP per capita of a labour 
force that will grow more slowly will be more 
than offset by increased productivity or output 
per worker. But output per worker is reflected in 
real wages, and it turns out that pension benefits 
have been closely linked to real wages. The 
higher the level of GNP per capita, however, the 
less difficult it will be to transfer any given 
percentage of GNP to older people. 

- The present system of public retirement income 
plans, in aiming to ensure adequate income for 
older Canadians, redistributes income among 
age groups and among various income classes. 
Such redistribution can affect work and saving 
incentives, as well as the degree to which the 
system is supported by the various groups. It 
must be taken into account when considering the 
future viability of the system. 

- If employer/employee contribution rates to the 
Canada and Quebec Pension Plans were to 
remain at the present level, the reserve funds 
that have been accumulating in recent years 
would be exhausted early in the coming century. 
In other words, contribution rates will have to be 
raised by the first decade of the coming century 
at the latest, just to keep the plans on a pay-as­ 
you-go basis. Even with existing benefit provi­ 
sions, redistribution of income to those now in 
the work force implies that, at some time in the 
future, workers may, depending upon the rate of 
growth of population, have to pay contribution 
rates in excess of those that would be required to 
fully fund their own pensions. 

- Pension-related employer costs appear to be 
higher at present in the United States than in 
Canada. Of course, extensive improvement in 
Canadian pension plans could change this situa­ 
tion if it were not accompanied by reductions in 
other costs or matched by similar improvements 
in the United States. 

- The economy's productive potential will, other 
things being equal, tend to be lower as a result of 
the aging of the population, especially because of 
slower growth in the labour force. On the other 
hand, although the pattern of economic growth 
may be affected by the retirement income 
system, the rate of economic growth and the 
future level of GNP do not seem to be extremely 
sensitive to it. As far as we can detect, the 
retirement income system does not have a strong 
adverse effect on the supply of savings (and 
capital formation) or the supply of labour. 
Canada's present retirement income system con­ 
tains fewer work disincentives than the 
U.S. social security system, and those that do 
exist affect a relatively small proportion of the 
population (see Chapter 7). That proportion 
would increase, however, if the age of entitle­ 
ment to public benefits were lowered to draw in 
the increasingly larger age groups approaching 
65. 

- Canadians cannot, of course, look with 
equanimity on policies that would reduce domes­ 
tic saving. For many years this country has, on 
balance, supplemented its domestic saving by 
drawing on that of other countries to finance an 
important part of its domestic investment. Such 
investment has brought many benefits, but it has 
also been reflected in deficits on the current 
account of the balance of international payments 
and in increasing levels of foreign ownership and 
net international indebtedness. If these features 
are to be reversed, more of our domestic invest­ 
ment will have to be financed from our own 
savings. This will be particularly important in 
the coming decade or so, when there will be 
major requirements for capital formation. Over 
the long run, however, slower growth in popula­ 
tion may also bring with it some reduction in the 
need for capital. Given the amount of capital per 
worker, total capital formation will slow down 
with the growth in the work force. Whether that 
will be offset by the provision of more capital 
per worker is open to debate. In this connection, 
it is worth noting that Canada is already one of 
the most capital-intensive industrial nations. 
But, whatever savings objectives are decided 
upon, there is also a need to consider the effi­ 
ciency and fairness of the methods used to pro­ 
vide those savings. 

- The present mix of public and private pension 
plans, as well as the growing institutionalization 
of the retirement income system, has had a 
considerable impact on the way in which 
Canadian savings have been channeled into vari- 



ous uses. Pension funds now supply a high pro­ 
portion of government-sector capital require­ 
ments, but they make a much smaller 
contribution to corporate financing, particularly 
with respect to newer firms or firms in high-risk 
activities. If those pension savings now going 
directly into the government sector were recy­ 
cled through capital markets or if the role of 
private-sector trusteed and insured pension plans 
were increased, the cost of corporate financing 
and the flow of foreign savings into Canadian 
business might both be reduced. On the other 
hand, care would have to be taken to avoid 
having those who invest pension funds exercise 
undue control over industry - a concern that is 
already apparent in Britain and the United 
States. 

- Even under the present system, the assets of 
occupational pension plans would increase more 
rapidly than GNP and could equal about four­ 
fifths of annual GNP by 2031. If the CPP and QPP 
were fully funded, the total assets of all pension 
funds could amount to nearly twice the value of 
GNP by that time (see Chapter 10). The assets of 
pension funds would, of course, represent a 
somewhat smaller proportion of the country's 
capital stock than of GNP. 

- The assets of pension funds in Canada are 
already concentrated to a considerable extent in 
a small number of plans. Concentration is a 
double-edged sword: it can detract from capital 
market efficiency by reducing competition, but 
at the same time the ability of large funds to 
acquire and use information promotes efficient 
investment and resource allocation. The possibil­ 
ity of nonmarket considerations affecting invest­ 
ment could be greatly increased if the CPP and 
QPP were to move to a more highly funded basis. 

- Present restrictions on the holdings of foreign 
securities by Canadian pension funds may 
increase the problems of concentration and con­ 
trol, particularly in view of the funds' potential 
for growth. These restrictions could also act to 
reduce the potential returns on the pension sav­ 
ings of Canadians. 

The present policies of both government and 
industry in Canada do very little to serve the 
needs of those older people who are both able 
and willing to work. Greater work-force partici­ 
pation by older people would not provide any 
major reduction in the potential "pension bur­ 
den," but it would provide important gains for 
individuals and at least some increase in the 
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economy's productive capabilities. The present 
mix of incentives in the retirement income 
system tends to discourage later retirement and 
labour force participation by older people. 
Increasing freedom of choice in either direction 
would involve costs, and encouraging more 
labour force participation by older people would 
likely involve positive incentives, as well as 
improvements in health and job opportunities. 

There are a number of gaps and inequities in the 
present system: the maximum OAS/GIS pay­ 
ments are not yet sufficient to raise the income 
of a number of older people - many of them 
unattached women, to the low-income cutoff as 
calculated by Statistics Canada, and public pen­ 
sion benefits cannot be accumulated directly by 
one major group - housewives. An even greater 
number of issues arise with respect to the private 
occupational system: the inadequacy of spouse 
and survivor benefits; the need for wider cover­ 
age to include, for example, those employed by 
small businesses; the much less favourable treat­ 
ment accorded private-sector employees com­ 
pared with government employees; the treatment 
of mobile workers relative to those who remain 
with one employer for long periods; and the 
income vulnerability of those in retirement com­ 
pared with those in the work force. Many of 
these problems are greatly exacerbated by infla­ 
tion, especially by unexpected changes in the 
rate of price increases. 

OPTIONS AND ALTERNATIVES 

The provision of income security for older people 
is only one of a number of national goals in Canada, 
but it has come to occupy a rather high priority in 
recent years. Canadians are faced with a wide range 
of alternatives - and perhaps some very hard 
choices - about the specific objectives of the 
income security system and the methods used for 
achieving those objectives. 

Most people are concerned about the level of the 
pension they will receive after they retire and 
wonder if it will be sufficient to provide them with a 
decent standard of living. They are also concerned 
about the opportunities available to them for build­ 
ing up those pension benefits. On the other hand, 
they do not appear to worry as much about such 
seemingly technical questions as how their pensions 
are funded or how their pension savings are invest­ 
ed. Yet the answers to questions such as these may 
go a long way towards establishing just how large or 
how secure the individual's benefits will ultimately 
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be. The funding formula selected, for example, will 
affect the way in which the "pension burden" will 
be shared between pensioners and labour force par­ 
ticipants or between present and future workers. 

THE SYSTEM'S GOALS AND OBJECTIVES 

The primary purpose of the system - the provi­ 
sion of income security for older people - is too 
vague for policy purposes. For a start, it is useful to 
think of it as the need to ensure a basic income for 
all people over a specified age, regardless of previ­ 
ous circumstances, and to replace some specified 
proportion of the income earned prior to qualifying 
for retirement benefits. 

Until quite recently, Canada tended to emphasize 
the first of these needs in its public retirement 
income system. Something had to be done about the 
widespread incidence of poverty among older 
people - a situation that reflected a breakdown in 
the traditional family support in the context of an 
increasingly urbanized industrial society with a 
mobile work force. Indeed, the Parliament of 
Canada has paid continuing attention to the matter, 
particularly since the passing of the Old Age Secu­ 
rity Act, which set the universal old age pension at 
$40 a month beginning in 1952. That amount was 
raised to $46 and then $55 in 1957, to $65 in 1962, 
and to $75 in 1963. Since that time, the emphasis 
has been on changing the basis of payment to 
provide for automatic adjustment as prices rose, 
although further ad hoc increases have also been 
made to both OAS and GIS benefits. 

As progress was being made in the direction of 
providing a basic income, however, concern grew 
about the second goal - the need to prevent too 
large a decline in income once full-time work ends. 
This concern is an explicit recognition of the dif­ 
ficulty of defining poverty or social deprivation. 
Affluence for one may seem like poverty to another, 
if he or she has become accustomed to a higher 
standard of living. Linking retirement income to 
pre-retirement income is one way - albeit an 
imperfect one - of dealing with this relative aspect 
of the problem. But it does help to avoid the situa­ 
tion in which individuals who had been earning an 
adequate income while working suddenly find them­ 
selves with a very sharply reduced living standard 
after retirement. 

The two goals mayor may not coincide. When an 
individual's pre-retirement income is low - and 
there will always be people who, for various reasons, 

are unable to work or who receive only low 
incomes - even a high level of income replacement 
will not provide sufficient basic income. When pre­ 
retirement income is high, on the other hand, some 
level of replacement will accomplish both goals. But 
the provision of a basic old-age income sufficiently 
high to prevent, by itself, a sharp drop in the 
retirement income of middle- and upper-income 
workers would be extremely expensive and could 
involve serious distortions of work and saving incen­ 
tives. For these reasons, many countries use sepa­ 
rate methods to achieve each goal. The U.S. social 
security administration has run into problems in its 
attempt to achieve both through a single system, 
and it has now begun to move towards a split system 
also. 

To make these goals operational for policy pur­ 
poses, however, it is necessary to define a number of 
much more specific objectives. In the case of the 
basic-income goal, this means, among other things, 
the establishment of an age of entitlement and of 
defined benefit levels. Whether a given level can 
prevent destitution will depend on its being adjusted 
to rising prices, as well as on the access of older 
people to related services, including housing and 
health care. 

There is wide public support in Canada for some 
measure of basic income support, although there 
may be disagreement about the levels and methods 
used. The income-replacement goal is more conten­ 
tious. Nevertheless, governments have stepped in, 
partly because of a growing realization that the 
private system has not provided sufficiently high 
income-replacement levels for a large proportion of 
the work force, particularly if these levels are cal­ 
culated in terms of their real purchasing power. The 
Council believes that there should be adequate 
opportunities for all working Canadians to build up 
earnings-related pension entitlements, in real terms, 
regardless of where or with whom they were 
employed or how many times they changed jobs. 
But, for policy purposes, this goal too must be made 
more specific as to conditions of entitlement and 
target replacement ratios, for example. 

BASIC-INCOME ALTERNATIVES 

The decision to ensure a basic income for all, 
regardless of previous circumstances, implies that 
there will be some redistribution of income. 
Although that can be undertaken effectively only by 
government, there is still a wide range of choice 
with respect to revenue sources, benefit structure, 
and benefit levels. 



Payroll taxes are used in some countries - for 
example, the Netherlands - to support basic flat­ 
rate benefits. This type of financing bears more 
heavily on lower- than on upper-income groups, 
however, and the present Canadian method of 
financing the OAS and GIS programs through gener­ 
al tax revenues seems fairer, since it spreads the 
costs more progressively across all income groups. 

With respect to the benefit structure of basic­ 
income programs, the main choices concern the 
adjustment of benefits to changing prices and 
wages, the degree of selectivity, and the benefit level 
itself. Benefits granted under the OAS and GIS pro­ 
grams are already indexed to the consumer price 
index. Without this, the basic income of older 
people would fall very rapidly in real terms during 
inflationary periods such as Canada has been 
experiencing in the last few years. It has also been 
suggested that benefits be adjusted to specially con­ 
structed price indexes that would focus more on the 
specific needs of older people. 

The issue of linking pensions to wage rather than 
price levels is more contentious. Without this pro­ 
tection, the basic income of retired people falls, 
relative to that of those still in the labour force, even 
when benefits are price-indexed. Yet wage indexa­ 
tion would add substantially to the cost of the 
system, and it would add a further element of 
rigidity. One approach would be to leave the matter 
to government discretion with respect to ad hoc 
increases, depending upon the state of the economy 
and the federal government's budgetary position - 
as is now the case - but to have a review procedure 
built into the Old Age Security Act. 

The GIS benefits are income-tested, although OAS 
pensions are not. The application of such a test 
increases the selectivity of the program, and expen­ 
ditures are reduced since payments go only to those 
who need them most. Using such a test for the OAS 
program too - in effect combining the present 
basic-income programs - would offer a way to 
further reduce expenditures or to raise the basic 
pension for those most in need without increasing 
the total cost. Enhancing selectivity in this way 
could also have disadvantages, however, as it might 
foster work and saving disincentives. More impor­ 
tantly, there is a long history in Canada, as well as 
in the United States and Britain, of struggles 
against such tests. Prolonged policy debate in 
Canada in the late 1940s and the 1950s finally led 
to political support for a universal nontested pro­ 
gram from various groups. The universal character 
of the OAS program is an important element in that 
support. 
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On the other hand, some suggest that antipathy 
towards means tests will change. Retirement pro­ 
grams, including some basic-income programs, are 
means- or income-tested in some European coun­ 
tries and in Australia. In Canada, since such tests 
are already built into the tax structure (as, for 
example, in Ontario's GAINS program) - a much 
more impersonal approach than in earlier years - 
they already apply to many people. Even if a change 
were contemplated, however, it would have to be 
undertaken gradually, in order to give people 
enough time to take it into account in their retire­ 
ment plans. 

The adequacy of the benefit levels themselves is a 
difficult matter. It cannot be considered in isolation 
from the availability of other services to the aged, 
such as medical care and housing. And, in fairness, 
it must also involve consideration of programs avail­ 
able for those in other age groups - the disabled 
for example - who are unable to participate in the 
labour force. Apart from that, the range of choice is 
very wide, and the decision will depend ultimately 
upon the electorate's priorities, the state of the 
economy, and demographic trends. 

INCOME- REPLACEMENT ALTERNATIVES 

The choice of methods for implementing an 
income-replacement objective is very wide, though 
perhaps not so great as first appears. Some methods 
preclude others. Indeed, to a very considerable 
extent, the public/private mix may be predeter­ 
mined by decisions made with respect to other 
questions, such as the most desirable method of 
funding. 

Funding Alternatives - Pensions may be fully 
funded, partly funded, or financed on a pay-as-you­ 
go basis. Private-sector occupational pension plans 
are generally required by law to be fully funded - 
within certain limits, their assets must be sufficient 
to meet all accumulated rights to benefits - so that 
they will be secure even if the employer goes out of 
business. Partly funded and pay-as-you-go plans are 
available only to governments. Among the former, 
there is a further range of alternatives, depending 
upon what the fund is designed to do. It may be just 
large enough to avoid frequent changes in contribu­ 
tion rates or, perhaps as has been the case with the 
CPP and QPP, to provide a part of provincial borrow­ 
ing requirements. Under a pay-as-you-go system, of 
course, the question of how the funds are to be 
invested is not relevant. 
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Pensions provided by private plans are made 
secure largely by investing contributions in the obli­ 
gations of third parties - other corporations or 
governments. In the case of public plans, or at least 
those of the federal and provincial governments, the 
third-party concept is more difficult to apply; in any 
event, the pension promise is backed by taxing 
powers. Therefore, the choice of a funding method 
for public plans has very little to do with security, 
except perhaps in an indirect way. Instead, the 
choice depends largely on how the burden of ulti­ 
mately transferring goods and services to older 
people will be shared and how the growth and level 
of GNP will be affected. 

The larger the country's GNP when the time 
comes to honour the pension promise, the less dif­ 
ficult it will be to transfer any given percentage of 
that GNP to the older population, even if that per­ 
centage itself does not change, or changes very little, 
as GNP changes. If the choice of a pay-as-you-go 
scheme greatly reduced saving - and, as a conse­ 
quence, capital formation and growth - or if it 
caused many people to withdraw from the labour 
force, GNP could be much lower in the future, and 
the burden of transfer would increase. 

We have pointed out, however, that the relation­ 
ship between saving and growth is more tenuous 
than is generally believed. Moreover, we have not 
been able to detect any highly adverse impact of the 
CPP and QPP on personal saving; and, to date at 
least, the plans have increased government saving. 
Finally, even if personal and total domestic savings 
were reduced by public pension plans, historical 
experience suggests that the outcome would more 
likely be an inflow of foreign savings - which, of 
course, would raise questions in its own right - 
than a decline in domestic capital formation. 

Although a public pension system that is less than 
fully funded does not appear to reduce domestic 
saving significantly, a fully funded system, partly 
because of its compulsory nature, would undoubted­ 
ly generate large savings. Indeed, even without full 
funding of the CPP and QPP, pension fund assets in 
Canada will grow more rapidly than GNP. 

For some time to come, Canada will require 
increased domestic saving if it is to reduce its 
present balance-of-payments deficit, its balance of 
international indebtedness, and the level of foreign 
ownership. Large savings will also be required for 
investment in energy development and for the 
rationalization of Canadian industry. But a word of 
caution in the other direction may also be warrant­ 
ed. With high savings levels over the longer run, 

keeping the economy at full employment would call 
for either continued rapid growth in investment or 
deficit financing by governments. 

A fully funded public system would also involve 
fewer disincentives to work than a pay-as-you-go or 
partly funded system since, by contrast with the 
latter two, it does not give rise to the type of wealth 
redistribution that could affect work choices. Our 
results also indicate, however, that work-incentive 
effects in the existing public system will not be too 
important unless there is a substantial lowering of 
the age of entitlement. 

What this suggests is that the choice of either a 
pay-as-you-go or a partly funded system need not be 
constrained by fear of the consequence for the 
growth and level of GNP. Instead, it can be made on 
the basis of how the burden of transferring goods 
and services to future pensioners will be shared 
between them and the work force of the future. 

The more the system moves in the direction of 
full funding, the more the retirees of the future will 
provide for their retirement needs through their own 
savings; the more it moves towards the pay-as-you­ 
go approach, the more those needs will be met by 
the future work force. There are reasons for sug­ 
gesting that future pensioners should not have to 
depend entirely on their own savings. Among other 
things, they have helped to lay the basis for future 
growth by paying for the education of the future 
work force and many of the public facilities which 
that work force will use. It only seems just that they 
should enjoy some of the returns from such 
investment. 

There are limits, however - uncertain though 
they may be - as to how far this process can go 
without affecting the continued viability of the 
system. Pay-as-you-go schemes are sensitive to 
demographic bulges such as Canada now faces. As 
the ratio of prospective pensioners to workers rises, 
pay-as-you-go contribution rates must also increase. 
At current cpp and QPP benefit levels, the increased 
rates would not be that high by international stand­ 
ards (see also Chapter 10). But the greater the 
increase in promised benefits or the decline in the 
age of entitlement, the more that contribution rates 
will rise. Political resistance to such changes can 
obviously be lessened if they are undertaken in a 
series of small steps rather than in one or two large 
increases. Nevertheless, at some point, additional 
benefits must be paid for by the future recipients 
themselves if any semblance of fairness is to be 
maintained. 



There are limits in the other direction too. A fully 
funded system takes care of the demographic bulge 
by having participants save enough to provide for 
their own benefits. But such a system, whether 
public or private, is likely to be adversely affected 
by inflation; assets are not likely to increase in value 
as fast as obligations. In contrast, pay-as-you-go 
schemes are better protected from inflation, since 
their revenue base increases at least as fast as the 
general price level. Bitter historical experience with 
inflation in Germany and France, for example, has 
led those countries to depend largely on the pay-as­ 
you-go approach. 

Thus the choice of a funding option is not clear­ 
cut. It will depend on assessment of future demo­ 
graphic trends and on the potential for inflation, as 
well as on how these features determine the way 
that the burden of transfer should be shared. 

Sources of Funds - Occupational pension plans 
may depend upon employer or employee contribu­ 
tions or on a combination of the two. In Canada, the 
combined approach (a contributory plan) is the 
more usual; in the United States, where only 
employer contributions are tax-deductible, noncon­ 
tributory plans (involving employer contributions 
only) are in the majority. In any event, the source of 
occupational plan funds is largely confined to the 
equivalent of a payroll or earnings tax. Public 
income-replacement schemes, no matter how they 
are funded, could draw upon wider revenue sources 
through the tax system. Partly or fully funded plans 
may also draw upon their investment income. 

The choice of revenue sources also determines 
how the costs of supplying goods and services to 
older people are to be shared. To the extent that an 
income-replacement program involves redistribution 
of income - and whether it should or not is 
debatable - there is much to be said for using a 
wide revenue base. 

A payroll- or earnings-based contribution - par­ 
ticularly one that applies only to earnings up to 
some maximum, as in the case of the CPP and QPP 
- bears more heavily on lower-income groups; as a 
percentage of total earnings, the contribution rate 
declines as earnings rise above the maximum. If the 
program is used to transfer income to the very poor, 
those only moderately better off will pay a larger 
percentage of their income to support the poor than 
will the rich. On the other hand, linking income­ 
replacement schemes to earnings has an advantage, 
in that participants perceive them as being related 
directly to their own efforts, so that they are more 
inclined to accept their share of the burden. In other 
words, if the pension plan is viewed more as a 
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compulsory saving mechanism, whereby each par­ 
ticipant provides for his/her own share of the goods 
and services required on retirement, the payroll tax 
is a more appropriate revenue source. 

Use of Funds - The question of the investment 
of funds is relevant only for partially or fully funded 
plans. For those plans, there could be a wide range 
of choice, ranging from unrestricted use to various 
eligibility conditions for investment. These condi­ 
tions may set the kinds of investments that can be 
made - such as government bonds, stocks with 
good dividend records, and Canadian or foreign 
securities - and the proportions in which they can 
be held. Other possibilities could include various 
methods of breaking up any concentration of funds 
and economic power that might be held by a rela­ 
tively small number of large public or private funds. 

The choice of options here may directly affect the 
amount of goods and services accruing to 
pensioners - as in the case of money-purchase 
plans - and the security of an individual pension. 
They may also have a bearing on economic growth, 
the concentration of economic power, and foreign 
ownership and control of Canadian industry. 

To maximize the amounts accruing to individual 
pensioners, pension savings must be allocated to 
their most productive uses - whether in Canada or 
abroad - consistent, of course, with the security of 
benefits. If rates of return were generally higher in 
Canada than abroad, this approach would also be 
consistent with increasing this country's rate of 
economic growth in terms of real GNP per capita. 
Some argue, however, that Canadian pension sav­ 
ings should be used only in Canada, to increase 
capital formation in this country. It is not unusual, 
of course, for countries to earmark savings for spe­ 
cific social purposes; when that is the case, however, 
the purpose should be set out explicitly, and the 
level and distribution of costs and benefits should be 
recognized. 

Because of its compulsory nature, pension saving 
might, for example, provide a very effective method 
of repatriating control of Canadian industry or 
increasing the domestic financing of capital forma­ 
tion. On the other hand, one might question the 
fairness of achieving either of these objectives 
through a payroll tax that would weigh most heavily 
on lower-income groups. Equally important, the real 
purpose of investment is not a larger capital stock 
but increased real income. If savings were invested 
only in Canada, without regard to the rate of return, 
the ultimate result could be a much larger capital 
stock but little increase in income. 
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Concern has also been expressed that govern­ 
ments will use pension savings for current expendi­ 
tures or for low-return investments - possibilities 
that could be avoided by channeling more pension 
savings through capital markets. It is also feared 
that private pension funds may be too averse to 
risks, but that situation could be mitigated by the 
creation of "venture investment agencies" or the 
type of re-insurance scheme recently announced by 
the federal government (see Chapter 6). 

Encouraging greater investment in domestic equi­ 
ties, in particular, would naturally increase the poss­ 
ibility that control of Canadian industry would 
become more and more concentrated in pension 
funds - a fear that has already surfaced in the 
United States and Britain. The problem could be 
aggravated if public income-replacement programs 
were to become more fully funded, unless action was 
taken through either the adoption of some version of 
the Swedish pension fund investment system or the 
auctioning-off of public pension funds to private 
institutions. 

The Benefit Structure - Many of the questions 
of greatest interest to individuals, including what 
opportunities are available to build up their benefits 
and how large those benefits will be in terms of real 
purchasing power, are related to the benefit struc­ 
ture. The level and structure of benefits - includ­ 
ing rules for eligibility and coverage - also playa 
major role in determining what proportion of GNP 
will ultimately be allocated to older people, how 
those benefits will be shared among various 
individuals and groups, and what the costs will be to 
individual employers. 

Some of the possible choices are: benefits based 
on various calculations of earnings from career­ 
average to best earnings; benefits protected through 
price and wage indexation and shorter vesting 
requirements; benefits proportional to earnings or 
decreasing with higher earnings (under public plans 
only); and various replacement ratios, ages of enti­ 
tlement, and eligibility conditions. 

The more that benefits are based on best earn­ 
ings, the more costly the system but also the higher 
the ultimate level of benefits and the better the 
protection provided pension rights against price and 
wage increases. As for post-retirement benefits, CPP 
and QPP payments are already indexed to the con­ 
sumer price index; but, in the absence of an invest­ 
ment that is proof against unexpected inflation, such 
indexation is difficult for private plans. 

There can be no doubt about the urgent need to 
protect retired people from the effects of inflation. 
On the other hand, post-retirement indexation of 
income-replacement pensions to wage increases is, 
we would think, a much less urgent matter. In the 
absence of such indexation, and even with post­ 
retirement price indexation, the real income of pen­ 
sioners will naturally fall relative to that of workers. 
On the other hand, building wage indexation into 
the system, whether public or private, would greatly 
increase rigidities, making it less amenable to 
modifications in line with the state of the economy. 
For the private system in particular, it could pose 
even greater problems than price indexation. 

The protection of benefits in private-sector occu­ 
pational pension plans is also greatly reduced at 
present by the relatively long periods required for 
vesting as well as by locking in provisions. Shorter 
vesting periods with continued provision for locking 
into deferred pensions provided by the employer 
would not much affect employer costs unless such 
pensions were indexed during pre-retirement years. 
Without some form of inflation protection, mobile 
workers would still face losses of accrued pension 
benefits during inflationary periods. 

The way in which total benefits are shared among 
individuals will depend, among other things, on 
whether individual benefits are proportional to earn­ 
ings or whether they decrease with them (a progres­ 
sive system). Progressive replacement rates can be 
achieved through an earnings-related system offer­ 
ing a minimum benefit and replacement rates that 
decline with rising earnings, or through an income­ 
replacement system where benefits are proportional 
to earnings, accompanied by a basic-income system 
that is not related to earnings. At present, the 
United States follows the first course; Canada has a 
mixture of the two systems, since the CPP and QPP 
(when they mature) will redistribute wealth to lower­ 
income groups. 

The choice of an income-replacement system in 
which benefits are proportional to contributions 
implies a complete separation of the income­ 
replacement and basic-income systems. There are 
several advantages to this approach. First, the 
required basic-income targets would be financed 
through general taxation, and CPP and QPP benefits 
would then be appropriately financed by the payroll 
tax. Second, all workers would receive an equitable 
return on their contributions; in the present Canadi- 



an system, higher-income workers might, before 
long, find the return on their contributions too low 
and support for the system could weaken. Finally, 
with benefits proportional to contributions, the 
system could, if so desired, be more flexible by 
allowing people to opt out upon proof of adequate 
coverage elsewhere. 

Changing the benefit structure by lowering the 
age of entitlement, increasing income-replacement 
rates or extending eligibility would obviously have a 
significant impact on the total resources accruing to 
older people. The Council recognizes the need for 
better coverage of groups such as mobile workers 
and housewives. But changes of this nature cannot 
be considered in isolation from the system. The way 
in which the costs of such changes are shared 
between future pensioners and the then-current 
work force (the funding decision) or among various 
income groups (the revenue-source choice) will 
affect the ultimate viability of the system itself. 

The Public/Private Mix - There is wide varia­ 
tion over time and among countries in the publici 
private mix of income security systems for the old. 
Choices range from a public system for both basic 
income and income replacement, at one extreme, to 
a system based on individuals and families, at the 
other. Combinations in between would include a 
public system for basic income and a private system 
only for income replacement, such as exists in Aus­ 
tralia, or a mixed public/private system for income 
replacement, as in Canada. Within the private 
system, there are various mixes of institutional and 
individual schemes possible. 
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It would not be practical to rely completely on 
individual and family support in any urbanized 
industrial society. Moreover, many of the publici 
private mix options are closed automatically by the 
choices made with respect to other structural issues. 
By and large, governments must accept responsibili­ 
ty for any program that involves large-scale redistri­ 
bution of income. Thus, to the extent that the 
basic-income objective or the need for some trans­ 
fers between different generations is stressed - as 
in the case of blanketing-in, for example - the 
government system will expand. What remains are 
largely considerations that bear on the choice be­ 
tween government or private fully funded income­ 
replacement programs. 

Private pension plans provide greater freedom of 
choice, and they can be better tailored to the differ­ 
ing needs of various workers through the collective 
bargaining process. In addition, since their funds are 
invested through the capital market, they are gener­ 
ally channeled into the most productive uses. On the 
other hand, public plans seem better able to adjust 
their post-retirement benefits for inflation and 
growth, and they also solve the mobility problem. 
Moreover, it has proven easier in most countries to 
achieve wide coverage of the labour force through 
public, rather than private, plans. Government plans 
may involve even greater concentration of power 
than private systems, however, and they raise ques­ 
tions about the level of government intervention. 
The ultimate balance will depend upon whether 
means of removing the disadvantages in either 
system can be found or, apart from that, upon 
straight political choice. 
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Canada can ensure its older people an adequate 
income without risk to the economy. To be sure, 
there will be many more of them - perhaps as 
many as one in every three Canadians aged 20 and 
over. Nor will the job be easy; it will involve contin­ 
uous, careful and prudent choice from among a 
wide range of policy alternatives, as circumstances 
change. 
One possibility would be to allow the system to 

continue to evolve in its present form and to 
attempt, through minimal adjustments, to ensure its 
financial soundness and to alleviate present 
inadequacies. Without detracting in the least from 
the present system's positive points, however, the 
Council does not feel that this would be a viable 
option. It might do very little, for example, to 
alleviate the continued high incidence of poverty 
among older women or to improve the coverage and 
benefit protection of the private system. 

The cost of the retirement income system, in 
terms of the proportion of GNP required to support 
older people, will increase even if the system contin­ 
ues in its present form. The greater the increase in 
the number of pensioners relative to workers, the 
higher that proportion will be, even without 
improvements in benefits. We would be surprised, 
however, in view of the inadequacies of the present 
system, if Canadians were not prepared to accept 
some additional increases in cost in order to improve 
benefits, even if a scenario of low demographic 
growth were to evolve. But there are limits to this 
process. The higher the total cost of these programs, 
the less the proportion of GNP that can be devoted to 
achieving other national objectives and the more 
important it becomes to ensure that the burden is 
shared fairly between the beneficiaries (through 
their own saving) and the future work force. 

COSTING THE OPTIONS 
Depending on the demographic-growth assump­ 

tions that are selected, there are wide variations in 

the percentage of GNP that would be required in the 
critical year 2031 to provide older people with any 
specified benefit package (Table 10-1). So long as 
benefits remain closely linked to real wages, that 
percentage changes very little, no matter what 
growth in those wages is assumed. Among the 
options we have attempted to cost are the proposals 
made by the Canadian Labour Congress in its sub­ 
mission to the Royal Commission on the Status of 
Pensions in Ontario.' The brief itself did not contain 
detailed calculations of cost. 
The basic-income package must be financed from 

general taxation, which will bear mainly on the 
future work force. Table 10-1 also shows what 
proportion of their contributory earnings the work­ 
ers of 2031 would have to pay in order to support 
income-replacement benefits for those aged 65 and 
over if they had to bear the whole burden of trans­ 
ferring the equivalent goods and services to that 
group and if a pay-as-you-go system were the only 
way to accomplish this. No one, as far as the 
Council is aware, is proposing anything like the 
burden on the work force that is implied by some of 
the higher pay-as-you-go rates in the table. Rather, 
the table is designed to highlight the types of choice 
that may have to be faced with respect to improving 
benefits within specific cost limits or sharing the 
burden more widely as those costs rise. 
If present OAS and GIS benefits were not aug­ 

mented in line with real wage increases (Option 1), 
the GNP cost would decline over time - even in the 
context of low demographic growth - but benefits 
would fall sharply in relation to the going real wage 
level. For those totally dependent on the basic pack­ 
age, this would soon imply a standard of living far 
below that of the average industrial worker. Options 
2 or 3 would avoid such a development. Option 3, 
which is roughly equivalent to the proposal made by 
the Canadian Labour Congress to the Royal Com­ 
mission on the Status of Pensions in Ontario, would 
also provide current beneficiaries with an immediate 
catch-up of OAS and GIS benefits in relation to the 



TABLE 10-1 
EXPENDITURES ON SELECTED RETIREMENT INCOME POLICY ALTERN A TIVES AS PERCENTAGES OF 
GNP AND CONTRIBUTORY EARNINGS UNDER VARIOUS DEMOGRAPHIC GROWTH SCENARIOS, 
CANADA, 1981 AND 2031' 
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Demographic growth to 2031 

1981 High Medium Low 

(Per cent) 

A NORMAL RETIREMENT AGE 65; 
NO ACTUARIAL ADJUSTMENT TO AGE 60 

Basic income package 

(I) Maintain present OAS/GIS benefits, including price indexation 2.1 1.0 1.4 1.9 
(2) Maintain present benefits, but index to wages 2.6 3.5 4.9 
(3) Canadian Labour Congress proposal- 2.7 3.6 5.0 
(4) As for (2), but increase selectivity by income-test of combined OAS/GIS 1.1 1.5 2.0 

Income-replacement packages 

(5) Maintain present benefit levels 1.0 2.8 3.8 5.4 
(3.6)3 (7.3) (10.0) (14.2) 

(6) Double the present benefits 5.5 7.6 10.8 
( 14.5) (19.9) (28.4) 

B NORMAL RETIREMENT AGE 65; 
ACTUARIAL ADJUSTMENT OF INCOME-REPLACEMENT 
PACKAGES TO AGE 60, WITH ALL WITHDRAWING FROM 
LABOUR FORCE AT AGE 60 

Basic income package 

(7) Maintain present OAS/GIS benefits, including price indexation 1.1 1.5 2.1 
(8) Maintain present benefits, but index to wages 2.7 3.7 5.1 
(9) Canadian Labour Congress proposafl 2.8 3.8 5.2 

(10) As for (2), but increase selectivity by income-test of combined OAS/GIS I.2 1.6 2.3 

Income-replacement package 

(II) Maintain present benefit levels 2.8 3.8 5.4 
(7.3) (10.0) (14.2) 

(12) Double the present benefits 5.5 7.6 10.8 
(14.5) (19.9) (28.4) 

average industrial wage, Then the payment for each 
ensuing group that reached age 65 would bear the 
same relation in the initial year to the then-current 
average industrial wage. After that point, however, 
the CLC proposal calls only for price indexation, so 
that there could still be a problem for those who live 
a long time in retirement. As they stand, either 
Options 2 or 3 would build an additional element of 
automaticity into the system. 
It is worth noting also that through the use of the 

selective approach (Option 4), full wage indexation 
could be provided for those who depend entirely on 
the basic-income programs at a GNP cost of only 
2 per cent, even in the context of low demographic 
growth. Alternatively, the basic-income benefits for 
that group' could be increased substantially and yet 
remain within a limit of 5 per cent of GNP. 
Whether any specified level of basic-income ben­ 

efits will be adequate will, in our opinion, be a 
matter for the continuing exercise of judgment. 

Obviously that judgment would depend in part upon 
the availability of income-replacement programs as 
well as the provision of services for the old. 

Our calculations suggest that with slow popula­ 
tion growth, the maintenance of present CPP and 
QPP income-replacement benefits, together with a 
wage-indexed basic-income package, would absorb 
about 10 per cent of GNP by 2031. Expansion of the 
existing private system on top of that - assuming 
maintenance of its present benefit levels but a rise of 
labour force coverage from 40 to about 60 per 
cent - would increase that proportion to about 
11.8 per cent. This compares with between 8 and 
9 per cent of GNP - and a much smaller GNP than 
Canada can expect in the coming century - 
already devoted by some European countries to 
their older people (Table 3-1). Overcoming the 
inadequacies of the present system would mean a 
further increase in the proportion of GNP devoted to 
the elderly. For example, we calculate that to pro- 



vide double the income-replacement benefits of the 
present cpp and QPP to the whole labour force 
would, under the low-demographic-growth 
scenario - and, again, including the basic-income 
package - require about 15 per cent of GNP by 
2031. 

No matter what level of combined benefits the 
economy as a whole can afford, however, as that 
level rises, it will become increasingly important to 
ensure that the burden of providing real goods and 
services to the older generation is not borne entirely 
by the work force of the time. To maintain the 
present CPP and QPP benefit levels (a maximum of 
25 per cent of the average industrial wage, price­ 
indexation after retirement, and survivor benefits 
equal to 60 per cent of the basic pension) would, 
under a pay-as-you-go system, call for the rate to 
rise to 14.2 per cent of contributory earnings under 
the low-demographic-growth scenario (Option 5). 
By contrast, the work force of 2031 could provide 
the same level of benefits for themselves with an 
advance funding contribution rate of about 9 per 
cent. 

Again, under the low-demographic-growth 
assumption, if benefits were doubled (increasing 
from 25 to 50 per cent of average industrial earn­ 
ings, with a corresponding doubling of survivor ben­ 
efits), the corresponding pay-as-you-go and advance 
funding rates would also double, to about 28 per 
cent and 18 per cent, respectively (Option 6). 
Increasing survivor benefits to 70 per cent of the 
basic pension, as recently recommended by the 
Canadian Labour Congress, would involve a small 
additional increase in the two rates of about 
0.5 percentage point. Provision of the same total 
benefits, on an actuarially adjusted basis, for early 
retirement at age 60 (Option 12) would not involve 
higher income-replacement contribution rates; to 
the extent that those electing earlier entitlement 
actually dropped out of the labour force, however, 
higher basic-income costs would be incurred. That 
option would, as noted earlier, raise additional prob­ 
lems (see Chapter 7). 

BASIC-INCOME POLICIES 

Ensuring a basic income for all older people, 
regardless of their previous circumstances, will 
remain a continuing concern of social policy in 
Canada. The basic elements of this policy have been 
the OAS and GIS programs. These programs have 
come to provide the foundation for the retirement 
income planning of many Canadians, and any large 
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or' rapid change would greatly increase the uncer­ 
tainty surrounding this process. The Council feels 
that the emphasis on these programs should there­ 
fore continue. Much could be done, however, to 
clarify their objectives and to adapt them in a 
regular but flexible fashion to economic and demo­ 
graphic trends and the evolving needs of the older 
population. 

Unfortunately, age remains an important element 
of the poverty problem in Canada. There has been 
substantial improvement in the income position of 
families with heads aged 65 and over; by 1977 only 
20 per cent of these families were in the low-income 
category, as calculated by Statistics Canada, com­ 
pared with 44 per cent in 1961. But 60 per cent of 
unattached individuals aged 65 and over, most of 
them women, were still in the low-income group in 
1977, down from 70 per cent in 1961.2 The max­ 
imum OAS/GIS benefit for married couples was 
raised to $6,753 in 1979, slightly above the national 
average low-income line of $6,563 for that group. 
At the same time, the maximum benefit for unat­ 
tached individuals was increased to $3,654 a year, 
which was still well below the Statistics Canada 
national average low-income line of $4,527. 

Particularly because of the growing proportion of 
older women, the incidence of lower incomes among 
the elderly unattached members of our society will 
continue to be a problem for many years to come. 
Quite simply, there will remain a hard core of 
Canadians who have been unable to build up ade­ 
quate earnings-related pension benefits. The basic­ 
income package should be designed not only to 
prevent this group from falling below some mini­ 
mum income level in real terms, but to provide a 
flexible way to improve their benefits over time. 

There are, of course, several possible measures of 
Canada's low-income line, all of which must be 
interpreted with caution.' We believe, however, that 
the establishment of the principle that the basic­ 
income package should be explicitly related to some 
measure of low income is far more important, at this 
time, than the choice of a particular measure or 
calculated benefit level. Therefore, 

Recommendation 1 

We recommend that the Government of Canada 
explicitly state that the objective of the OAS and 
GIS programs is to prevent the income of any 
individual aged 65 and over from falling below 
some acceptable measure of a low-income cut-off, 
with that measure to be determined in accordance 



100 One in Three 

with the general economic and social policies of the 
time," 

Whatever the choice of benefit level at a particu­ 
lar point in time, serious consideration must be 
given to the question of how these levels should be 
adjusted over time. One method is already built into 
the OAS and GIS programs. Because they are linked 
automatically with the consumer price index, ben­ 
efits are prevented from declining in real terms. We 
view this feature as a necessary minimum for the 
adjustment process. Accordingly, 

Recommendation 2 

We recommend that all payments under the OAS 
and GIS programs continue to be indexed to the 
consumer price index. 

Even with benefits price-indexed, however, they 
would tend to decline over time relative to the 
standard of living of those currently in the work 
force. Our projections suggest that there will be 
scope for improving benefits, but that scope will be 
greatly affected by demographic and economic 
trends, by the fiscal positions of the federal and 
provincial governments, and by changing percep­ 
tions of poverty - features that cannot be taken 
into account adequately by any automatic formula. 
In fact, Canadian governments have frequently 
taken these matters into consideration, and major 
changes to the Old Age Security Act have been 
made on a number of occasions since the program 
was established in 1952. It would be useful from the 
viewpoint of pension planning, as well as fiscal-poli­ 
cy planning, to make this process more systematic 
and to expand it so that the income problems of the 
growing numbers of older people are ensured con­ 
sideration by Parliament and the public at regular 
intervals. Therefore, 

Recommendation 3 

We recommend that the Old Age Security Act be 
reviewed at regular intervals and that the review 
process include public hearings and a published 
report by the appropriate Committee of Parlia­ 
ment. We further recommend that the Committee 
appraise various possible benefit levels in relation 
to the distribution of income of the elderly; various 
statistical measures of the low-income cut-off 
lines; the facilities and services provided to the 

·See the dissenting comments by Messrs. McCambly and Pearse 
at the end of this chapter. 

elderly by public authorities at all levels; the 
standards of public support provided by the provin­ 
cial and municipal governments to other persons in 
need; as well as the best possible forecasts of the 
costs of such benefits and their relation to demo­ 
graphic, social, and economic trends. 

Implementation of this recommendation would 
provide a flexible method for reviewing the existing 
benefit structure in line with evolving needs and the 
capability of the economy. In its deliberations, the 
Committee would undoubtedly wish to consider 
whether any suggested changes should be imple­ 
mented through an increase in OAS or GIS benefits, 
or some combination of the two. In this connection, 
the Council wishes to reiterate the importance of 
the universal OAS program as a basic cornerstone 
for retirement income planning. It notes too that 
over time the GIS should decline in importance, as 
increasing numbers of Canadians are able to qualify 
for more adequate earnings-related retirement ben­ 
efits. In order to retain the status of OAS and yet 
take advantage of the direction in which the GIS will 
evolve, 

Recommendation 4 

We recommend that, while OAS payments should 
be maintained at approximately their present level 
in real terms (as per Recommendation 2), any 
increase in the basic income of the elderly take the 
form of discretionary changes in the Guaranteed 
Income Supplement, which would be made in 
accordance with the considerations set out in 
Recommendation 3.· 

Whatever the choice of adjustment method, for 
the work of the Committee to be truly effective, 
there would be a continuing need to monitor the 
changing demographic scene and to develop better 
data and research on the needs and problems of 
older people. Accordingly, 

Recommendation 5 

We recommend that Health and Welfare 
Canada, with the assistance of Statistics Canada 
and the federal Department of Insurance, be 
assigned responsibility for the regular monitoring 
of demographic trends and of the impact of the 
changing age composition on the economy; the de­ 
velopment of more adequate data and research 
bearing on the needs of older people; and the co- 

·See Mr. Pearse's dissenting comment at the end of this chapter. 



ordination of background work for the parliamen- will necessitate a greater degree of co-operation and 
tary Committee reviewing these subjects. partnership between government and the private 

pension industry than has existed in the past. 
The range of work that could be undertaken in 

this respect is very wide. As a minimum, the Coun­ 
cil sees specific requirements for the development of 
information that would improve the prediction of 
birth rates, for an increase in the availability of data 
that would trace the lifetime patterns - for exam­ 
ple, the savings habits and work experience - of 
individuals through to retirement age, and for an 
expansion of information on the needs of, and ser­ 
vices available to, older people. 

In general, what we are suggesting are measures 
to increase direct assistance to older people in need. 
It might be noted that this approach would weaken 
the rationale for special income tax exemptions for 
the elderly. The existing provision in the Income 
Tax Act for such exemptions was first implemented 
in 1948, well before the recent increases in Canada's 
basic-income programs. Any suggestions about 
changing exemptions for older people, however, 
should be considered only in the context of the 
broad range of all income tax exemptions. 

INCOME-REPLACEMENT POLICIES 

If there is one feature that emerges clearly from 
our projections, it is that an increasing proportion of 
Canada's total goods and services will be required to 
provide retirement benefits for the older population. 
That proportion would increase even if nothing were 
done to improve present benefits. It will increase 
even further if action is taken - as we believe it 
must be - to extend the coverage of the labour 
force by adequate income-replacement plans or to 
improve benefits for such groups as dependants and 
survivors, housewives, or mobile workers. 

If the retirement income system is to remain 
viable as that proportion increases, it will become 
more and more necessary for the future retirees 
themselves to bear an increasing share of the 
burden - to shift it away from the future labour 
force, which will be growing more slowly. In brief, 
particularly as benefit levels rise they will have to be 
increasingly pre-funded through saving for retire­ 
ment. This could be accomplished by increasing 
contribution rates and expanding the present cpp 
and QPP programs; through expansion of private 
pension plans - particularly occupational plans; or 
through some combination of the public and private 
approaches. The Council feels that a mixed publici 
private system should remain the cornerstone of 
Canada's income-replacement policies but that this 
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By international standards, the contribution rates 
that would be required to support the present cpp 
and QPP benefits on a pay-as-you-go basis during 
the critical 2015-30 period are not unreasonably 
high, even if demographic developments were to 
follow a low-growth scenario. For example, the 
employer I employee contribution rate for the 
U.S. social security scheme is already over 10 per 
cent, and it is expected to rise further. And, bearing 
in mind the volume of savings that will be generated 
by other parts of the income-replacement system, 
we are not convinced that moving immediately to 
fully funded rates for all future benefits under the 
present system is either necessary or desirable. Con­ 
tinued partial funding of the present system could, 
however, be used to prevent the contribution rate 
from significantly exceeding the rate that the work 
force, during the critical period from about 2015 to 
2030, would incur to fully fund similar pension 
benefits for themselves. Therefore, 

Recommendation 6 

We recommend that the Government of Canada 
propose to the provincial governments that contri­ 
butions to the Canada and Quebec Pension Plans be 
increased moderately every few years, beginning in 
the early 1980s, in order to maintain some growth 
in the funds during the remainder of this century 
and to reduce the burden that will otherwise fall in 
the early decades of the next century on those who 
are now young workers. 

To implement this recommendation under our 
extreme case - the low-demographic-growth 
scenario - would require that one way or another 
the contribution rate be raised to about 9 per cent 
within 15 years. The more quickly that rate is 
reached, the greater will be the investment fund 
generated. If it becomes evident that the low-growth 
scenario will not occur, then the contribution rate 
could be lowered. For example, if the medium­ 
growth scenario were to occur, the rate would need 
to be raised to only about 7 per cent within 15 years 
and maintained at that level to 2051. 

Implementation of Recommendation 6 would, in 
effect, place a limit on the share of now-promised 
pension benefits that would have to be borne by the 
work force during the critical period of the coming 
century. Benefit levels above those now promised by 
the CPP and QPP should, in our opinion, be financed 
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largely, if not entirely, by the savings of the future sion system can be overcome - deficiencies that are 
retirees themselves. worth recalling here: 

One of the deficiencies of the present public 
income-replacement system is that parents who care 
for young children at home may receive less, if any, 
employment income for a certain period, with the 
result that their pension credits may be reduced. In 
order to overcome this deficiency, the Province of 
Quebec has passed legislation that will allow parents 
caring for children under the age of 7 to drop those 
years out of the lifetime earnings calculation on 
which the QPP pension is based. Similar legislation 
has been passed by the Parliament of Canada but it 
has not yet been ratified by the governments of 
Ontario and British Columbia. Although the provi­ 
sion may benefit higher-income families more than 
lower-income families (see Chapter 4), it is one step 
towards providing more-adequate pension benefits 
for women (as well as men). For this reason, there­ 
fore, and to bring the cpp into line with QPP, 

Recommendation 7 

We recommend that the governments of Ontario 
and British Columbia ratify the provisions now 
existing - in the Canada Pension Plan Act but not 
yet proclaimed - that would allow family allow­ 
ance recipients to drop those years in which they 
had children under 7 years of age from the calcula­ 
tion on which the amount of their retirement pen­ 
sion is based. 

Increasing benefits through expansion of the 
present occupational pension system would permit 
them to be tailored to the requirements of workers 
in individual industries. It would mean less govern­ 
ment intervention, avoid concentration of retirement 
savings in government hands, and reduce fears that 
such savings might not be allocated to their most 
productive uses. It would also result in very large 
pools of savings. Our calculations suggest that if 
occupational plans were to provide an income­ 
replacement ratio equal to a further 25 per cent of 
the average industrial wage (that is, in addition to 
the 25 per cent now provided by the CPP and QPp) 
for the whole labour force, their funds would triple 
in size. Under the low-demographic-growth sce­ 
nario, this would imply that, by 2031, the funds 
would be equivalent to twice the size of GNP, or 
slightly greater than the country's total capital 
stock, assuming present capital/output ratios were 
to continue. 

The real question, of course, is whether the 
present deficiencies of the private occupational pen- 

- The present coverage of private plans is very 
inadequate. As recently as 1976 only 46 per cent 
of employed paid workers were covered and the 
coverage was very uneven among industries and 
sectors. Half of those workers covered were pub­ 
lic-sector employees. The coverage was particu­ 
larly low in the trade field, particularly retail 
trade, and in community, business, and personal 
services (Chart 2-5). 

- Preservation of accrued benefits as prices or real 
wages rise is also very limited. Although most 
government-employee plans are of the final­ 
average or average-best-earnings types, which 
provide a good deal of pre-retirement inflation 
protection, less than one-third of private-employ­ 
er plans are of those types. Moreover, because of 
inadequate vesting and portability features, only 
a small percentage of those participating in pri­ 
vate plans are likely to qualify for maximum 
benefits. And, while most public-employee plans 
provide for post-retirement price indexation, 
most private-employer plans do not. 

- Many private occupational plans have inade­ 
quate survivor benefits. 

The Canadian Labour Congress has recommend­ 
ed to the Royal Commission on the Status of Pen­ 
sions in Ontario that the present CPP and QPP 
system be expanded, based on the premise that the 
private plans will not, in fact, be able to overcome 
these deficiencies. The CLC believes that the benefit 
improvements needed would involve an assumption 
of risks that most employers would not be willing or 
able to accept.' 

The CLC proposes that the CPP and QPP be 
expanded to provide a replacement rate of 50 per 
cent of the earnings of an individual at the average 
industrial wage, compared with the present target of 
roughly 25 per cent, to be financed by increased 
contribution rates. Their proposal would take care 
of the inadequate coverage of the existing private 
system; it would directly increase the protection of 
benefits in the face of inflation and mobility; and it 
could allow for a range of choice in contribution 
rates as the demographic scenario evolved. 

For those proposals, too, the Council has prepared 
estimates of cost based on its own population and 
labour force projections. Once again, the level of 
contribution rates could be set so as to limit, to 
varying degrees, the burden on the work force 
during the critical period in question. Secondary 



considerations would include the size of the savings 
fund that could be generated, the impact on the 
financial position of provincial governments, and the 
size and timing of changes in contribution rates. 

Our calculations suggest, for example, that to 
fully fund the proposed increase in benefits from 
1980 on (though still leaving an unfunded lia bili ty 
for benefits accrued to date) would require an 
employer jemployee contribution rate of 18 per cent 
of contributory earnings.' This is the rate that 
should be compared with that required under pay­ 
as-you-go or partly funded alternatives. Under a 
complete pay-as-you-go system, the work force of 
2031 would, by way of illustration, face contribution 
rates of 19.9 and 28.4 per cent under the medium­ 
and low-demographic-growth scenarios, respectively 
(Table 10-1). In other words, increasing the contri­ 
bution rate for an expanded CPP and QPP scheme to 
18 per cent in 1980 would be sufficient, even under 
a low-demographic-growth scenario (and assuming 
a real rate of return on the invested funds of 2.5 per 
cent), to pay the increased benefit from that year 
until the bulge of the retired population disappears 
and to bring the required contribution rate for 2031 
down by 10 percentage points. Moreover, it would 
generate a large pool of savings in the interim. 
Those savings would amount to roughly 115 per 
cent of GNP at the fund's peak in about 2031, or to 
two-thirds of the country's capital stock at that time 
(given a continuation of the present ratios of capital 
to output). The fund would be extinguished around 
2051, when the population bulge will disappear. 

By way of illustrating what amounts to the oppo­ 
site extreme, the increased contribution rates could 
be phased-in over a much longer period. For exam­ 
ple, the higher benefits could be financed by 
increasing the contribution rate from 1980 on by 
0.5 percentage point a year, from its present level of 
3.6 per cent, to reach a maximum of 22 per cent (in 
the year 2017), where it would remain during the 
critical period. Under this option, the work force of 
2031 would, under the low-demographic-growth 
scenario, face a rate 6 percentage points lower than 
the pay-as-you-go rate, and the accumulated invest­ 
ment fund would also be considerably smaller - 
amounting to a maximum of about 50 per cent of 
GNP, or roughly one-third of the capital stock, by 
2021. Under this more flexible approach, contribu­ 
tion rates could also be revised easily (that is, not 
increased as much) should population growth turn 
out to be greater than that implied by our low­ 
demographic-growth scenario. 

What the CLC proposal would entail, however, is 
considerably more government intervention in the 
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retirement system than at present. The Council is 
perhaps less pessimistic than the CLC about the 
ability of private plans to overcome the present 
deficiencies. We wish, however, to emphasize 
strongly these two points. First, time is very rapidly 
running out for accomplishing the required improve­ 
ments; second, it is highly unlikely that they can be 
achieved in the absence of some form of partnership 
with government. 

The Council has discussed at length some of the 
ways in which government and private employers 
could try to overcome jointly the deficiencies in the 
present private system. One approach that could 
retain many of the best features of the private 
system, while moving quickly to overcome its defici­ 
encies, would involve the establishment of a fully 
funded supplement to the Canada and Quebec Pen­ 
sion Plans, with an option for employers to contract­ 
out, as in the present British system. 

Such a supplementary plan could be designed to 
provide a further pension equal to, say, 25 per cent 
for the individual at the average industrial wage, on 
top of the present 25 per cent, with immediate 
vesting and locking-in. Rights to the additional pen­ 
sion would be adjusted for price increases after 
retirement. Employers could contract-out only if 
they provided benefits at least equivalent to those in 
the public scheme, except - and this would be a 
major attraction - that those benefits would be 
fixed in cash terms at retirement. The state would 
assume responsibility for adjusting all benefits to 
the equivalent of the additional guaranteed pension, 
whether contracted-out or not, for inflation after 
retirement. That part of the scheme could be 
financed on a pay-as-you-go basis. Alternatively, an 
inflation premium might be charged, as in the feder­ 
al public service superannuation plan, with indexa­ 
tion (as now proposed for that plan) subject to some 
sort of limit. 

This type of plan would set the minimum stand­ 
ard for occupational plans, and it could be used, as 
in Britain, to administer the deferred pensions of 
employees who leave contracted-out plans. In 
Canada, however, this function would presumably 
be handled by agencies within each province, prefer­ 
ably with representation by employers and 
employees. 

Such a scheme could provide many advantages 
with respect to coverage, benefit protection, and 
portability. Like some of the funding options that 
could be used to finance the CLC proposals, it would, 
of course, also raise problems - though by no 
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means insurmountable problems - as to how the 
funds should be invested or insulated from political 
influence. Moreover, we recognize that even this 
scheme would involve much more government inter­ 
vention in the retirement field than at present, and 
that could reduce the incentive for improvement in 
the private sector. We have noted too that steps 
have been taken recently to improve the adequacy of 
private pension plans - notably the expansion of 
multi-employer schemes, as in the construction 
industry, and the proposal of the Canadian Life 
Insurance Association for improving portability (see 
Chapter 7). For these reasons, the Council is not 
prepared at this time to recommend the establish­ 
ment of a supplement to CPP and QPP benefits. 
Instead, we wish to propose, for the time being, 
certain more limited steps to improve the viability of 
the private pension system, while urging employers 
and labour to expand coverage of the system with­ 
out delay. 

We have noted some of the obstacles to improve­ 
ment and extension of benefits under private pen­ 
sion plans. For small business, the costs and com­ 
plications of administering their own pension plans 
are said to be deterrents. Private employers are 
generally uneasy also about what they consider to 
be an open-ended commitment to index benefits to 
prices. Furthermore, because of the wide variety of 
private-employer plans and the range of actuarial 
assumptions used in them, it has been difficult to 
establish portability among plans. This works to the 
severe disadvantage of persons who work for several 
employers in the course of their career, and the 
problem is further exacerbated by inflation. Because 
the tax base tends to increase with inflation, govern­ 
ments are in a much better position to prevent the 
redistribution of real income away from pensions 
that inflation entails. Therefore, 

Recommendation 8 

We recommend that a co-ordinated plan be 
established by the federal and provincial govern­ 
ments to encourage and induce the extension and 
improvement of private occupational pension plans. 
As part of such a plan the federal government 
should be prepared to sell price-indexed annuities. 
Such annuities would be limited to purchases by 
individuals out of the proceeds of registered retire­ 
ment savings plans, and by pension funds that meet 
defined standards, on behalf of individuals, at the 
time of or after their retirement from the labour 

force. Such defined standards would include the 
early vesting of contributions made on behalf of 
individual employees and the transfer of such 
vested contributions to special registered retirement 
savings plans of employees leaving one employer to 
work for another. The amount to be transferred 
should not be less than the employee's contribution 
plus accumulated interest or the actuarial value of 
accrued benefits, whichever is greater. Employers 
not wishing to establish formal pension plans 
should be encouraged to contribute to employees' 
special registered retirement savings plans. Funds 
deposited in special registered retirement savings 
plans could not be withdrawn prior to an 
employee's retirement, at which time the proceeds 
could be used to purchase price-indexed annui­ 
ties. * 

In order to place some limit on the federal gov­ 
ernment's commitment, such annuities could, per­ 
haps, be provided in amounts limited to the protec­ 
tion of pensions equivalent to some specified 
proportion of the average industrial wage. More­ 
over, we are not proposing that the federal govern­ 
ment supply deferred annuities on an indexed basis, 
since savings accumulated in tax-free RRSPS under 
inflationary conditions will usually increase fairly 
rapidly in comparison with inflation rates - cer­ 
tainly more rapidly than funds locked into deferred 
pensions provided by sponsors. 

We recognize too that there are difficulties in 
calculating the vested pension to be transferred to 
an RRSP. These difficulties exist even under present 
pension benefits legislation, however, and for that 
reason proposals for similar transfers require the 
approval of pension supervisory authorities. We 
wish to stress that this approach would by no means 
eliminate all of the deficiencies of the present pri­ 
vate pension system, but it would be of assistance in 
expanding the post-retirement price indexation of 
benefits. It would do considerably less for the pre­ 
servation of accrued benefits prior to retirement. To 
the extent that funds transferred to special RRSPS 
were reinvested in the market as nominal rates of 
interest rose, it could provide somewhat better pre­ 
retirement protection for mobile workers against 
unexpected price increases than if their vested ben­ 
efits had to be locked into a deferred pension or 
annuity. It would induce pressure for shorter vesting 
periods and, in effect, provide mobile employees 
with a better career pension than many could expect 
at present. To further enhance improvement in this 
regard, however, 

·See the dissenting comments by Messrs. Kaplansky, 
McCambly, and Pearse at the end of this chapter. 



Recommendation 9 

We recommend that the federal and provincial 
governments consider requiring, as a minimum, 
graded vesting of employer-funded pension credits, 
with 20 per cent being vested each year until full 
vesting is reached after five years of employment 
with the plan sponsor. We further recommend that 
all vested pension credits be locked-in until retire­ 
ment or that their value be deposited in a special 
locked-in registered retirement savings plan for 
employees. When the contributions plus accrued 
interest of employees who change jobs exceeds the 
value of their deferred annuity, the excess should 
be returned to them. 

It should be recognized that Recommendations 8 
and 9 will not ensure expanded coverage and that 
they will, in contrast with the present system of 
locking vested benefits into a deferred pension pro­ 
vided by the employer, add somewhat to employer 
costs. In other words, they will require private plans 
to assume some of the burden of mobility, albeit in 
exchange for an indexed post-retirement benefit 
that many employers find difficult to provide on 
their own. By so doing, it will, we hope, encourage 
private employers to respond by moving ahead rap­ 
idly themselves. 

In this respect, the Council again draws attention 
to the prospectus recently set forth by the Canadian 
Life Insurance Association (CLlA) for providing 
portability among private plans (see Chapter 7). 
Unfortunately, not all of the details have been 
worked out, and firms in other industries such as 
manufacturing, with characteristics much more 
diverse than life insurance companies, could find it 
much more difficult to implement. As part of the 
co-ordinated plan suggested above, however, these 
proposals should be examined intensively by govern­ 
ment, industry, and labour. 

If it could be coupled with the special registered 
retirement plans and with post-retirement price 
indexation through the annuities suggested above, 
the CLiA plan could go a long way in filling some of 
the major gaps in private pension plans. What 
would still be lacking, of course, is the incentive for 
employers - particularly small businesses - to 
adopt pension plans in the first place. The Council 
urges consultation between governments and indus­ 
try associations in those sectors where pension cov­ 
erage is inadequate, to search for solutions that 
would avoid the need for further large-scale govern­ 
ment intervention in the pension industry. 

Whatever choices are ultimately made with 
respect to the public/private mix of income-replace- 
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ment policies, there will be a continuing role for 
private plans. If the private pension industry is to 
administer effectively the much larger volume of 
retirement savings that will be generated in the 
future, additional action will be required to 
strengthen it, to enhance its acceptance by partici­ 
pants and the general public, and to ensure an 
adequate level of benefits at minimum cost. 

There has been much criticism of the investment 
performance of private pension funds in the 1970s. 
The Council's work has been directed more at the 
aggregate impact of the retirement income system 
on the economy, and it has not looked in detail at 
investment procedures. The projected growth of the 
pension system, as well as prospective developments 
in financial markets, suggests very strongly, how­ 
ever, that it will be important to make a wider 
variety of investments accessible to Canadian pen­ 
sion funds over time. The supply of mortgages for 
investment, for example, will not be rising as rapidly 
in the future as in the recent past, and it may well 
be that the supply of high-quality Canadian equities 
will not rise as rapidly as pension savings. More 
generally, it could well be that, in the not-too-dis­ 
tant future, Canadian savings will turn out to be in 
excess of domestic requirements. The problem will 
be alleviated by measures to make it easier for 
pension funds to invest in new and small enterprises, 
such as those recently suggested by the federal 
government (see Chapter 6), but it wiJl not be 
removed. 

One very obvious possibility is an increase in the 
holdings of high-quality foreign securities by 
Canadian pension funds. The ultimate limitation on 
such holdings is not provincial pension benefits 
legislation but the provisions of the federal Income 
Tax Act. At present, most Canadian pension funds 
do not, in fact, invest up to the allowable limits, but 
greater use of foreign securities might provide 
higher rates of return on investment portfolios with­ 
out increased risk. With the projected growth in 
pension funds, the present 10 per cent limit on 
holdings of foreign securities would be a much more 
severe constraint. Immediate easing of this con­ 
straint might increase Canada's present balance-of­ 
payments difficulties; but, over the longer run, it 
would seem to be a logical and necessary move. 
Therefore, 

Recommendation 10 

We recommend that, as the balance of payments 
and other circumstances permit, the Government of 
Canada amend the Income Tax Act to permit an 



increase in the proportion of the assets of Canadian the provisions of the Canada Pension Benefits 
pension funds that may be held in the form of Standards Act and the relevant provincial acts. 
foreign securities. * 
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Some will undoubtedly voice concern about such 
a suggestion. There is a strong feeling that Canadi­ 
an savings should be used for development in 
Canada. In reply, one must ask whether anyone 
group should have to bear the burden of Canada's 
economic development. To meet the primary objec­ 
tive of pension policy - that is, to guarantee the 
return to pensioners - it is not the stock of capital 
in Canada that should be the concern, but rather 
the stock of capital, wherever it may be located, that 
will provide an adequate return to our pensioners. 
The costs of Canada's economic development 
should, in brief, be borne by Canadians generally 
and not just by some. In addition, it must be 
remembered that the real goal is an increase in 
income, not simply an increase in Canada's capital 
stock. 

Implementation of Recommendation 10 might 
also help to prevent undue concentration of Canadi­ 
an equities in large institutional funds. In this con­ 
nection, it has been suggested that pension funds, 
which are normally tax-exempt, should receive the 
dividend tax credit that is available to individuals, in 
order to further encourage their participation in 
equity markets. The decision not to provide the 
credit to tax-exempt institutions when the Income 
Tax Act was changed in 1972 was deliberate, and 
we do not feel that circumstances have altered in a 
way that would warrant changing this earlier 
decision. 

There has been a continuing attempt in Canada, 
particularly on the part of the Canadian Association 
of Pension Supervisory Authorities (CAPSA), to pro­ 
mote greater standardization of the various pension 
benefits standards acts in Canada. Further align­ 
ment of these acts could be of considerable assist­ 
ance to firms whose operations extend across provin­ 
cial borders. It would reduce the costs of 
administration and impediments to both the move­ 
ment of labour between provinces and the establish­ 
ment of pension plans by more employers." 
Therefore, 

Recommendation 11 

We recommend that the federal and provincial 
governments take measures to further standardize 

·See Mr. McCambly's dissenting comments at the end of this 
chapter. 

Some provinces have already amended their ben­ 
efits standards legislation in one particularly impor­ 
tant area - the provision of information to pension 
plan participants. Quebec's Supplemental Pension 
Plans Act, for example, now requires that informa­ 
tion on plan investments be made available to par­ 
ticipants at least once a year and that information 
on their accrued benefits be provided to individual 
participants at intervals of not more than three 
years. Such provisions could assist greatly in the 
pension planning of individuals and focus greater 
emphasis on the responsibility that pension fund 
managers bear towards plan participants. They 
would also be a substitute for more detailed govern­ 
ment supervision of pension plan operations, par­ 
ticularly if they were reinforced by the presence of 
employee and employer representatives on pension 
boards. Since most of the required information 
would already be available in computerized form for 
the management of the funds, such procedures 
should not involve any substantial additional costs, 
particularly if more standardized benefits legislation 
could be agreed upon by the provinces as per 
Recommendation 11. Accordingly, 

Recommendation 12 

We recommend that, as part of the co-ordinated 
planning referred to above, the federal and provin­ 
cial governments undertake jointly, after consulta­ 
tion with industry and labour, to amend the rele­ 
vant pension benefits legislation to require 
representation of plan participants, as well as spon­ 
sors, on pension plan advisory committees and to 
require public disclosure of information to occupa­ 
tional pension plan participants or their bona fide 
agents. We further recommend that this informa­ 
tion consist of at least the following: 

(1) The plan text and amendments, to be made 
available on request for collective bargaining 
purposes; 

(2) A written explanation of the plan, including 
its rules, the basis for employer and 
employee contributions, and the benefits on 
termination of employment, death, or retire­ 
ment; 

(3) Annual statements of portfolio composition 
and rates of return and triennial statements 
of the actuarial evaluation of a plan, includ­ 
ing the assumptions used as a basis for that 
evaluation; and 



(4) An individual employee pension statement, 
to be made available on request at intervals 
of not more than three years, indicating 
contributions to date by the employee and 
the employer, the accumulated benefits pur­ 
chased to date, and the current benefits in 
event of death or termination of employ­ 
ment. 

There has been great concern in the business 
community about one particular group of occupa­ 
tional pension plans - those for government-sector 
employees. By contrast with private-employer plans, 
many government plans provide full post-retirement 
price indexation. In the case of the federal public 
service plan, legislation was introduced that would 
limit the indexation, but it has not yet been adopted 
by Parliament. Many businessmen feel strongly that 
the federal plan sets an example that would be 
extremely costly for them to follow, and they fear 
that indexation may involve large future demands 
on the public purse. On the other side, there are 
those who argue just as strongly that indexation is a 
vital necessity for pensioners, that to remove it from 
public plans would not only be a retrograde step but 
also an infringement of the collective bargaining 
process (although the federal plan itself is not a 
subject of collective bargaining). 

Implementation of Recommendation 8 would 
contribute to a reduction in present disparities of 
treatment between government and private-sector 
employees. The indexed annuities that we have 
recommended would be made available on the same 
basis to both government and private-sector plans. 
Beyond that, however, it can be argued that govern­ 
ments should not, simply because of their taxing 
powers, be able to provide pension benefits that are 
not available to those in private industry. In brief, 
any additional price indexation should be paid for 
by matching employer and employee contributions 
combined. It would also seem advisable to put gov­ 
ernment-employee pension funds on the same basis 
as private-sector funds in respect of investments. 
Accordingly, 

Recommendation 13 

We recommend that all government-employee 
pension plans be put on a fully funded basis 
equivalent to that required of private-employer 
plans; that their assets (including claims on the 
employing government, which should be represent­ 
ed by securities of suitable maturities and with 
interest rates equivalent to market rates) be segre­ 
gated from consolidated-revenue accounts and 
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placed in special trust funds; and that all future 
increases in such funds be invested through the 
market in securities selected on the principles of 
prudent management followed by the managers of 
private-sector funds. 

These government pension funds should be en­ 
titled to purchase indexed federal government 
annuities for retiring employees on the same terms 
as other funds and subject to the same limits. 
Benefits beyond those limits should be indexed only 
to the extent permitted from time to time by the 
special contributions made by, or on behalf of. 
participants for this purpose and by the earnings of 
the portion of the fund attributable to pensioners in 
excess of the interest rates required to provide basic 
benefits to them, after taking into account the 
premium paid for the indexed pension purchased. * 
Implementation of this recommendation would 

imply that the pension savings of all government 
employees would be recycled through the capital 
market. It would put government pension funds in 
the same basic position as private-sector funds in 
respect of the post-retirement price indexation of 
benefits through access to federal government price 
indexed annuities. Beyond that, it would imply a 
"cap" on price indexation that would, in effect, limit 
claims on public funds to matching combined 
employer and employee contributions. 

The Council is also concerned with the need to 
expand the choice of workers with respect to the 
length of working life. We have noted that there is a 
need for much more intensive examination of alter­ 
natives to earlier retirement; but, that said, it seems 
likely that some action will have to be taken to 
provide more freedom of choice with respect to the 
minimum age of retirement itself. We recognize 
that this can, and should, vary among industries and 
occupations, depending upon the nature of the work 
entailed; however, that is largely a matter to be 
decided in the process of industrial relations. The 
question here is whether the universal public pen­ 
sion schemes should also provide more flexibility. 

For public pension plans there would appear to be 
three possible alternatives - to lower the general 
age of eligibility, to provide a fair actuarial adjust­ 
ment for retirement before age 65, or to alter the 
schemes to provide for the earlier retirement of 
those whose need is greatest. The first option would 
be the most expensive; and, although we reiterate 
that we do not regard any particular retirement age 
as sacred, in our opinion there are needs with higher 

·See Mr. Kaplansky's dissenting comments at the end of this 
chapter. 
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priority at this time. The U.S. social security 
scheme provides fair actuarial adjustment for all 
participants to age 62, but that approach locks some 
people into permanently lower retirement incomes. 

The evidence suggests that a substantial number 
of Canadian workers retire early because of poor 
health, even when their retirement incomes are rela­ 
tively low. It suggests also, however, that a higher 
proportion with low retirement incomes than with 
higher retirement incomes work till age 65 or later 
despite poor health. Rather than generally extend 
cpp and QPP benefits on an actuarially adjusted 
basis, the Council feels that priority should be given 
to relieving the problems caused by the unemploya­ 
bility of older workers. Therefore, 

Recommendation 14 

We recommend that the federal and provincial 
governments jointly consider easing the CPP and 
QPP disability provisions and expanding the disa­ 
bility program so that the qualifying level of disa­ 
bility would decrease with age. 

In the coming years, it will also become increas­ 
ingly important to extend the retirement choice in 
other directions, to remove impediments to, and 
provide opportunities for, greater labour force par­ 
ticipation by older people. The Council does not 
accept the view that later retirement should be 
considered as a substitute for more adequate retire­ 
ment programs, and it wishes to reiterate its find­ 
ings that even sharply higher participation rates by 
people aged 65 and over would not go very far to 
reduce the "pension burden." 

There are strong social and medical arguments 
for increasing the labour force participation of older 
people, however, and the economic benefits will also 
increase over time. Perhaps unfortunately, much of 
the discussion of the subject has come to focus on 
the issue of mandatory retirement. It must be recog­ 
nized that the general abolition of mandatory retire­ 
ment could involve substantial costs - including 
intervention in the collective bargaining process - 
especially if it were implemented quickly. There is 
evidence to suggest that this factor is not the major 
impediment to continued work-force participation. 
We are convinced in any event that mandatory 
retirement provisions will wither away in the future, 
as the number of older and experienced workers 
rises relative to that of new entrants to the labour 
force. What is needed is positive action to expand 
job opportunities for older people. Accordingly, 

Recommendation 15 

We recommend that the federal and provincial 
governments, in consultation with industry and 
labour, promote later retirement from the labour 
force through expanded opportunities for retire­ 
ment planning and through counselling, training, 
and job opportunities for older people. 

THE TREATMENT OF WOMEN 

For many elderly women, provision for retirement 
income under the existing system is most inade­ 
quate. Unfortunately, the reasons for this situation 
extend well beyond the scope of retirement policies. 
Some women do not participate in the paid labour 
force at all. For those who do, earnings records are 
often intermittent. Then, too, women are more 
likely to be in low-paying, nonunionized jobs, where 
pension coverage is low for all workers. Women are 
also often affected more adversely than men by 
coverage and eligibility requirements and by vesting 
and portability problems. 

The implementation of some of our recommenda­ 
tions would, by improving the retirement income 
system generally, help to improve the lot of elderly 
women in particular. Moreover, more than half of 
all adult Canadian women are now in the labour 
force. As this participation rate increases, women 
who are full-time homemakers may form a relative­ 
ly small proportion of the adult female population. 
According to our own projections, the proportion of 
women aged 65 and over who will not be beneficiar­ 
ies of a retirement (as opposed to a survivor's) 
pension under the CPP and QPP will decrease from 
68 per cent in 1981 to 12 per cent by the year 2031. 
Nevertheless, these women will still be disadvan­ 
taged unless ways can be found to deal with the 
particular problems of women workers outlined 
above. 

It would be presumptuous for the Council to 
make comprehensive recommendations to deal with 
such problems. The background work for this 
Report, detailed as it may be, simply would not be 
sufficient, particularly since some of the problems 
can be traced to wider questions concerning the 
position of women in the economy generally. Never­ 
theless, we are convinced that action will have to be 
taken on these matters without delay, and we would 
hope that our broad estimates of costs will be of 
assistance in setting out priorities. Beyond that, we 
would like to set out some of the other consider­ 
ations that should be kept in mind. 



For the minority of women who remain as full­ 
time homemakers, the proposal that they be allowed 
to contribute voluntarily to the CPP and QPP raises a 
number of difficult problems. In particular, a volun­ 
tary contribution scheme would favour those home­ 
makers with family incomes high enough to enable 
them to afford the contributions, whereas it might 
be the wives of low-income husbands who would 
most need the provisions for retirement income. 

An alternative would be to introduce additional 
compulsory CPP and QPP provisions for dependent 
spouses. Under the present system, an employee 
pays 1.8 per cent of contributory earnings, with a 
further 1.8 per cent being paid on the employee's 
behalf by his/her employer (the self-employed con­ 
tribute 3.6 per cent). With the proposed modifica­ 
tion, a further 3.6 per cent of contributory earnings 
would be contributed to the CPP and QPP in the case 
of employees with a dependent spouse (the addition­ 
al 3.6 per cent could be paid entirely by the 
employee or split equally between the employer and 
the employee). Such a revised scheme could thus be 
operated in a manner similar to that of the Ontario 
Health Insurance Plan, whereby employees with one 
dependant pay double the premium of single 
employees. Of course, this would pre-empt the need 
for survivor benefits, since all spouses would be 
entitled to their own retirement benefits under the 
revised CPP and QPP scheme. 

Alternatively, instead of increasing contributions, 
the CPP and QPP could be modified so that half the 
earnings (and hence the benefits) of an employee or 
self-employed person would be deemed to belong to 
the wife and half to the husband. 

As far as the private pension plan system is 
concerned, any measure designed to expand cover­ 
age and improve vesting and portability provisions 
for all workers would likely be beneficial to women 
as well. Nevertheless, there remains the problem 
that private pension plans make hardly any provi­ 
sion for all those women who have had little, if any, 
participation in the paid labour force, upon the 
death of, or divorce from, their husbands. Of par­ 
ticular concern is the fact that the provision of 
survivors' pensions under private pension plans is 
rare outside of government employment. 

A survivor's pension is a pension over and above 
the plan member's basic pension - i.e. similar to 
that which exists under the CPP and QPP. Many 
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plans have options whereby the member's pension 
can be reduced to provide a benefit to a survivor. 
That is not an extra benefit, but simply a way of 
dividing up a single pension. In 1976, only 4.5 per 
cent of private-sector occupational plans, covering 
22 per cent of all participants, provided a widow's 
pension as an additional benefit in the event of the 
death of the participating member before retire­ 
ment. In the case of death after retirement, the 
comparable figures were 2.8 and 24 per cent, 
respectively. If one considers a pension as a deferred 
wage, however, then it follows that individual con­ 
tributors with no dependants should receive higher 
pay to compensate for that fact. 

A modest alternative to survivors' pensions per se 
would be to classify pensions as wealth, subject to 
sharing, as with any other marital asset; of course, 
though, the division of matrimonial property is gov­ 
erned by provincial legislation and varies consider­ 
ably from one province to another. This could 
involve mandatory provision of joint benefits, 
whereby pension benefits would be shared through a 
joint annuity based on both lives. Under a joint life 
annuity, the plan member's retirement benefits 
would necessarily be lower than otherwise in order 
to provide a survivor benefit. Such a mandatory 
provision could be extended to cover RRSPS and 
occupational pension plans. Furthermore, it has 
been suggested that the pension benefits legislation 
be amended so that pension credits would be divided 
equally between partners in the event of marriage 
breakdown. This would parallel the 1978 changes in 
the Canada and Quebec Pension Plans. 

A CONCLUDING PERSPECTIVE 

This country has the basis for a remarkably good 
system of ensuring decent retirement incomes. Cer­ 
tainly there are holes in the present fabric. Yet our 
basic conclusion is that despite the future growth in 
the number of older people who will have a legiti­ 
mate claim on this system - a system to which they 
will have contributed in many ways - we can meet 
those claims and correct any shortcomings without 
risk to the economy. Our objective should be a 
system that is reasonable, effective, affordable, and 
equitable. That goal is well within the grasp of a 
country that is energetic and growing, and aptly 
described by one of our members as a young nation 
maturing, not a mature nation aging. 



Comments and Dissents 

COMMENT BY MR. ROBERT LÉVESQUE 

As I pointed out to the members of the Council 
during our deliberations about this report, I was a 
member of the Comité d'étude sur le financement 
du Régime de rentes du Québec et sur les régimes 
supplémentaires de rentes (COFIRENTES+) in 1976 
and 1977. In that capacity, I signed the Comité's 
report - entitled La sécurité financière des per­ 
sonnes âgées au Québec - which was published in 
September 1977. 

The COFIRENTES+ report is somewhat narrower 
in scope than the Council's, but the issues of income 
security examined by the two organizations are the 
same, the problems identified are quite similar, and 
the analysis is also largely comparable. Further­ 
more, the goals identified by the two groups are 
essentially the same. 

Nonetheless, there are differences between the 
two reports, notably in some of the conclusions and 
recommendations. In particular, the relative impor­ 
tance given to the goals and the methods proposed 
for achieving them differ - only slightly in some 
cases, more substantially in others. 

As to which set of recommended measures could 
be implemented most easily and which is best suited 
and most likely to help resolve the issues identified 
and to bring about the desired results, that question 
is, in most instances, a matter of judgment. While 
some of the COFIRENTES+ recommendations go 
somewhat farther than those contained in this 
report, I believe that the Council's proposals, if 
implemented, will constitute an appropriate strategy 
for dealing with the problems identified here. 

DISSENT BY MR. KALMEN KAPLANSKY 

While I appreciate that this report reflects a great 
degree of consensus reached by the Council after 

lengthy discussions attempting to reconcile the vari­ 
ous opposing points of view, I have to voice reserva­ 
tions regarding two interrelated aspects. 

As a general principle, the basic pension rights of 
all employees should be protected. Having pointed 
out the many serious deficiencies of the private 
occupational pension system with respect to cover­ 
age, vesting and portability provisions, protection of 
benefits in the face of inflation, and survivors' ben­ 
efits, the report stops short of making recommenda­ 
tions commensurate with these deficiencies. The 
fact is that, except for a minority of individuals - 
usually in the higher-income category - occupa­ 
tional pension provision is, in general, inadequate, 
and implementation of Recommendation 8 would, 
in my view, do little to overcome the fundamental 
inadequacies that permeate the present occupational 
pension plan system. Since many employers appear 
to be unwilling or unable to make the needed 
improvements, I see no alternative but to expand the 
Canada and Quebec Pension Plans, as advocated by 
the Canadian Labour Congress and in the COFI­ 
RENTES+ report, or, at the very least, to establish a 
fully funded scheme for all employees (as described 
in Chapter 10), that would supplement the existing 
Canada and Quebec Pension Plans and provide an 
option for employers to contract-out. 

I am also disturbed by Recommendation 13, 
which constitutes a veiled criticism of those occupa­ 
tional schemes - namely, government-employee 
plans - that, unlike most other occupational pen­ 
sion plans, do, by and large, protect employee pen­ 
sion rights. The connotation appears to be that these 
plans have an unfair advantage over their counter­ 
parts in the private sector. Such plaintiveness about 
the generosity of government-employee pension 
plans is a total misdirection of attention and 
argumentation. The objective of public policy 
should be to ensure that private-sector occupational 
pension plans are improved in line with their public­ 
sector counterparts, rather than to bring the latter 
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down to the often mediocre standards of the private 
sector. 

Finally, I would like to reiterate my belief in the 
principle of universality, as embodied in the Old 
Age Security program. It is a fundamental feature 
of the present system and, as such, should not be 
called into question, as is the case in some of the 
supporting chapters. Universality remains the best 
way to minimize both bureaucratization and arbi­ 
trariness of any kind in the delivery of this program. 
Accordingly, it is the best way to safeguard the 
dignity of each and every senior citizen. 

DISSENT BY MR. JAMES A. MCCAMBL Y 

In its report the Council has, quite rightly, focused 
considerable attention on two fundamental areas of 
weakness in Canada's existing retirement income 
system. First and foremost, adequate occupational 
pensions cover too few of the working population. 
Secondly, the incidence of poverty among elderly 
unattached individuals who have been unable to 
build up adequate earnings-related pension benefits 
remains a cause for concern. 

Unfortunately, the report fails to make the kind 
of recommendations that, if implemented, would go 
a long way towards correcting these serious 
shortcomings. 

I have severe misgivings concerning the major 
suggestions for remedying the deficiencies in occu­ 
pational pension plans. There is a need for increas­ 
ing the earnings-replacement rate over and above 
the present 25 per cent target level provided by the 
CPP and QPP. An option discussed, but not recom­ 
mended, by the Council, involving the establishment 
of a fully funded supplement to the CPP and QPP, 
with or without the contracting-out option, would, 
in my opinion, impair the viability of existing pri­ 
vate pension plans. On the other hand, 
Recommendation 8 will do little to alleviate the 
problem. I would like to see discussion of more 
alternatives, which might include the possibility of a 
gradual increase in the CPP and QPP earnings­ 
replacement rate above its present level, or a supple­ 
mentary plan that would be open to employees not 
covered by an occupational plan. 

I am also disappointed by the Council's reluc­ 
tance to give guidance to the government in 
Recommendation l, as to what it perceives as an 
acceptable measure of income adequacy. Of the 
three measures that are in widespread use, the one 
developed by Statistics Canada is the lowest and 

does not seem to be an unreasonable mimmum 
which could be attained over a period of time 
through an expanded GIS program. This would 
greatly alleviate the incidence of poverty among 
elderly unattached individuals, the majority of them 
women, who are unable to accumulate adequate 
earnings-related pension benefits through CPP or 
QPP or through supplementary private schemes. 

Finally, I am not convinced by the arguments 
presented in support of Recommendation 10. I am 
reluctant to agree to a proposal that would increase 
the limit on the holdings of foreign securities by 
pension funds beyond the present 10 per cent level 
without a more detailed analysis of the possible 
repercussions of such a move. 

DISSENT BY DR. PETER H. PEARSE 

I dissent from several of the recommendations made 
in Chapter 10, mainly because they fail to focus 
attention on the particular problems identified in 
earlier chapters as deserving high priority. In my 
opinion, some of the reforms proposed by the 
majority of the Council are not sufficiently dis­ 
criminating; they would therefore be unnecessarily 
costly and, at the same time, fail to meet certain 
urgent needs adequately. The financial implications 
of the pension arrangements in Canada have 
become so enormous, and the future demands on the 
system will be so great, that I cannot concur in 
recommendations that would continue to direct 
large sums to groups that are not in need while 
other older Canadians would be left with inadequate 
support. 

Accordingly, I disagree with Recommendation 4 
insofar as it advocates perpetuation of the OAS; in 
my opinion this undiscriminating plan has outlived 
its usefulness and should now be abandoned in 
favour of an enriched Guaranteed Income Supple­ 
ment, which provides support according to needs. 
Our research indicates that if, in 1979, the OAS 
pension had been replaced by an expanded GIS 
guaranteeing the same minimum income as that 
provided under the existing OAS/GIS program, it 
would have resulted in a saving to the federal 
government of close to a billion dollars. That is 
roughly the amount needed to solve one of the 
problems we identify as urgent - namely, to raise 
the incomes of single GIS recipients, mainly women, 
to the minimum level of income adequacy calculat­ 
ed by Statistics Canada. The OAS has unquestion­ 
ably served a valuable social purpose in the past, but 
times have changed. In the interests of both taxpay- 



ers and older people in greatest need, we should now 
channel basic income support through our newer 
and more effective programs. 

In this connection, Recommendation I does not, 
in my opinion, go far enough in advising the govern­ 
ment to specify a minimum income for those 
aged 65 and over. Such a floor is already implied by 
the maximum OAS/GIS entitlement, but this is 
clearly inadequate, especially in the case of single 
persons. Selection of any statistical measure of 
income adequacy involves judgment and is vulner­ 
able to criticism, but until a better one is available, 
the "low-income cutoff' determined by Statistics 
Canada appears to be a suitable choice. 

Contrary to the statements following 
Recommendation 5, I feel strongly that the special 
income tax exemption for those aged 65 and over, 
together with the pension income deduction, should 
be abolished. Such provisions are perverse; because 
of the progressivity of the tax schedule, they provide 
the greatest benefit to those with the highest 
incomes; they are of little help to those whose 
incomes are low and not at all to those whose 
incomes are too low to be taxable. Our work sug­ 
gests that in 1977, the exemption alone reduced tax 
revenues by $210 million, while both the exemption 
and the pension income deduction together reduced 
revenue by $365 million. This would have been 
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sufficient to raise GIS benefits by about one-third. 
While the old-age exemption had some justification 
when it was introduced in 1948 (before Medicare, 
GIS, and other basic-income programs existed), 
today both these provisions merely introduce inequi­ 
ties in the income-support and tax systems. 

Finally, and most importantly, I dissent from the 
crucial Recommendation 8, because it does little to 
alleviate what this report identifies as the major 
deficiency in our existing income-replacement 
system - namely, its failure to provide for that 
54 per cent of employed paid workers (many of 
them with small private employers) not covered by 
occupational pension plans. Indeed, while the 
recommendation would enrich provisions for 
employees of governments and large firms who 
already have the advantage of such plans, it would 
aggravate the relative disadvantage of those whose 
employers do not offer them. The proposal thus fails 
to address the most urgent need. My conclusion is 
that if the gap in the present system is to be closed, 
this can best be done by introducing a fully funded 
supplement to the Canada and Quebec Pension 
Plans with an option for employers to contract-out, 
as in the present British system, described in the 
paragraphs preceding Recommendation 8. 

With these exceptions, I support the recommen­ 
dations of the majority. 



APPENDIXES 



A Glossary 

In the course of preparing this report, the Council 
encountered many terms that may be unfamiliar to 
the general reader. Worse still, there is much confu­ 
sion, at least in many public discussions, about the 
use of some of these terms; often they are defined 
only imprecisely, if indeed they are defined at all. 
For its own part, the Council found it useful to have 
a glossary setting out some of the more important 
terms in the sense in which they are used in this 
report. 

More detailed technical definitions and descrip­ 
tions of various plans can be found in Lawrence 
E. Coward, Mercer Handbook of Canadian Pension 
and Welfare Plans (Toronto: CCH Canadian Lim­ 
ited, 1977). For explanation of many of the more 
difficult concepts pertaining to pension plans, 
another book has also proved to be particularly 
useful: D. Don Ezra, Understanding Pension Fund 
Finance and Investment (Toronto: Pagurian Press, 
1979). 

INCOME SECURITY FOR OLDER PEOPLE 

The report is concerned with various ways of 
ensuring income security for older people. Such 
security may be provided by way of income from 
current employment; but, for the most part, it is 
likely to involve sources of income that are not 
related to such employment (although they may be 
related to previous employment). The latter are 
referred to here as retirement income. Retirement 
income may come from such things as investments 
or personal savings, but for many people it now 
consists largely of various forms of pensions, includ­ 
ing government transfer payments (for example, 
Old Age Security). It is well to realize, however, 
that income security policies - or retirement 
income policies - do involve more than pensions; 
for example, they most certainly involve tax policies. 

TYPES OF PENSION PLANS 

Since pensions loom so large in this field, how­ 
ever, much of our report is concerned with them. 
They can be defined in a strictly formal sense as 
follows: 

pensions are regular payments arising from government 
legislation or from employer plans that promise payments 
bearing some relation to years of employment and salaries 
received; or that are made as a result of legislation on the 
attainment of a specified age, or on the attainment of a 
specified age by individuals with income that is con­ 
sidered by the legislation to be too low.' 

This definition is useful for economists because it 
distinguishes pensions from retirement savings 
plans, in which "the payments received depend 
solely on the accumulated savings and the rates of 
return received from their investment'? - a distinc­ 
tion that can be important for analysis. 

For the most part, however, we have included 
such savings plans - for example, registered retire­ 
ment savings plans (RRSPS) - in what we refer to 
broadly as pensions, a treatment more in line with 
general usage. The real catch is that pension plans, 
even in this broad sense, may be further classified, 
and indeed cross-classified, in many ways - in 
relation to the body sponsoring them, the funding 
agency, their benefit formula and structure, their 
financing structure, and so on. 

PLAN SPONSORS AND FUNDING AGENCIES 

The term public pension plans in this report 
refers to those administered by government for citi­ 
zens at large; in effect, universal plans. The most 
important of these are the Old Age Security (OAS) 
program, the Guaranteed Income Supplement 
(GIS), various provincial supplement programs, and 
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the employment-related Canada and Quebec Pen­ 
sion Plans (CPp / QPp). 

The term private pension plan refers to occupa­ 
tional or personal plans, both of which supplement 
the public programs. Like the CPP and QPP, occupa­ 
tional plans are employment-related. The vast 
majority of them are employer-sponsored, although 
some are backed by other sponsors such as unions. 
Sponsors are responsible for the administration of 
the plan; depending upon the nature of the plan, 
they may accept ultimate liability for meeting 
promised benefits. In the text, we try to distinguish 
between private-employer-sponsored plans and 
public-employer-sponsored plans. 

Private-employer-sponsored plans are of two main 
types - trusteed and insured - depending upon 
the organization that provides the facilities for 
accumulation of assets and the ultimate payment of 
benefits. When these facilities are provided by a 
trust company or a group of individuals, the scheme 
is called a trusteed plan. Pension plans using the 
facilities of insurance companies are known as 
insured plans. 

Public-employer-sponsored schemes, on the other 
hand, may be of the trusteed or insured variety or 
they may be consolidated-revenue plans. Contribu­ 
tions to consolidated-revenue plans are, like tax 
revenues, paid into the consolidated-revenue fund of 
the government concerned and used for general 
government purposes. The federal public service 
employee pension program is a consolidated-revenue 
plan. 

The choice of benefit formula for an employment­ 
related pension plan will affect the ultimate level of 
benefits and, for example, the preservation of pen­ 
sion credits in the face of inflation. There are two 
main types: defined-benefit plans and defined-con­ 
tribution plans. 

Defined-benefit plans promise benefits that are 
determined in one of a number of ways: 

(1) Unit-benefit plans relate benefits to an 
employee's previous earnings and number of years 
of service. Such plans fall into one or a combination 
of the following subcategories: they may be final­ 
earnings plans, in which individuals' pensions are 
based upon length of service and final earnings, or 
some average of earnings during their final years 
prior to retirement; they may be career-earnings 
plans insofar as individuals accumulate annually a 
unit of pension equal to a percentage of average 
earnings or a percentage of average best earnings 
over their careers. The CPP and QPP are modified 
forms of career-earnings plans. 

(2) A flat-benefit plan provides a fixed-dollar 
amount of pension benefit for employees after they 
have fulfilled certain age and service requirements. 
Usually a specified amount of benefits is paid for 
each year of service. Many flat-benefit plans are the 
result of collective bargaining, and their benefits 
may be adjusted from time to time as a result of 
such bargaining. 

Defined-contribution plans include the following: 

(1) Money-purchase plans, where contributions 
are specified but the resulting pension is unknown. 
The pension is determined by the amount of total 
contributions accumulated, plus interest paid by, or 
accredited to, the employee. 

(2) Profit-sharing pension plans, which are simi­ 
lar to money-purchase plans except that employers' 
annual contributions on behalf of employees vary 
with their profits. 

The most common type of personal pension plan 
is the registered retirement savings plan, which is a 
contract between an individual and an insurer, trus­ 
tee, or corporation authorized to issue investment 
contracts. The plan is essentially a money-purchase 
plan that allows individuals to contribute to a pen­ 
sion for themselves or their spouses and, at the same 
time, to deduct such contributions from their gross 
income in determining their taxable income. 

FINANCING METHODS 

Pension plans may be financed or funded in sever­ 
al different ways. A pay-as-you-go plan is one in 
which the current contribution rate is set just high 
enough to pay for all benefits and other charges 
such as administrative costs in the current period 
(for example, one year). Many pension plans, how­ 
ever, are funded. A funded plan is one in which 
contributions are set high enough to accumulate a 
fund that is invested to provide for all or part of 
future benefit payments and other expenditures. 

In a partially funded plan, contributions exceed 
benefits paid out while the fund is being built up. 
The initial contribution rate, however, is not set 
high enough to accumulate a fund sufficient to pay 
all benefits as they accrue, nor is there any formal 
arrangement for making up the deficiency. 

The definition of a fully funded pension plan can 
be even more complicated; and, indeed, there are 
several ways in which full funding can be 
approached.' Strictly speaking, a pension plan is 
fully funded when the contribution rate has been set 
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high enough to accumulate an investment fund suf­ 
ficient to pay all benefits that have accrued to date 
on account of the operation of the plan. For this 
state to be completely achieved at any point in time 
the plan sponsors' assumptions about such things as 
rates of return on investment and wage rates would 
have to be borne out by actual experience. Often 
this is not the case; however, formal mechanisms do 
exist for defining the liabilities of the sponsors in 
such an event. In this report, therefore, we take a 
fully funded pension plan to be one in which the 
accumulated investment fund plus the recognized 
liability of the plan sponsor are equal to the accrued 
value of the benefits that have been promised to 
date. 

Pay-as-you-go or partially funded pension plans 
are, by and large, dependent on the backing of 
governments. In short, the ultimate security of ben­ 
efits will rest in whole or in part upon the ability of 
a government to tax. Private-sector occupational 
plans are required, within certain limits, to be fully 
funded so that if a firm, for example, were to go out 
of business, the investment fund would be sufficient 
to pay accrued benefits. 

The limits referred to above cover the ways in 
which any gaps between the value of the investment 
fund and the accrued benefits must be closed. A 
pension plan is said to have an unfunded liability 
when the value of the actual fund is less than that of 
the fund required to pay future benefits that have 
accrued to date on account of the operation of the 
fund. An experience deficiency is that part of the 
unfunded liability that results from the plan's 
actuarial assumptions being violated by actual 
experience. Such a deficiency may arise, for exam­ 
ple, when wages rise more rapidly than assumed or 
investment returns are less than originally assumed. 
A past-service deficiency is that part of the unfund­ 
ed liability resulting from the recognition of 
employee service prior to the plan's inception or 
from improvements made to the plan after its incep­ 
tion. A current-service cost arises from pension 
credits that have been earned in the current year by 
current members of the plan, as well as from ad hoc 
increases to existing pensions to meet inflation. In 
Canada, pension benefit legislation sets out the time 
periods during which past-service, or experience 
deficiencies must be extinguished. 

Pension plans may also differ in their sources of 
contributions. Defined-benefit plans may be either 
contributory, in which case both the employer and 
employee make contributions on behalf of the 
employee, or noncontributory, in which case only 
the employer makes contributions. 
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BENEFIT STRUCTURE 

In addition to the various benefit formulas, there 
are a number of other terms used in the report that 
bear on the coverage and adequacy of benefits; for 
example, the report frequently distinguishes be­ 
tween age of entitlement (to benefits) and age of 
retirement. The term retirement is usually used here 
in the general sense of withdrawal from the labour 
force, either completely or partially. In other words, 
a "retired" person may work part-time. On the 
other hand, withdrawal from the labour force is not 
necessarily a condition of entitlement to pension 
benefits. That is, individuals may be entitled to 
benefits at a specified age - the age of 
entitlement - whether they retire or not. 

In some cases (for example, the GIS program), 
however, it is not the age of retirement that is 
important in qualifying for benefits but the 
individual's income or earnings. Some retirement 
income plans are subject to income, earnings, needs 
or means tests. The most comprehensive of these is 
the means test, whereby both eligibility and the 
level of benefits are determined by income from all 
sources, as well as holdings of wealth (that is, 
income-producing assets). An income test is similar 
to the means test but is less rigorously applied. The 
only real difference is that wealth itself is not taken 
into account in determining both eligibility and the 
level of benefits, although pecuniary income from 
wealth, as well as income from employment, is 
considered. An earnings test is even less restrictive, 
taking into account only income from employment. 
The needs test differs from the foregoing means and 
income tests, in that an assessment of need is sub­ 
stituted for an arbitrary income ceiling. 

The foregoing terms have a bearing on the ben­ 
efits that are actually paid out to individuals. Three 
other terms that are encountered frequently refer to 
provisions that affect the accumulation of pension 
credits before retirement. These are vesting, lock­ 
ing-in, and portability. 

Vesting, locking-in, and portability provisions all 
pertain to the methods used to preserve the pension 
credits of employees who move from one employer 
to another. Portability enables employees to carry 
their pension credits from one employer to another 
when changing jobs. Canada and Quebec Pension 
Plan benefits are completely portable; with occupa­ 
tional plans, however, portability can be complicat­ 
ed. It can be provided through reciprocal agree­ 
ments between employers, and this approach is in 
fact used in the case of most government-employee 
pension plans in Canada, as well as private-sector 
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multi-employer plans. Because occupational pension 
plans, sponsored by individual private employers, 
differ so widely in structure, however, reciprocity as 
a means of ensuring portability is difficult to 
achieve. That is where vesting becomes particularly 
important. 

Vesting provisions remove the obligation of plan 
participants to remain in a pension plan until retire­ 
ment in order to qualify for pension credits, and 
they establish the credits to which individuals are 
entitled if they change jobs. In Canada, if pension 
rights are not vested, employees will, upon changing 
employers, get back only their own contributions to 
the plan plus accumulated interest. Vesting refers in 
general to the right of employees, should they 

change jobs prior to retirement, to all or part of the 
pension credits associated with the contributions 
made to a pension plan on their behalf by the 
employer, whether those benefits are taken in cash 
or as a deferred pension. This definition, it should 
be noted, avoids the confusion that arises in some 
other definitions that link vesting to either contribu­ 
tions or benefits. 

In Canada, however, vesting is now usually 
associated with mandatory locking-in provisions. 
These prevent workers from withdrawing either 
their own or their employer's contributions in cash; 
they must accept a deferred pension - that is, a 
pension that is payable only at the normal age of 
entitlement, usually 65. 



B Development of Canada's Retirement Income System to 
the 1970s1 

Until the late 1920s, provision for old age remained 
primarily a matter of personal or family responsibil­ 
ity in Canada. Individuals were expected to save for 
their later years, and it was considered a family 
duty to support elderly relatives who were unable to 
work. 

Apart from figures on annuities, there are no data 
indicating the extent to which Canadians saved for 
their old age, but it would appear that long-term 
saving in the forms familiar today were negligible. 
The development of a diversified institutional struc­ 
ture of financial markets capable of mobilizing and 
channeling the long-term savings of individuals into 
profitable investments is a relatively recent phe­ 
nomenon in Canada. 

Occupational pensional schemes were almost 
unheard of, although the Superannuation Act of 
1870 did make some pension provision for federal 
civil servants, and the first plan sponsored by a 
private employer was introduced by the Grand 
Trunk Railway in 1874. Subsequently, the Pension 
Fund Societies Act of 1887 permitted federally 
incorporated companies to establish pension fund 
societies, and chartered banks were among the first 
to take advantage of its provisions. 

For many years, annuities issued by the insurance 
companies provided the principal means through 
which individuals could convert their modest savings 
into a stream of retirement income. This device 
developed only very slowly, however; by the end of 
1910, less than 2,000 contracts were in force, two­ 
thirds of them underwritten by a single company 
(Sun Life). In an attempt to fill the vacuum, the 
Government Annuities Act was introduced in 1908 
to facilitate and encourage individuals of limited 
means to save for their old age. The Act allowed the 
federal government to sell small annuities to the 
public at rates that, at that time, were more favour­ 
able than those offered by private companies. Then, 
in 1919, the Income War Tax Act provided some 

stimulus to occupational plans by permitting the 
existing income tax deferment for employer contri­ 
butions to be extended to cover employee contribu­ 
tions as well. 

It was becoming increasingly apparent, however, 
that despite the foregoing legislative measures many 
individuals were unable to save enough to support 
themselves in their later years. Employer-sponsored 
pension plans expanded only slowly, with the 
number of formal plans growing from 172 at the 
end of the First World War to some 600 by 1936. 
Although there is no way of calculating what pro­ 
portion of the labour force was covered by these 
plans, it has been suggested that it was in the 
neighbourhood of 10 to 15 per cent. Yet even this 
figure probably overstates the case, since employees 
who change employment before acquiring vested 
rights to a pension must forfeit their benefit entitle­ 
ments. Because vesting periods of 20 years or more 
were not unusual at that time, the number of 
employees who actually received a pension from 
private industry was effectively reduced. Further­ 
more, few Canadians took advantage of the oppor­ 
tunity to buy annuities from the government; less 
than 12,000 contracts for such annuities were in 
force at the end of March 1931, almost a quarter of 
a century after the Act came into effect. The annui­ 
ty business of private insurance companies was even 
less impressive, amounting to little over 
3,500 contracts in December 1930. Thus, although 
saving for old age was still considered to be largely a 
personal responsibility, it came to be recognized 
that some public support would be required for 
those who received little family support and those 
who failed to make sufficient provision for them­ 
selves through occupational pension plans or person­ 
al saving. 

As a consequence, the first significant federal 
government intervention in the social welfare field 
occurred in 1927 with the introduction of the Old 
Age Pension Act. The Act established a framework 
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for cost-sharing arrangements with the provinces, so 
as to provide means-tested pensions to all needy 
individuals aged 70 and over. Legislation adopted 
by the provinces gradually extended those benefits 
to all parts of the country. 

By the end of the Second World War, which had 
followed the greatest depression in modern history, 
perceptions of the economic world had undergone 
some fundamental changes as a result of what has 
become known as the Keynesian revolution in eco­ 
nomics. Governments were now seen to have a 
major responsibility not only for promoting full­ 
employment economic growth, but also for provid­ 
ing wide-ranging social welfare programs. More­ 
over, Britain's Beveridge Report on social insurance 
received worldwide publicity. In Canada, too, pen­ 
sions emerged as a priority issue. 

A significant modification in public policy took 
place in 1951 with the introduction of the Old Age 
Security and Old Age Assistance Acts. The former 
embodied many of the principles of Beveridge's 
thinking, including nationwide, universal subsist­ 
ence pensions financed by contributions and pro­ 
vided by one unitary system. More precisely, the 
federal government assumed full responsibility for 
providing a universal flat-rate (as opposed to means­ 
tested) old age pension at age 70, subject only to a 
residence requirement. A special levy - the "old 
age security tax" - was imposed and linked to the 
financing of the program. Receipts were paid into 
an "old age security fund" that, in effect, constitut­ 
ed a separate account in the consolidated-revenue 
fund, and benefits were paid out of this fund. The 
Minister of Finance was also authorized to make 
loans to the fund, if necessary, so that the program 
was in effect recognized as a charge on general 
revenues. 

While the cornerstone of the government's policy 
remained the personal obligation to save for retire­ 
ment, the Old Age Security Act guaranteed a basic 
minimum that individuals could supplement as their 
circumstances allowed and their preferences 
decreed. Indeed, those with the means and the 
inclination to do so were expected to provide addi­ 
tional retirement income for themselves through 
either personal saving or occupational pension plans. 
In contrast to the universal pension provided under 
the Old Age Security Act, the Old Age Assistance 
Act provided for federal contributions to means­ 
tested pension programs, administered by the prov­ 
inces, for individuals between the ages of 65 and 69. 

The decision to institute a universal plan guaran­ 
teeing a basic minimum pension became a lankmark 
in pension legislation in Canada, and though it was 

made with some reluctance by the government of 
the day, it proved to be irreversible. There still 
remained the problem, however, that most workers 
suffered a drastic reduction in income upon their 
retirement. Consequently, the idea of relating pen­ 
sion benefits to earnings - that is, of assuring an 
adequate rate of income replacement upon 
retirement - began to gain favour in the late 1950s 
and early 1960s as a method of supplementing, 
rather than a substitute for, the universal OAS 
pension. 

Private pension plans alleviated the problem only 
to a very limited degree. To be sure, the Second 
World War had provided a major fillip to the 
growth of employer-sponsored pension plans. Faced 
with policies that restricted wage increases in a tight 
labour market, industry turned to pension plans and 
other fringe benefits to attract and retain 
employees.' and, after the war, pension benefits 
became an important element in collective bargain­ 
ing. Thus by 1960 there had been a considerable 
shift from individual to institutionalized pension 
plans, with over 8,900 plans, including those for 
public-sector employees, covering approximately 
1.9 million workers. In addition, following an 
amendment to the Income Tax Act in 1957, regis­ 
tered retirement savings plans (RRSPS) were intro­ 
duced to encourage personal provision for retire­ 
ment. The amendment, by allowing a tax deferment 
(within prescribed limits) for contributions paid into 
RRSPS, provided the self-employed with the same 
fiscal incentives to save for retirement as those 
enjoyed by employees in occupational plans, and it 
also presented the latter with a means of supple­ 
menting existing pension plans. 

Although institutionalized occupational plans 
and, to a lesser extent, RRSPS had experienced rapid 
growth by the early 1960s, many people felt that 
there were still serious inadequacies in the system. 
In 1961, government basic-income payments were 
still the major source of income for 48 per cent of 
the men and 72 per cent of the women in the 
65-and-over age group. The coverage provided by 
earnings-related occupational pension plans to pub­ 
lic-sector employees was almost complete by 1960, 
but this was not true of private industry. Further­ 
more, vesting and portability provisions continued 
effectively to reduce coverage. Consequently, there 
was a growing demand for fully portable pension 
plans in which workers could accumulate and retain 
pension entitlements even though they changed 
employment. At the same time, the desire both to 
control costs and to improve benefits militated in 
favour of contributory plans. The outcome was a 
significant expansion in the role of government in 



the area of pensions, by way of the Canada and 
Quebec Pension Plans, a restructured basic-income 
package, and legislation governing the operation of 
private pension plans. 

The changes of the 1960s began with the formu­ 
lation of separate programs by Ontario, Quebec, 
and the federal government. Ontario's legislation, 
introduced in 1963, was designed to serve three 
main purposes: to establish minimum standards of 
solvency for private plans, to set a minimum level of 
vesting, and to require all employers of 15 workers 
or more to provide a plan with prescribed minimum 
benefit levels. Until then, there had been virtually 
no formal regulation of private pension plans other 
than the general principles adopted in 1946 by the 
Department of National Revenue on the eligibility 
of the contributions to such plans as deductions for 
income tax purposes. It was generally recognized, 
however, that legislative authority for the regulation 
of private plans rested solely with the provinces. 

Meanwhile, Quebec was formulating a scheme of 
its own - the Régime de rentes du Québec, or 
Quebec Pension Plan (OPp) - and the federal 
Liberal Party was working on the development of 
the Canada Pension Plan (cer) at the time that it 
came back into power in 1963. The Quebec program 
provided for survivor, death, and disability 
benefits - items outside the constitutional compe­ 
tence of the federal government - and, unlike the 
initial formulation of the CPP, which proposed pay­ 
as-you-go financing, it was Quebec's intention to 
have substantially greater funding of its plan, with 
consequent higher contribution rates. 

The national plan that emerged was a compro­ 
mise between the sometimes conflicting interests of 
the federal and provincial governments.' The pri­ 
mary objective of this compulsory and contributory 
plan was to ensure a minimum rate of earnings 
replacement (up to a given maximum earnings ceil­ 
ing) for those reaching the age of 65 and, at the 
same time, to allow plenty of scope for the continua­ 
tion and extension of private pension plans and 
personal saving over this minimum level. Pressure 
from Quebec and other provinces resulted in the 
national plan providing considerable investment 
funds for use by the provinces. 

In 1965, when the final formulation of the 
Canada and Quebec Pension Plans was introduced, 
the Ontario Pension Benefits Act was amended to 
remove the section that would have forced smaller 
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establishments to implement pension plans. The 
regulatory elements of the Act and the standards of 
vesting and funding were retained. Other provinces 
followed Ontario's lead in regulating private plans 
within their jurisdictions. Today, similar legislation 
exists in Alberta, Saskatchewan, Manitoba, Quebec, 
and Nova Scotia. Undertakings that fall under fed­ 
eral jurisdiction are covered by comparable regula­ 
tory legislation administered by the federal Depart­ 
ment of Insurance. 

The introduction of the CPP and the OPP and 
more extensive provincial regulation of private plans 
had a significant impact on the development of 
Canada's retirement income system. The universal 
OAS program remained the cornerstone of the basic­ 
income package, but the qualifying age was lowered 
by one year annually, from 70 in 1966 to 65 by 
1970. Moreover, the Old Age Security Act was 
amended in 1966 to provide, in addition to OAS 
benefits, a monthly guaranteed income supplement 
(GIs). Although it was originally directed at those 
born before 1910 and therefore ineligible for CPP or 
OPP benefits, the supplement was broadened to 
cover all those aged 65 and over with a minimum of 
10 years' residence in Canada. It is income-tested, 
with monthly payments being reduced by $1 for 
every $2 of income over and above the OAS 
payments. 

There were substantial changes also in income­ 
replacement plans, particularly with respect to total 
assets. Canadian pension funds together (excluding 
RRSPS) held assets equal in value to about one-fifth 
of GNP in the early 1960s. That ratio grew to 
one-third by 1977. By far the largest part of this 
growth was attributable to the Canada and Quebec 
Pension Plans. The growth of the assets of trusteed 
and insured plans has been fairly constant over the 
past two decades, except during the early years of 
the Canada and Quebec Pension Plans. Many plans 
became integrated with the two public plans, and 
their benefits were lowered in consideration of the 
benefits expected to be paid by the government 
schemes. As a result, contributions to the integrated 
plans were reduced, and the growth of their assets 
slowed temporarily. Indeed, a few trusteed and 
insured plans - largely those with limited coverage 
and comparatively low benefits - were terminated. 
The total number of occupational pension plans 
grew much less rapidly after 1965 than during the 
early 1960s. Indeed, it actually declined after 1970, 
although membership in existing plans continued to 
grow. 



C Alternative Population and Labour Force Projections: 
The Underlying Assumptions 

The size and composition of Canada's future popu­ 
lation will depend on the rates of fertility, mortality, 
and immigration. The higher the birth rate, life 
expectancy, and net immigration, the larger the 
population will be. Because it is impossible to pre­ 
dict with certainty the future levels of these vari­ 
ables, demographers often base their population and 
labour force projections on a variety of assumed 
levels. For each variable, usually three levels are 
assumed: the high, medium, and low. 

This is the procedure followed in the projections 
that have been prepared for the Council. J The 
demographic and labour participation assumptions 
used are presented in Table C-l. The levels assumed 
are based on past experience and/or likely trends. 
Thus, the high fertility level assumes a return to the 
high birth rates of the postwar baby boom. The 
medium level postulates that the birth rates of the 
eàrly seventies would prevail, while the low level 
assumes a further decline in birth rates from the 
present level. As for life expectancy, no drastic 
changes are expected as the decline in death rates 
has recently leveled off. Thus, the assumed increases 
in life expectancy vary from a slight rise in the low 
projection to a moderate improvement in the high 
one. In the case of immigration, it is assumed that 
there would be 140,000 net immigrants annually in 
the high projection, 80,000 in the medium, and 
20,000 in the low. 

Some twenty population projections have been 
prepared on the basis of these assumptions about 
future fertility and net immigration rates, and life 
expectancy. Eleven of these, identified as P-Ol to 
P-ll, are shown below in Table C-2. The assump­ 
tions underlying them are as follows: 

P-Ol: "Medium" projection: medium fertility, 
medium life expectancy, and medium net 
immigration. 

P-02: High fertility; otherwise the same as P-OI. 

P-03: Low life expectancy; otherwise the same as 
P-Ol. 

P-04: High net immigration; otherwise the same as 
P-Ol. 

P-05: Low fertility; otherwise the same as P-Ol. 

P-06: High life expectancy; otherwise the same as 
P-Ol. 

P-07: Low net immigration; otherwise the same as 
P-Ol. 

P-08: "High growth" projection: high fertility, high 
life expectancy, and high net immigration. 

P-09: "Low growth" projection: low fertility, low 
life expectancy, and low net immigration. 

P-IO: "Old population" projection: low fertility, 
high life expectancy, and medium net 
immigration. 

P-ll: "Young population" projection: high fertility, 
low life expectancy, and medium net immigra­ 
tion. 

Table C-2 indicates a population of just over 
38 million in the year 2031 under the "medium" 
projection (P-OI). Under certain extreme assump­ 
tions, the population might reach 63 million in that 
year as in the "high" projection (P-08), or only 
24 million as in the "low" projection (P-09). 

Table C-3 shows that the proportion of persons 
65 and over in the total population will double under 
the "medium" projection (P-Ol), from about 9 per 
cent to 18 per cent by 2031. On the other hand, it 
will go to almost 25 per cent under the "low popula­ 
tion" projection (P-09). The proportion of old 
people would rise slightly to 13 per cent under the 
"high population" projection (P-08). 

The labour force participation assumptions 
(Table C-4) are specified separately for men and 
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women, and 1981 and 1991 are chosen as target 
years in which the assumed changes would be 
achieved. The 1991 participation rates are similar to 
the 1981 rates for men under 55, but lower for those 
55 and over, to allow for the continuation of the 
trend towards earlier retirement. For men aged 
between 25 and 44 the assumed rates are virtually 
the same as the actual 1976 rates. For other age 
groups, the assumed changes are rather small. 
Much larger changes are assumed for women. This 
is especially true of women aged 20 to 54, for whom 
higher participation rates are specified in 1981 and 
with further increases occurring by 1991. For 
women under 20 and over 65, a slight decline in 
participation is expected. 

Combining each of three alternative levels of 
labour force participation rates with various popula­ 
tion projections produces a large number of labour 
force projections. Three of these - referred to in 
this report as high, medium, and low - are shown 

in Table C-5 (there are twelve more in the back­ 
ground study). The underlying assumptions are the 
following: 

L-OI: "Medium" projection: medium fertility, 
medium life expectancy, medium net immi­ 
gration, and medium labour force participa­ 
tion rates. 

L-08: "High" projection: high fertility, high life 
expectancy, high net immigration, and 
medium labour force participation rates. 

L-09: "Low" projection: low fertility, low life 
expectancy, low net immigration, and medium 
labour force participation rates. 

Under the "medium" projection, Canada would 
have a labour force of just over 17 million by 2031. 
Over 39 million people would be in the labour force 
under the "high" projection, but only just under 
11 million by that time under the "low" projection. 

TABLE C-l 
DEMOGRAPHIC ASSUMPTIONS OF ALTERNATIVE POPULATION GROWTH PROJECTIONS, CANADA, 
1976 TO 2051 

Population growth projections 

High Medium Low 

Life Life Life 
expectancy Immigration? expectancy Immigration- expectancy Immigration? 

Fertility' Men Women Gross Net Fertility' Men Women Gross Net Fertility! Men Women Gross Net 

(Years) (Thousands) (Years) (Thousands) (Years) (Thousands) 

1976 2,102 70.1 77.9 172 131 1,923 69.8 77.4 172 131 1,803 69.6 76.9 172 131 
1981 2,650 70.8 79.5 171 131 2,024 70.3 78.4 120 80 1,607 69.8 77.4 69 29 
1986 2,979 71.5 81.3 180 140 2,085 70.8 79.5 120 80 1,489 70.1 77.9 60 20 
1991 2,979 72.3 83.3 180 140 2,085 71.3 80.7 120 80 1,489 70.3 78.4 60 20 
2001 2,979 72.7 84.3 180 140 2,085 71.6 815 120 80 1,489 70.5 78.9 60 20 
2011 2,979 73.0 85.3 180 140 2,085 71.9 82.3 120 80 1,489 70.7 79.3 60 20 
2021 2,979 73.0 85.3 180 140 2,085 71.9 82.3 120 80 1,489 70.7 79.3 60 20 
2031 2,979 73.0 85.3 180 140 2,085 71.9 82.3 120 80 1,489 70.7 79.3 60 20 
2041 2,979 73.0 85.3 180 140 2,085 71.9 82.3 120 80 1,489 70.7 79.3 60 20 
2051 2,979 73.0 85.3 180 140 2,085 71.9 82.3 120 80 1,489 70.7 79.3 60 20 

'Total fertility rate per 1,000 women of child-bearing age. 
'The difference (about 40,000) between gross and net immigration represents emigration. 
SOURCE F. Denton, C. Feaver, and B. Spencer, "The Future Population and Labour Force of Canada: Projections to the Year 2051," a background study 

prepared for the Economic Council of Canada, 1979. 
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TABLE C-2 

PROJECTED POPULATION, CANADA, 1976 TO 2051 

Population growth projections 

P-OI P-02 P-03 P-04 P-05 P-06 P-07 P-08 P-09 P-IO P-II 

(Thousands) 

1976 22,993 22,993 22,993 22,993 22,993 22,993 22,993 22,993 22,993 22,993 22,993 
1981 24,561 24,929 24,536 24,681 24,314 24,586 24,441 25,076 24,171 24,338 24,904 
1986 26,351 27,624 26,278 26,810 25,499 26,426 25,892 28,181 24,982 25,572 27,546 
1991 28,099 30,367 27,955 28,933 26,582 28,248 27,265 31,415 25,648 26,724 30,213 
1996 29,626 32,841 29,399 30,858 27,478 29,861 28,393 34,433 26,103 27,702 32,597 
2001 30,966 35,222 30,655 32,616 28,169 31,288 29,317 37,389 26,341 28,473 34,884 
2006 32,289 37,980 31,887 34,374 28,698 32,699 30,203 40,768 26,406 29,083 37,536 
2011 33,662 41,298 33,163 36,207 29,086 34,165 31,118 44,774 26,319 29,553 40,731 
2016 34,992 44,892 34,394 38,019 29,314 35,588 31,966 49,121 26,071 29,859 44,192 
2021 36,162 48,452 35,466 39,683 29,350 36,848 32,640 53,487 25,640 29,969 47,614 
2026 37,152 52,013 36,355 41,175 29,185 37,933 33,129 57,906 25,015 29,879 51,025 
2031 38,014 55,848 37,109 42,541 28,819 38,896 33,487 62,661 24,204 29,592 54,690 
2036 38,796 60,143 37,784 43,828 28,269 39,782 33,763 67,949 23,233 29,116 58,796 
2041 39,510 64,831 38,402 45,048 27,570 40,592 33,973 73,697 22,153 28,478 63,285 
2046 40,156 69,753 38,970 46,195 26,778 41,312 34,116 79,735 21,027 27,719 68,006 
2051 40,758 74,908 39,512 47,295 25,955 41,967 34,221 86,059 19,915 26,900 72,955 

SOURCE F. Denton, C. Feaver, and B. Spencer, 'The Future Population and Labour Force of Canada: Projections to the Year 2051," a background study 
prepared for the Economic Council of Canada, 1979. 

TABLE C-3 
PROJECTED PERCENTAGES OF POPULATION AGED 65 AND OVER, CANADA, 1976 TO 2051 

Population growth projections 

P-OI P-02 P-03 P-04 P-05 P-06 P-07 P-08 P-09 P-IO P-II 

(Per cent) 

1976 8.7 8.7 8.7 8.7 8.7 8.7 8.7 8.7 8.7 8.7 8.7 
1981 9.4 9.3 9.4 9.4 9.5 9.5 9.4 9.3 9.5 9.6 9.2 
1986 10.0 9.5 9.8 9.8 10.3 10.1 10.1 9.5 10.3 10.4 9.4 
1991 10.7 9.9 10.5 10.5 11.3 11.0 10.9 9.9 11.3 11.6 9.7 
1996 11.2 10.1 10.9 10.9 12.1 11.6 11.6 10.2 12.1 12.5 9.8 
2001 11.5 10.1 11.1 11.1 12.7 12.0 11.9 10.2 12.6 13.2 9.7 
2006 11.7 9.9 11.2 11.2 13.2 12.3 12.2 10.0 13.2 13.8 9.5 
2011 12.4 10.1 11.8 11.9 14.4 13.1 13.1 10.2 14.5 15.2 9.6 
2016 13.9 10.8 13.2 13.2 16.6 14.6 14.7 10.9 16.8 17.4 10.2 
2021 15.4 11.5 14.7 14.7 19.1 16.2 16.4 11.6 19.5 20.0 10.9 
2026 17.2 12.3 16.4 16.4 21.9 18.0 18.2 12.4 22.4 22.9 11.6 
2031 18.3 12.4 17.4 17.5 24.2 19.2 19.3 12.7 24.8 25.3 11.8 
2036 18.2 11.7 17.2 17.4 25.0 19.2 19.2 12.1 25.7 26.3 11.0 
2041 17.5 10.7 16.5 16.9 25.2 18.6 18.4 11.2 25.8 26.6 10.0 
2046 17.3 10.4 16.3 16.7 25.2 18.4 18.2 11.0 25.8 26.7 9.8 
2051 17.6 10.9 16.6 17.0 25.2 18.7 18.5 11.4 25.8 26.7 10.3 

SOURCE F. Denton, C. Feaver, and B. Spencer, "The Future Population and Labour Force of Canada: Projections to the Year 2051," a background study 
prepared for the Economic Council of Canada, 1979. 
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TABLE C-4 

ASSUMPTIONS OF LABOUR FORCE PARTICIPATION RATES, BY AGE GROUP AND BY SEX, CANADA, 
1981 AND 1991 

Men Women 

1976 1981 1991 1976 1981 1991 

Actual Medium Medium Actual Medium Medium 

(Per cent) 

Age group 

15-16 33.2 30.1 30.1 27.7 24.0 24.0 
17-19 66.6 63.3 63.3 60.2 59.0 59.0 
20-24 85.2 85.2 85.2 67.3 72.0 78.0 
25-34 95.5 95.3 95.0 53.9 60.0 68.0 
35-44 96.0 96.0 96.0 53.3 58.9 70.0 
45-54 92.5 92.0 92.0 48.3 51.1 55.1 
55-64 76.8 74.5 70.0 32.0 32.7 34.0 
65-69 25.4 21.9 15.0 7.9 6.0 5.0 
70 and over 9.7 8.5 6.0 2.1 2.0 1.4 

NOTE The participation rates are annual averages based on Statistics Canada Labour Force Survey definitions, modified to include the armed forces and 
residents of the Yukon and Northwest Territories. For years between 1976 and 1981, and between 1981 and 1991, rates are calculated by linear inter­ 
polation; for years after 1991, they are assumed constant at their 1991 levels. 

SOURCE F. Denton, C. Feaver, and B. Spencer, 'The Future Population and Labour Force of Canada: Projections to the Year 2051," a background study 
prepared for the Economic Council of Canada, 1979. 

TABLE C-S 

PROJECTED LABOUR FORCE, CANADA, 
1976 TO 2051 

Demographic growth projections 

Medium High Low 
(L-01) (L-08) (L-09) 

(Thousands) 

1976 10,411 10,411 10,411 
1981 11,723 11,771 11,668 
1986 12,803 13,040 12,559 
1991 13,655 14,101 13,201 
1996 14,299 15,141 13,510 
2001 15,099 16,771 13,689 
2006 15,861 18,628 13,673 
2011 16,380 20,244 13,428 
2016 16,610 21,589 12,922 
2021 16,771 23,088 12,291 
2026 16,982 25,007 11,613 
2031 17,296 27,347 10,960 
2036 17,689 29,862 10,409 
2041 18,060 32,389 9,900 
2046 18,331 34,908 9,383 
2051 18,557 37,593 8,888 

SOURCE F. Denton, C. Feaver, and B. Spencer, "The Future Population 
and Labour Force of Canada: Projections to the Year 2051," a 
background study prepared for the Economic Council of 
Canada, 1979. 



D The Present Value of Future Income 

Suppose that the rate of interest on savings accounts 
is 5 per cent. How much would have to be deposited 
in a savings account today to have $100 a year from 
now? The answer is $95.24. That amount is the 
present value of the $100. In other words, if an 
individual deposits $95.24 today, a year from now 
he will get back that amount plus 5 per cent interest 
($4.76), or $100. 

It is important to note that the present value of a 
given sum will be smaller, the farther away the 
payment date and the higher the interest rate. To 
illustrate the first point, suppose we ask how much 
our saver would have to deposit to get $100 back in 
not one year but two years from today, still at a rate 
of interest of 5 per cent a year. The answer is 
$90.70. At the end of the first year, he would have 
accumulated $90.70 + 5 per cent ($4.54), or 
$95.24; at the end of the second year, he would 
receive $95.24 + 5 per cent ($4.76), or $100. 
Now assume that the interest rate is 10 per cent. 

To receive $100 one year hence would now require a 

deposit of $90.91; two years hence, a deposit now of 
$82.64. In other words, with an interest rate of 
10 per cent, $100 one year from now is valued at 
$90.91 today and $100 in two years from now at 
$82.64 today (the present value). Similarly, we can 
determine the present value for an individual at 
age 18 of net benefits, less contributions and taxes 
on benefits, from cPp/QPP or OAS/GIS, although the 
calculations are somewhat more complicated. 

One might ask, however, just how a particular 
interest rate arises. It is rather like the old saying 
that a bird in the hand is worth two in the bush. The 
fact is that people prefer to have $100 now rather 
than a year from now. They must be paid something 
extra to wait for it. Just how much extra is required 
will depend on how important their present needs 
are relative to their future needs. Economists refer 
to this as time preference. When time preference is 
high - that is, when present needs are considered 
far more important than future needs - the reward 
for waiting (the interest rate) will be higher. 



NOTES 

CHAPTER I 

Thomas Wilson, ed., Pensions. Inflation and Growth 
(London: Heinemann Educational Books, 1974), 
p.8. 

CHAPTER 2 

Examples of public or publicly funded programs are 
the New Horizons program of the Department of 
National Health and Welfare, Canadian Executive 
Service Overseas, and Counselling Assistance to 
Small Enterprise. In the private sector, Associated 
Senior Executives of Canada Limited offers part­ 
time work to retired senior executives who can pro­ 
vide management advice to small businesses, while 
the Rockway Repair Committee in Kitchener and the 
Senior Citizens' Home Repair Committee of Toronto 
provide part-time work for older workers in plumb­ 
ing, electrical, painting, and handyman services. 

2 Brian J. Powell and James K. Martin, "Economic 
Implications of an Aging Society in Canada," a 
paper prepared for The National Symposium on 
Aging, Ottawa, October 25-27, 1978 (Health and 
Welfare Canada), p. 18. 

3 Social Planning Council of Metropolitan Toronto, 
"Old Age Insecurity," Toronto, August 1978, p. 53. 

4 See, for example, Canadian Manufacturers' Associa­ 
tion (Ontario Division), "A Brief to the Royal Com­ 
mission on the Status of Pensions in Ontario," 
Toronto, January 27, 1978, Appendix B. 

5 For estimates of outstanding liabilities, see Samuel 
A. Rea, Jr., "Redistributive Effects of Canada's 
Public Pension Programs," a background study pre­ 
pared for the Economic Council of Canada, 1979. 

6 Lawrence E. Coward, Mercer Handbook of Canadi­ 
an Pension and Welfare Plans, 6th ed. (Toronto: 
CCH Canadian Limited, 1977); and Statistics 

Canada, Pension Plans in Canada. 1976, 
Cat. No. 74-401,1978. 

7 Economic Council of Canada, People and Jobs: A 
Study of the Canadian Labour Market (Ottawa: 
Queen's Printer, 1976), Appendix G. 

8 An integrated occupational plan is one in which the 
calculated pension is inclusive of all or part of the 
government plan. 

9 "Vesting requirements under pension benefits 
acts" - Six provinces (Alberta, Manitoba, Nova 
Scotia, Ontario, Quebec, and Saskatchewan) have 
pension benefits legislation regulating the operation 
of employer-sponsored pension plans, while the Fed­ 
eral Pension Benefits Standards Act applies to feder­ 
al employers. The legislation requires plans to pro­ 
vide for the lock-in vesting of employer contributions 
paid in respect of service after the qualification date, 
when a member has completed 10 years of service 
and is 45 years of age. Manitoba requires vesting 
after 10 years of service regardless of age. For defini­ 
tions of vesting, portability and locking-in see 
Appendix A. 

10 The major types of pension benefit formula are 
defined in Appendix A. 

II Tomenson-Alexander Associates Limited, Report on 
Certain Aspects of the Public Service Employee 
Pension Program (Ottawa: Supply and Services 
Canada, 1978), pp. 128-31. 

12 U.S. Bureau of Labor Statistics, "Revised Equiva­ 
lence Scale for Estimating Equivalent Income or 
Budget Costs by Family Type," Bulletin 1570-2 
(Washington: Government Printing Office, 1968), 
p.4. 

13 Jenny Podol uk, "Poverty and Income Adequacy," a 
paper presented at the Conference on Canadian 
Incomes, Winnipeg, Manitoba, May 10-12, 1979, 
p. 16. 

14 The following provinces have, in the past, allocated 
some or all of their Canada Pension Plan funds to 
specific Crown corporations under their jurisdiction: 



132 One in Three 

British Columbia - British Columbia Hydro and 
Power Authority; B.C. School Financing Authority; 
and B.C. Hospital Authority 

Alberta - Alberta Municipal Financing Corpora­ 
tion 

Saskatchewan - Saskatchewan Power Corporation; 
Saskatchewan Telecommunications; and Saskatche­ 
wan Land Bank Commission 

Manitoba - Manitoba Water Supply Board; 
Manitoba School Financing Authority; Manitoba 
Development Corporation 

Ontario - Ontario Education Capital Aid Corpora­ 
tion; and Ontario Universities Capital Aid Corpora­ 
tion. 

CHAPTER 3 

The Germans coined the word "Rentenberg" - the 
"pension mountain" - to describe the increased 
pension requirements in their country. See Harry 
Weitz, "The Foreign Experience with Income Main­ 
tenance for the Elderly," a background study pre­ 
pared for the Economic Council of Canada, 1979. 
This study discusses some of the lessons that Canada 
might learn from the earlier experience of European 
countries. 

2 Frank Denton, Christine Feaver, and Byron Spencer, 
"The Future Population and Labour Force of 
Canada: Projections to the Year 2051," a back­ 
ground study prepared for the Economic Council of 
Canada, 1979. See also Appendix C for an explana­ 
tion of the assumptions used. 

3 Statistics Canada, Population Projections for 
Canada and the Provinces, 1976-2001, 
Cat. No. 91-520, February 1979, pp. 21 and 46. 

4 R. Clark and J. Spengler, "Changing Demography 
and Dependency Costs: The Implications of New 
Dependency Ratios and Their Composition," in Bar­ 
bara Herzog, ed., Aging and Income: Programs and 
Prospects for the Elderly (New York: Human 
Science Press, 1978); and Linda McDonald, "Chang­ 
ing Population and the Impact on Government Age­ 
Specific Expenditures," an unpublished study pre­ 
pared for the Treasury Board Secretariat, Ottawa, 
April 1977. 

5 Whether total benefits rise at the same rate as real 
wages until the time of retirement depends upon the 
particular benefit formula used. Since the CPP and 
QPP are not linked to growth in real wages after 
age 65, a beneficiary's income-replacement ratio will 
decline relative to the current average real wage. 

How much the average replacement ratio will decline 
will depend upon the size of succeeding age cohorts, 
the length of retirement, and the rate of increase in 
real wages. In any event, the average ratio would 
change only slowly, if at all; for present purposes, one 
can thus assume that it is more or less fixed with 
respect to the current real average wage at any point 
in time. Increasing benefits after the eligible age in 
line with real wages would be the equivalent of 
raising the replacement ratio at age 65; it would also, 
of course, further increase benefit levels. OAS and GIS 
benefits are not officially indexed to real wages but 
ad hoc increases have had the same result. The 
projections are based on the assumption that this 
practice will continue in the future. 

6 The population and labour force projections used in 
this report were made in 1978. Since that time, 
Statistics Canada has published revised data for 
1975-78, showing increased participation rates by 
women, especially those in the 25-44 age group. Our 
projections, of course, already call for varying 
degrees of increased female participation; whether 
the ultimate levels projected, rather than simply the 
timing of their attainment, should be changed 
remains questionable. 

7 See also Leroy Stone and Susan Fletcher, "A Profile 
of Canada's Older Population," a background paper 
prepared for the Economic Council of Canada. 

8 J. A. Clark and N. E. Collishaw, "Canada's Older 
Population," Health and Welfare Canada, Staff 
Paper 75-1, Ottawa, May 1975, pp. 14-15. 

CHAPTER 4 

The term "wealth" is used here in the economist's 
sense - that is, as assets from which an income can 
be derived. 

2 The size of the redistribution is affected by the rate 
of discount used in the calculation. 

3 There is a net redistribution of wealth to or from 
individuals of a particular generation under a pay-as­ 
you-go scheme when the benefits they receive are 
greater or less than those they could have received if 
their own contributions had been invested at market 
rates of interest. For example, if the ratio of workers 
to pensioners is constant, then the workers' credits 
under a pay-as-you-go scheme grow at the same rate 
as earnings. If contributions were invested, credits 
would grow at the rate of interest. If the rate of 
interest were less than the rate of growth of earnings, 
then benefits received under a pay-as-you-go plan 
would be greater than if the same lifetime contribu­ 
tions had been invested at market rates of interest, 
and vice versa. 



4 A survey of the professional literature on redistribu­ 
tive objectives is provided in A. Asimakopulos, "The 
Nature of Public Pension Plans: Intergenerational 
Equity, Funding, and Saving," a background study 
prepared for the Economic Council of Canada, 1979. 

5 Samuel A. Rea, Jr., "Redistributive Effects of Cana­ 
da's Public Pension Programs," a background study 
prepared for the Economic Council of Canada, 1979. 

6 There is the possibility that some young workers in 
contributory plans may not even suffer a loss. This 
would be the case if their contributions exceeded the 
cost of benefits promised. On the other hand, the 
nearer a mobile worker is to retirement age, the 
higher the employer contributions that could be lost. 

7 For definitions of the tests to which social assistance 
programs may be subjected, see Appendix A. 

8 It is worth noting that resistance to means tests 
seems to be much less in continental European coun­ 
tries than in Britain, the United States, or Canada. 
For some of the possible reasons, see Thomas Wilson, 
ed., Pensions. Inflation and Growth (London: Heine­ 
mann Educational Books, 1974), pp. 366-68. 

9 That statement is, of course, true for the tax-transfer 
system in general. The major difference is that the 
cpp and QPP are extolled as earnings-related plans. 

CHAPTER 5 

For U.S. work in this area, see Philip Cagan, The 
Effect of Pension Plans on Aggregate Saving: Evi­ 
dence from a Sample Survey, NBER Occasional 
Paper 95 (New York: National Bureau of Economic 
Research, 1965); George Katona, The Mass Con­ 
sumption Society (New York: McGraw-Hill Publi­ 
cations, 1964), Chapter 19; Martin Feldstein, "Social 
Security and Private Saving: International Evidence 
in an Extended Life Cycle," Discussion Paper 361 
(Cambridge, Mass.: Harvard Institute of Economic 
Research, 1974); Martin Feldstein, "Social Security, 
Induced Retirement and Aggregate Capital Accumu­ 
lation," Journal of Political Economy, 82, no. 5 
(September-October 1974); Alicia H. Munnell, The 
Effect of Social Security on Personal Saving (Cam­ 
bridge, Mass.: Ballinger Publishing Co., 1974); 
Alicia Munnell, "Private Pensions and Saving: New 
Evidence," Journal of Political Economy, 84, no. 5 
(October 1976); R. J. Barro, "Social Security and 
Private Saving: New Evidence from the U.S. Time 
Series," University of Rochester, Rochester, N.Y., 
1977; R. J. Barro and G. M. MacDonald, "Social 
Security and Consumer Spending in an International 
Cross-Section," University of Rochester, Rochester, 
N.Y., 1977; J. A. Turner, "Social Security, Saving 
and Labour Supply," Washington, Social Security 

Notes 133 

Administration, 1978; for a critique of this evidence, 
see A. Asimakopulos, "The Nature of Public Pension 
Plans: Intergenerational Equity, Funding, and Sav­ 
ing," a background study prepared for the Economic 
Council of Canada, 1979. 

2 See, for example, Gregory V. Jump, "Interest Rates, 
Inflation Expectations and Spurious Elements in 
Measured Real Incomes and Savings Rates," Insti­ 
tute for Policy Analysis, University of Toronto, 
Toronto, January 1979, mimeo. 

3 Government of Ontario, Ministry of Treasury, Eco­ 
nomics and Intergovernmental Affairs, "Public Pen­ 
sions and Personal Saving: Canadian Evidence in the 
Extended Life Cycle Model," Taxation and Fiscal 
Policy Branch, Preliminary, revised, March 1978. 
The study cautions that the results depend on "rough 
parameter estimates whose magnitudes depend upon 
model specification. Further, the variables used to 
estimate the impact of Canada's public pension 
system on saving are indirect and are undoubtedly 
imprecise measures of changes in social security 
wealth perceived by life-cycle savers". 

4 P. P. Boyle and J. D. Murray, "Social Security 
Wealth and Private Saving in Canada," Working 
Paper 574, University of British Columbia, Vancou­ 
ver, April 1978. 

5 Peter Wrage, "The Effects of the Growth of Private 
and Public Pension Plans on Saving and Investment 
in Canada," a background study prepared for the 
Economic Council of Canada, 1979. 

6 Both the method of financing the two public pension 
programs and the partial funding of the CPP and QPP 
programs account for their differing effects on per­ 
sonal saving. The OAS program involves a pure 
income transfer financed from general revenue - 
i.e. from progressive income taxes. One would there­ 
fore expect OAS to have an effect on personal saving. 
The CPP and QPP programs, however, are financed 
from contributions that are regressive - i.e. they 
may force lower-income groups to provide involun­ 
tary additional saving, thus reducing any adverse 
effects in personal saving. In addition, until the CPP 
and QPP programs have fully matured, the partial 
funding of these programs would help to offset any 
reduction in personal saving. 

7 Munnell, "Private Pensions and Saving," p. 1031. 
The net increase in personal saving resulting from the 
funding of private pension plans was estimated at 
U.S. $8.1 billion in 1973. This was approximately 
7 per cent of total personal saving in the United 
States in that year. 

8 The CPP is not funded in the same sense that private 
pension plans are funded. While the excess of contri­ 
butions over benefits has generated funds that are 
loaned to the provinces, private pension plans must 
back all their liabilities - i.e. expected pension plan 



134 One in Three 

benefits - with a fund that is invested in financial 
assets. 

9 A more complete discussion is provided in James 
E. Pesando, "The Canada Pension Plan as a Finan­ 
cial Intermediary," in James E. Pesando and Law­ 
rence B. Smith, Government in Canadian Capital 
Markets (Montreal: C. D. Howe Research Institute, 
1978), pp. 78-80. 

10 Keith Patterson, "The Effect of Provincial Borrow­ 
ings from Universal Pension Plans on Provincial and 
Municipal Government Finance," a background 
paper prepared for the Economic Council of Canada, 
1979. 

Il See also Pesando, "The Canada Pension Plan," 
pp. 88-91. He concludes, on the basis of indirect 
evidence such as statements by government repre­ 
sentatives, that provincial spending generally 
increased. 

12 Richard E. Caves and Grant L. Reuber, Canadian 
Economic Policy and the Impact of International 
Capital Flows, Private Planning Association of 
Canada, Canada in the Atlantic Economy series, 
vol. 10 (Toronto: University of Toronto Press, 1969), 
Chapter 1. 

13 J. C. Pattison, Financial Markets and Foreign Own­ 
ership, Occasional Paper No. 8 (Toronto: Ontario 
Economic Council, 1978), p. 72. 

14 Brian L. Eyford and Bobbi Cain, "Simulations with 
CANDIDE to the Year 2000," Economic Council of 
Canada Discussion Paper No. 89, May 1977. 

15 A. Tarasofsky and T. G. Roseman, "Ex Post Aggre­ 
gate Real Rates of Return in Canada, 1947-76," a 
background study prepared for the Economic Coun­ 
cil of Canada, 1979. 

16 Part of this section is based on the very useful 
discussion provided in Selig D. Lesnoy and John 
C. Hambro, "Social Security, Saving, and Capital 
Formation," Social Security Bulletin, 38, no. 7 (July 
1975):3-15. 

17 Donald J. Daly, "Canada's Comparative Advan­ 
tage," a background study prepared for the Econom­ 
ic Council of Canada, 1979. It has been estimated 
that, on average, Canadian capital output ratios are 
approximately twice as large as the U.S. ratios; see 
Ludwig Auer, Regional Disparities of Productivity 
and Growth in Canada, Economic Council of Canada 
(Ottawa: Supply and Services Canada, 1978). 

18 Edward F. Denison, "The Contribution of Capital to 
the Postwar Growth of Industrial Countries," in 
U.S. Economic Growth from 1976 to 1986: Pros­ 
pects, Problems, and Patterns, Volume 3 - Capital, 
Studies Prepared for the Use of the Joint Economic 
Committee of the Congress of the United States 

(Washington: U.S. Government Printing Office, 
1976), pp. 45-75. 

19 L. R. Christiansen, D. Cummings, and 
D. W. Jorgenson, "Economic Growth, 1947-1973: 
An International Comparison," Social Systems 
Research Institute, Workshop Series No. 7621, Uni­ 
versity of Wisconsin, Madison, December 1976. 

CHAPTER 6 

See also D. Don Ezra, Understanding Pension Fund 
Finance and Investment (Toronto: Pagurian Press, 
1979), Chapter 2. 

2 Gordon R. Sharwood, "Investment for Innovation," a 
report to the Minister of Science and Technology, 
Ottawa, 1977, p. 59. 

3 The Economist, November 4, 1978: "A Private Cor­ 
porate State," p. Il; and "20 Billion of Pension 
Funds in Need of Regulation," p. 109. 

4 Peter F. Drucker, The Unseen Revolution: How Pen­ 
sion Fund Socialism Came to America (New York: 
Harper & Row, 1976). 

5 Tristram Lett, "Savings or Consumption? The Role 
of the Public Pension Plan in the National Econo­ 
my," remarks to the Association of Canadian Pen­ 
sion Management, Vancouver, September 19, 1977. 

6 The Toronto Stock Exchange, "Submission to the 
Royal Commission on the Status of Pensions in 
Ontario," January 1978. 

CHAPTER 7 

For the distinction between earnings, income, and 
means tests, see Appendix A. 

2 These concepts are discussed in David Hoffman, 
Marc Laplante, and Nicole Schwartz-Morgan, 
"Retirement Reconsidered: An Essay in Long-Term 
Forecasting," a submission to the Special Senate 
Committee on Retirement Age Policies by the Insti­ 
tute for Research on Public Policy, Montreal, 
January 1979, p. 12. 

3 A. Leslie Robb and John B. Burbidge, "Public Pen­ 
sion Plans and the Incentive to Work," a background 
study prepared for the Economic Council of Canada, 
1978. A retirement test meant that a plan member 
had to be retired from regular employment to qualify 
for benefits. 



4 The Retirement Survey was conducted by Statistics 
Canada on behalf of Health and Welfare Canada in 
February 1975. It collected information from 2,418 
individuals aged 55 and over, with respect to their 
actual or expected age of retirement from full-time 
employment, their reasons for retirement, their 
retirement and pre-retirement incomes, and so on. 
For a discussion of data limitations, see Robb and 
Burbidge, "Public Pension Plans," p. 67. 

5 Robb and Burbidge, "Public Pension Plans," p. 77. 

6 Virginia Reno, "Why Men Stop Working at or 
Before Age 65: Findings from the Survey of New 
Beneficiaries," Social Security Bulletin, 34, no. 6 
(June 1971 ):3-14. 

7 Ed Finn, "The Debate Over Mandatory Retire- 
ment," The Labour Gazette, 78, no. 1 
(January 1978):9. 

8 Alicia H. Munnell, The Future of Social Security 
(Washington: The Brookings Institution, 1977), 
pp.73-76. 

9 Joseph A. Pechman, Henry J. Aaron, and Michael 
K. Taussig, Social Security: Perspectives for Reform 
(Washington: The Brookings Institution, 1968), 
p. 141. 

10 Leroy O. Stone, "Population Aging and Dependency 
Ratios in Canada," a submission to the Special 
Senate Committee on Retirement Age Policies, 
Ottawa, November 30, 1978. 

11 See Kenneth Bratthall, "Flexible Retirement and the 
New Swedish Partial Pension Scheme," Industrial 
Gerontology, 3, no. 3 (Summer 1976), for a general 
discussion of the Swedish approach to flexible 
retirement. 

12 This conclusion holds for a given earnings pattern. In 
other words, given their earnings pattern, the more 
frequently that workers change jobs, the lower will be 
their retirement benefits. For some workers, job 
changes may be associated with an upward shift in 
earnings; for others, the opposite could be true. 

13 Raymond Préfontaine and Yves Balcer, "Job Mobili­ 
ty and Its Implications for the Employer-Sponsored 
Pension System in Canada," a study prepared for the 
Task Force on Retirement Income Policy, 
September 1977. 

14 Canadian Labour Congress, "Submission to the 
Royal Commission on the Status of Pensions in 
Ontario," Toronto, March 23, 1978. 

15 The projections do not, however, assume that all 
workers will work full-time for the whole period 
between age 20 and age 65. 

16 Paterson, Cook Limited, "Pension Plan Simulation 
Model, Development of Cost Estimates," a study 

Notes 135 

prepared for the Task Force on Retirement Income 
Policy, May 1978, pp. 20-21. 

17 Canadian Life Insurance Association, "Report of the 
Sub-Committee on a Portable Pension Project," 
Toronto, 1979. See also Canadian Life Insurance 
Associati'on, "A Portable Pension System for Canadi­ 
ans," Toronto, June 18, 1979. 

18 Canadian Labour Congress, "Submission," p. V-Il. 

19 Comité d'étude sur le financement du Régime de 
rentes du Québec et sur les régimes supplémentaires 
de rentes (COFIRENTES+), La sécurité financière des 
personnes âgées au Québec (Québec: Editeur officiel 
du Québec, 1977). 

20 The employer may limit his liability to index to 
8.5 per cent per annum by paying a premium to the 
government, which then takes on the responsibility of 
making up the rest. 

CHAPTER 8 

Frank Blackaby, "Income Policies and Inflation," 
National Institute Economic Review, no. 58 
(November 1971), p. 38. 

2 The discussion in this and the following sections is 
based in large part on James E. Pesando, "Private 
Pension Plans in an Inflationary Climate: Limita­ 
tions and Policy Alternatives," a background study 
prepared for the Economic Council of Canada, 1979. 

3 James E. Pesando and Samuel A. Rea, Jr., Public 
and Private Pensions in Canada: An Economic 
Analysis, a research study prepared for the Ontario 
Economic Council (Toronto: University of Toronto 
Press, 1977), p. 45. Until December 1975, the 
Department of National Revenue explicitly preclud­ 
ed pension plans from incorporating into salary pro­ 
jections an allowance for the possible effects of infla­ 
tion. This rule meant that final-earnings plans would 
suffer sharp increases in experience deficiencies 
during periods of accelerating inflation. 

4 See also Economic Council of Canada, Sixteenth 
Annual Review: Two Cheers for the Eighties 
(Ottawa: Supply and Services Canada, 1979), 
Chapter 3; and Glenn P. Jenkins, Inflation: Its 
Financial Impact on Business in Canada, Economic 
Council of Canada (Ottawa: Supply and Services 
Canada, 1978). 

5 Pesando and Rea, Public and Private Pensions, 
pp.40-42. 

6 William R. Waters, "Pensions and the Competitive 
Position of Canadian Firms," a background study 
prepared for the Economic Council of Canada, 1979. 



136 One in Three 

7 James E. Pesando, The Impact of Inflation on 
Financial Markets in Canada (Montreal: 
C. D. Howe Research Institute, 1977), Chapters 2 
and 3. 

8 In other words, at the new higher interest rates, the 
price of fixed-interest securities carrying lower nomi­ 
nal rates will fall and the sponsor will have to make 
up this capital loss by additional payments. 

9 Much of this section is based on Waters, "Pensions." 

10 A. F. Ehrbar, "Those Pension Plans Are Weaker 
Than You Think," Fortune (November 1977), 
pp. 104-14. See also "Unfunded Pension Liabilities: 
A Continuing Burden," Business Week (August 14, 
1978), pp. 60-63. 

11 The Royal Bank of Canada, Econoscope 
(October 1978), p. 8. 

12 Financial Executives Institute of Canada, "Report on 
Survey of Pension Plans in Canada," March 1978, 
p.26. 

13 For all practical purposes, the tax base is the gross 
national product. Any change in the general price 
level is matched by a corresponding change in GNP in 
money terms. Canada's income tax system is, of 
course, price-indexed. If it were not, tax revenues 
would increase even more rapidly than prices. 
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Incomes, Winnipeg, Manitoba, May 10-12, 1979, 
p. 16. 
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Development 

Senate Committee on 
Poverty 
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4,940 8,222 

9,209 5,533 

4 Canadian Labour Congress, "Submission," pp. 11-2 
and V-9. 

5 This rate, or indeed any of our calculated rates, 
should be compared with present employer/employee 
contribution rates for existing funded schemes. 

6 A. E. Safarian, "Impediments to the Interprovincial 
Mobility of Labour in Canada," a paper presented to 
the Fourth Annual Meeting of the Association of 
Quebec Economists, Montreal, April 26, 1979. 
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ing," a background study prepared for the Economic 
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out in Canada Pension Plan Advisory Committee, 
"Review of the Objectives of the cPP," a Report to 
the Honourable Monique Bégin, Minister of Nation­ 
al Health and Welfare, 1978. 

ApPENDIX C 
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ground study prepared for the Economic Council of 
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estimates by the Economic Council of Canada in People and Jobs 
(Ottawa: Information Canada, 1976), p. 91. 

Chart 7-7 
Distribution of Occupational Pension Plan Members, by 
Period Required for Vesting, Canada, 1970 and 1976 
(p. 73) 
I Years of service with the employer or years of participation 

in the plan, whichever is the lesser. In many plans, parti­ 
cipation may be limited to employees working full-time, or 
being a certain age, or having completed one year of service. 

Source Statistics Canada, Pension Plans in Canada, Cat. No. 
74-401, various issues. 

Table 7-1 
Actual and Projected Labour Force Participation Rate of 
Population Aged 65 and over, by Sex, Selected Countries, 
1950, 1970, and 2000 (p. 67) 
Source International Labour Office, Labour Force Estimates 
and Projections, 1950-2000 (Geneva: ILO, 1977), vols. I and IV. 

Table 7-2 
Number of Men per Sample of 1,000 Who Retire before, 
at, or after Age 65, by Retirement Income Group and 
by Reason of Retirement, Canada, 1975 (p. 68) 
I Retirement income includes income from public and private 

pensions, and from investment. It is adjusted to reflect the level 
of retirement income that the individual would have received 
had he or she retired at the age of 65. The adjustment was made 
by increasing the actual income of those retiring before the age 
of 65 by the amount of OAS, plus the amount of the life annuity 
that they could have bought at the age of 65 had they saved 
their retirement income until that age. 

Source Based on tabulations produced by the Economic Council 
of Canada from the micro data of the 1975 Retirement Survey 
conducted by Statistics Canada on behalf of Health and Welfare 
Canada. 

Table 7-3 
Distribution of Labour Force Aged 15 and over and 
Aged 65 and over, by Industry and by Sex, Canada, 1978 
(p. 71) 
I Figures do not add up to total because of rounding and 

because of the exclusion of "unclassified industries." 
2 Includes community, business, and personal service industries. 
Source Based on data from Statistics Canada, Labour Force 
Survey Division. 
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Table 7-4 
Pension Plans and Duration of Employment, by Industry, 
Canada, 1975 (p. 72) 
I The sample consists of men aged 55 and over who have 

not retired from full-time employment and are not self­ 
employed. The sample includes only those whose longest-term 
employer is the current one. The reason for this exclusion is 
that some of the information in the survey relates to their job 
with their longest-term employer, while other information 
relates to the current job. This exclusion resulted in a 
28 per cent reduction of the sample. 

Source Same as for Table 7-2. 

Table 7-5 
Full-Time Employees Aged 55 and over, by Longest 
Duration of Employment with Same Employer, Canada, 
1975 (p. 74) 
Source Same as for Table 7-2. 

CHAPTER 8 

Chart 8-1 
Year-to- Year Percentage Change in Consumer Price Index, 
1960-78 (p. 77) 
Source Statistics Canada, Consumer Prices and Price Indexes. 
Ca!. No. 62-010, various issues. 

Chart 8-2 
Purchasing Power of Unindexed Pension of $10,000 with 
5%% Price Increase, 1966 to 1981 (p. 77) 
Source Estimates by the Economic Council of Canada. 

Chart 8-3 
Distribution of Average Assessed Income of Canadians 
Filing Income Tax Returns, by Age Group and Income 
Source, 1976 (p. 78) 
Source Revenue Canada, Taxation, Taxation Statistics. 1978. 

Chart 8-4 
Average Income of Family Units, by Source and by Age 
of Head, Canada, 1971 and 1975 (p. 78) 
Source Estimates by the Economic Council of Canada, based on 
unpublished data from Statistics Canada, Survey of Consumer 
Finances (economic family series), 1976. 

Table 8-1 
Average Nominal and Real Rate of Return on Trusteed 
Pension Plans, Canada, 1963-77 (p. 81) 
I As measured by the consumer price index. 
Source Statistics Canada, Trusteed Pension Plans, Financial 
Statistics, Cat. No. 74-201, various issues. Estimates by the 
Economic Council of Canada. 

CHAPTER 10 

Table 10-1 
Expenditures on Selected Retirement Income Policy 
Alternatives as Percentages of GNP and Contributory 
Earnings, under Various Demographic Scenarios, Canada, 
1981 and 2031 (p. 98) 
I Figures in parentheses are percentages of contributory 

earnings - i.e. pay-as-you-go contribution rates. These are 
relevant only for the income-replacement options; basic­ 
income options are financed from general tax revenues. It 
should be noted too that increasing CPP/QPP benefits beyond 
present levels would in fact slightly reduce the requirements for 
the income-tested portion of the basic-income packages. For 
practical purposes, however, this can be ignored, and the two 
sets of options can be treated as additive. 

2 For details of the Canadian Labour Congress proposals, see 
Note 1 for Chapter 10. 

3 This figure is the actual contribution rate at the present time 
rather than the pay-as-you-go rate. 

Source Estimates by the Economic Council of Canada. 
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