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Abstract 
This paper discusses the problems resulting 

from human interference with the nests of sensi­
tive bird species. It notes the toll of eggs and 
nestlings caused by an undiscerning general pub­
lic, which makes it especially necessary for ama­
teur bird-watchers and professional biologists to 
act responsibly when they visit active nests. One 
set of problems centres on the desertion of nests 
by frightened adult birds, the injury to eggs and 
young that they may cause in doing so, the ad­
verse environment for eggs and nestlings brought 
about by this desertion, and the consequent 
threats to the feeding and safety of the young. 
A further set of problems arises from mishandling 
— the unnecessary handling, awkward handling, 
admiring, and photographing of young birds in 
the nest. The discussion includes possible solu­
tions to the problems, and also calls for know­
ledgeable trespass on a bird's territory — or no 
trespass at all. 

Resume 
La presente communication porte sur les 

problemes que cause 1'intrusion humaine dans 
les nids d'oiseaux d'especes fragiles ou faciles a 
effaroucher. On y fait 6 tat des pertes d'oeufs et 
d'oisillons causees par un grand public sans dis-
cernement, ce qui fait, tout particulierement aux 
amateurs d'observation ornithologique et aux 
biologistes professionnels, une necessite de se 
comporter raisonnablement lorsqu'ils visitent 
des nids habites. Une des series de problemes en 
cause decoule de l'abandon des nids par des 
oiseaux adultes effrayes et va du dommage qu'ils 

peuvent ainsi causer aux oeufs et aux petits, a 
1'environnement defavorable a l'ensemble de leur 
progeniture qui resulte de cet abandon, et aux 
dangers qui s'ensuivent pour la nutrition et la 
securite des oisillons. Un autre ensemble de pro­
blemes releve de la manipulation nuisible, que 
cette consequence resulte de l'absence de ne­
cessite de cette intervention, de la maladresse a 
l'effectuer, d'une approche trop poussee (fut-
elle causee par le sentiment d'admiration) ou de 
faction de photographier des petits au nid. On 
indique des solutions possibles et demande qu'il 
n'y ait d'intrusion dans le territoire d'un oiseau 
qu'a bon escient. 
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Introduction 

Eggs and nestling birds are observed, count­
ed, collected, weighed, measured, and photo­
graphed — both casually and professionally — 
sometimes at the expense of the birds. Because 
an undiscerning general public continues to take 
its toll, amateur bird-watchers and professional 
biologists especially need to act responsibly, and 
to encourage others to do so, in visiting active 
bird nests. There must be both compassion and 
common sense, including the realization that the 
eggs and young birds that may be jeopardized are 
the future breeding stock. 

It must also be recognized that our current 
knowledge of nesting birds has come from com­
petent field study. Except for a very few historical 
instances, this bird research has not had long-
term detrimental effects on the population dyna­
mics of any species. This paper is presented in 
an effort to perpetuate the good record of pro­
fessional ornithologists and to alert casual bird 
watchers to potential problems. 

Although much of the following may seem 
superfluous to active ornithologists and natur­
alists, we sincerely hope that professionals will 
benefit from the introspection stimulated by 
the ideas presented, that inexperienced field 
biologists will profit from the discussions, and 
that all other bird enthusiasts and casual observ­
ers will be encouraged to recognize the problems 
and develop the empathy necessary to deal 
considerately with birds in the field. 

Our call is for knowledgeable trespass on a 
bird's territory, or none at all. 

1. Scope of the discussion 
The authors have used their experiences 

with raptorial birds (birds of prey) to illustrate 
problems that may arise during ornithological 
field studies with bird species that are sensitive 
to human interference. In addition, we have 
included the observations and recommendations 

of other raptor researchers. Of necessity, much 
of the discussion and general conclusions follow 
from specific, often one-time or unusual occur­
rences in the field. The generalizations that we 
have made are in the interest of conservational 
field research. 

Any of the following problems could be en­
countered when a nest is visited: 1) the parent 
birds may become so disturbed that they desert 
their eggs or young completely; 2) the incidence 
of egg breakage or trampling of young by parent 
birds may be increased, as may the chances of 
cooling, overheating, loss of humidity, and avian 
predation of eggs; 3) newly hatched birds may be 
chilled or overheated, and may die in the absence 
of brooding; 4) older nestlings may leave the 
nest prematurely, damaging still-growing feathers 
and breaking bones at the end of futile first 
flights, or may be forced to spend one night or 
several on the ground where they may be highly 
vulnerable to predation; 5) mammalian predators 
may follow human scent trails directly to the 
eggs or young; 6) the attention of other people 
may be attracted by the visitor's activities; 7) 
mishandling a nestling may damage feathers, 
bones, and claws; and 8) on cliffs, the visitor may 
inadvertently knock rocks and other debris onto 
eggs or young birds. 

In the following discussion we assess each 
of the above problems in terms of its seriousness 
to birds of prey and recommend some solutions. 
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Problems and solutions A male Prairie Falcon incubates the eggs. The males of 
this species tend to be shyer at the nest site than the 
females. 

1. Desertion 
The failure of parent birds to return to eggs 

or young after human interference is both serious 
and unpredictable. The potential effects of inter­
ference vary greatly depending upon the species, 
the idiosyncrasies of individuals, and the previous 
experience of the birds with man (Smith and 
Murphy, 1973). The possibility of desertion also 
varies according to the level of acceptability to 
the birds of their nest sites (Ratcliffe, 1962; 
Hickey, 1942; and many others). 

Many observers suggest that the most critical 
time from the standpoint of nest desertion is just 
prior to egg-laying, when the female spends many 
hours sitting on or near her empty nest (Nether-
sole-Thompson and Nethersole-Thompson, 
1944). Our field observations also suggest that 
the site tenacity of many species of raptors is 
weakest when they first establish their territories. 
At that time, human disturbance of even limited 
duration may cause desertion, not only of nest 
sites, but also of long-established territories. 
Desertion of nest ledges has been observed (both 
before and during egg-laying) following single 
short visits to the eyries of both Peregrine and 
Prairie falcons. Desertion of established nesting 
cliffs and territories of Peregrines, Prairie Falcons, 
and California Condors (Sibley, 1969), Fer­
ruginous Hawks, and even Ospreys (Dunstan, 
1973) have also been documented early in in­
cubation. 

Some species of buteos, such as Ferruginous 
Hawks, seem to be more prone to nest desertion 
than others during the early stages of nesting. 
However, the factors causing disturbance are 
little understood and may vary within a species 
and between areas. For example, the experience 
in north-eastern Colorado has been that Swain­
son's Hawks do not desert if disturbed late in 
incubation. In Alberta and Saskatchewan, how­
ever, researchers maintain a hands-off policy 

with Swainson's Hawks during incubation be­
cause they are desertion prone. In both areas, 
Prairie Falcons, which readily desert a nest site 
prior to egg-laying, rarely desert once incubation 
has begun. 

Desertion is less likely to occur the longer 
incubation is allowed to progress. As hatching 
approaches most species are especially tenacious 
to their clutches of eggs. Peregrine Falcons, 
Prairie Falcons, Golden Eagles, and even some 
Swainson's and Ferruginous hawks will usually 
sit tight during the several days just before and 
just after hatching, and will allow people to ap­
proach closely, occasionally to within a few feet. 
At such close quarters, however, the eventual 
hasty departure of the parent bird can crack eggs 
or injure eyases (see below). 

Generally it is uncommon for raptors to 
desert a nest after the young hatch. Coincidental 
with the decreased likelihood of desertion, the 
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